
Category: Comprehensive Support and Improvement 

Types of Schools Description Timeline for 
Identification 

Initial year of 
identification 

Lowest-
Performing  

Lowest-performing five percent of schools in 
the State participating in Title I. 

At least once every 
three years 

2018-2019 

Low High School 
Graduation Rate 

 

Any public high school in the State with a 
four-year adjusted cohort graduation rate at 
or below 67 percent, or below a higher 
percentage selected by the State, over no 
more than three years. 

At least once every 
three years 

2018-2019 

Chronically Low-
Performing 
Subgroup   

Any school participating in Title I that was 
identified for targeted support and 
improvement because it had a subgroup of 
students performing at or below the 
performance of all students in the lowest-
performing schools and did not improve 
after implementing a targeted support and 
improvement plan over a State-determined 
number of years. 

At least once every 
three years 

State-determined 

 
Category: Targeted Support and Improvement 

Types of Schools Description Timeline for 
Identification 

Initial year of 
identification 

Consistently 
Underperforming 
Subgroup 

Any school with one or more consistently 
underperforming subgroups. 

Annually 2019-2020 

Low-Performing 
Subgroup 

Any school in which one or more subgroups 
of students is performing at or below the 
performance of all students in the lowest-
performing schools.  These schools must 
receive additional targeted support under 
the law. 

 

If this type of school is a Title I school that 
does not improve after implementing a 
targeted support and improvement plan 
over a State-determined number of years, it 
becomes a school that has a chronically low-
performing subgroup and is identified for 
comprehensive support and improvement. 

 

At least once every 
three years 

2018-2019 

 


