BID ABSTRACT

Hope Hull Restoration
Hope Hull, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-16-B-0034-S

29-Sep-16
General Contractor Bid Item A Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Bid Item B
Amity Construction Company NO BID
Carmon Construction 3,079,844.00 261,500.00 | $ 105,500.00 20,500.00 31,500.00 | $ 243,500.00
Holley-Henley Builders, Inc. 2,802,363.00 224,900.00 | $ 74,400.00 17,400.00 42,700.00 | $ 167,000.00
Interscapes NO BID
Jake Marshall Service, Inc. NO BID
Pemberton, Inc. 2,818,000.00 233,000.00 | $ 68,000.00 25,000.00 32,000.00 | $ 238,000.00
RDT Enterprises, LLC NO BID
Russell Construction of Alabama, Inc. 2,822,000.00 209,000.00 | $ 63,000.00 18,000.00 44,000.00 | $ 175,000.00
Southeast Cherokee Construction, Inc. 3,187,564.00 246,971.00 | $ 69,634.00 18,441.00 52,735.00 | $ 220,916.00
W. W. Compton Contractor, LLC NO BID
Wyatt Sasser Construction, LLC NO BID

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A. WEEKS,

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.




