BID ABSTRACT

Geneva Restoration
Geneva, ALABAMA
IFB # AC-16-B-0024-S

29-Sep-16
General Contractor Bid Item A Bid Item B Bid Item C Alternate #1 Alternate #2 Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5 Alternate #6

Anderson Construction Company of Fort Gaines $ 2,980,000.00 | $ 828,000.00 | $ 335,900.00 44,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 63,000.00 35,000.00 189,000.00 137,000.00
Bear Brothers BID REJECTED

Bullard Cook NO BID

Enco NO BID

RDT Enterprises, LLC NO BID

Southeast Cherokee Construction, Inc. NO BID

Wyatt Sasser Construction, LLC $ 2,870,500.00 | $ 840,000.00 | $ 380,000.00 56,000.00 | $ 37,000.00 | $ 47,000.00 27,000.00 140,000.00 108,000.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
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I CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE
ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT
CORRECT.




