
Amendment 0001 
 

BAA 10-020 titled “Dynamic Tactical Communications Networks”  
 
 

The purpose of Amendment 0001 is to revise Section IV. Application and Submission 
Information, paragraph 1, as follows: 
 

1. Application and Submission Process - Industry Day, Oral Presentation, Full Proposals 

Industry Day/Pre-Proposal Conference: 

The Office of Naval Research (ONR) plans to conduct an Industry Day on Friday, June 25, 2010 
at Naval Research Laboratory, 4555 Overlook Ave, SW, Washington, DC 20375.  Building 222 
Auditorium.  No Foreign Nationals are permitted.  Check-in will begin at 8:00 AM Eastern 
Time.  

For details concerning registration to attend this event, please contact the following point of 
contact (POC):  Registration POC: Barbarajo Cox, BJ.Cox@nrl.navy.mil, 202-767-2804. 

Registration must be completed by June 22, 2010 at 12:00 PM Eastern Time.  You must be 
registered for base access. There will be no late registration or registration on the day of the 
event. 

Full Proposals/Oral Presentations: 

Full Proposals are due no later than 2:00 PM Eastern Daylight Time on July 23, 2010.  The 
submitters of proposals judged to be of "particular value" to the Navy will be identified in the 
initial response provided by ONR and encouraged to make oral presentations of their proposals 
on August 23, 2010. The submitters of any proposals not judged by the ONR reviewers as being 
of "particular value" to the Navy are ineligible to make an oral presentation or submit a revised 
full proposal under this solicitation. Questions regarding oral presentations and submission of 
revised full proposals must be submitted at least one week before the presentation/proposal due 
date.  Proposals shall be submitted directly to the Technical Points of Contract (TPOCs). 

Following the oral presentations, the submitters will again receive written notice from ONR on 
August 30, 2010 as to whether the proposed research is still judged to be of particular value to 
the Department of the Navy. The submitters of proposals and oral presentations still judged to be 
of “particular value” to the Navy will be asked to submit a revised full proposal by September 7, 
2010.  Any oral presenter’s proposal subsequently judged to not be of “particular value” to the 
Navy is ineligible to submit a revised full proposal under this solicitation.  Any revised full 
proposal submitted can range from either a complete new proposal to simply a timely email 
notifying the Government that the original proposal as submitted is reaffirmed.  

“White Papers” are not desired for this solicitation. 


