AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS—JULY 28, 2005 119 STAT. 3667
ENROLLMENT CORRECTIONS—H.R. 3377 July 21, 2005

[H. Con. Res. 212]
Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concurring),
That, in the enrollment of the bill H.R. 3377, the Clerk of the
House shall make the following corrections in section 5 of the
bill:

(1) In the matter amending section 157(g)(1) of title 23,
United States Code, strike “$92,054,794,521” and insert
“$92,054,794”.

(2) In the matter amending section 163(e)(1) of such title,
strike “$90,410,958,900” and insert “$90,410,958”.

(3) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(1) of the
Transportation Equity Act for the 21st Century strike
“$135,616,438,356” and insert “$135,616,438”.

(4) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(2) of such Act
strike ‘$59,178,082,192” and insert “$59,178,082”.

(5) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(3) of such Act
strike “$16,438,356,164” and insert “$16,438,356”.

(6) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(4) of such Act
strike “$32,876,712,329” and insert “$32,876,712”.

(7) In the matter amending section 2009(a)(6) of such Act
strike “$2,958,904,110” and insert “$2,958,904”.

Agreed to July 21, 2005.

ADJOURNMENT—HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES  July 25, 2005
AND SENATE [H. Con. Res. 225]

Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concurring),
That, in consonance with section 132(a) of the Legislative Reorga-
nization Act of 1946, when the House adjourns on the legislative
day of Thursday, July 28, 2005, Friday, July 29, 2005, or Saturday,
July 30, 2005, on a motion offered pursuant to this concurrent
resolution by its Majority Leader or his designee, it stand adjourned
until 2 p.m. on Tuesday, September 6, 2005, or until the time
of any reassembly pursuant to section 2 of this concurrent resolu-
tion, whichever occurs first; and that when the Senate recesses
or adjourns on any day from Friday, July 29, 2005, through Friday,
August 5, 2005, on a motion offered pursuant to this concurrent
resolution by its Majority Leader or his designee, it stand recessed
or adjourned until noon on Tuesday, September 6, 2005, or at
such other time on that day as may be specified by its Majority
Leader or his designee in the motion to recess or adjourn, or
until the time of any reassembly pursuant to section 2 of this
concurrent resolution, whichever occurs first.

SEC. 2. The Speaker of the House and the Majority Leader of
the Senate, or their respective designees, acting jointly after con-
sultation with the Minority Leader of the House and the Minority
Leader of the Senate, shall notify the Members of the House and
the Senate, respectively, to reassemble at such place and time
as they may designate whenever, in their opinion, the public interest
shall warrant it.

Agreed to July 28, 2005.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-09-27T10:49:24-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




