AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

CONCURRENT RESOLUTIONS—DEC. 17, 2007 121 STAT. 2645
ENROLLMENT CORRECTIONS—H.R. 1585 Dec. 14, 2007

[H. Con. Res. 269]
Resolved by the House of Representatives (the Senate concur-
ring), That, in the enrollment of the bill H.R. 1585, the Clerk
of the House of Representatives shall make the following correc-
tions:
(1) In the table in section 2201(a)—
(A) strike “Alaska” in the State column and insert
“Alabama”; and
(B) in the item relating to Naval Station, Bremerton,
Washington, strike “$119,760,000” in the amount column
and insert “$190,960,000”.

(2) In section 2204(b)—
(A) in paragraph (2), strike “Hawaii” and insert
“Hawaii)”;

(B) in paragraph (3), strike “Guam” and insert

“Guam)”; and

(C) add at the end the following new paragraph:

“(4) $71,200,000 (the balance of the amount authorized
under section 2201(a) for a nuclear aircraft carrier maintenance
pier at Naval Station Bremerton, Washington).”.

(3) In section 2703—

(A) insert “(a) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—

” before “Funds”;

(B) in paragraph (4), strike “$2,107,148,000” and insert

“$2,241,062,000”; and

(C) add at the end the following new subsection:
“(b) GENERAL REDUCTION.—The amount otherwise authorized to
be appropriated by subsection (a) is reduced by $133,914,000.”.

Agreed to December 14, 2007.

UNIVERSITY OF HAWAII—100TH ANNIVERSARY Dec. 17, 2007
[H. Con. Res. 264]

Whereas while the natural beauty of Hawaii is recognized through-

out the world, the real beauty of the island state lies in its

people, who, through their personal relationships with their fami-

lies, friends, and neighbors, and through their dedicated efforts

to serve the needs of the people of Hawaii, have created prosperity

and high standards of living;

Whereas the institution which would eventually become the Univer-
sity of Hawaii at Manoa finds its humble beginnings in 1907
in a small house on Young Street as the College of Agriculture
and Mechanic Arts;

Whereas with the establishment of the Colleges of Arts and Sciences
in 1920, the university became a full-fledged university, known
today as the University of Hawaii at Manoa;

Whereas in 1941, the Hawaii Vocational School was founded near
downtown Hilo, becoming a University branch campus in 1951
and the University of Hawaii at Hilo in 1970;

Whereas in 1964, the University of Hawaii community colleges
system was established with the creation of four community
college campuses: Honolulu; Kapiolani; Kauai; and Maui, with



		Superintendent of Documents
	2012-09-27T10:55:32-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




