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ACL-O-R-0004 

I. INTRODUCTION 

A. Background 

The United States lmmigration and Naturalization Service (INS), an agency of the 
United States Department of Justice (DOJ), is responsible for the detention of aliens 
in removal proceedings and aliens subject to a final order of removal. The INS 
houses those detainees in SeNiee Processing Centers (SPC) and a variety of 
federal, state, local and private facilities. 

B. Detention and Removal Mission Statement 

The mission of the Detention and Removal Program (D & R) is the planning, 
management, and direction of a broad program relating to the supervision, 
detention, and deportation of aliens who are in the United States Illegally. These 
activities are chiefly concerned with the enforcement of departure from the United 
States of aliens who have entered Illegally or have become removable after 
admission. 

In implementing Its miSSion. D & R is responsible for carrying out all orders for the 
required departure of aliens handed down In removable proceedings, or prior 
thereto, and arranging for detention of aliens when such becomes necessary. 

D & R maintains and operates the Deportable Allen Control System (OACS) to 
process cases located by the Border Patrol, Investigations and Inspections activities. 
The D&R activities are directly reliant upon these other activities. Investigative and 
Border Patrol activities locate aliens who are denied entry or further stay in the 
United States and whose departure must be enforced. 

c. Scope of Work 

The Contractor shall furnish unarmed security guard seNices, including management 
personnel, supervision, manpower, relief guards, uniforms, equipment, and supplies 
to provide guard services seven (7) days a week, twenty-four (24) hours per day at the 
El Centro Service Processing Center, EI Centro, CA. The Contractor shall provide a 
minimum of one Custody Officer of the same gender as the detainees per shift. 

The Contractor shall provide its own equipment, supplies and forms that pertain to 
Its own business enterprise. Business activities may include replacing equipment 
and manpower to ensure full seNlce at the INS location. In addition, the Contractor 
will provide full and complete cooperation in any request or investigation conducted 
by the Government. 

The Contractor is to include in the man-hour rate at Schedule B all costs for services 
INS requires in the contract. 
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