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DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Fish and Wildlife Service

50 CFR Part17
RIN lOIS-ACOI

Endangered and Threatened Wildlife
and Plants; Determination of Critical
Habitat for the Mojave Population of
the Desert Tortoise

AGENCY: FishandWildlife Service,
Interior.
ACTiON: Final rule.

SUMMARY: TheU.S. FishandWildlife
Service(Service)designatescritical
habitatfor theMojavepopulationof the
deserttortoise(Gopherusagassizii),a
speciesfederallylistedasthreatened
underthe Endangered SpeciesAct of
1973.asamended (Act). Located
primarily on Federalland,andto a
lesserextenton State,private,and
Tribal lands,thiscritical habitat
designationprovidesadditional
protectionundersection7 of theAct
with regardto activitiesthat require
Federalagencyaction.As requiredby
section4 of theAct, the Service
consideredeconomicandotherrelevant
impactspriorto makinga final decision
on thesizeandconfigurationofcritical
habitat.
EFFECTiVE DATE: March10, 1994.

ADDRESSES: The complete
administrativerecordfor this rule is on
file at theU.S.FishandWildlife
Service,NevadaFieldOffice, Ecological
Services,4600KietzkeLane,Building
C—125, Reno,Nevada89502.The
completefile for this rulewill be
availablefor public inspection,by
appointment,during normalbusiness
hoursattheaboveaddress.
FOR FURThER INFORMATION CONTACT: Mr.
DavidL Harlow, FieldSupervisor,
NevadaFieldOffice. U.S. Fishand
Wildlife Service,at the aboveaddress
(702/784—5227).

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATiON:

Background

TheMojavepopulationof the desert
tortoise,referredto hereinasdesert
tortoiseor tortoise,is oneof three
speciesin thegenusGopherusfoundin
theUnited States.TheBerlandier’s
tortoise(C. berlandieri) is foundin
northeasternMexico and southern
Texas.Thegophertortoise(C.
polyphemus)is foundin thehot,humid
portionsof thesoutheasternUnited
States.C. agassiziiis relativelylarge,
with adultsmeasuringup to 15 inches
in shelllength,andinhabitstheMojave,
Colorado,andSonoranDesertsin the

southwesternUnited Statesand -

adjacentMexico. Thespeciesis divided
intotheSonoranandMojave
populations.TheSonoranpopulation
occurssouthandeastof theColorado
River in ArizonaandMexico, andthe
Mojavepopulationoccupiesthose
portionsof theMojaveandColorado
Desertsnorthandwestof theColorado
River in southwesternUtah,
northwesternArizona.southernNevada,
andsouthernCalifornia.

Fora thoroughdiscussionof the
ecologyand life historyof thedesert
tortoise,seetheDraft RecoveryPlanfor
theDesertTortoise(MojavePopulation)
(U.S. FishandWildlife Service1993)
andtheApril 2, 1990, final rule listing
thedeserttortoiseasa threatened
species(55FR 12178).Thesedocuments
incorporatethemajorityof current
biological information on thedesert
tortoiseusedto developthis rule.

TheEndangeredSpeciesAct of 1973,
asamended(Act) requiresthe Serviceto
designatecritical habitatto the
maximumextentprudentand
determinableconcurrentlywith listing a
speciesasendangeredor threatened.On
August20.1980,theServicelistedthe
BeaverDamSlopepopulationof the
deserttortoise(Gopherusagassizil),in
southwesternUtah,asa threatened
speciesanddesignated35 squaremiles
of criticalhabitat (45 FR 55654).On
September14, 1984,the Service
receiveda petition from the
EnvironmentalDefenseFund,Natural
ResourcesDefenseCouncil, and
Defendersof Wildlife to list the desert
tortoiseinArizona,California.and
Nevadaasendangered.In September
1985,theServicedeterminedthat the
listing waswarrantedbutprecludedby
otherlisting actionsof higherpriority
underauthorityof section4(b)(3)(iii) of
theAct (50 FR 49868).The Service
madeannualfindingsof warrantedbut
precludedfrom 1985through1989
underSection4(b)(3)(C) of theAct. On
May 31, 1989,thesamethree
environmentalorganizationsprovided
substantialnewinformationand
petitionedtheServiceto list the desert
tortoiseasendangeredthroughoutits
rangein theUnited Statesunderthe
expeditedemergencyprovisionsof the
Act. As a resultof thenewinformation,
on August4. 1989(54FR 32326),the
ServicelistedtheMojavepopulation,
excludingthe BeaverDam Slope
populationin Utah,asendangeredby
emergencyrule. TheMojavepopulation
wasdesignatedin theemergencyruleas
all tortoisesoccurringnorth andwestof
theColoradoRiver, inCalifornia,
Nevada,Arizona.andUtah.TheMojave
populationwasthenproposedunder
normal listing procedureson October

13, 1989 (54 FR42270),andlistedas
threatenedon April 2, 1990(55 FR
12178).

Section4(a)(3)of theAct requires
that,to themaximumextentprudent
anddeterminable,the Secretary
designatecritical habitatat thetimea
speciesis determinedto beendangered
or threatened,TheService’sregulations
(50 CFR424.12(a)(2))statethatcritical
habitat is notdeterminableif
informationsufficientto perform
requiredanalysesof the impactsof the
designationis lackingor if thebiological
needsof thespeciesarenot sufficiently
well knownto permit identificationof
anareaascritical habitat.At thetimeof
listing, the Servicefoundthat critical
habitatwasnotdeterminablebecause
the specificsizeandspatial
configurationof essentialhabitats,as
well asvital linkagesconnectingareas
necessaryfor ensuringtheconservation
of theMojavedesertpopulation
throughoutits range,could notbe
determinedwithout further information.

On January8, 1993,severalplaintiffs
filed a motionin DesertTortoiseet al.
v. Lujan etci., Civ. No. 93—0114MHP
(N.D. Cal.)seekingto stopthetransfer
of public landto theStateof California
forconstructionof a low-levelnuclear
wastedisposalfacility in WardValley
locatedin southernCalifornia.The
plaintiffs contendedthat theService
violatedtheAct by failing to designate
critical habitat for thedeserttortoise
andsoughtan injunctionprohibiting
transferof thesite until critical habitat
wasdesignatedanda new section7
biological opinionthataddressedthe
effectsof thetransferon critical habitat
wascompleted.

On January27, 1993.theNatural
ResourcesDefenseCouncilandother
environmentalgroupssuedto compel
designationof critical habitatfor the
Mojavepopulationof thedeserttortoise,
allegingthat the Secretaryhadfailedto
meetthe designationdeadlineunder
section4(b)(6)(C)(ii) of theAct (Natural
ResourcesDefenseCouncilv, Babbitt,
No. C—93—0301MHP (N.D. Cal.)).
Plaintiffs furtherrequestedthecourtto
prohibit theServicefrom issuingany
furtherbiological opinionsfor the
tortoiseundersection7 of theAct until
critical habitatwasdesignated.

On May 21, 1993,theplaintiffs, in
bothcases,andthe Secretaryagreedon
a stipulationrequiringthe defendantsto
proposecritical habitat for thedesert
tortoiseby August1, 1993,and to
designatecritical habitatby December1,
1993. On July 30, 1993. theplaintiffs
agreedto anextensionof these
deadlinesto August29, 1993,for a
proposalandDecember15. 1993,for a
final decision.
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OnMarch 30,1993,theService
announcedtheavailability of theDraft
RecoveryPlanfor the DesertTortoise
(Mojave Population) (Draft Recovery
Plan) (58FR 16691).The Draft Recovery
Plan(U.S. Fish andWildlife Service
1993)dividestherangeof the desert
tortoise into6 recoveryunitsand
recommendsestablishmentof 14 Desert
Wildlife ManagementAreas(DWMAs)
within therecoveryunits.Within each
DWMA, the Draft RecoveryPlan
recommendsspecificmanagement
actionsto effectrecoveryof desert
tortoises.Thepublic commentperiod
on the Draft RecoveryPlanclosedon
June30, 1993.

The Servicepublisheda proposed
rule to designatecritical habitat for the
deserttortoiseon August30, 1993 (58
FR45748).TheAugust30 proposal
requestedcommentsfrom all interested
partieson the proposeddetermination
andassociatedeconomicanalysis.This
final rulerepresentstheService’sfinal
decisionon this issue.However,the
Servicemayrevisecritical habitatin the
futureif landmanagementplans,
recoveryplans,orotherconservation
strategiesthat are developedand fully
implementedreducetheneedfor the
additionalprotectionprovidedby
criticalhabitatdesignation.
Definition of Critical Habitat

Critical habitatis definedin section
3(5)(A) of theAct as“(i) the specific
areaswithin the geographicarea
occupiedby thespecies * * on which
are foundthosephysicalor biological
features(I) essentialto the conservation
of the speciesand (II) which may
requirespecialmanagement
considerationsorprotection;and(ii)
specificareasoutsidethegeographical
areaoccupiedby thespeciesatthe time
it is listed* * * upona determination
a * a thatsuchareasareessentialfor
theconservationof thespecies.”The
term“conservation,”asdefinedin
section3(3)of theAct, means“~ * * to
useand theuseofall methodsand
procedureswhich arenecessaryto bring
anendangeredspeciesor threatened
speciestothe pointat which the
measuresprovidedpursuantto thisAct
areno longernecessary,”i.e.,the
speciesis recoveredandremovedfrom
the list of endangeredandthreatened
species.Section3 furtherstatesthat in
mostcasestheentirerangeof a species
shouldnotbeencompassedwithin
critical habitat.

Rolein SpeciesConservation
Useof theterm “conservation”in the

definition of critical habitat Indicates
that its designationshouldidentify
landsthat maybe neededfor a species’

eventualrecoveryanddelisting.
However,whencritical habitat is
designatedatthetimea speciesislisted.
the Servicefrequentlydoesnot know
exactlywhatmaybeneededfor
recovery.In this regard,critical habitat
servesto preserveoptions for a species’
eventual recovery.

The designationof critical habitatwill
not, in itself, lead to recovery,but is one
of severalmeasuresavailableto
contributetoa species’conservation.
Critical habitathelpsfocusconservation
activitiesby identifyingareasthat
containessentialhabitat features
(primaryconstituentelements)
regardlessof whetheror not they are
currentlyoccupiedby the listed species,
thusalertingthepublic to the
importanceof anareain the
conservationof a listedspecies.Critical
habitatalsoidentifiesareasthatmay
requirespecialmanagementor
protection.Critical habitat receives
protectionundersection7 of theAct
with regardto actionscarriedout,
funded,orauthorizedby a Federal
agency.Theaddedprotectionof these
areasmayshortenthetimeneededto
achieverecovery.Asidefrom the added
protectionprovidedundersection7, the
Act doesnotprovide other forms of
protectionto landsdesignatedascritical
habitat.

Designatingcritical habitatdoesnot
createa managementplan,it doesnot
establishnumericalpopulationgoals,it
doesnot prescribespecificmanagement
actions(insideor outsideof critical
habitat),nordoesit havea directeffect
on areasnot designatedas critical
habitat,Specificmanagement
recommendationsfor critical habitatare
moreappropriatelyaddressedin
recoveryplans,managementplans,and
section7 consultations.

In additionto consideringbiological
informationin designatingcritical
habitat,the Servicealsoconsiders
economicandotherrelevantimpactsof
designatingcritical habitat.The Service
mayexcludeareasfrom critical habitat
whenthe benefitsof suchexclusion
outweighthebenefitsof includingthe
areaswithin critical habitat,provided
that theexclusionwill notresult in the
extinctionof a species.

Critical habitat identifies specific
areasessentialto theconservationof a
species.Areasnotcurrentlycontaining
all of theessentialfeatures,butwith the
capability to do soIn thefuture,may
alsobeessentialfor the long-term
recoveryof thespecies,particularlyin
certainportionsof its range,andmaybe
designatedascritical habitat,However,
notall areascontainingthefeaturesof
a listedspecies’habitatarenecessarily
essentialto thespecies’recovery.Areas

notindudedincritical habitatthat
containoneor moreof theessential
elementsarestill importantto aspecies’
conservationandmaybeaddressed
underotherfacetsof theAct andother
conservationlawsandregulations.All
designatedareasmay alsobeof
considerablevaluein maintaining
ecosystemintegrityandsupporting
otherspecies,althoughthat is nota
considerationin designatingcritical
habitat,

Theprocessof designatingcritical
habitatfor thedeserttortoiseconsisted
of threestepsthatareexplainedin this
document.Thefirst stepwasto
determinetheelementsandareas
essentialto thetortoise’sconservation.
Thisstepwascompletedin theproposal
processand is summarizedin the
sectionsof thisrule entitled“Primary
ConstituentElements”and “Criteria for
Identifying Critical Habitat.”The
secondstepwasto determinethe
potentialcostsof theproposed
designation,which wascompletedin
the proposalprocessand is summarized
in this rule in the sectionentitled
“EconomicSummaryof theAugust30
Proposal.”The final stepwasto
considerwhetheranyareasshouldbe
excludedbaseduponeconomicand
otherrelevantimpactsandto determine
the costsassociatedwith the final
designation.Thisstepis discussedin
thesectionsentitled“Summaryof the
ExclusionProcess,”“Effectsof the
Designation,”“EconomicImpactsof the
Final Designation,”and“Available
ConservationMeasures.”A sectionon
biodiversity is includedto highlight the
importanceof that issueand its
relationshipto thedeserttortoise.

Designationof critical habitatmaybe
reevaluatedandrevised,atanytime,
whennewinformationindicatesthat
changesarewarranted.TheServicemay
revisecritical habitatif land
managementplans,recoveryplans,or
otherconservationstrategiesare
developedand fully implemented,
reducingtheneedfor theadditional
protectionprovidedby critical habitat
designation.Forexample.afterthe
DesertTortoiseRecoveryPlanis
finalized,landmanagementagencies
mayimplementincreasedprotectionfor
the deserttortoise.If protection
measuresareimplemented,theService
mayreviseits critical habitat
designationin the future. With
increasedprotection,somecomponents
of environmentalvariability threatening
tortoisepopulations(or contributingto
thevarianceof growth rates)may be
reduced,thuslesseningtheneedfor
largepopulations.In suchan event,a
population viability analysis—
consideringpopulationtrendsbasedon
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thevace’oTpopulation’grow*h
rates—’mightsuggestthatsma’ller,
viable,populationswouldrequire-less
habitatfi:e..smallerDbWalAs’andless
need~forcrfticalhat-designation).
Therefore,critical habitat-urtfts-(CHtJs)
couldbe decreasedinsi~increased-in
size.oreliminstedbasedonthangesin
certain environmental -variables,in land
status, ar’tortoisepopulations.

PrimaryConstituentElements

In determiningtheareasto designate
ascriticaliaabitat, the-Serviceconsiders
thosephysicalandbiological attributes
thatare.essentialto a species’
conservation.In addition,theAct
stipulatesthat the areas-containing these
elementsmayrequirespecial
managementconsiderationsor
protection.-Suchphysicalandbiological
features,asstatedin50CFR424.12,
include,but are not limited to, the
following:

(1) Spacefor individualend
populationgrowth,andfor-normal
behavior;

(2) Food, water,or othernutritional or
physiologicalrequirements;

(3) Cover or shelter,
(4) Sitesfor breeding, reproduction,

rearingofdffspring;and
(5) Generally,habitatsthatare

protectedfrom disturbanceor are
representativeofthe historic
geographicalandecological
distributionsof a species.

The Serviceis requiredto basecritical
habitat designationsupon the-best

scientific andcommercialdataavailable
(50CFR424.12)..Indesignatingcritical
habitat for the-deserttortoise, the
Servicehasreviewed-itsoverall
approachto theconservation~ofthe
deserttortoise undertakensinceits
emergencylisting in 1989.-In addition,
the Servicereviewedall available
information that pertains to habitat
requirementsof.thisspecies,including
materialreceivedduringthepublic
comment period from Stateand Federal
agencies,otherentities,andmembersof
the public.

Inherentdiffictilties in-designating
critical habitat for wide-ranging
threatened species,such asthe desert
tortoise, makeitunlikely- that allhábltat
within the-rangeofthe specieswould be
included inthedesignation.Infact,
section3(5)(C)oT the Actstetesthat, in
mostcases,critical habitat—should-not
encompassthe entire’r’ange’of the
species.Based-uponthe-parameters
discussedbelow,theService
determinedtheappropriatenessof
including specificareas.

HabitatChamcteristics

The Servicehasdeterminedahatthe
pliysic.áland-biologicafliabitolfeatures
(referred toestheprinrary.constituent
elements)~thatsupport-nesting.foraging,
shaltering,.dispersal..andlnrgeneflow
areessentialto the conser:vationof the
desert~tortoise.These-elementswere
determinedkernstudieson desert
tortoisehabitat,prerenGes-.(e~g,,hahitat
structureanduse,’foragerequirements)
throughout-therange-ofthespecies(U;S.
Fish and Wildlife Service1993).Desert
tortoisehabitatconsistsof the following
primaryconstituent elements:Sufficient
spaceto support-viable-populations
within ‘eachof thesi~xrecoveryunits
and provide for-movements,di~persal.
andgeneflow;sufficient-quantityand
qualityof foragespeciesandthe proper
soil conditions-toprovide-for~the-growth
of suchspecies;suitable-substrates-for
burrowing, nesting,andoverwintering;
burrows,calichecaves,andother
sheltersites;szxfficient~vsgetationfor
shelterfrom1emperature~extremes-and
predators;~andhabitatprotectedfrom
disturbanceandhuman-caused
mortality.

-Designatedcritical habitatbr the
desert-tortoiseancompassesportionsof
theMojave andColoradoDesertsthat
contain the primary constituent
elementsandfocusesonareasthat are
essentialto thespecies’recovery.The
CHU boundaries-arebasedon proposed
DWMAs in the DraRRecoveryPlan.
Becausethe-boundaries-weredrawn-to
conformwith acceptedprinciplesof
conservationbiology(US.Fish-and
Wildlife Service1993),the areasmay
containboth “suitable”-and
“unsuitable” habitat. Theterra
“suitable” generaflyrofers-tohabitat
that providestheconstituentOlements
of nesting.sheltering, foraging,
dispersal,and/orgene-flow.
Ecologiccil-Considerations

The-range-of theMojave population of
the deserttortoiseincludesportionsof
the MojaveDesertandthe COlorado
Desertdivision of the -SonoranDesert
(COloradoDesert)and spansportionsof
four States.The-MojaveDesert-islocated
in southernCalifornia, southern
Nevada,-northwesternArizona,and
southwesternUtah.It is-bordered-onthe
northbytheGreatBasinDesert,on the
west-bythe-SierraNevadeand
Tehacihapiranges,onthe-south-by the
San GabrielandSanBernardino
Mountains andthe ColoradoDesert,and
on the eastby-the-Grand WashCliffs
and Huelapai Mountainsof Arizona.
Thisareaincludespartsof lnyo, Kern,
Los Angeles,Sen Bernardino.and
RiversideCounties-in-Calffomia;-the

northwesternpartof-MOhaveCounty in
Arizoria;’Clai’kCounty,arid-thesouthern
parts-of-Esmeralda.Nye, and Lincoln
Counties~in~evada;andpart~df
WashingtonCountyin-Utah.The
ColoradoDesert-is located-southof the
Mojave Desert,easto’f’Cdlifornia’s
Peninsular-Ranges,and-west-of the
COloradoRivet Thisarea-includes
Imperial-Countyandpartsof’San
Bernardinoand~RiversideCounties,
California.

The desert-tortoiseis most-commonly
found within the desertscrub vegetation
type,primerilyin-creosotebush-scrub
vegetation,butalso-in succulentscrub,
cheesebushscrub,blackbushscrub,
hopsagescrub,-shadscalescrub,
microphyll-woodland,andMojave
saltbush-allscalescrub.-Within-the
desert-microphyll woodland, the-desert
tortoise occursin bluepalo verde-
ironwood-smoketreewoodland.The
deserttortoisealsooccursin scrub-
steppevegetationtypesof the desertand
semidesertgrasslandcomplex-(U.S.Fish
andWildlife Service1993).

Within thesevegetationtypes,desert
tortoisespotentially-can-surviveand
reproducewheretheirbasichabitat
requirementsaremet. These
requirementsincludeasufficient
amountand quality of-forage species;
sheltersitesfor-protection -from
predatorsand environmental extremes;
suitable-substrates-forburrowing,
nesting, andoverwintering;-various
plantsfor shelter; and-adequateareafor
movement,dispersal,andgeneflow.
Throughout mostof-the-Mojave -Region,
tortoises-occur-mostcommonlyon
gently sloping terrain with soilsranging
from sand to-sandy-graveland-with
scattered-shrubs,andwhere there-is
abundant inter-shrub spacefor growth
ofherbaceous-plants.Throughout-their
range,however,tortoisescan be found
in steeper,rockierareas(U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service1993).

The sizeof deserttortoise home
rangesvarieswith respectto location
and year. Femaleshave long-term home
rangesthat are approximately-half-that
of the average-male,-whichrange’from
10 to 80hectaresfBerry1986).

Although deserttortoisepopulations
arenotgenerally.knownto inhabit
elevations-much-above4,000-feet,
tortoiseburrowshave-beenlocatedat
4,800feetin-the ProvidenceandClark
Mountains of the easternMojave
(Luckenbach1982;~W.Ywniko, —pers.
comm., 1992).Reliable sourceshave
recorded deserttortoisesat -7.300 feet-in
DeathValley National Monument,
Callfornia(Lucikenbach1992);-at 4,800
feetin theGoodspringsMountains (R
Marlow,-pers.comm) andtheSpring
Range,1~levada(C. Stevenson,’pers.
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comm.);at 5,000 feetin theEast
PahranagatRange,Nevada(C.
Stevenson,pers.comm.);andat 5,200
feet on the NevadaTest Site (B. Burge,
pers.comm.).In addition,numerous
anecdotalreportsplacedesert tortoises
ashigh as 7,000feet on Mount
Charleston, Nevada,and in the Clark
Mountains, California. Fossilremains
from the Pleistoceneto late Holocene
(12,000to 1,000yearsbeforepresent)
indicatethepreferredhabitatof the
deserttortoiseincludedelevationsfar
exceedingthoseof today,perhapsin
responseto aridclimatic episodesthat
occurred during this epoch(Morafka
and Brussard, in prep.; Schneiderand
Everson 1989).This fossilevidence
indicates that the speciesmay have
spent less than10 percent of its
taxonomic life span in the contemporary
warm creosotebushdesert,the
remainder having beenspentin more
mesic,equable,and productive climates
andecosystems.Thisimpliesthat
contemporarytortoise populations in
most of the Mojave region are likely to
be vulnerableto adverseclimatic
conditions andto regional climate
change(Morafkaand Brussard, in
prep.).

Throughout its geographic
distribution,the deserttortoise exhibits
traitvariations in behavior,ecology,
genetics,morphology, andphysiology
(Weinstein andBerry 1988,Germano
1989,Lambat al. 1989,Brussard 1992,
BrussardandBritten 1992).For
example,three basicshell shapes
(phenotypes)are indicative of desert
tortoisepopulationsindistinct
geographicareaswithin theirrange
(Weinsteinand Berry1988).Tortoises
occurringin California andsouthern
Nevadaexhibita boxlike, high-domed
shell phenotype;BeaverDarnSlope
tortoiseshave a short plastron
(underside) anda low-domedshell
phenotype;andSonoranDeserttortoises
have a pear-shaped,low-domed shell
phenotype (Weinstein andBerry 1988).
Furthermore, Identification of the three
phenotypesparallelsresults of
mitochondrialDNA (mtDNA) studies
that also“type” deserttortoisesinto the
samethreepopulationsbasedon
genetics(Lambat a]. 1989).It is because
of suchvariability that six recovery
units representingsix distinct
population segmentsof the Mojave
population have been proposedin the
Draft RecoveryPlan (U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service 1993).These
population segmentsshould not be
confusedwith subspeciesorrecognized
populations,e.g.,the Mojave or Sonoran
populations. The six recovery units
within the rangeof the desert tortoise,

as’outlinedin the Draft RecoveryPlan,
mirror thebiotic andabioticvariability
foundin thedesert tortoise habitat.

Theobjectiveof the Draft Recovery
Planis the recovery and delisting of the
Mojave populationof the deserttortoise.
Deserttortoisepopulationshave
declinedsubstantially throughout the
Mojave Region in the last 2 decades,
primarily due to habitat loss.These
populations grow slowly, and
significant improvement in the status of
the Mojave population will be a very
long process,measuredin decadesor
centuriesin most parts of the Mojave
Region. Nevertheless,delisting of the
desert tortoise maybe consideredif the
followingcriteriaaremet:

(1) As determinedby a scientifically
crediblemonitoring plan, the
population within a recovery unit
exhibits a statistically significant
upward trend toward target density or
remainsstationaryat targetdensityfor
at least12 years(one-halfof a desert
tortoisegeneration);

(2) Enoughhabitatis protectedwithin
arecoveryunit andlorthe habitatand
desert tortoise populations aremanaged
intensivelyenough to ensurelong-term
population viability;

(3) Regulatory mechanismsor land
managementcommitmentshave been
implementedthat provide for adequate
long-term protection of desert tortoises
andtheir habitat; and

(4) The population is unlikely to need
protection under the Act in the
foreseeablefuture.

Even thoughthe Draft RecoveryPlan
hasnot beenapproved, it representsthe
bestavailablebiological information on
the conditionsneededto bring the
Mojave population of the desert tortoise
to the point where listing under the Act
is no longernecessary(i.e., recovery).

TheServicewould delisttheMojave
populationof thedeserttortoise if the
delistingcriteriaweremetbecause
protection under the Act would be
unnecessary.With the delisting criteria
met, the desert tortoise andits habitat
would continue to be protectedunder
other regulatory mechanismsoutlined
in a final recovery plan. Upon delisting,
the interim protection affordedby the
Act in the designationof critical habitat
would beeliminated.
ManagementConsiderations

Currentand historic desert tortoise
habitat loss,deterioration, and
fragmentation is largely attributable to
urban development,military operations,
and multiple-usesof public land, such
asoff-highway vehicle(OHV) activities
and livestock grazing.Historically,
habitat reduction and fragmentation
have not beenuniform throughout the

desert tortoise’srange,but have been
concentratedaround populatedareas,
suchasMohave,Boron, Kramer
Junction, Barstow,Victorville, Apple
Valley, LucerneValley, andTwentynine
Palms, California. Similar patterns are
evident nearLas Vegas,Laughlin,and
Mesquite,Nevada;and St. George,Utah.

Human“predation” (takingdesert -

tortoises outof their natural populations
eitherby death(accidentalor
intentional) or by removal) isalso a
major factor in the declineof the desert
tortoise. People illegally collect desert
tortoises for pets, food,and commercial
trade. Someimmigrants to the United
Stateshave collected deserttortoises for
medicinal or other cultural purposes
(U.S. Fish andWildlife Service1993).

Deserttortoises are oftenstruckand
killed by vehicleson roadsand
highways,andmortality of desert
tortoisesdue to gunshotand OHV
activities is commonin many parts of
the Mojave Region,particularly near
citiesandtowns. In the westernMojave
Desertof California, 14.3percent of the
carcassesfound on 11 permanentstudy
plots showedevidenceof gunshot
(Sieverset a]. 1988).At one plot, 28
percent of the carcasseshad evidenceof
gunshot.Lossof tortoises from
vandalismhasalsobeenreportedin
northwesternArizona.Approximately
10 percent of shell remains from a
tortoise study plot near Littlefield,
Arizona,hadgunshotwounds.

OHV usein the desert hasincreased
andproliferated sincethe 1960s(U.S.
Fish andWildlife Service1993).As of
1980,OHV activitiesaffected
approximately 25 percent of all desert
tortoise habitat in California, aswell as
substantial portions in southernNevada
(U.S. Fish andWildlife Service1993).
Negativeeffectsrangefrom minor
habitat alteration to total denudation of
extensiveareas. While directeffects are
immediate(mortality from crushing,
collection,andvandalism),indirect
effectscanbeeitherimmediate
(disruption of soil integrity; degradation
of annualplants, grasses,andperennial
plants;andlordestruction of desert
tortoise sheltersites),delayed,andior
cumulative (soil lossdue to erosion, soil
compaction and its effectson annual
andperennial plants, water pollution.
and litter and refuse)(Biosystems
Analysis1991).

Impacts of roadswithin deserttortoise
habitat extendsignificantly beyond the -

tracksthatare created.Fewer tortoise
signsare found closerto roads,
suggestingreducedpopulations
(Nicholson 1978).Thus, well-usedOHV
areasoften result in depressedtortoise
populationsextendingbeyondthe
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immediate-boundariesof the-directly
disturbed-habitat.

Theuseof OHVs eppears-toheve-a
significant-effectontortoise-abundance
and-distribution.Although-road
closureshavebeen-im~lementedin
someareas,liiegal -venicleroute
proliferationhasalsooccurredin:man-y
areasand-canresultin a significant
cumulative lossof habitat. Humen
accessincreasesthe incidenceof
tortoisemortalityfrom collecting,
gunshot,and crushingby vehicles.

Domesticlivestock grazinghas
occurredindeserttortoisehabitat-since
the mid-1800s,withan increasein
intensity-neartheturn of thecenturyto
the midil93Os (BiosystemsAnalysis
1991).Possibledirect impactsfrom
grazingincludetramplingof both
tortoisesandsheltersites;possible
indirectimpactsincludelossof plant
cover,reductionin numberof suitable
sheltersites,changein-vegetation.
compaction of soils,reduced water
infiltration, erosion,inhibition-of
nitrogenfixation in desertplants, and
theprovision of a favorable seed-bedfar
exotic annualvegetation(U.S. Fish and
Wildlife Service1991, 1993). Habitat
destructionanddegradationare
especiallyevident in livestockwatering,
bedding,loading,andunloadingareas
(U.S. FishandWildlife Ser,-ice1991).

The degreeandnatureof impacts
from livestockgrazingare dependent
upon the local ecosystem,grazing
history, seasonsof use,stockingrates.
annualrainfall, anddensityof the
tortoisepopulation.Desertecosystems
requiredecadesto recoverfrom
disturbances,anddesert tortoise
populations are incapable of rapid
growth,evenunderoptimum
conditions.

Deserttortoises,particdiarly
hatchlingsandjuveniles,arepreyed
upon by severalnative speciesof
mammals,reptiles,andbirds.Domestic
and feral dogsare-anew sourceof
mortality.

Commonraven (Corvuscorax)
populationsin the southwesterndeserts
have increasedsignificantly since the
1940s,presumablyin-responseto
expandinghumanuseof the desert.
Sewageponds, landfills (authorized and
unauthorized),powerlines,roads,and
otherhumanusesheveincreased
available foraging,roosting,and-nesting
opportunities for ravens. Over the lest
20 years.raven populations in the
westernMojaveDeserthave increased
1528percentbetween1968and 1988
(about15 percent-peryear)and
increasedin theCOlorado-Sonoran
Deserts474 percent(over 9 percentper
year).While notall ravens’mayinclude
tortoisesassignificantcomponent-sof

their diets,-thesebirds arehighly
opportunisticin theirfeedinEpatterns
and concentrateon-easilyavailable
seasonal-food sources,-suchas‘juvenile
tortoises.Increasedmortality -of-young
desert’turtoises(in part-dueto predation
by ravens),combinedwith-drasticafly
loweredsurvivorshipof addits,is likely
responsiblebr observedcatastrophic
population declines(U.S. Fishand
Wildlife Service1993).

An-upperrespiratorytract-disease
(URTD) is prevalentin captivedesert
tortoisesandhasbeenidentified in wild
desert-tortoises-inmany localitiesin the
westernMojaveDesertandin limited
localitieselsewhere.IJRTD appearsto
bespreadingendmayhavebeen
introducedto wild populations-through
illegal releasesof diseasedcaptive
deserttortoises.Wild-deserttortoises
with signsof URTDarecommonly
foundnear-citiesand towns-with
concentrationsof captivedesert
tortoises (Marlow andBrussard1993).
Diseaseh-ascontributedto high
mortality-rates in the western Mojave
Desertin the last 4 years(Avery and
Berry 1990,U.S. FishandWildlife
Service1993).

Recentstudieshave demonstrated
Mycoplasmaagassiziisp. nov.as-the
causativeagentofURTD. Predisposing
factors, suchashabitatdegradation,
poornutrition,anddrought,arelikely
involved in increasingthe susceptibility
of individual animals to disease
(Jacobsoneta]. 1991).Droughtand
concomitantpoor nutritionhave the
potentialto compromisedeserttortoises
immunologicallyand,therefore,make
them-moresusceptibleto URTD and
otherdiseases.Controllinghuman-
relatedspreadof URTD, improving
habitatconditions,andmonitoring
healthstatusof deserttortoise
populationsare-someof themore
important -managementtools-that canbe
used in controlling URTD in wild
populationsof-the deserttortoise(U.S.
FishandWildlife Service1993).

A shell diseasehasalso beenobserved
in the Chuckwalla Bench population in
the easternColoradoDesert(Jacobsonet
a!. 1992).A variety of mineralandmetal
deficiencies,aswell asvarious
toxicants,areknown to cause
integumentarypathologyin mammals,
suggestingdiseaseor toxicosis-may be
responsiblebortheseobservedshell
abnormalities(U.S.Fish andWildlife
Service 1993). Another shell-disease.
osteopenia,occursin~deserttortoise
populations onthe-BeaverDamSlope
andmay berelated to poornutrition
(Jarchow andMay 1989).

CriteriaforidentIfyingCritical Habitat
The maintenanceof stable,self-

sustaining,and-well-tlistributed
populations-ofdeserttortoises
throughouttheir rangeis dependent
upon habitat quality andits-ability to
supportviablepopuhitions.The
biologicalandphysicalcharacteristics
of the desertecosystemthatsupport
nesting, foraging. sheltering,dispersal,
and/or geneflow areessentialfor this
purpose.The Servicebasedits
designationof critical habitat on those
areasrecommendedfor recovery of the
deserttortoisein the Draft Recovery
Plan.

TheDraft RecoveryPlanproposes14
DWMAs within 6 recoveryunitswithin
the range Of the deserttortoise.The
Service usedthe DWMAs asthebasis
for CHUsbecause:

(1) The Draft Recove~rPlan’s
conservationstrategy is basedupon the
bestavailable information on desert
tortoises gathered and analyzedoverthe
past20 years;

(2) The Draft RecoveryPlan represents
an in-depthanalysisof theconservation
needsof thedeserttortoise;

(3) The areasrecommendedas
DWMAs were proposed by experts
familiar with thespeciesandits habitat
basedontheprinciplesof conservation
biology; and

(4)Useofthe D~%’MAsis consistent
withtheService’sotherconservation
efforts (e.g.,it hasbeenthe focusin
section 7 consultationsand
conservationplanning).

The Service’sidentificationof areas
consistentwith the proposedDWMAs
containing the primaryconstituent
elementsdescribed abovewasbasedon
the sevenprinciples of conservation
biologyused in the Draft RecoveryPlan:

(1) Reservesshouldbewell-
distributed acrossa species’native
range;

(2) Reservesshould contain large
blocks of habitat with largepopulations
of the target species;

(3) Blocks of habitat should:beclose
together;

(4)Reservesshouldcontain
contiguousratherthanfragmented
habitat;

(5) Habitat patches-should-contain
minimal edgeto arearatios;

(6) Blocksshouldbeinterconnected
by corridors or linkagescontaining
protected,preferredhabitat for-the-target
species;and

(7) Blocks ofbabitat~should-be
roadlessor -otherwiseinaccessibleto
humans.

Criticalhahitatis basedon the
frameworkof the-DraftRecovery-Plan.
Should-a final approved-recovery plan
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varysignificantlyfrom thedraft,or
significantlychangetheassumptions
underlyingthiscriticalhth~tat
designation,thentheServicemay
reevaluateiaiticai habitatbeundaiies.

DifferencesFrom the Draft Recovery
Plan

Designationofcritical habitatdoes
notaccomplishthesamegoalsorhave
asdramaticaneffectupontortoise
conservationasdoesarecoveryplan
becausecritical habitatdoesnotapply
a managementprescriptionto
designatedareas.Becausecritical
habitatdesignationis nota management
plan, therewasnot a limitation on the
sizeof the areasdesignated,although
the designationis consistentwith
recommendationsoftheDraft Recovery
Plan.
Adjustmentsto LegallyDescribed
Boundaries

Theregulationsrequire that the
Servicedefine”4 •by specificlimits
usingreferencepointsandlinesas
foundon standardtopographicmaps”
thoseareasdesignatedascritical habitat
(50 CFR424.12(c)).After selecting
DWMAs asthestartingpoint,the
Servicemadeseveraltypesof
adjustments.To facilitatelegal
definition, CHU boundarieswere
adjustedto adjacentsectionlines,
dependingupon theamountandquality
of habitat within the adjacentsections.
The boundariesgenerallyfollow the
4,100-footelevationcontourline, except
whereexcludinghigherelevations
would compromisereservedesign
principles. When adjacentto citiesor
towns,criticalhabitat boundarieswere
drawnon½or 1/4 sectionlinesto
removeasmuchunsuitablehabitatas
possible.

In addition to adjustingDWMA
boundariesto meetthe requirementsto
define critical habitatboundaries,the
Servicemadeotherchanges.Some
CHUs representmore precisely
describeddeserttortoisehabitatwithin
the DWMA boundary,andthus,
encompassa muchsmallerarea.For
example,portions ofDWMAs werenot
includedin critical habitatif unsuitable
habitatwasidentifiableon available
mapsandtheexclusionwould not affect
the sizeor configuration
recommendationsmadeby thetheft
RecoveryPlan. Conversely,somecritical
habitat boundaries were expanded
beyondDWMA boundariesto include
additionalhabitatbasedon information
madeavailabletothe Serviceduring
preparationof the rule.

In addressingtheabovefactors,the
Serviceconsideredexistingsuitable
habitatanddeserttortoisepopulations

that irere notincludedin existing
DWMAs andareaswhereadditional
protectionshouldbe consideredto
reducetherisk to recovery.When
indudingotherareas,theService
consideredfactorssimilartothose
ouffinedin theDraft RecoveryPlanon
contiguity,shape,habitatquality,and
spacing.Areaswith anicimal
fragmentationwereselectedoverareas
with moreextensivefragmentation.

Thedeserttortoiserequireslarge,
contiguousareasof habitat to meet its
life requisites.Humanactivitieshave
reduced-muchof thehabitat in some
areasto small, fragment-ed,andisolated
areasthat arenot expectedto support
viable populationsovertime.In some
cases,thoseareasweredesignatedas
criticalhabitat whentheywere needed
to promotefuturedevelopment-of large
contiguoushabitat areas in the future.

LandsOutsideof Criticoi Habitat

Not all suitabledesert tortoisehabitat
was includedin critical habitat. The
Servicerecognizesthe importanceof all
lands,butdid notincorporateall habitat
within CHUs, primarily becausemostof
theselandsdidnotmeet-thedesignation
criteria{i.e.,werenot associatedwith an
arearecommendedin the Draft
RecoveryPlan,weretoosmallto
maintain a stable population of tortoises
overtime, or werealreadyprotected).
This doesnotmeanthat landsoutside
of critical habitat donot play an
important role in thetortoise’s
conservation.Theselandsare also
important to providing nesting, foraging.
sheltering,dispersal,and/or geneflow
habitat for tortoises.

PreviouslyProtectedAreas

The currentmanagementpoliciesof
the DesertNational Wildlife Range,
JoshuaTree NationalMonument,and
theDesertTortoiseNaturalAreaprovide
adequateprotection againstpotential
habitat-altering activitiesbecausethey
areprimarily managedasnatural
ecosystems.The Serviceconsidered
their relative contribution to the
tortoise’s conservationbut did not
include them in critical habitat because
of their currentclassification.These
landsareessentialto the conservationof
the speciesbecausethey provide
important links andcontain largeareas
of contiguoushabitat.

By themselves,thesepreviously
protectedareasarenot largeenoughand
donotcontainsufficientpopulation
levelsto support viable populations.
Theywill beconsideredhideveloping
recoveryareasfor thedeserttortoise,in
addition to surroundingpublic lands
with deserttortoise habitat.

ManagementPlanning

The Service’sintent in designating
critical habitat for the desert tortoise is
to provide protection for habitat that
containsconstituent habitat elementsin
sufficient quantities andquality to
maintain a stable population of desert
tortoisesthroughouttheirrange.The
emphasisfor futuremanagementwill be
on maintaining or developinghabitat
that hasthe characteristicsof suitable
tortoise habitat andto avoid or reduce
the adverseeffectsof current
managementpractices.

Althoughcritical habitat is nota
managementplan,the areasselectedfor
inclusionplay a role in maintaining a
stable andwell-distributed population
of tortoises. Identificationof theseareas
concluded the first step in the
designationof criticalhabitatfor the
desert tortoise.

EconomicSummaryof August30
Proposal

Section4tb){2) of theAct requiresthe
Serviceto designatecritical habitat on
the basisof the bestscientificdata
available and to considerthe economic
effectsandotherrelevantimpactsof
specifyinganyparticularareaascritical
habitat. The Secretary mayexclude
areasfrom critical habitatif he
determinesthat thebenefitsof such
exclusionsoutweighthe benefitsof
specifyingsuchareasaspart~f the
critical habitat, unlesshe determines,
basedonthe bestscientific-and
commercialdata available,that the
failure to designatesuchareas-ascritical
habitat will result in the extinctionof
thespeciesconcerned.

The economiceffectsof designating
critical habitat for thedeserttortoiseare
the incrementalimpactsoverandabove
thoseimpactsthatoccurredasa result
of implementation of management
plans, suchasFederal land management
plans, habitat conservationplansthat
havealreadybeenimplemented,and
previousevents.includingthelisting of
thedesert tortoise.Theeconomic
analysisconsidersthecritical habitat
impacts to be thoseincrementalimpacts
that are expectedasa resultof the
critical habitat.

TheServiceanalyzedthe economic
effectsof the August30. 1993,proposal
to designatecritical habitat
(Schambergereta).1993).A summary
of that analysiswas -providedin the
proposedrule(58 FR 45748).That
analysisexaminedbow designationof
critical habitat wasexpectedtoaffect
theuseof Federallandsor Stateor
privateactivitieswith someFederal
involvement,andtheeconomiccostsor
benefits that would ensuein the four-



5826 Federal Register / Vol. 59, No. 26 / Tuesday, February 8, 1994 / Rules and Regulations

Statearea.Thesewere the regional
economiceffectsof thedesignationthat
v,’ere over andabovethoseexpectedto
result from previous actions, including
the listing of the deserttortoise as
threatened.The economicanalysis
assumedthosevaluesthat were in place
prior to critical habitat (e.g.,final
Bureau of Land Management(BLM)
plans,section 7 jeopardy standard,the
Clark County short-term habitat
conservationplan, andsection9
prohibitions) asthe baselinefor this
analysis. As a result, critical habitat
effects were thoseincremental impacts
that would occur solelyas a result of the
critical habitat proposal aboveand
beyond the effects of theseother actions.

The critical habitat coversa broad
geographicareain four Statesand
includes Federal, State,private, and
Tribal lands. Becausethe designation
affectsonly Federalagencyactions
under section 7, it is assumedthat any
ensuingeconomicimpactsof the
designationwould occuronly on
Federallandsor on non-Federallands
where there is Federal involvement. The
Service concludedthat the impacts on
Federal landswould be largely limited
to livestockgrazing, mining, and
recreational activitiesthat may affect
tortoise habitat.

As a resultof that analysis, the
Serviceconcludedthat the August 30
proposalwould affect51 Federal
grazingpermits that provide about
59,500animal unit months (AUMs). The
maximumpotential reduction in
regionalemployment wasestimatedto
be 425 jobs (340directjobs; 85 indirect
jobs). The profitability of ranchesin the
sevencountiesis estimatedto fall by
$4,470,000due to critical habitat
designation. That is the estimated
permanent decreasein ranch profits,
capitalized at 10 percentfor a 50-year
period, in accordancewith the
methodology of Riceet ci. (1978).
Reducedgrazingfeesin the seven-
county region from Federalallotments
wasestimatedto total $170,000
annually. Half of this amount($85,000)
was returned to the grazingprograms for
range improvements, the U.S.Treasury
received a maximum37.5percent
($63,750)of the fees,and local
governmentsreceiveda minimum of
12.5percent ($21,250). The effectof
reducedgrazing on Federal land is
expectedto varyamongcounties.The
designationof critical habitat is not
expectedto havesignificant economic
effectswithin anyof the sevencounties.

Designationof criticalhabitat will not
affect ongoingmining operations,asthe
grounddisturbancestypical of mineral
extraction make mine sites unsuitable
for tortoise habitat. Expansion of

existingmines or developmentof new
mineswill requiresection7
consultation with the Service.Most of
the CHUsinclude surfaceareason
which mining claimshavebeenfiled.
The economicimpactof critical habitat
designationcannotbe determinedat the
presenttimedueto the uncertaintyof
economicallyfeasiblemineral
extraction.Mining claims allow
explorationbut do notassureexerciseof
exploration rights, nor do theyensure
economicprofits to the owner.

The Servicewasunable to identify
significanteconomicimpacts to
recreationactivities dueto critical
habitat designation.

Conservationof the deserttortoise
andits habitat through designationof
critical habitat will result in a wide
range of benefits,including recreation
values,watershedprotection,and
others,aswell asthe values that society
placesonconservationof the tortoise
andits ecosystem.However, it wasnot
possibleto placedollar estimateson
thesevalues.

As a result of thisanalysis,the
Serviceconcludedthat the economic
impacts that would be incurredfrom
critical habitat designationwould not be
significant to either the regional (seven-
county) or national economy.The
Service did not recommendany
exclusionsbasedon economiceffects.

Summaryof theExclusionProcess
To determine whether or not to

exclude areasfrom the designationof
critical habitat pursuant to section
4(b)(2) of theAct requires
determinations of:

(1) The benefitsof excluding an area
ascritical habitat,

(2)Thebenefitsof including an area,
and

(3) The effectsof exclusionson the
probability of speciesextinction.

This processconsistsof estimating the
benefitsof retaining or excluding cHUs,
weighing thosebenefits,and
determining if exclusionof an areaor
areaswill lead to the extinctionofthe
species.If the exclusionof an areaor
areasfrom critical habitat will result in
eventual speciesextinction, thenthe
exclusionwould be prohibited under
the Act.

Extinction
Critical habitatconsistsof areaswith

habitatcharacteristicsthat are essential
to the conservationof a listed species.
However,the exclusionprocessfocuses
upon a threshold for speciesextinction.
Conservation(recovery)and extinction
areseparatestandards.Recoveryand
extinction are at oppositeendsof a
continuum, with the likelihood of a

species’continued survival increasing
the closerthe speciesis to therecovery
end of the continuum. It may be more
difficult to predictthe point at which
extinctionwould be inevitable than to
determinewhere recoverymay occur.

Each suchdetermination may be
different for differentspeciesandmay
varyover the rangeof a species.It may
be related to a number of factors, such
asthe number of individuals, amount of
habitat, condition of the habitat, and
reproductivesuccess.Extinction of a
wide-rangingspeciessuchasthedesert
tortoise would most likely occurasa
result of increasedfragmentationof its
habitat (affectingquality).Portionsof
thespecies’rangewould nolonger
support tortoises beforethe species
would becomeextinct.Cumulatively,
reductions in rangewould inevitably
lead to the species’extinction. The
focus of the analysiswas on those
factors that pertain to theseissuesand
included considerationof the condition
andlocationof habitat.

Criteria andDecision

The Act specifically prohibits
consideration of economiceffectswhen
listing speciesas threatened or
endangered,but requires an analysisof
the economicandother relevant
impacts of designatingcritical habitat.
Therefore, economiccostsandbenefits
of critical habitat designationwere
definedasthe economiceffectsthat:

(1) Exceedthosethat resulted from
listing thedeserttortoiseasa threatened
speciesin April 1990; and

(2) Are abovethoseeconomiceffects
resulting from the previous
implementation of tortoise protection
measuresby Federal land management
agencies.

in evaluating the designationof
criticalhabitatto determinewhetheror
not to exclude areasbecauseof concerns
overeconomiceffects,the Serviceused
the following process:

(1) Areaswereidentifiedthatare
essentialto the conservationof the
speciesbaseduponthecriteria
describedin thisdocument; and

(2) An economicanalysiswas
conductedto ascertainthe anticipated
economicconsequencesof designating
areasascritical habitat, usingthe
countyasthe basiclevel of economic
analysis.

Exclusion -

After consideringthe economicand
other factors that maybe pertinentto
any decisionto excludeareasfrom
designationascritical habitat, the
Secretaryof the Interiorhasdetermined
that no exclusionsareappropriate.
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Bindogir.vJModificationsto&wnedanes
Basedoninformationreceiveddining

the proposalprocess,the Servicerefined
boundariesof sixCHUs basedon
biological informationthattheseareas
did notcontain constituent elements
and thatdeletionof themfrom critical
habitat would notcompromisethe
function of the OIU or its reserve
design.Theseareasincluded:

(1) Approximately 2,000acresinthe
ChocolateMountainsin theChuckwalla
CHU in California;

(2) Approximately 20.800acres
within andadjacent to theTwentynine
PalmsMarineCorpsBasein theOrd-
RodinanCHU in California.

(3) Approximately13.200acresin the
NewberryMountainsin thePiute-
Eldorado CHU in Nevada;

(4) Approximately76.300acreson
both the northern andsouthernborders
of theMormonMesaCHU in Nevada;

(5) Approximately 80.757acres
around theColdButte-PakoonCHU in
Arizona; and -

(6)Approximately8.100acresnorth
of St. George,Utah in theUpper Virgin
River CHU in Utah.

In addition, basedon informationand
a request submitted from theBLM, the
Serviceincludedanadditional1,920
acreson the southernborderof the
BeaverDarnSlopeCHTJ in Arizona.This
requestwasaccommodatedbecause:

(1) It wasmadeby the landownerand
will not affect otherlandowners.

~2)The proposedinclusion
constitutesaninsignificantchangefrom
theproposedrule, and

(3) It will allow the BLM’s desert
tortoise study plots to be included
within deserttortoisehabitat.

Effectsof theDesignation
The proposedrule for the designation

of critical habitat for the desert tortoise
publishedonAugust30.1993.
identified12 areasencompassinga total
of approximately 6.6 million acres.it

includedei8htcHustotaling4.8
million -acresinC*lifOUUa, fourOllis
totaling13 million acresinNevada,two
CHIJstotalling 137,200acresin Utah,
andtwo CHUstotaling417,400acresin
Arizona.ThisincludedS million acres
of BLM land,247,400acresofmilitary
lands,151,200acresof NationalPark
Serviceland,170,1(X)acresof State
lands,1,600acresofTribal lands.
1,079,500acresof privatelands,and
100acresofForestServiceland.A
summaryof changesin acreagebetween
the proposedruleandthis final ruleare
provided in Table 1.

TABLE I .—S~3MMARYOF CHANGES IN
ACREAGE BETWEEN PROPOSAL AND
FINAL CWT1CAL HABITAT DESIGNA-
TIONS

[Figuresare rounded to the nearesthundred]

Total acre
reduction

Reductions:
Bureauof 1.and Management...
Military ~_...

National ParkService..._.....

State ~

Tribal..... -

Increases:
P,vate..._~.____.__....__.

204,900
5,200
3.900
4,000

0

118,900

lAn increasein private land weagere-
sultedfrom a correctionin landstatusin -the
Mormon Mesa CHU; the BLU land sold to
Aerojet-GeneraiCorporation through the Ne-
vada-Florida Land ExchangeAct ci 1988was
originally shownasBIN.

TotalAiresIncludedin Critical Habitat

As a result of boundaryrevisions
basedon new biological information.
theServiceis designatingapproximately
199,100acreslessthan proposedin the
August 30, 1993 proposal.The final rule
for the designationof critical habitatfor
the desert tortoise identifies 12 areas,
encompassinga total of 8.4million
acres.TheServicehasdesignatedeight
unitstotaling4.8million acresin

California,four unitstotaling1.2
million acresinNevada,twounits
totaling129,100acresin Utah, andtwo
units totaling338,700acresin Arizona.
Thefinal designationencompasses
approximately4,790,500acresof BLM
land,242,200acresof military land,
147,200acresof National Park Service
land.166.200acresofStateland. 1,600
acresøfTriballand,and1,098,400acres
of privateland (seeTables2 and3J.
ThreeCHU boundariesspanmorethan
oneState—Piute-Eldorado(California
andNevada),Gold Butte-Pakoon
(NevadaandArizona),andBeaverDam
Slope(Nevada.Arizona.andUtah).

TA&E 2.—APPRoxIMATE ACREAGE OF
CRITICAL HABITAT DESIGNATED FOR
THE DESERT TORTOISE BY CRITICAL
HABiTAT UNIT

[Figuresareroundedto the nearesthundred)

Critical habitatunit Acres

California: -

Chemehuevi 937,400
Chuckwalla...... .. 1.020,600
Fremont-Kramer... -

lvanpahValley —

518,000
632.400

Pinto Mountains ......... 171,700
Ord-Rodman -..._ .... 253,200
Piute-Eldorado 453,800
Supenor-Cronese 766,900

Nevada: -

BeaverDam Slope ..... 87,400
Gold Butte-Pakoon ........... ... 192,300
Mormon Mesa ...... 427,900
Piute-Eldorado 516,800

Utah:
BeaverDarnSlope 74,500
UpperVirgin River -. 54,600

Arizona:
BeaverDam Slope 42,700
Gold Butte-Pakoon .. 296,000

TABLE 3.—APPROX?MATE ACREAGE OF CRJTICAL HABITAT DESIGNATED FOR THE DESERT TORToiSE BY -LANDOWNERSHIP
[Figures are roundedto the nearesthundred]

California Nevada Utah Arizona Total

Bureauof Land Management -

Military ..... . .. ..

National ParkService ....

State .~......

Tnbal ~

Frivate ............_...... ...... ..... ~

Total ...............~. -.......... .. ....__......__....

Numberof critical habitatunits ....

3,327,400
242,200

0
132,900

0
1,051,500

1,085,000
0

103,600
0
0

35,800

89,400
0
0

27,600
1,600

10,800

288.800
0

43,600
5,700

.0
600

4,790,600
242,200
147.200
166,200

1,600
1,098,400

4,754,000
8

1,224,400
4

129,100
2

338,700
2

6.446,200
12

‘Two areaso~laptwo States,oneareaoverlapsthreeStates.
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Developedareas,suchastowns,
airports,and roads,anddry lakes,active
mining operations,andwater bodies
will not be affectedby the designation
becausetheywill nevercontain primary
constituent elements.To the extent
possible,theseareasweredeleted from
critical habitat. If theseareaswere found
alongthe peripheryof CHUs,
boundarieswereredrawnto physically
excludethem from the final maps. This
wasnotpossiblefor areasimbedded
within individualunits. Acreagetotals
wereadjustedwhere possibleto reflect
their exclusion.

The majorityof deserttortoises and
suitable deserttortoisehabitat(i.e., for
nesting,sheltering, foraging, dispersal,
and geneflow) are found onBLM land.
Much of the private land included in
the critical habitat boundariesresults
from checkerboardlandownershi
patternsalongrailroads.The fina
designationof critical habitat includes
theareasthat contain the bestremaining
desert tortoisehabitat.
Economic Impactsof the Final
Designation

Theeconomicanalysis(Schamberger
etal. 1993)provides the Service’s

conclusions on thepotential impactsof
theareasselectedfor final designation
ascritical habitat. This analysisserved
asa decision document in evaluating
economicconsequencesof theaction
leadingto the final decision to designate
critical habitat.

Consistent with the requirements of
section4 ofthe Act, the economic
analysisreviewsthe final economic
impactof designatingcritical habitat.
Only these incrementalcostsand
benefitsof designationmay be
considered in determining whether to
excludelands from designation.The
economicanalysisexaminedthe costs
andbenefits of precluding or limiting
specific land useswithin portionsof
critical habitatbeyondthoserestrictions
thathavealreadybeenimplemented
either for the benefit of the desert
tortoise throughthe listing processor
for someother reason.Incremental
analysiswas the appropriatemethodto
usebecausethe designationof critical
habitatis theonly action for which the
Servicenowhasdecisionauthority.The
economiccostsof listing the species
havealreadybeenincurred,and the
economiceffectsof actionstakenby
otherFederal or State agenciesare
outsidethe purviewof the Service.The
analysiswascast in a “with” critical
habitat versusa “without” critical
habitat framework andmeasuresthenet
changein variouscategoriesof benefits
andcostswhenthe critical habitat
designationwas imposedon the existing

baseline.Theanalysisevaluated
national economic,or efficiency, costs
andbenefitsthatreflectchangesin
socialwelfare.The standardmeasureof
thosecostsandbenefits is economic
surplusin the form of economicrents
andconsumersurplus.

The costsof designatinganareaas
critical habitatarethenet economic
costsof precluding or restrictingcertain
land usesover the period of analysis.
Costsaremeasuredasthe difference
betweentheresource’svaluein its
economicallybestusewithout critical -

habitat and its nextbestuse
(opportunitycost)whenthat useis
precludedor restrictedby critical
habitat. Economiceffectsincludea
mixtureof efficiencyandequity
measures.

The economicefficiencyeffects of
designationinclude thosethat result in
changesin socialwelfare. Regional
economicimpactsoften represent
transfersamongpeople,groups, andior
geographicregions.Forsimplicity,
economicefficiencyeffectsarereferred
to asbenefits andcosts,and
distributionaleffectsarecited as
economicimpacts. National economic
efficiencyeffectsmay include,but are
not restrictedto:

(1) Net changein aggregatevalue of
capital (e.g.,lands)due to critical
habitat designation.

(2) Wageearnings foregone from a
significant numberof employees
permanently displacedthrough critical
habitat designation;

(3) Opportunity costsof foregone or
precludedeconomicactivities (e.g.,
curtailed or terminated land
development);and

(4) Benefitsof retaining geneticand
biological diversity throughspecific
speciesprotection measures.

Regional(distributional)economic
impacts may include:

(1) Changesin specificcounty tax
revenuesdue to changesin land use
(e.g.,developedreal estateversus raw,
undevelopedland); and

(2) Regionalsocialcostsand benefits
from factors suchas transient
unemployment, job training, or
redistributionof existing job-mix
categories(e.g..transitioning from
underemployment in seasonalrange or
mine work to full employment in other
sectors).

The analysisof effectsofcritical
habitat designationcombinesnational
economicefficiencyeffectsand regional
(distributional) impacts.Theseinclude
effects on the net returnsof local ranch
operations,foregonegrazing fees,
compensationto allotteesfor permanent
improvements to land leased from the
Federal governmentfor grazing, changes

in total employment,andthe portion of
grazing feesthat would be sharedwith
local governments.

Theseconsequencesare presentedin
the context of size,relativeto the value
added,of the sevencountiesin which
the grazingimpactswould ife realized.
Theseconsequencesillustratethe
relative magnitudeof critical habitat
designationeconomiceffects.

EconomicBaseline
In assessingthe economicimpacts of

the critical habitat designation,the
Servicehas usedthe expectedeconomic
situation consistentwith restrictions
that were in place at the time of
proposingcritical habitat. The principal
land userestrictions that were already
in placewere theBLM’s Management
FrameworkPlans,Resource
ManagementPlans,andhabitat
managementplans; the BLM’s
RangewidePlan; National Park Service
land managementpolicies; military
land-usepolicies; andthe listing of the
desert tortoise as a threatened species
(section7 jeopardystandardandsection
9 prohibitions).

Industry (e.g..grazing and mining)
and recreation-relatedeffects of
designatingcritical habitat concern
primarily those activities not already
affectedby earlier decisions.For all
activities,however,it is the incremental
effectsof avoiding adversemodification
of critical habitat and the marginal
changesin ensuingbenefitsand costs
that arethe appropriate measuresof the
effects ofcritical habitat designation.

Deserttortoise managementand
curtailment of the activities that
threatened the speciesbegan whenthe
BLM establishedthe Desert Tortoise
Preservein 1973 in the Western Mojave
Desert (Brussard etal. 1993). The
preservewasexpandedand formally
designateda ResearchNatural Areaand
an Areaof Critical Environmental
Concern (ACEC) by 1980 (U.S.Fish and
Wildlife Service1993).In 1988, the
BLM published its RangewidePlan
(Spanget al. 1988).which is basedon
the categorizationof desert tortoise
habitat on BLM land into three
categoriesbasedon:

(1) Importanceof the habitat to
maintaining viable populations,

(2) Resolvability of conflicts,
(3) Deserttortoise density, and
(4) Deserttortoise population status

(stable, increasing,or decreasing).
Category1 landsare the most

important to desert tortoises for survival
and recovery,andcategory3 lands are
the least important. The Rangewide Plan
providesmanagementgoalsand
objectives for each form of authorized
multiple usewithin eachof the
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andmanagedby
- ~livestock grazing,
~1activities. All CHTJs

ule minimally include
~ndJor2 habitats.

~nally, ~HUs containsome
Legory3 habitats,uncategorized

habitats, and landsmanagedby other
Federal entities.

TheServicehasassumedadistinction
existsbetweenthe effects of listing the
speciesand the incremental effectsof
designatingcritical habitat. The
differencesbetweenlisting and
designationof critical habitat vary
within eachCHU basedon existing
management.

Eight CHUs, or portions thereof, are
designatedin California (Chemehuevi,
Chuckwalla, Pinto Mountain, Piute-
Eldorado(includesFennerDWMA),
lvanpah,Fremont-Kramer,Ord-Rodman,
andSuperior-Cronese).All aremanaged
primarily by the BLM accordingto
guidanceprovided in the California
DesertConservationArea Plan of 1980,
asamended(DesertPlan), and the 1992
California StatewideDesertTortoise
ManagementPolicy (Tortoise
ManagementPolicy).The DesertPlan
definesfour classesof land usewith
differing managementgoalsand
prescriptions. Classesinclude
controlleduse(wildernessandareas
recommendedfor wilderness), limited
use,moderateuse,and intensive use
(vehicle travel restrictions rangefrom
designatedroutes only in limited-use
areasto no vehicular restrictions in
intensive useareas).The Tortoise
Management Policy designatesthree
categoriesof desert tortoise habitat in
which varying levelsof protection are
afforded to the desert tortoise andits
habitat.Additional management
guidance is provided in livestock
allotment managementplans(AMPs),
habitat managementplans (HMPs) for
deserttortoisesand other wildlife
species.the EastMojaveNationalScenic
Area Plan, andmanagementplansfor
specificA~ECs.

The West Mojave Coordinated
ManagementPlanandthe Eastern
ColoradoDesertHMP areBLM
managementplanscurrentlyin
prepara~onthat will have an important
effecton deserttortoisemanagementin
California.TheWest Mojave
Coordinated ManagementPlan will be
the basisfor a programmatic section 7
consultation for BLM activities in the
westernMojaveDesert and may serveas
a basisfor habitat conservationplan(s)
for local governmentsin the section
10(a)(1)(B)permitprocess.The Eastern
Colorado DesertH~v1Pwill addressall
BLM activities in the Chuckwalla Bench

areaandwill provide a framework for
a programmaticsection7 consultation.

The Chuckwalla CHU is managedby
theBLM and the Navy (Chocolate
Mountains Aerial Gunnery Range).Parts
of the Superior-CroneseCHU are
managedby the Army (National
TrainingCenterat Ft. Irwin) andthe
Navy (China LakeNaval Air Weapons
Station). The Fremont-KramerCHU
includesa portion of Edwards Air Force
Base.Portionsof thePiute-Eldoradoand
IvanpahCHUs in California are within
the boundariesof theEastMojave
National ScenicArea, which affords
specialprotection to the area’snatural,
scenic,andother values(BLM 1980).

Severalprogrammaticandother
biological opinions have resulted in
additionalregulationof activities within
desert tortoise habitat in California.
Biological opinionshave limited grazing
of sheepto category3 habitats.
Programmatic consultationshavebeen
completed for land useplansat the
NavalAir WeaponsStationand the
Rand-Fremont Valley areas.The Service
has also completeda biological opinion
concerningtheon-going missionfor the
Army’s NationalTrainingCenterat Ft.
Irwin. Programmaticconsultationsalso
exist that define standardterms and
conditions for mining operations
disturbing lessthan 10 acres, for non-
competitivevehicleraces,suchaspoker
runs, which occuron designatedroutes
in somedesert tortoise areas,and for the
four OHV managementareaswithin the
westernMojaveDesert.

The Serviceand the BLM are
currently developinga programmatic
approach to long-term pipeline
maintenance.The Serviceandthe Navy
are also informally consultingon a
programmaticconsultationfor training
activities at the Marine Corps Air
Ground Combat Center (MCAGCC) and
within theChocolateMountainsAerial
Gunnery Range.

In Nevada,the majority ofthe desert
tortoise habitat is managedby the BLM
under the Clark County Management
FrameworkPlan.The StatelineResource
Area of the Las VegasDistrict has
prepared a draft ResourceManagement
Planthatproposesdesignation of
ACECs for deserttortoises; however,
this document has not yetbeen
finalized. Livestock grazing in Nevadais
restricted to the period ofJune 15 to
March 1, in accordancewith the BLM’s
proposed livestock grazing program and
the Service’sbiologicalopinion that
analyzedthat proposal.However,as of
this date, the BLM’s decisionto
implement this seasonalrestriction has
beenstayedby an Administrative Law
Judge. Although Interior Boardof Land
Appeals Administrative Law Judges

have theauthority to review land use
decisionsmadeby Interior agencies,
they lack jurisdiction neededto review
biologicalopinionsissuedby the
Service.In southern Clark County,
portions of the Piute-Eldorado CHU are
alsomanagedby the National Park
Service(Lake MeadNational Recreation
Area).

In 1991, the Piute-Eldorado Valley
wasestablishedas a Tortoise
ManagementArea (TMA), as mitigation
for the incidentaltakeof deserttortoises
in the LasVegasValley, pursuant to
section10(a)(1)(B) ofthe Act.TheShort-
Term Habitat ConservationPlan for the
DesertTortoise in the LasVegasValley,
Clark County, Nevada(Regional
Environmental Consultants 1991),
which describedthis mitigation,
provides land-usecontrol measuresfor
this area. Thesemeasuresinclude
prohibition of competitiveand
commercialevents,exceptin some
portions of Eldorado Valley, placing
livestock grazing areasinto non-use
status, and designationof roads and
trails.

The majority of the lands within the
Cold Butte-Pakoonand BeaverDam
Slope CHUs in Arizona are managedby
the BLM undertheArizona Strip
ManagementPlan. This plan designates
the BeaverDam SlopeACEC and
includesmanagementprescriptions
designedto minimize impacts to desert
tortoisesand their habitat. All desert
tortoise habitat in Arizona is within the
areamanagedby the Virgin River-
PakoonBasinHabitatManagementPlan,
a cooperativeSikesAct document
written by the BLM and the Arizona
Gameand Fish Department.
Additionally, deserttortoisehabitat
occurring in wilderness areasin Arizona
is managed accordingto the Paiute-
BeaverDamWildernessManagement
Plan and theGrandWashCliffs
WildernessManagementPlan. Grazing
is administered accordingto the Cedar
Wash,Highway, BeaverDarnSlope,
Mormon Well, Littlefield Community,
MesquiteCommunity,Mosby-Nay,
PakoonSprings,Pakoon,Cottonwood,
Mud andCane,andTassiAllotment
ManagementPlans.In additionto
prescriptionsset forth in theseallotment
managementplans.a Servicebiological
opinion on livestockgrazinglimited
grazingto the period from June1 to
March 15,

In Utah, theBeaverDam SlopeCHU
is primarily managedby theBLM. In the
CastleCliffs allotment, a 3,040-acre
exclosureencompassingthehistoric
Woodbury-Hardystudyareaandseveral
other important tortoise sheltersite
areaswasestablishedto serveas a
naturalstudyareato enhancethe
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tortoisepopulation.However,the
exciosurewasnevercompletely
operationa’or effectiveineliminating
grazingin the area. TheBLM reduced
the exciosureto 1,500acres,where
grazingwascompletelyexcluded.The
Dixie ResourceArea developeda
resourcemanagementplan for thearea.
butthefinal documentwasrejected and
theprocesshasbeenreinitiated.~
Currently.BLM managementin the
BeaverDarnSlopeCMLI is conducted
undertheHabitat ManagementPlan
adoptedin 1980.

The BLM andthe Stateof Utaharethe
primary managersof the UpperVirgin
River CHU. Smalleramountsof habitat
areownedby privateentitiesandby the
PaiuteIndians.Severalconsultations
havebeeninitiatedregardinggrazing.
housingdevelopment,horseracing.and
energypipelinedevelopments,for
which theServicehasprepareddraft
biologicalopinions.Also,Washington
Countyis pursuingdevelopmentof a
habitat coi~ervationplan for the area
encompassingthe Upper Virgin River
CHU, and theServiceis providing
guidancefor developmentof this plan.
The BLM is pursuing landexchanges
with the Stateof Utah for consolidation
of deserttortoise habitat within the
UpperVirgin River CHU for easeof
managementand for tong-term
conservationof the deserttortoise and
other desertspecies.The BLM’s Dixie
ResourceArea is currently preparing a
ResourceManagementPlanto guide
land managementon BLM lands
encompassingthe Upper Virgin River
CHU. Becauseof the area’ssmallsize
and its proximity tn~an expanding urban

populationcenter,the Servicehas
maintainedthat anysignificantlossesof
habitat within this areawould likely
jeopardizethe continued existenceof
deserttortoiseswithin the Upper Virgin
River Recovery-Unit.

Limitationsof theAnalysis

The regionaleconomyincludesthe
full economicactivity of eachcountyin
whichproposedCHUs arelocated.
CEUsgenerallyarelocatedin remote
areascontainingavery smallfractionof
the humanpopulationandtotal
economicactivity within acounty.The
entirecountyeconomymaynot be
affectedby establishingCHUs; thus,the
sizeof the relevant regional economy
may be overstated.Likewise. important
activitiesin ruralareasmay appearto be
insignificant whencomparedto the
entireregionaleconomy.For example,
mining doesnot appearto be an
importantemployer in theseven
counties,but may contribute to the
economicstability of smallrural
communitiesthat offer few other
employmentopportunities.

CostsofCritical HabitatDesignation

Thefollowing sectionssummarize the
resultsof theService’sanalysisof data
and identify thepotentialcosts
associatedwith thefinal designationof
critical habitat.

RegionalEffectstoLivestockindustry

Public lands in the four Statesin 1990
furnishednearly3,000operatorswith
cattlegrazingpermitsthat provided
more than 3 million AUMs (Table 4).
Thedesignationofcritical habitatmay

partiallyor totally
permitsthatprovided
Nearlyall sheepgrazing‘~

from mostCHUspriortocr~
designation;therefore,sheepgre.
wasnot anactivity examinedin the
economicanalysis.Theeffectof CHU
restrictionson theavailability of Federal
land for grazingvarieswidely among
theStates,from 0.6percentof cattle
AUMs in Nevadato 9.6percentof cattle
ALJMs in California.Acrossthefour
States,CHUsmayaffect 1.7 percentof
cattleandsheepgrazingAUMs tnote
theseeffectsapplyto theStatesrather
thantheseven-countyregion, for which
comparabledatawerenotavailable).

Theeconomicconsequencesof
reducedcattlegrazingon Federallands
to establishtheproposedCHUs includes
threeeffects.Ranchprofits In theseven
countiesareestimatedto fall by
$4,470,000.Thisamountis the
estimatedpermanentdecreasein ranch
profits, capitalizedat 10 percentfor a 50
yearperiod,in accordancewith the
methodologyof Riceatci. (1978). The
Federalgovernmentwill cornpensate
allotteeswith a one-timepayment
estimatedat $376,000for the lossof
permanentimprovementsto grazing
lands(pendingBLM administrative
decisionsof partially affected
allotments).Discontinuinggrazing
leaseswill resultin an annual reduction
of $170,000in collectedgrazingfees
that aredividedamongrange
improvements,theU.S.Treasury,and
local governments.The$170,000is not
a “net” annualreductionin that it does
notinclude thereducedcostsof grazing
programadministration.

TABLE 4.—CATTLE GRAZING AFFECTED BY CRITICAL HABITAT UNITS

State
Grazingper-
~ AUMS ~

CNUs~
AUMS

Statewidea Percent

Arizona ~ .. .. ..... .~

California ~

Nevada ~ ..~.

Utah ..._.~....... .. ~

Total ~ .. .... ..

12
13
17
9

10,580
28,240
11,790
8,870

514,674
295,676

1,821,875
770,143

2.1
9.6
0.6
1.2

51 59,480 3,402,368 1.7

• Includescattleandsheep.
Source:U.S. Bui’eauof Land Management 1991. U.S. Bureauof LandManagement,district offrces.personalcommunications,1993

RegionalEffectsofMining Industry

TheServicedoesnot anticipate
disruptionto current mining operations
from designationof critical habitat. The
Servicenotes that activeor previously
disturbedmine sitestypically do not
providesuitablehabitat fordesert
turtoises. Thoseareas,suchascurrently
operatingmine sites,lacking primary

constituentelementsarenot considered
critical habitat.

Expansionof mining siteson public
landwould requiresection7
consultationto determinewhetherthe
expansionwould likely destroyor
adverselymodify critical habitat. In
caseswherehabitatis likely tobe
adverselymodified,the Servicemay
recommendreasonablearidprudent

alternatives,includingrelocationof
roadsorrecoveryof disturbedmine
sites.Mining claims providerightsto
exploreanddevelopmineraldeposits
but thereis no assurancethat deposits
canbedevelopedeconomically.

Claimsmayneverbedevelopedif
marketconditionsdonot warrantor if
reservesproveinsignificant.The
uncertaintyinvolved in mining claims
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andmineralreservesprecludesaccurate
estimationof economiceffects from
designationof critical habitat.

Reductionsin CountyRevenues
Potential revenueloss to the seven

countiesexaminedin the economic
analysisdueto reduced useof existing
Federal leasesand/orpermits is not
preciselycalculabledue toseveral
factors,including (but not limited to):

(1) The aggregatenumber of leasesfor
grazingthat havebeenissuedunder
section15 of theTaylorGrazingAct of
1934,and from which a 50 percent
revenue-sharingbasisexists,asopposed
to section3 permitsthatcarryabasisof
12.5 percentrevenuesharing with the
affectedcounty;

(2) The final administrative decision
by the BLM to partly or completely
terminate certain permits/leasesfor
grazing predicated upon their location,
existing ingress/egressto other lands,
etc.;and

(3) The percentagemixture of the
abovetwo typesof permits issuedby the
BLM and its attendantfeestructure.

Although it is known that certain
grazingfeesin eachof thecountieswill
bereducedand/orforegone. it is not
possibleto estimateaccuratelythe
dollar impacton thespecificcounty
level until theBLM hasconcludedits
administrative decisionprocess.The
effectto thesevencountiesis expected
to totalapproximately$21,000(the
minimum 12.5 percentlocal shareof the
$170,000grazingfeescollectedon
allotments affectedby critical habitat
designation).

NetEconomicEffectto U.S. Treasury
The U.S. Treasury’sportion of grazing

feescollectedby the BLM in fiscalyear
1989was insufficient to coverthe direct

costsof administeringgrazingprograms
ineightBLM districtsin the hot deserts
of the southwest.According to a 1991
report from the U.S.GeneralAccounting
Office (GAO), the BLM collectedgrazing
feestotaling $3.97million from the
eight BLM desertdistricts.Half of this
amount($1.98million) was returnedto
the grazingprogramsfor range
improvements,theU.S.Treasury
receiveda maximum37.5 percent($1.49
million) of the fees,andlocal
governmentsreceivedaminimum of
12.5 percent($496,000).The U.S.
Treasury thus receivedno more than
$1.49million, 53 percentof the $2.79
million expensefor grazingmanagement
in the eight BLM districts.According to
GAO:

“Critics of livestockgrazingcouldargue
that thecostsof managinglivestockgrazing
* * * exceededthefundsavailable to the
Treasuryto offset thesemanagementcosts.
Proponentscould counter that * * * grazing
feesmore thanoffset~ • a management
costsandprovided funds for Stateand
county projectsaswell as for range
improvements.

Nomatter how costsareanalyzed,the
resourcescurrently being spenton range
management * are insufficient to
performall essentialtasks. Ilinsufficient
funding andstaffinghavebeeninstrumental
in the BLM’s inability to restoredegraded
riparianareas,dealwith overstockedgrazing
allotments, anddetectlivestockgrazing
trespass.Consistent with ourfindings,the
BLM hasconcluded that its currentbudgetis
inadequateto performall neededland
managementtasks throughout the public
lands” (U.S.GeneralAccountingOffice
1991).

Basedon the GAO’s findings,the U.S.
Treasurymayrealizea net financial gain
from discontinuingor reducing Federal
grazingprogramsin thehotdesert
(assumingadministrative costswere

reducedaccordingly andnot
reassigned).Although the potential
savings to the U.S.Treasury wasnot
evaluatedin the Draft Economic
Analysis, it is reasonableto assumethat
discontinuationof grazing on the public
landsdesignatedascritical habitat for
the deserttortoisemay contribute to
thosesavings.

EmploymentEffects

Designationof critical habitat for the
deserttortoise is expectedto result in
the lossof nomorethan 425 jobs in the
seven-countyregion (Table 5). This
estimateincludes 340 jobs lost directly
in ranching and85 jobs lost indirectly
in other industries. This job loss, dueto
the reduction of Federal grazing permits
in CHUs. is an insignificant proportion
of the 1,535,100workers employedin
the sevencountiesin 1990. Specific
employment lossescannot be estimated
for each county until theBLM decides
on how to handlepartially affected
grazingallotments.This total job loss
will be reducedif there is replacement
of affectedpermits by permitson
unaffectedlands (Federal or private) or
if thoselaborers transferto jobs on
unaffectedranch lands.Theseestimated
employment losseswill not be
permanent for most laborers, asit is
anticipatedthatover85 percentwill be
reemployedwithin 2 years.

Critical habitat designationis not
expectedto result in lost jobs in the
mining sectorbecausecurrentmining
operations will not be affectedby
designation.Theimpact on future
employmentin the mining sectorcannot
be calculated reliably becauseof the
uncertaintyof futureexpansionand
developmentof claims.

SummaryofPotential Impacts

The economicconsequencesof
designatingcritical habitat includes
reducedranch profits in the seven
countiesof $4.470,000(this amount is
the estimatedpermanent decreasein
ranch profits capitalized at 10 percent
for a 50-yearperiod, in accordancewith

themethodologyof Riceetal. (1978)).
TheFederalgovernmentwill
compensateallotteeswith aone-time
payment estimatedat $376,000for the
lossof permanentimprovementsto
grazinglands(pendingBLM
administrative decisionsof partially
affected allotments). Discontinuing

grazingwill result in an annual
reduction of $170,000in collected
grazingfeesthat aredivided among
rangeimprovements, the U.S. Treasury,
and local governments.

Critical habitatdesignationshould
result in the loss of fewer than425total
jobs in the sevencounties.These

TABLE 5.—REGIONAL EMPLOYMENT LOSSES FROM CRITICAL HABITAT DESIGNATION COMPARED WiTh TOTAL REGIONAL
EMPLOYMENT

State Direct ranching
employmentloss

Err~loyment
multiplier

Total employ-
mentloss

Total em-
ployees

Arizona
California
Nevada
Utah

Total

35-60
40—80
45-120
40—80

1.21
1.25
1.14
1.44

40—75
50—100
50-135
55—115

36,600
1,031.900

446,800
19,800

160—340 195—425 1,535,100

Source:EstimateddirectemploymentlossesSUppliedby BLM offices in affectedareas.Employmentmultiplier estimatedby IMPLAN.
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include340 direct ranchingjobs and85
indirect jobsin other industries.The
estimatedemploymentlosswill notbe
permanentbecauseover85 percentof
laborerswill bereernployedwithin 2
years.

Benefitsci Critical Habitat Desigiiation
Conservationof the deserttortoise

and its habitatthroughdesignationof
criticalhabitat may resultin a wide
rangeof benefits.Thesebenefitsinclude
preservationof recreationandexistence
valuesthatwiU increasethebenefitsfor
mostaffectedactivities.Scenicbeauty
contributesto thequalityof desert
recreationalexperiences.Many of the
CHUs areadjacentto or within
Wildemnes~.StudyAreasor in
designatedWildernessAreas.Habitat
conservationwill enhancethe
wildernessvaluesof theseadjacentor
contiguousareas.Habitatpreservation
alsoprovidesfor improved water
quality, scenicandair quality,
biological diversity,andother
environmentalbenefits.

Many of the resourceservices
providedby critical habitat are not
marketed.The lackof marketprices
makesIt difficult to value themin dollar
terms, as comparedto somecost
impacts,suchas impactsto livestock
grazing. As a result, thisanalysis
currentlyfocuseson the costimpacts,
primarily related to livestockgrazing.
No comprehensiveestimateof the
benefitsof designatingcritical habitat is
feasiblewith available data, Rather, the
analysisprovides a discussionof the
kinds of benefitsthatareexpectedto
ensue,with empiricaldata and
examplesas available.Existencevalues
representanadditional categoryof non-
usebenefit, albeitone that remains
difficult to measure.Furthermore,
societyplacespreservationbenefitson
endangeredspeciesfor the option of
futurerecreationaluse,with the
knowledgethat thedeserttortoise’s
naturalecosystemexistsandis
protected,andthe satisfactionfrom its
bequestto futuregenerations.Many of
thesebenefitsare expectedto increase
In relativevalueover time. As human
activities continuetoreducedesert
ecosystems,theremainingareaswill
becomelessavailableandmore
valuable.Habitatprotectionfor the
deserttortoiseclearly benefitsother
species,aswell asthehumanuseand
enjoymentof thesespecies.

Dividing thesumof benefitsbetween
thevariouspartsby whichgainsare
generatedis a delicatetask.If
preservationof a speciesis
accomplishedwholly through
designatingcritical habitat, thenthe full
valueof’ benefitscouldbeattributedto

thataction.Typically.however,
preservationisattainedthroughaset of
interactivemanagementactions,eachof
which Isessentialtosuccessandno one
of whichcanbe singledoutasthesole
meansby whicha speciesispreserved
(Walsh1992).Giventheinformationat
hand,andwithout betterunderstanding
the network of consequencesfrom
managementalternatives,it Is not
possibleto disaggregatethesureof
benefits to identify that portion directly
attributableto critical habitat
designation.

BiodiversityBenefits
Designationof critical habitat for the

deserttortoisewill contributeto the
protectionof the biotic diversity ofthe
aridSouthwest.Thetortoise’shabitat
includes componentsthat make it useful
to a varietyof otherdesertspecies
whoseexistenceis enhancedthrough
retentionof originalcharacteristicsof
theirhabitat.Modification or
eliminationof activities thatwould
adverselymodify the naturalecologyof
theregionwill conservethedesert
tortoise,as well asother animal and
plant species.

RecreationalUseBenefits
Direct, non-consumptiverecreational

useof the deserttortoise(I.e., tortoise
watching)occurs,althoughit is limited
by the deserttortoise’sburrowinghabits
andits relatively dispersedpopulations.
Some recreationalactivitiesmaybe
relocatedor restrictedrtue to critical
habitat designation,particularlyOHV
use.

intrinsic Values
Usersandnon-usersof natural

resourcesplacevalueon knowing that
resourceswill exist in the future.
Benefits,which may be substantial,
residein the form of ensuredfuture
existenceandavailability for useand in
the ability to preservethe resourcefor
futuregenerations.By designating
critical habitat for the desert tortoise,
landmanagerswill assuretheretention
of option andbequestvalues,
potentiallyprovidingbenefits far
outsidethe designatedhabitat region.

Long-TeimEffects of Critical Habitat
Designa6on

Theanalysisof economicimpactsof
critical habitatdesignationwasbased
primarily on datathat are both current
andcalculable.Long-termeconomic
impacts.,especiallyona county-level
basis,explicitlyhavenotbeen
addressed.For example,althoughthere
maybe a very low level of temporary
unemployment(lessthan 0.1 percent) of
those laborerson any givenFederal -

aflottee’slease/permit.it is normally
anticipatedthat thoseworkerswill be
reemployedwithin 2 yearsor be shifted
to otherprivateranchlandsin theshort-
term.

A givencounty’sreceiptof grazing
feeswill bebasedon final
administrativedecisionsby the surface
managingagencieson the numberof
issuedjreissuedpermitsandtheir
percentagerevenuesharingbase(cited
In Schambergeret ci. 1993).

Mining may be impacted over the
long term,but only to the extent that
surfaceexpansionis limited explicitly
to avoid adversemodificationto critical
habitat. If suchlimitations do occur,
theywould alsobe predicatedon
governmentaladministrativedecisionat
that time (by the BLM. military, tribal
councils),but reasonablywould be
expectedto be minimal bothin percent
anddollar-level impacts.

Available ConservationMeasures
The purposeof the Act, asstatedin

section2(b),is to provide a meansto
conservetheecosystemsupon which
endangeredandthreatened species
dependand to provide a programfor the
conservationof listed species.Section
2(c)(1)of theAct declaresthat~* * *

all Federaldepartmentsand agencies
shallseekto conserveendangeredand
threatened speciesandshall utilize their
authorities in furtheranceof the
purposesof thisAct.”

The Act mandatesthe conservationof
listedspeciesthroughdifferent
mechanisms,suchas: Section 7
(requiring Federal agenciesto further
the purposesof the Act by carryingout
conservation programsand insuringthat
Federalactionswill not likely
jaopardizethecontinued existenceof
the listed speciesor resultin the
destructionor adversemodification of
critical habitat); section9 (prohibition of
taking of listed species);section10
(wildlife researchpermitsandhabitat
conservation planning on non-Federal
lands); section 6 (cooperativeStateand
Federal grants); land acquisition; and
research. Other Federal lawsalso
require conservation of endangeredand
threatened species.suchasthe Federal
LandPolicy ManagementAct, National
EnvironmentalPolicy Act, andvarious
other State andFederal laws and
regulations.

The Service’sintent in designating
critical habitat is to provide habitat that
contains primary constituent elements
in sufficient quantitiesto maintain
viable populations of deserttortoises
within the six recovery units. Critical
habitat designationwill help reducethe
risk associatedwith the near-term
reduction in desert tortoise numbers
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andcurrrulativelossof habitat
anticipatedfrou~on-goingmanagement
plans.Critical habitatoffersafcFitional
protectionthroughsection7, but it dees
not replacethemanagement
recommendationsprovidedby theDraft
RecoveryPlan..Designationof critical
habitatwill, however,provide’
regulatoryprotectionandhelpretain
options until long-termconserration
plansareacceptedand fully
implemented.

OtherProtections

The Statesof Nevada,California.
Arizona, andUtahhaveestablished
lawsthat providevarying levelsof
protectionfor individual desert
tortoises.TheStateof Nevadaaffords
limited protectionto thedeserttortoise,
havingestablishedit as a protected
reptile undersection 501.110.1(d)of the
NevadaRevisedStatutes,protectedand
rareoutsideof theurbanareasof Clark
County (LasVegas)undersection
503080.2of theNevadaAdministrative
Code,andunlawful to transportacross
Statelines without thewritten consent
of the NevadaDepartmentof Wildlife.
Nevadadoesnot haveany lawsthat
regulatethedegradationofdesert
tortoisehabitat.

TheCalifornia Fish andGame
Commissionlistedthedeserttortoiseas
a Statethreatenedspecieson June22,
1989,amei.dingtheCaliforniaCodeof
Regulations.section670.5(b)(4)of title
14. Californiahasalsodesignatedthe
deserttortoiseasits official State
reptile.

The Arizona GameandFish
Commissionextendedfull protection
from taketo thedeserttortoise,effective
January1, 1988, throughCommission
Order43: Reptiles.Also prohibitedis
thesaleof deserttortoisesandtheir
importationto theState,aswell asthe
releaseof captivetortoisesinto the wild.
Thereis no Stateauthority in Arizona
to regulatethemodificationof desert
tortoise habitat.

In Utah,thedeserttortoise is
considereda“prohibited reptile,
protectingit from collection,
importation, transportation.possession,
sale,transfer,or releasebecauseit poses
unacceptabledisease,ecological,
environmental,orhumanhealthor
safety-risks. No Stateregulationsexistto
stopthe loss or degradationofdesert
tortoisehabitat throughland
developmentor otheractions~TJ.S.Fish
andWildlife Service1g90).

RecoveryPlanning andSection7
Consultation

Recoveryplanningundersection4W
of theAct is-the~urnbrella’ that
eventuallyguidesall of the ACt’~s

activitiesandpromotesaspecres’
conservationandeventnaldelisting.
Becausecritical habitatdesignationwas
basedonrecommendationsprovidedhr
theDraft RecoveryPlan. final critical
habitatwill be incorporatedas partof
the fliral recoveryplan for thedesert
tortoise.The Servicehasworkedclosely
with theRecoveryTeamandother
efforts to ensureconsistencyandwill
reevaluatetheneedfor critical habitat
aftercompletionandimplementationof
the recoveryplan orat anytime that
new informationindicatesthatchanges
maybewarranted.The Servicemayalso
reassesscritical habitatdesignationif
other landmanagementplansor
conservationstrategies,which rosy
reducetheneedfor theadditional
protectionprovidedby critical habitat
designation,aredevelopedandfully
implemented.

Although critical habitatis not
intendedas amanagementor
conservationplan,associationwiththe
Draft RecoveryPlan leavesthe
perceptionthatcritical habitat is a form
of that plan. The Draft RecoveryPlan,
critical habitat, and other conservation
processesareworkingwith thesame
land basecontainingthesamespecific
locationsof deserttortoisepopulations
within recoveryunits; it is therefore
inevitablethat theseprocessesoverlap.
Critical habitat is basedupon the -

recommendationsof the Draft Recovery
Planbecauseit lays out a frameworkfor
identifyingandevaluatinghabitatthat is
foundedon scientific principles.
Designationof critical habitat doesnot
offer snecificdirection for managing
deserttortoisehabitat.Thattypeof
direction, as well as anychangein
direction, will comethrough
administrationof other facetsof theAct
(e.g.,section7, section10, and recovery
planning)or throughdevelopmentof
landmanagementplansaddressing the
deserttortoise.

The final DWMA boundaries will be
determinedby landmanagement
agencies,in consultationwith the
Service,througha planningprocessthat
is coordinatedwith local government
andinterestedmembersof thepublic.
The Serviceintendsthat critical habitat
for theMojave deserttortoise
populationconform to the DWMA
boundaries determinedthroughthe
recoveryplanningandimplementation
process.Becausetheagencyplanning
processfor determiningtheDWMA
boundarieswill notbecompleteduntil
after critical habitat for the Mojave
desert tortoisepopu-lation is initially
designated,adjustmentsto critical
habitatmay needtobemadein
subsequentrulemakingdocumentsto
makecritical habitatcorrespondto the

DWMAs. As soon astheagency
planning processfor delineatingDWMA
boundariesis completed.theService
will considerpublishinga proposed
rule to effect appropriate adjustmentsin
the critical habitat boundariesfor the
affectedrecoveryunit(s).

Section7 Consultation

Section7(aY~2}of theAct requires
Federalagenciesto ensurethat activities
they authorize,fund,orcarryout are not
likely to destroyor adverselymodify
critical hthitat. This Federal
responsibilityaccompanies.and is in
addition to. the requirementin section
7(a)(2)of theAct thatFederalagencies
ensuretheiractionsdo not jeopardize
thecontinuedexistenceofany listed
species.Regulationsimplementingthis
interagencycooperationprovision of the
Act arefound at 50 CFRpart 402.As
requiredby 5o~CFR402.14.a Federal
agencymustconsultwith theServiceif
it determinesanactionmayaffecta
listed specieso critical habitat. Thus,
the requirementto consideradverse
modificationof critical habitatis an
incrementalsection7 consideration
aboveandbeyondsection7 review to
evaluatejeopardyandincidental takeof
thespecies.

Jeopardyis definedat 50 CFR 402.02
as any action that would be expectedto
appreciablyreducethe likelihood of
boththe survivaland recoveryof a
species.Destructionor adverse
modificationof critical habitat is
definedat 50 CFR402.02asadirector
indirectalterationthatappreciably
diminishesthevalueof critical habitat
for boththesurvival andrecoveryof a
listedspecies.Theregulationsalso
clearlystatethatsuchalterations
include,but arenot limited to,
alterationsadverselymodifyinganyof
thosephysicalor biological feeturesthat
werethebasisfor determiningthe
habitatto becritical.

Survivalandrecovery,mentionedin
boththe definition of adverse
modificationand jeopardy,aredirectly
related.Survival maybeviewedasa
linearcontinuumbetweenrecoveryand
extinctionof thespecies.Thecloserone
is to recovery,thegreaterthecertainty
in thespecies’continuedsurvival.The
terms“survival andrecovery’~arethus
relatedby thedegreeof certaintythat
thespecieswill persistovera given
periodof time. Survival relatesto
viability. Factorsthat influencea
species’viability includepopulation
numbers,distributionthroughoutthe
range,stochasticity,expectedduration,
and reproductivesuccess.A species
may beconsideredrecoveredwhen
thereis a high degreeof certaintyfor the
species’continuedviability.
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The Act’s definition of critical habitat
indicatesthat the purposeof critical
habitat isto contributeto a species’
conservation,which by definition
equatesto recovery.Section 7
prohibitionsagainstthedestructionor
adversemodificationofcritical habitat -

apply to actions that would impair
survivalandrecoveryof the listed
species,thusproviding aregulatory
meansof ensuringthatFederalactions
within critical habitat are consideredin
relationto the goalsand
recommendationsof arecoveryplan.As
a result of the link betweencritical
habitat and recovery,the prohibition
againstdestruction or adverse
modification of the critical habitat
should providefor the protectionof the
critical habitat’s ability to contribute
fully to a species’recovery.Thus, the
adversemodificationstandardmaybe
reachedcloserto the recovery endof the
survival continuum,whereasthe
jeopardystandardtraditionallyhasbeen
appliednearerto theextinction endof
the continuum.
Basisfor Anaiysis

Designationof critical habitat focuses
on the primaryconstituent elements
within the defined units and their
contribution to the species’recovery,
basedon considerationofthespecies’
biological needsand factorsthat
contributeto recovery(e.g.,distribution,
numbers,reproduction,andviability).
Theevaluationof actionsthatmayaffect
critical habitat for the desert tortoise
should consider the effectsof the action
on anyof the factorsthat were the basis
for determining the habitat to be critical,
including theprimaryconstituent
elementsof nesting,foraging,sheltering,
dispersal,andlorgeneflow, aswell as
thecontributionof theareato recovery.
The Servicewill focuson aproposed
action’seffecton the eventualrecovery
of the tortoisein aCHU (e.g.,thetype
of activitiesthat ledto thetortoise’s
listing, suchashabitat loss, degradation,
and fragmentation).TheServicewould
issuean adversemodificationopinion if
it determinedthataproposedaction
was likely to precluderecoveryof the
tortoise in a particularunit.

The rangeof the deserttortoisehas
beendivided into six recoveryunitsin
theDraft RecoveryPlan.Theseareasare
basedongenetic, morphological,
ecological,andphysiologicaldifferences
amongthe deserttortoises. The
designatedCHUsareintended to
provide for viable populations of desert
tortoisesrepresentingthis variation in
traits. The basisfor an adverse
modification opinionshould follow the
recommendationsin the recoveryplan
for maintaining viable populations and

variationthroughoutthe range.Should
the RecoveryTeam redefinethese
parametersin the final recovery plan,
then the basisfor analysisunder section
7 will follow that basis,

For a wide-rangingspeciessuchasthe
desert tortoise, where multiple CHUs
aredesignated,eachunit hasboth a
local role anda rangewiderole in
contributingto theconservationof the
species.The loss of a singleunit may
not jeopardizethe continued existence
of the speciesbut may significantly
reducethe ability of critical habitat to
contributeto recovery.

Presentconditions vary throughout
the range of the desert tortoise, with the
result that someareasmay be lessable
to sustain continuing impactsthan
othersat anygiven time. The level of
disturbance a CHU could withstand and
still fulfill its intended purposeis
variablethroughoutthe tortoise’s range
andwill needto be reviewed in the
context of its currentstatus,condition,
and location.

Each projectwill needreview asto its
impacts at all levels.When determining
whether any particular action would
appreciablydiminish the valueof the
habitat for the survivalandrecovery of
the tortoise, thebaselinecondition and
expectedrole for the individual unit
and thosewithin thesamerecoveryunit
must be considered.Among the factors
to be consideredarethe extent of the
proposedaction, the presentcondition
of the habitat (e.g.,percent of the area
containing the primaryconstituent
elements,degreeof fragmentation, size
of the unit),the existingdensity of
deserttortoises in theunit, the expected
time to regeneratesufficient habitat to
support an effectivepopulation in a
particular area, consistencyof theaction
with the intent of the recovery plan,
geographicconsideration,and local and
regional problems.The analysisshould
alsoconsiderthe effect of the action on
critical habitat from actions planned
outsidethe designatedarea. Analysis of
impactsto individual units must
considertheeffects to the local area, the
recovery unit in which it resides,and
theoverall range of the listed species.
ConsultationProcess

Section 7 consultationfor critical
habitat will focuson the effects of
actions on tortoise habitat whether or
not it is currently occupied.The
presenceor absenceof tortoises will not
factor into the determination of actions
that trigger section7. Any action that
may affectcritical habitat will trigger
section 7 consultation.

The requirement to consideradverse
modification of critical habitat isan
incremental section7 consideration

above andbeyond section 7 review
necessaryto evaluatejeopardy and
incidental take. As required by 50 CFR
402.14,a Federal agencymust consult
with the Serviceif it determinesan
action may affect a listed speciesor its
critical habitat. Federal agenciesare
responsiblefor determining whether or
not to consult with the Serviceand
should considera number of factors
whendetermining if a proposedaction
may affect critical habitat. To the extent
possible,agenciesshould consult on a
programmatic basis.

The Servicewill consider the effect of
the proposedaction on the primary
constituent elementsalong with the
reasonswhy thatparticularareawas
determinedto be critical habitat. The
trigger to initiate section 7 consultation
(under adversemodification) is any
action that may affect any of the five
primaryconstituent elementsof critical
habitat or reducethe potential of critical
habitat to develop theseelements—this
is independent from anyactionthat
would affectknown individuals. The
evaluationshould alsotakeinto
considerationwhat happensoutsideof
critical habitat becausesuchprojects
may alsoImpact habitat within critical
habitat. It should alsoconsider what
effects the action may have on other
adjacent CHUs, the recovery unit, and
the overall range of the desert tortoise.
ExamplesofProposedActions

Section4(b)(8)of the Act requires, for
any final regulationthat designates
critical habitat, a brief description and
evaluation of thoseactivities (public or
private)thatmayadverselymodify such
habitat or may be affectedby such
designation.Regulations found at 50
CFR 402.02define destructionor
adversemodification of critical habitat
asa director indirect alteration that
appreciably diminishesthe valueof
critical habitat for both the survival and
recovery of a listed species.Such
alterations include, but arenot limited
to,alterations adverselymodifying any
of thosephysical or biological features
thatwerethe basis for determining the
habitat to be critical.

Activities that disturbor remove the
primaryconstituent elementswithin
designatedCHUsmight adversely
modify the tortoise’scriticalhabitat.
Theseactivities may include actions
that would reducethe areaof arecovery
unit below that which cansustaina
viable population or provide for
movements,dispersal,andgeneflow;
reducethequantityandquality of forage
species,eitherdirectly or throughsoil
modifications,thereby affecting the
tortoise’s nutritional requirements;
reducethesuitability of substratesfor
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burrowing,nesting,andoverwintering.
reducethe numberandavailahffity of
burrow sites,calichecaves,andother
sheltersites;appreciablymodifythe
function and/or availability of
vegetationto provideshelterfrom
temperatureextaeinesandpredators
andincreasethe potentialfor &ture
habitat disturbanceandhuman-caused
mortality.

A numberof Federalagenciesor
departmentsfund, authorize,orcarry
out actionsthataffectlands that the
Servicedesignatesas critical habitat.
AmongtheseagenciesaretheBLM,
Departmentof Defense(DOD).Bureauof
Mines, Corpsof Engineers.Bureauof
Reclamation,Bureau of Indian Affairs
(BIA). FederalEnergyRegulatory
Commission,NationalParkService,
FederalHighwayAdministration,and
Department of HousingandUrban
Development.Federalagenciesandthe
Servicearecurrentlyconsultingon
numerousactivitiesproposedwithin the
rangeof thedeserttortoise.These
activities include Federal land
managementplans;Bureaulivestock
grazingoperations;road,trail, and
utility construction andmaintenance;
mining plansof operation;landsales,
leases,and exchanges;Federalhousing
loans;BLM recreationand public
purposeteases;permitsforOHV
activities; military operations.sandand
graveloperations;rights-of-way:
landfills; anda numberof smaller
actions.Theeconomicanalysisprovides
moredetailson specificprojects
affectedby critical habitat designation.

The Serviceexpectsthat proposed
actionsthatare inconsistentwith land
managementrecommendationsfor
DWMA’s in the Draft RecoveryPlan
would likely beconsideredto adversely
modify critical habitat.Proposedactions.
that are consistentwith the
recommendationswithin the Draft
RecoveryPlanwould notbe likely to
resultin destructionoradverse
modificationof critical habitat.

Areasdesignatedas critical habitat
supporta numberof existingand
proposedcommercialandnon-
commercialactivities.Commercial
activitiesthatmay affectdeserttortoise
critical habitatinclude,but arenot
limited to, livestockgrazing,sandand
gravelextraction,mining.OHV
activities,militaryoperations,landfills,
rights-of-way,andutility corridors.
Commercialactivitiesnot likely to
destroyor adverselymodify critical
habitatincludevarioussite-specific
activitiessuchas.scenictonrs.
Conductingdeserttortoisesurveys
would not likely destroyor adversely
modify criticalhabitatNon-commercial
activitiesarelargelyassociatedwith

recreationandarenot consideredlikely
to adverselyaffectcritical habitat.
providedtheydo antinvolve useof
vehiclesoffof designatedroads..Such
activitiesinclude hiking,camping.
hunting,andvariousactivities
associatedwith natureappreciation.In
certainCHUswheremoreintensive
managementisneeded(e.g.,.theUpper
Virgin River CHU), theeffectsof
recreationalactivitieswill beevaluated
on a case-by-casebasis.

Someactivities,couldbeconsidered
to be of benefit to deserttortoisehabitat
and,therefore,wouldalsonotbe
expectedto destroyor adverselymodify
criticalhabitat.Examplesof activities
thatcouldbeof benefittocritical
habitatincludeprotectivemeasures
suchassomeformsof fire suppression
and restoratianof disturbedareas.
Furtherresearchmay supportorrefute
any potentialbenefits.fromsuchactions.
At this time, theywill beevaluatedon
a case-by-casebasis.

In general,activities that do not
removeor degradeconstituentelements
of habitat for deserttortoises.arenot
likely to destroyoradverselymodify
critical habitat. Each proposedaction
would be examinedpursuant to section
7 of theAct in relation to its site-
specific impacts. Thus,proposed
actionsmay or may notdestroyor
adverselymodify critical habitat,
dependingon thetypeandextentof the
action arid the pre-projectconditionof
the areain relation to desert tortoise
habitatneeds.The involvedFederal
agenciescanassistthe Servicein its
evaluation of proposedactionsby
providing detailedinformationon the
habitat configuration of a project area,
habitatconditionsof surroundingareas,
andin-formationon known locationsof
deserttortoises.

The designationof critical habitat
doesnot imply that landsoutside of
critical habitat donot play an important
role in theconservationof the desert
tortoise.Landsoutsideof critical habitat
areimportantfor providing nesting,
sheltering,foraging,geneflow, and
dispersalhabitatfor deserttortoises.
Federalactivitiesoutsideof critical
habitatarestill subjectto review under
section7 if theymayaffectthedesert
tortoise.TheServiceexpectsthat
managementactivitiesoutsideof critical
habitaton Federallandswould be
managedasrecommendedby afinal
recoveryplan,.Federalland
managementplans,or othervalid plans.

ReasorrrzbkandPrudentAlternatives

In caseswhereit isconcludedthatan
action would likely result in the
destructionoradversemodificationof
critical habitat,totheextentpossible,.

theServiceis requiredto provide
reasonableandprudentalternativesto
theproposedactionin its biological
opinion. By definition, reasonableand
prudent alternativesallow the intended
purposeof theproposed actiontogo
forwardand removethe conditions that
would adverselymodify critical
habitat—elternativesmayvary
accordingto local conditions,project
size, or otherfactors.TheService
recommendsthat the agenciesinitiate
discussionsearlyenoughin the
planningprocessto preserveagreater
numberof optionsto reduceimpacts.

Under this scenario,if adverse
modificationwasanticipated,examples
of possiblereasonableandprudent
alternativesthat may beprovidedin a
biologicalopinion inc.lude:

(1) Relocatingthe planned action to
anotherlocation.

(2) Modifying the actionto minimize
fragmentation, andior

(3) Modifying the actionto implement
landmanagementpracticesthat are
known to be compatiblewith
maintainingprimary constituent
elementsfor the deserttortoise.

For someactions,the Servicemay
proposeminor modificationsto the
projectdesignthatmayavoid adverse
modification of critical habitat.In the
caseof a proposedupgradeofa
powerlineright-of-waycorridor,for
example,theServicemayrecommend
that the corridorbe expandedon one
side of the existingcorridorversusthe
othersideto avoid impacts to habitat
wherethe primaryconstituentelements
areof higherquality. Far projectsthat
may result in more severeimpacts,
substantialprojectchesigesmay be
necessary.The Servicewould propose
reasonableandprudentalternativesto
the agency’sproposedaction.
Reasonableandprudentalternatives,by
definition,would allow the intended
purposeof theprojectto go forward
without adverselymodifyingcritical
habitat

No reasonableandprudent
alternatives maybeavailablefor some
proposedactions.Forexample,dueto
the sizeof a unit or high levelsof
existingfragmentation,an level of
habitatdisturbancemaybepossible
without resultingin thedestructionor
adversemodificationof critical habitat.
In thesesituations,theServicewould
issueanadversemodificationbiological
opinion with no reasonableandprudent
alternatives,TheServicerecommends
thatagenciesinitiatediscussionsat the
earliestopportunityto helpavoidthis
typeof situation.

Researchon deserttortoisesandtheir
habitatmay negativelyaffectcritical
habitat. Whereverpossible,research
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shouldbe conductedoutside of CHUs,
coordinatedthroughoutthe listed range
of the tortoise,andbaseduponan
approvedlong-termstrategy.

ConservationMeasureson Non-Federal -

Lands
State,private, andTribal landshave

beenincluded within the designation of
critical habitat.Critical habitat
designationwill not affectnon-Federal
landsexceptfor actions that are
authorized, funded,or carriedout by a
Federalagency.Actionson Stateand
privatelandswill continueto besubject
to section9 of theAct, requiringan
incidental takepermitpursuantto
section10(a)(1)(B)of theAct for any
actions that may resultin takeof desert
tortoises.This provisionalsowill apply
to actionson Tribal landswithout a
Federalnexus.Thosewith a Federal
nexuswill be subjectto section7
consultation under the Act.

Section9 of theAct prohibits
intentional andnon-intentional “take”
of listed speciesandapplies to all
landownersregardlessof whether or not
their landsarewithin criticalhabitat.
The term “take,” asdefinedby the Act,
meansto harass,harm,pursue,hunt,
shoot,wound, kill, trap,capture,or
collect,or to attempt to engagein any
suchconduct, “Harass”is definedasan
intentional or negligentact or omission
that createsthe likelihood of injury to
wildlife by annoyingit to suchan extent
asto significantly disruptnormal
behavioral patterns, which includes
breeding,feeding,or sheltering. “Harm”
in the definition of “take” meansany
action, including habitat modification,
whichactually kills or injureswildlife.
Suchact may include significant habitat
modificationor degradation where it
actuallykills or injureswildlife by
significantly impairingessential
behavioralpatterns, including breeding.
feeding,or sheltering (50CFRpart17).

Section10(a)(1)(B) authorizesthe
Serviceto issuepermits for the taking of
listed speciesincidental to otherwise
lawful activities,suchashousing
development.Incidental take permit
applicationsmustbesupportedby a
habitat conservation plan (HG?)that
identifies conservationmeasuresthat
the permitteeagreesto implement to
conservethe species.A key elementof
the Service’sreview of an HG?is a
determinationof the plan’s effectupon
the long-term conservationof the
species.An HG? would be approved
and a section10(a)(1)(B) permit issued
if it would minimize andmitigatethe
impactsof thetaking andwould not
appreciablyreducethe likelihood of
survival andrecoveryof that speciesin
the wild.

Dueto limited Federalinvolvement,
the Serviceexpectsthat few, if any,
formalsection7 consultationswould be
initiated for Statelandsthat are
includedin critical habitat. TheStates
aresubjectto the “take” prohibitions
under section9 of the Act, however,and
may enter into the section10 HG?
processwhere appropriate.

Deserttortoises occurringon lands-
outsidecriticalhabitat boundariesare
still subjectto section9 prohibitions.
The Service envisionsthat the role of
deserttortoise habitat in the
conservationof the specieswill be
addressedthroughsection7, the HG?
process,the recoveryplanningprocess,
andother appropriate StateandFederal
laws. On theselands,it is expectedthat
recoverygoalswill beachievedthrough
the useof other conservation
mechanismsavailable to the Service and
other landowners (e.g.,land exchanges,
conservationand development
easements).
Summaryof Commentsand
Recommendations

In the August30, 1993,proposedrule
and associatednotifications,the Service
requestedall interested partiesto
submit factual reports or information
that might contribute to the
developmentof this final rule. The
public commentperiod was openfrom
August30, 1993, to October 29, 1993.
During that period, the Service
conductedthree public hearingson this
issueat the following locations:
Riverside, California, on October 6,
1993; Las Vegas, Nevada,on October12,
1993;andSt.George,Utah,on October
14, 1993.The Serviceaccepted
testimony from the public from I to 4
p.m. andfrom 6 to 8 p.m on each of
thosedays.The Serviceannouncedthe
dates,times, and locationsof the public
hearingsin the August 30, 1993,
proposedrule (58 FR 45748).
Appropriate Stateagencies,county
governments,Federalagencies,
scientificorganizations,andother
interested partieswerecontactedand
askedto comment.In addition, the
Servicepublishednotices in the
KingmanDaily Miner, Las VegasReview
Journal, LasVegasSun, Barstow Desert
Dispatch,The Sun, andthe Press
Enterpriseon September23, 1993,and
in the Daily Spectrumon September16,
1993,announcing the publication of the
proposedrule and the dates,times, and
locationsof the public hearings.

During the 60-day commentperiod,
the Servicereceivedapproximately 270
written comments.In addition, 147
peopletestifiedat the threepublic
hearings.The Servicereceived
comments from the BLM, the Bureau of

Mines,otherFederalagencies,military
installations, Stateand county agencies,
town boards, environmental
organizations,the mining industry,
recreationalenthusiasts,and the
ranchingindustry.Commentsare part of
the administrative record andare
available for public review. Issuesraised
during the public commentperiod
announcedin theAugust 30, 1993,
proposal.whether written or oral, are
discussedbelow.

Issue1: Onerespondentrequested
that the Service adjust the boundariesof
CHUs to reflect the boundariesproposed
for the EastMojaveNationalPark,as
depictedin SenateBill 21.

ServiceResponse:The Servicecannot
assumethat the legislation for the East
Mojave National Park will passor what
form it will take. The boundaries
proposedfor theEastMojave National
Park in SenateBill 21 reflect the
balancingof a varietyof concerns,both
biotic andabiotic, andshouldnot be
expectedto resembleboundaries
reflecting habitat critical to the recovery
of a singlespecies.Should theEast
Mojave National Park be established,the
Servicewill reevaluatethe designation
of critical habitat, if appropriate.

Issue2: The Servicereceivedseveral
comments regardingthe presenceof
unsuitable habitat within proposed
CHUs. Examplesof areasalready
developedthat were includedin the
proposal were golfcourses,buildings,
towns,andexistingmining operations.
Many stated that theseareasshould not
be included evenfor the easeof writing
legal descriptions.

ServiceResponse:The Service
identified largecontiguousblocks of
tortoise habitat containing the primary
constituentelementsthatsupport
nesting, foraging, sheltering,dispersal,
and/or geneflow, primarily on Federal
lands. To the extent possible,the
Serviceadjustedboundariesto exclude
peripheralareasthat do not support
primaryconstituent elements.However,
it wasnot possibleto excludeall areas
of non-habitat viaboundary revisions.
In somecases,CHUs contain small
towns, farms, or human-made
structures.Theseareas,although
physically locatedwithin the
boundariesof critical habitat, arenot
included in critical habitat designation
becausethey donot contain any of the
primaryconstituent elementsof desert
tortoise habitat. Areasnot currently
containing all of the essential features,
but with the capability to do soin the
future,may still be neededfor the long-
term conservation of the species,
particularly in certain portions of the
range.
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Issue3: Somerespondentsstatedthat
the Serviceshould usenatural
landmarksfor critical habitat
boundariesandlegal descriptionsrather
thansectionlines.Useof sectionlines
instead of natural or human-made
boundarieswill make enforcement
difficult, if not impossible.One letter
statedthat, in a majority of cases
(accordingto the BLM), documented
sheeptrespassesduring the 1993
grazingseasonoccurredwhere there
wereambiguousboundarylines.

ServiceResponse:In designating
critical habitat, the Serviceis required
to legally define boundaries.In this
effort, the Servicehas primarily used
sectionlines.The Servicealsoused
major roadsto legally define someof the
CHUs.

Issue 4: Many commenterssuggested
removing specificareasfrom the
proposal. Such suggestionstypically
reflectedconcernsover inclusion of
privatelandsin theproposalorwere
basedon potentially conflicting uses,
especiallymining areas.Someletters
providedadditionalbiological
information to support site-specific
deletions from critical habitat.

ServiceResponse:The Servicehas
reviewedthe individual requestsand
determined whether the critical habitat
boundaries should be modified to avoid
non-tortoisehabitat.Wherepossible,
consideringrestraintsof the map scale
with which theServicewasworking,
boundarylines have been modified.
Areas suggestedfor deletion on the basis
of perceivedland-useconflictswere
deletedif theydid not meetthe criteria
for inclusionor did not provide
important benefitsto the species.Areas
suggestedfor deletionbecauseof poor
habitatwere re-examinedin termsof
valueto tortoises.In somekey areas,
habitatcurrentlyin poorcondition was
retained becauseof its important
location andhigh potential for
contribution to recovery.

Issue5: A number of commenters
statedthat critical habitat should not be
designatedbecauseexistingreserved
lands,suchasnational parks and
wildlife refuges, provide sufficient land
for thetortoise.

ServiceResponse:The Service
determinedthatthe tortoiseshouldbe
listed as a threatened speciesin 1990
(55 FR 12178)partly because
insufficient habitat is protected within
congressionallyprotected areasto
adequately conservedesert tortoises. In
addition, theDraft RecoveryPlan
recognizesthat areasof sufficient sizeto
support self-sustainingtortoise
populations do not exist in already
protected habitats. Critical habitat is
primarily designatedfor areasidentified

in the Draft RecoveryPlanasnecessary
for recoveryof the deserttortoise.

Issue6: Many commentersstatedthat
the Service had proposedto designate
too much habitat for the deserttortoise.

ServiceResponse:The Service
proposedcritical habitatdesignationfor
thoseareasthat met certain criteria. The
proposedand final designationsinclude
at leastone CHU within eachof the six
recovery units outlined in the Draft
RecoveryPlan. The sizeoftheseareas
is basedprimarily on the requirements
to support self-sustainingpopulations.
Landmanagementagencies,in
consultation with the Service,may
establish desert wildlife management
areasin which the deserttortoise will
receivespecialconsideration.Upon
establishmentof theseareas,the Service
may reevaluatethe critical habitat
designation.

Issue 7: Several respondentsstated
that the designation should include
other important desert tortoise habitats,
especiallythe southern portion of Ft.
Irwin, JoshuaTree National Monument,
the DesertTortoise Natural Area
(DTNA), andthe DesertNational
Wildlife Range.They statedthat
Congressionalwithdrawal of public
lands within the DTNA from the general
mining and mineral laws must be
renewedafter20 years(year2000).If
mineralextractionis allowed after that
time, designationof the DTNA as
critical habitat may be the only wayto
protect this habitat from the effectsof
mining. Somerespondentsquestioned
why managementplansdevelopedfor
theDTNA and JoshuaTreeNational
Monument are sufficient to preclude
critical habitat designation, yet the
BLM’s ConservationPlan of 1980is
ignored.One letter said that such
inconsistenciesdegradethe Service’s
contentionthat the DTNA is protected
so well that it neednot be included in
the critical habitat designation.

ServiceResponse:The critical habitat
designation includesthe southern 2
mile-strip of Ft. Irwin, which is south of
where most existing military operations
have already degradedor eliminated
deserttortoise habitat. JoshuaTree
National Monument, the DTNA, and the
DesertNational Wildlife Rangewere not
included in the designationof critical
habitat becausethe designationwould
not afford theseareasanyadditional
benefit. The mandatesof the Service
andthe National Park Serviceprovide
for ecosystemmanagement,and thoseof
the BLM arefor multiple useof public
lands.The DTNA is managed
specifically for thebenefit of the desert
tortoiseasboth a researchnatural area
arid anAreaof Critical Environmental
Concern.The specifiedareasare

consideredimportant for recoveryof the
desert tortoise in the Draft Recovery
Planandwill be consideredin
establishingdesertwildlife management
areas.If, in thefuture,mineral
extractionor other actions that may
adverselyaffectcritical habitat are
proposedto be allowedwithin these
areas,theServicemayreevaluate
whetheradditional critical habitat
should be designated.

Issue8: Severalpeople were
concernedthat critical habitat would
restrictaccessto their private lands or
mining operations.

ServiceResponse:The Service
anticipatesbeing able to work with
other Federalagenciesto minimize
effects on private landowners.Section 7
consultation requirements on Federal
rights-of-wayapplicationsmay,in some
limited cases,result in additional
mitigation requirementsor modified
accessto private lands,but the Service
cannotquantify the economiceffects.

Issue 9: A few lettersstatedthatthe
critical habitat designationshould
include the Pahrump/Arnargosa Valley.

ServiceResponse:The Servicebased
its critical habitatproposalon those
areasrecommendedfor recoveryin the
Draft RecoveryPlan.The Pahrump/
AmargosaValley was not one of those
areas,and, therefore, it wasnot
included in the proposeddesignation.

Issue 10: A few respondentsrequested
inclusion of additional areasas critical
habitatfor thedeserttortoise.Oneletter
suggestedthat inclusion of previously
disturbed areaswill provide buffer
zoneswhile recoveryof the habitat
occurs,thereby minimizing edgeeffects
of incompatible land usesandproviding
smooth-edgedboundaries that are
preferablein minimizing theboundary-
to-arearatio.

ServiceResponse:The Administrative
ProcedureAct requires Federal agencies
to provide appropriate notification of
proposedactions prior to making final
determinations. Therefore, the Service
cannot adopt a final rule that is
significantly different from the proposed
rule without first offeringthe public an
opportunity to commenton the
differences. Departmental policy is to
waivenoticeand public commentonly
in specialcasessuchas emergenciesor
instanceswherea proposedamendment
makesonly minor technical changesin
a rule. The only addition to critical
habitat in the final rule for desert
tortoise critical habitat wasthe
inclusion of 3 squaremilesof BLM land
on thesouthernboundaryof theBeaver
Dam SlopeCHU in Arizona. This
requestfor inclusion camefrom the
BLM, asthe landowner, to ensurethat
its desert tortoisestudy plot waswithin
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desertt~rtoi.secriticalhabitat.No other
landownerswill beaffectedby thi~
inclusion.Other.requestsfor inclusions
wereconsidered’signifl~antandwere
not requestedby the landowner.In
order to meetthecourt-mandated
schedulefor designationof critical
habitat, theServicewasnot abI~eto
preparea secondproposalincluding
any of theseareasfor public review.
Suchinclusionsmay beconsidered
duringanyfuturereevaluationof the
designatedcriticalhabitatbouni:Iarias.

Issue ii: The BIA opposes
designation,of anycritical habitaton
anytribal lands.The.critical habitat
proposalincludedlandswithin Pai.ute
IndianTribe ofUtah-Shi’vwits Band
(Paiute-Shivwits)lands~The BJ.A
maintainsthat formalconsultation
underthesection7 jeopardystandardof
the Act providesadequateprotection for
the deserttortoise..

ServiceResponse:The Serviceexpects
that all. landowners,regardiess.oftheir
status,will comply with theAct and
will contribute,to theconservationof
thedeserttortoise.Low, medium, and
high densitydeserttortoisehabitat
existson Utah tribal lands.Tribal lands
were not,excludedfrom final
designationbecausenonew biological
or economicinformation wasprovided,
andtribal landscontaindeserttortoise
habitatnecessaryfor recoveryof the
Upper Virgin RiverRecoveryUnit This
recoveryunit is unique in that it
containssomeof thehighestdensitiesof
deserttortoisesknownthroughoutthe
species’range,andit is the smallest
recovery unit, requiringmoreintensive
managementto ensurelong-term
survivability andultimaterecoveryof
the unit. Deserttortoisehabitat
necessaryfor recoverywithin the Upper
Virgin River RecoveryUnit is not
distinguishedby landownership
boundaries,and it includesFederal,.
State,private, andTribal lands.
Following Service,approval and
implementationof aWashingtonCounty
HCP,theServicewill reevaluatethe
critical habitatboundariesand may
propose to modify critical habitat,if.
appropriate.

Issue 12:The Servicereceivedseveral
commentsconcerningthe Washington
County HCPprocess,an effort that has
beenon-going for morethan ayears.
The final critical habitat designation
should reflect the final DesertHabitat
Preserve,to be proposedundera
WashingtonCountyHCP.

ServiceResponse:Washington
County, Utah, i&preparingan HCP
under sectionIi) of the Act, as partof
its application for apermit to take desert
tortoises incidentally.To issuea section
10(a)permit, the Servicemust

determinethat,. to the maximumextent
practicable,.thaapplicant.will’ minimize
andmitigatethainipact~of the taking.
The mnitigatica. fox the Washington~
Countypermil ineludesestablishment
of a.DesertHabitat Preserue~,.pirin’iaril.y
far deserttortaisasurvival,andrecovery.
WashingtonCount} hasnotyet
submitted~i application~for asection
10(a)permit~oraaHCPto.theService..
This final designationof critical habitat
for thedeserttortoisereflects.in large’
partthehabitatconservationplanning
processto,date that,, if successful,will.
result in~adeserthabitatpreserve’of
sufficientsizeand configurationto
pruvideforsurvivaland~recoweryof
desert tortoisesin.this~recoveryunit. 11
theServiceapprovesaWashington.
County HCP’and issuesapermit to take
desert tortoises incidentally,,the Service
may reevaluatecriticalhabitat,and.
proposerevisions,if appropriate.

Issue13:Thedesignationof critical
habitatwill’ create“dumpinggrounds”
for desert tortoises.

ServiceResponse:Handling(e.g.,
“dumping”) of deserttortoisesis
prohibited by the Act, which defines
“take” to meanto harass, harm,pursue,
hunt, shoot,wound, kilL trap, capture,
or collect,any listed species.Critical
habitatprovidesanextralayerof
protection for deserttortoise habitat, but
hasno effectuponthe other protections
provided by the Act.

Issue 14:The DesertHabitatPreserve
boundary line north of thecity of
Washington.was“agreed.u.pon” by
membersof the Washington County
HCPSteeringCommittee,and that exact
line should be reflected in final
designationof critical habitat.

ServiceResponse:The Servicehasnot
reviewedthat “agreed upon” line, nor
has it approved any aspect.of a
Washington.County HCP to date. That
line will be reviewedin the context of
a DesertHabitat Preserveestablished
undera WashingtonCounty HCP,as
partof the mitigation for incidental take
of desert tortoisesand their habitat.

lssue15: Somerespondentsperceived
critical habitat designationfor the desert
tortoiseas a meansby which the Federal
government,can seizeand“federalize”
public andprivate lands.Oneperson
sawdesignationof criticalhabitat as a
Federalconspiracy..The Servicehasa
hiddenpolitical agenda,is deliberately
misinformingthe public, and is
attempting to control private property,
much in thesameregnrd.asif undera
communist regime.

ServiceRespense:Designationof
critical habitat does.not,in andof itself,
impose additionallegal restrictionson
private lands exceptfor actionsthat are
authorized, funded, or carriedout by

Federal agenciesonthoselands.Non-
Federal.aswell asFederal’lands,with
or withoutdesignated’critical’ habitat,
are still subjectto the prohibitions
againsttakeof listedspecieson their
land,pursuantto secthm~9of the Act.
Designationof critical habitat isnota
conspitacy,.hutratheris a requirement
of the EndangeredSpeciesAct for
threatenedanttendangeredspecies.

Issu,e16: Numeiouscommentswere
receivedfrom DOD agencies,.requesting
that in.il’itary installationsbeexcluded
from designationof critical habitat. The
agenciescited.conceraaver theirability
to useexistingfacilities,the existenceof
deserttortoisemanagementplans,the
increasedcostolmanagingcxitical
habitat,andexisting regulatory
mechanismsthatmakethedesignation
of critical habitat unnecessary.

ServiceResponse:Numerousongoing
activities,occuron Federallands
managedby th~military. The Service
hasissuedsection.7 biological opinions
on many of theseactivities.These
opinions contain termsandconditions,
which were usually developed’in
coordinationwith the military, to
reducethe takeof desert’ tortoises. Many
ongoingactivitiesand existing uses,
such as the bombing rangesat Edwards
Air ForceBase(EAFB), the Naval’ Air
WeaponsStation (NAWS) at China
Lake,the ChocolateMountains Air
Gunnery Range, the communications
facilities at theNational Aeronautics
andSpaceAdministrations’ Coldstorie
Deep SpaceCommunicationsComplex,
and the rocket test areaat Le’uhmarni
ridge on EAFB, have alreadyresulted in
the removal of theconstituentelements
ofdeserttortoisehabitatandwould not
be affectedby a designation of critical
habitat. Therefore, military agencies
would’not be required to relocate
existing facilities to areasoutside of
critical habitat.

Issue 17: SeveralDOD agencieswere
concernedthat expansionof existing
facilities or the siting of new facilities
would be prohibited by designation of
critical habitat.

ServiceResponse:In the caseofnew
or expanded facilities that may affect
desert tortoisesor designatedcritical.
habitat,the DODagencieswill, be
requiredto.consultwith, the Service
pursuantto section7 of theAct.
Throughtheconsultationprocess,the
Servicewill determineif the proposed
action is likely to jeopardize.the.
continued existenceof the desert
tortoise or destroyor adverselymodify
designatedcritical habitat. The. DOD.
provided.no economicdatafor such.
futuredevelopmentsby which the
Servicecould consider theeconomic
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costsof designatingcritical habitatin
theseareas.

Issue 18:The NAWS andNational
TrainingCenterat Ft. Irwin citedthe
existenceof deserttortoisemanagement
planson their landsand the increased
costsof managingcriticalhabitat as
reasonsfor excluding theselands from
critical habitatdesignation.

ServiceResponse:The Servicefully
acknowledgesthe positiveeffortson
behalfof the desert tortoise already
implementedby theNavyand the
Army. Suchplansshould be considered
in establishingrecoveryareasfor the
deserttortoise,asrecommendedby the
Draft RecoveryPlan.The DOD should
work closelywith the BLM andthe
Servicein determining where these
recoveryareaswill be locatedandwhat
actions will be implementedwithin
them to effectrecoveryof the desert
tortoise.Following establishmentof
recovery areas, the Servicewill
reevaluateits designationof critical
habitat.

Issue19:EAFB expressedconcern
that designationof critical habitat
would prevent useof supersonic
corridors in the desert,

ServiceResponse:The primary
potentialadverseeffectsof supersonic
flight on thedeserttortoise would be to
the tortoises themselves,aspotential
harmor harassment.Supersonicflight is
not expectedto destroy or adversely
modifydeserttortoisehabitat,

Issue20: The MarineCorpsrequested
that Twentynine PalmsAir Ground
Combat Center beremoved from critical
habitat designationin the Ord-Rodman
CHU.

ServiceResponse:The Servicehas
reevaluatedthe desert tortoise habitat
within theTwentynine PalmsAir
GroundCombatCenter.Off-road travel
by armoredvehicles,bombing and
strafingwith live ammunition,and
emergencydisposalof ordnance and
fuel from aircrafthave resulted in
deteriorationof habitat quality over
largecontiguousareas.Basedon this
reevaluation, the Servicehas refined the
boundariesof the Ord-RodmanCHU to
removethe TwentyninePalms Air
GroundCombatCenter from designation
ascritical habitat.

Issue 21:A few cominenters
respondedthat there is no substantive
evidencethat directly links the decline
in tortoise numberswith livestock
grazing,nor is there anyevidencethat
tortoiseshave sufferedbecausetheir
habitat hasbeengrazed.

ServiceResponse:The Serviceis
currentlyconsultinginformally with the
BLM regardingimpactsof livestock
grazing on deserttortoisecritical
habitat. Although nodefinitive studies

onthe relation betweenlivestock
grazingandthe welfare of desert
tortoiseshave yetbeencompleted,there
isa significantamountof scientific
literatureon theadverseeffectsof
livestockgrazingon desertecosystems,
in termsof vegetationchanges,soil
compactionanderosion,andreduction
of microorganismsin the soil. The
Servicewill continuediscussionswith
the BLM and the DesertTortoise
RecoveryTeam on this issue.

Issue22: Someletters statedthat
utility corridor expansion.road
proliferation from illegal OHV activity,
legal mineral exploration, and current
grazing practices areexistingactivities
that degradetortoise habitat. Stopping
theseusesthat are destructive to
existingcritical habitat is the answerto
protecting the tortoise.

ServiceResponse:As stated
previously,designationof critical
habitat doesnot createaland
managementplan. Federalagencieswill
enter into consultation pursuant to
section7 of theAct with the Servicefor
all activitiesthat they authorize, fund,
or carryout. Through that consultation,
the Servicewill determine if the actions
arelikely to jeopardize the continued
existenceof the speciesor destroyor
adverselymodify critical habitat. The
Federal land managementagencieswill
addressthemultiple useson lands
under their administration in the
processof establishingdesertwildlife
managementareasto implement
recoveryactions for the desert tortoise.

Issue23: Somepeoplequestionedthe
existenceof scientific datathat reflects
a truedepiction of thedistribution of
desert tortoises in the WestMojave or
elsewhere.

ServiceResponse:Although not every
squareinch of land in theMojave Desert
hasbeeninventoried for the presenceof
desert tortoises,the BLM andother
agenciesandbiologistshavespent
considerabletime and effort conducting
desert tortoise surveys throughout the
rangeof the deserttortoise. Such
information hasbeencompiledinto the
BLM’s categoryanddensitymaps for
the deserttortoise,whichareusedby
many of the agenciesinvolved in desert
tortoise management.This information
wasalso usedin preparing the Draft
RecoveryPlan. Issue24: Somepeople
statedthat the Serviceshould consider
the customand culture andthe
continued quality of existenceof the
humanspecies.The customsand
culture of the peopleshould have the
sameconsiderationasbiology and
economicsin determining critical
habitat for thedesert tortoise.

ServiceResponse:The designationof
critical habitat is mandatedby the

EndangeredSpeciesAct andis basedon
thebestscientificdata available after
taking into considerationthe economic
impact andany other relevant impact of
specifyingan areaascritical habitat. In
developing DWMAs, landmanagement
agencieswill havethe opportunity to
considerlocal customandculturein
their decision processes.

issue25: Onerespondentstatedthat
the Service’sstatementsabout
increasingOHV useasof 1980statistics
did not addressthe extent of landsmade
unavailable betweenthe years1980and
1993.Currently lessthan2 percent of
the California desert is accessiblefor
motorized recreation.

ServiceResponse:Although more
roadshave beenclosedsince 1980,
between1980 and1988, there were
moreopen areasand limited access
areasand fewer closedareas
(BiosystemsAnalysis1991). In addition,
the impact of OHVs on tortoises has
increasedover the last decadedue to
changesin BLM zoning, increasesin
OHV use,andthe proliferation of illegal
roads, a factor that results’in serious
environmental impacts anda difficult
managementissuefor the BLM.

Issue26:One letter statedthat
organizedOHV activities in the West
Mojave are regulatedby section 7
permits issuedby the Servicethrough
consultationwith the BLM. Because
OHVs have abidedby thesestipulations,
expansivedesignationof critical habitat
is not necessaryin light of the
protection available throughthe
permitting/stipulationprocess.

ServiceResponse:Throughsection7
of the Act, the Serviceconsultswith
Federalagenciesthat authorize, fund, or
carry out actions that may affect a listed
species.With the listing of a species,the
Service determinesthroughthese
consultationswhetheran action is likely
to jeopardize thecontinued existenceof
a species.The adversemodification
standard maybe applied whenan action
would likely preclude recovery of a
listed species.Thus critical habitat
providesadditional protection to a
speciesand its habitat through section
7 of the Act. After designationof critical
habitat, the Servicewill alsodetermine
if an action is likely to destroyor
adverselymodify critical habitat.
Following designationof critical habitat,
all current activities for which a Federal
agencymaintains discretionaryaction
must undergo reinitiation of
consultation to analyze whetheror not
they are likely to destroyor adversely
modify critical habitat. OHV activities
within the designatedcritical habitat are
not the only activities that may
adverselyaffect the desert tortoiseand
its habitat.
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lssue27~Somelettersobjectedt~the
generalstatements’thatOHYactivity
resultsin negativeimpacts’on desert
tortoisehabitatwithoutquantifying
snch~efl~cts.

Setvice-~eSpeRserThei,e~ati~a-
impactsof 01Wacti~v*yon-desert
tort~shabitathavebeenqu.nti~ed
extensivelysincethe-war1~r1S7Os.
Tortoisesare-averselyaf(ectedby
OHVsthrough’lossefforageand
vegetativecover~increasedmortality
from crushing.coliection,and
vandelism~andsoi.l compactionand
lossofburrow-sites.flecansetheuse-of
OHVs in des~areas isahighly charged
issue,muchattention-hasbeenplaced
on the evwofstudiesandthe
appropriateuseof statisticaltestsin the-
quantifyingtheresultant data.

Isst&e2& Seinerespondentssaidthat
the BLM hasafreed~yaddressed
protection-ofthe deserttortoisein the
Western Mojave CoordInated
ManagementPlan and’other
managementplanspreviously approved
and implementedunderthe Federal
LandPOlicyandManagement-Act.
Further protectionisnot necessary.

Seivice’Response:TheWestern
MojaveCoordinated-ManagementPlan
is still in the planningstagesand,
therefore,doesnotyet affordthe desert
tortoiseany’protection.Upon its
finalization andimplementatiOn,the
Servicemay reevahiate-the critical
habitat designation~

issue29~One respondentsaidthat the
Service,asa- government agency,hasan
obligation to~the-generalpublic it serves
to consider itsactionsthat, in
conjunctionwith theproposed-rule,will
affect all of the public, including those
that engagein OHV recreation-.There
are-no areasto- which theseactivities
canbe relocatedor restricted.

ServiceResponse:Protection-
measureswereimplementedby the
BLM in 1988-throughits Rangewide
Plan to reduceOHV usethroughoutthe
range-of thedeserttortoiseIn category
I and II habitats.As statedin the-Draft
EconomicimpactAnalysis, in Its off-
highwayusersguide,Californialisted
2401Wrecreationalareasmanagedby
Federal,State,andotheragenciesin
Imperial,Rivers1de~andSenBernardino-
Counties.Foursitesin~the-guide-lie Just
outsideproposedCHUS.Critical habitat
designation-asproposedwill notaffect
OHVuseatthesefern’ sites.Theother
threeStatesalsooffOr areasfor useby
OHV enthusiasts.

Issue30: Oneletterstatedthat hiking,
camping,andbfrdwatchuigare listedin~
theproposedruleasexamplesof non-
consumptive-uses.All of theseactivities
necessitatea~vehicle~,in mostInstances
off of a pavedroad, therefore,acting as

OHVs. ATstr, OHV activitiesare’not
“commercial,”butrather“‘recreational.’
The-Service-shouldreevaluatethis’
classificatkon~

Ser.*e-Response~Any use’ofvehicles
off of desi~nsPedreedsandtrails’, for
whateverthaireason,can-negativefy
im~ct-thedesertecosystem.The
Service’isnotsinglingout organized
01Wusergroupsin this assessment
However; theactions ofhiking
camping, andbirdwetching.provided
they denotinvolve useof vehiclesoff
of designatedroadsand trails, arenot
likely to adverselymodify critical
habitat. TheService’recognizesthat
mostrecreational-activity isnot
commercial.However,most01Wraces
involve profits fOr-thepromoters,which
isconsideredaconrrnerciaienterprise.

issue31: Many respondentswere
concernedthat designationof critical
habitat would restrict all motorized
accessinto theseareas.Somestatedthat
OHVrecreationanddeserttortoise
protectionare-netmutually exclusive.

ServiceResponse:TheService
anticipatesthat,althoughFederallend
managersmay closesomeroadsasa-
resultofcritical habitat designation-,
therewill still beopportunitiesfor
scenictouring andothermotorizeduses
on designatedroadsand trailswithin
CHUs.

Issue32: Oneletterstatedthat the-
managementdecisionto set-aside-
millions of acresviolatesthe Federal
LandPolicy andManagementAct
becauseit exceeds100;000acresand
requiresapproval of Congresswithin 90
daysthereafter.Therefore,the
designationof critical habitat hasno-
forceandeffect.

ServiceResponse:Designationof
critical habitat is nota land withdrawal
nora landmanagementaction,.b-ut
ratheranactionrequiredby section4 of
the EndangeredSpeciesAct. Land-use
actions’authorized,funded,or carried
out by Federalagenciesmustundergo
section7 consultation,wherebythe
Servicewill determineif suchactions
aielikely to jeopardizethecontinued
existenceof thedeserttortoiseor
destroyoradverselymodifyitscritical
habitat. Exchisionof activities’ is not
automatic upon the designationof
critical habitat.

Issue3~:Oneletterstatedthat
designationof criticalhabitat may
severelylimit the ability of Stategame
agenciesto travel- off-highway to
developwildlife enhancementprojects
involving- constructieniof roadsor other
facilities.

ServiceResporise-~Designationof
critical habitatwill’ not prohibit
constructionandmaintenance’of
wildlife- developments.Eachsuch

developmentwilt beevaluatedon a
case-by-casebasisthroughsection7
consultationbetween,the Federalland
managementagencyandtheService.
Althoughthelandmanagementagency
may restrict off.roadtravelwithin.
critical habitat,deliveryofconstruction
materialscanmostoftenbe
accom~lisbedby othermeans,suchas
by foot,.horseback,,or helicopter..

Issue34:SomeLettersreconsanended
thatareasthat havetraditionallybeen
heavilyusedfor recreation.should be
exclude&asenforcementwill becostly
and-ineffective.

ServiceResponse:The-Service-has
included thoseareascontaining
constituentelements,consistentwith
recommendationsin theDraft Recovery
Plan.hr the final, rule, the Service,
wherepracticable,hasdeletedareasthat
do notcontainconstituentelements.No
such informationwasprovidedfor the-
recreationareasdescribed.Land
managementagenciescan consider
these~recreationareasduringtheir
establishmentof recoveryareasfor
deserttortoises.

Issue35:Several-people-were
concernedthatdesignationof critical
habitatwouldprecludetherecreational
useof lendsthat their familieshave
usedforgenerations,andtheystrongly
opposedits designation.

ServiceResponse:Designationof
critical habitat-is notsynonymouswith
settingasidewirdem~e-,locking up’the
lands’within, orprohibiting-all uses.
The Serviceanticipates,that the land
managementagencieswilli- designate-
roadsand trails within critical habitat,
and that theywill closesome’roadsthat
aresecondaryand notnecessaryfor
accessto private landsor mines.Also,
designationof critical’ habitatcould-
increasecertaintypesof recreational
use.Many peopleenjoyareasthatshow
fewersignsof human activity. Activities
considerednot:likely to- adversely-affect
critical habitatincludehunting,
picnicking,casual-horsebacktiding (on-
designatedroadsand trailsbcamping.
bivdwatching,bike riding (on designated
roadsand trails),hiking, andmotor
vehicleuse-on-designatedroads.

Issue36: Somelocal agenciesand
utility companieswereconcernedthat
designationof critical habitatwould
affecttheirability to access,use,and
maintainexisting-facilities, rights-of-
way-, andfee-property.Somestatedthat
existingutility corridorsshould be
excludedfrom criticalhabitat
designation.Severalagencieswere
concernedthatcritical habitat
designationwouldeitherexclude or
significantly Increasethe costoffuture
public worksprojects.
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Reqion~Designationof
criticalhabitatshould~ot interfere‘with
on-goingmaintenanceof existingroads
andutilities. Thesesthictiiresdonot
normallycontainpthnarycenstiteeni
elemonts,andtheywould. theesfors~,not
beeffectedby thedesi ion. Routine
maintenancaoperationson-existing
pipelines,buried~ber-opticlines,and
electricaltransmissionline rights-of-
way aregenerally-coveredunder
existingsection7consultationsandare
nut likely to constituteadverse
modificationof critical habitatAny
expansion,addition,or znedi&ation
wiihin therights-of-wayorfeeproperty
will besubjectto section7 consultation
if authorized,funded,orcarriedoutby
a Federalagency.Throughsuch
consultation,the Servicewill determine
if the proposedactionAs likely to
jeopardizethecontinuedexistenceof -

thedeserttortoiseor destroyor
adverselymodifyitscritical habitat.

Issue37: Severalin~vidoa}s
requestedthat the final rulecontaina
discussionof howCHUs will be
managed.Othermembersof thepublic
wereconcernedthatcritical habitat
designationforcescreationof a.
managementplan,establishes
populationgoals,or prescribesspecific
manageinentactions.

SemceResponse:The designationof
critical habitatdoesnotcreatea
managementplanfor the listedspecies.
It is the responsibilityof land
managementagenciesto ensurethat
actionstheyauthorize,fund,or carry
out do not destroyor adverselymodify
designatedcritical habitat. Several
Federalagencieschargedwith
managementof the public’s landsare
preparingor alreadyimplementing
managementplansthat includeactions
that will benefit thedeserttortoise.
Developmentof such landuseplans
should focuson recommendations
providedin the deserttortoiserecovery
plan.

Issue38: Somepeoplecommented
that theServiceshould preparean
Environmental impact Statement
pursuantto the NationalEnvironmental
PolicyAct ~NEPA’)on the proposed
designationof critical habitatpriorto
publishinga final rule.

ServiceResponse:The decisionin
Pacific Le~,aJFoundationv. Andrus,675
F2d 829 Ir6th Gin. 19811,held thatasa
matterof law, anEnvironmentalImpact
Statementis not requiredfor listings
under theAct. The decisionnotedthat
preparingEnvironmentalImpact
Statementson listing actions doesnot
further the goals of NEPA-ortheAct.
The Servicebelievesthat,underthe
reasoningof thisdecision,preparingan
EnvironmentalImpactStatementon the

proposedcritical habitatdesignation
would notItntherthe~ais of N~PAor
theActendisnot legallyrequired.
NEPiIdocementationwill berequired
for BLM plansandactivitiesthat
involvecriticalhabitatTheService
publishedanoticeoutlining this
determinationonOctober2.5, 1983(48
FR492.44).Thedecisionin Dotagias
Countyv. Babbitt.810F.Supp. 1470(D.
Ore.1992),whichheld thattheService
bestcomply with NEPAin designating
criticalhabitat,hasbeenstayedpending
appealof thedecisiontotheNinth
CircuitCourtof Appeals.

Issue39: Oneletter statedthat final
designationshouldincludemore
definitive guidelinesand specific
examplesformeasuringadverse
modificationof critical habitat.

ServiceResponse:It isdifficult for the
Serviceto anticipateall activitiesthat
may beproposedwithin critical habitat.
In addition,theServiceshouldavoid
prejudgingtheoutcomeof section7
consultations.TheServicewill makea
determination,on acase-by-casebasis,
if the proposedactionis likely to
jeopardizethecontinuedexistenceof
the speciesor destroyor adversely
modify critical habitat.

Issue40:A numberof organizations
and individuals requestedthat the
Serviceincludewithin criticalhabitat
theproposedsite for the low-level
radioactivewasterepository(LLRWR) in
Ward Valley (ChemehueviCHU).
Commentersprovideda varietyof
reasonsfor inclusionof theLLRWR site,
includingpotential threatsto thedesert
tortoiseshouldthe LLRWR leak
radionuclide-contaminatedfluids,
leachatecontaminationof the aquifer
underly.ing the LLRWR site,the
potential for contaminationof the
ColoradoRiver andsubsequentadverse
effectsto listed speciesthat inhabitthe
ColoradoRiver,-andtheallegedpoor
operatingrecordof theproposed
licensee.Somecommentersstatedthat
allowing the proposedLLRWR inWard
Valley would violate sections2, 4(b)(2),
and 7(a)(1) of the EndangeredSpades
Act.

ServiceResponse:The Servicehas
determined that the Ward Valley
LLRWR facility sites.hould-beincluded
in this criti al habitatdesignation.
Following designationof critical habitat,
all currentactivitiesfor whichaFederal
agencymaintains discretionaryaction
must undergoreinitiationof
consultationto analyzewhetherornot
they are likely to destroyoradversely
modify critical habitat.Asaresult,the
BLM will needto reinitiateconsultation
undersection7 to determineif its
proposedtransferof lands to the State
of California for the proposedLLRWR

facility is likely toresultin theadverse
modificationof critical habitat

Issue41:Onegroupstatedthat the
Servicemustconsider~theculturalvalue
to nativepeoplesof landswithin critical
habitat Specifically, theseindividuals
slatedthattheculturalvaluesof Ward
Valley shouldbeconsideredin the
decisionto include orexcludefrom
criticalhabitattheproposedLLRWR site
in WardValley.

ServiceResponseTheService
designatedcritical habitatbasedon
biologicalinformationregarding
whetherornotanareacontainsthe
primaryconstituentelementsof desert
tortoisehabitat,aftertakingintoaccount
the economiccostsof’designatingthat
area.AlthoughtheServicerecognizes
thatWard Valley is i.mportanlculturally
to indigenouspeoplesoftheregion,the
Act doesnot addressinclusionof areas
within critical habitatfercultural
reasons.

Issue42:Somerespondentsstated
that critical habitat shouldnot be
designatedbecausespecieslike the
tortoisethat cannotadaptshouldbe
allowedto becomeextinct.

ServiceResponse:In section2 of the
Act, Findings,Purposes,andPolicy,
Congressfoundthatnumerousspecies
of fish, wildlife, andplantshadbecome
extinctandthatotherspecieshad
becomeso depletedin numbersthat
thesespeciesware in dangerof, or
threatenedwith, extinctiondue to a lack
of concernfor their conservation.
Furthermore,Congressfound that these
speciesof fish, wildlife, and plants.are
intrinsically valuabletothe Nationand
its people.Thesefindingsarethebasis
of theEndangeredSpeciesAct, the
purposeof which is to conserve
threatenedandendangeredspeciesand
the ecosystemson which theydepend.
Thedesignationofcriticalhabitatis-one
mechanismprovidedundertheAct to
facilitate the recoveryof listedspecies.
It would be contrary to theAct andthe
mission of the Serviceto-allow the
deserttortoiseto becomeextinct
without takingall reasonable
preventativeactions.

Issue43: Seinerespondentsstated
that the Servicehad not protected
enoughcritical habitat,becauseeven
full implementationofthe draft
recoveryplangivesthetortoiseonly a
50/50chanceof survivingSO0years.

ServiceResponse:The CHUs
proposedby theServicewerebasedon
recommendationsprovidedin theDraft
RecoveryPlan becausethoseareasare
necessaryfor the recqveryof the desert
tortoise.Someareasarelargerthan
thoserecommendedin the Draft
RecoveryPlanbasedon new biological
information.The Draft RecoveryPlan
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pointed out that implementation of
recoveryactionscanincreasethe
probability of survival of the species.

Issue44:Onerespondentstatedthat
designationof critical habitat abovethat
requiredor suggestedby the Act as
mitigation againstthreatenedadditional
litigation is improper. Section4(b)(2) of
the Act definesthe methodologyto be
usedin the determination ofcritical
habitat, asexemplified by the actions of
the RecoveryTeam.However,the
boundariesof the proposedCHUs
extendbeyondthatrecommendedby
theDesertTortoiseRecoveryPlan for
DWMAs. The Serviceshould not
arbitrarilydesignateadditional acreage
that is “unsuitable”or excessive.
Critical habitatshouldnot include the
entirerangeof the species.The Service
neither identifies nor makesavailable
the contentor sourceof the additional
information upon which these
expansionsare basedsothat the
reviewing public hasan opportunity to
baseits commentsuponthe same
information. The proposedrule
increasedthenumberof DWMAs in
California from four to eight.

ServiceResponse:The Servicebased
its designationof critical habitat on
biological information and recovery
recommendationsprovidedby theDraft
RecoveryPlan. The Draft RecoveryPlan
provided generalareasin which
recoveryis necessaryto ensure
maintenanceof viable populations of
deserttortoisesin eachof the six
recoveryunits.The Act requiresthat
critical habitatboundariesbe definedby
legal metesandbounds.To refinethe
Draft RecoveryPlanrecommendations,
the Serviceheld regional meetingsof
desert tortoise biologists and agency
personnelduring preparation of the
proposed rule. Informationgathered
during thesemeetingswasevaluated
arid incorporated into the critical habitat
boundaries,which were generally
drawnto the nearestsectionline. Final
designationof critical habitat also
included an economicanalysisof the
costsof designatingcritical habitat.

The Draft RecoveryPlanrecommends
eight DWMAs within four recovery
units in California.Theseinclude
ChemehueviDWMA (Northern
Colorado RecoveryUnit); Chuckwalla
andpartof JoshuaTreeDWMAs
(Eastern Colorado RecoveryUnit); Ord-
Rodman, Superior-Cronese,Fremont-
Kramer,andpart of JoshuaTree
DWMAs (Western Mojave Recovery
Unit); andFennerandIvanpahDWMAs
(Eastern Mojave RecoveryUnit). The
FennerDWMA is incorporated into the
Piute-Eldorado0-lU, which extends
into Nevada.JoshuaTreeNational
Monument, although still considered

important for recovery,wasnot
designatedas critical habitat because
suchdesignationwould not afford the
deserttortoise anyadditional benefit
dueto the National ParkService’s
ecosystemmanagementof the area.
However, the BLM land northof the
Joshua TreeNational Monument was
designatedcritical habitat,andwas
given thenew nameof the Pinto
Mountains CHU.

Issue45:One letter disagreedwith the
useof recoveryunitsas legally and
biologically acceptedsubpopulationsof
the Mojave population. Behavioral,
physiological,and ecological
uniquenesshave not beenlinked to the
geneticand morphologic variability
describedfor Nevadapopulations. The
boundsof adaptiveplasticity for the
deserttortoisehave not been
determined.

ServiceResponse:The Servicebased
the critical habitat designationon
recommendationsprovided in the Draft
RecoveryPlan,which is the most
comprehensivesourceof information on
the desert tortoiseat this time. Should
therecommendationsin the final
recoveryplandiffer significantly from
that of the draft, the Servicewill
reevaluatethe critical habitat
designation.

Issue46: Onerespondentstated that
the proposedcritical habitat designation
focusedattention only onactivities that
impair vegetation,soil structure,or
other physical attributes of the habitat,
andconsideredthis analysisto be too
narrow.The criteria should also include
rectifyingbiological imbalancesthat
result from habitat alteration (e.g.,
ravensand non-native plant species).
Feralpredators,suchas dogs,should be
consideredin the sameway as feral
horsesand burros. Surface disturbances
causedby suchactivities as utility
rights-of-way, road construction, and
real estatedevelopmentshould be
included.

ServiceResponse:The Servicealready
addressesthoseactions that may
increaseferal predators or ravens
through section 7 of the Act to
determine if such actionsarelikely to
jeopardize thecontinued existenceof
the deserttortoise. The Serviceagrees
that habitat imbalancesnegativelyaffect
deserttortoises and should be avoided
within critical habitat. Such imbalances
often result in increasedexotic species,
suchas weedyvegetation,and have
contributed toward the increaseof
ravensin the Mojave Desert.The final
rule discussesroad andutility
construction and issuanceof Federal
housing loans asrequiring consultation
pursuant to section7 of the Act to
determine, on a case-by-casebasis,

whether or not suchproposedactions
arelikely to adverselymodify or destroy
critical habitat.

Issue47: Several letters statedthat
desert tortoisesare not native to the
UpperVirgin RiverRecoveryUnit (nor
CHU); they were imported into the area
by humans.Therefore,critical habitat
designationis really landacquisition,
not a designationof natural habitat.

ServiceResponse:Listing of the
Mojave population of deserttortoisesas
a threatened speciesaffords it protection
under the Act, regardlessof speculation
on the origin of populations.

Issue48: Severalcommenters pointed
out that areasproposedas critical
habitatwithin theUpperVirgin River
CHU included areasthat do not have
deserttortoises present(e.g., developed
areas,high elevations).

ServiceResponse:The Servicehas
used readily recognizableland features
and legal descriptions to define the
boundaries of deserttortoise critical
habitat. Only the land within those
boundaries that is suitable desert
tortoise habitat (i.e., containsthe
primaryconstituent elements)is treated
ascritical habitat. Although the Service
hasadjusted boundary lines to exclude
non-habitat to a great extent in this final
designation,it remainsmechanically
impossiblefor the Serviceto specifically
identify all non-habitat by legal
description, particularly becausemany
of theselands are less than 40 acresin
size. Actions proposedwithin areas
without the primary constituent
elementsof desert tortoise habitat will
not be subject to section 7 of the Act,
unlesssuchactions may affect nearby
critical habitat.

In the caseof unoccupied, suitable
desert tortoise habitat, the Act states
clearly thatareasin needof special
management(inside or outside of the
current range of the species)can be
included in designationof critical
habitat. Recoveryof the desert tortoise
within the Upper Virgin River Recovery
Unit is dependentuponmaintenance
andimprovement in thequantity,
quality, and/orarrangementof habitat.

Issue 49: One letter statedthat critical
habitatdesignatedonTribal landin
Utahis insufficientto supportaviable
population of desert tortoises.

ServiceResponse:Population viability
analysisis appropriateonly at the
population level. Therefore, the Service
doesnot evaluatepopulation viability of
separateportions of a CHU. Although it
requiresmoreintensive managementas
it is a smallerpopulation,theUpper
Virgin RiverRecoveryUnit, as
recommendedby the DesertTortoise
RecoveryTeam, is a viable and
recoverablepopulationof desert
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tox~ses.TheTribal landswithin Utah
areo~deiedpeititthis recowe~i~
The lJç~erVirVn ~ii~erCHU
correspondsto this reaswyunit

1ss~e50: Several~letters~La4edthatthe
impoitamceof~iningandgmzingin
rural~i aiuiiãtieswas~ adequa&e~y
addreasedin ibaeconomicanalysis..

~Moe Response:The.s~alLest
subdivisionwithstandard. ningfal
economicdatanormally~san individ~a1
coua.tythus,economicimpactsare
basedupon county datz(orreional
effects,whereasstatewideor nationwkle
data andeffectsareaddressedonly if
they becomeeconcinicellyrelevant.

i~ssue5~:A fewpeoplewere
concernedthat inclusionof their private
landwithin criticalhabitatboundaries
would negateFt. Irwin’s desireto
purchasetheir land for future
expansion,and theyaskedif theService
wasgoing to compensatethem for their
lossof revenue.In addition,some
peoplesubmittedcommentsaskingthe
governmentto compensatethem for
reductionsin landvaluesdueto their
inclusion within critical habitat
boundaries.

ServiceResponse:TheNational
TrainingCenterat Ft. irwin revisedits
expansionproposalin responseto the
Service’sconcernsfor deserttortoises
prior to the proposalofcriticafliabitat.

Therefore,designationoI•critical
habitatwould not affect privatelands
thatwerein theoriginal proposed
expansionarea.In thefuture,the
Federalgovernmentmay pursue
acquisitionof privatelandswithin the
CHUson awilling seller/wiltingbuyer
basisto fnrther theconservationof the
deserttortoise.

Neitherthe Act nor anyotherlaw
administeredby the Serviceauthorizes
compensationfor perceiveddecreasesin
land valueassuggestedby the
comments.Consequently,this issueis a
matterforotheragenciesandCongress
to consider.

Issue52~Somerespondertts‘stated
that ‘the Serviceis ‘underestimating
economicimpactsby separatingimpacts
from the listingprecessandthe
designationof~ritical habitat.The
economicanalysisaddresses‘on’y
incrementalimp&1s associatedwith
designationof aitical habitatandomits
impactsremitting from previous
managementplansandoensultations.

&s~m~The Endangered
Sp~sActap&i~esthatihelistingal
speciessheuldbebaseds.~elyupan‘the
bestbiologicalinf~umtionav.ailahle.
However,the1~ap~thesthatthe
Serviceshou.klconsidereconomicand
otherrelevantiiap~1sin the
desi~iatiimofcritical hab~aLListinga
speciesprovidesprotectionunderthe

jeopardy standard andincidentaltahe
designating siticalhabitatpsovides
additional p7aL&1K~throu~the
adverse~lification standard.These
areintezidedto be sep~lestandardsto
be addm~Ithroughsection7
cenanltstioa,Theeconomicanalysis
clearlydistinguishesbetweenthecasts
andbeneAtsof theseindependentend
incrementalactionsendisnot on elfort
to underestimate‘costs.The total ‘costof
conservingthe deserttortoiseis greater
thanthe‘costold signetin i’itica’l
habitatalone,andit includesthe ‘costs
of priortortoiseprotection~eastares
underotherlawsendcostsr’esultirtg
from listingunderthe Act, aswall asthe
costof designatingcriticalhabitat.

Issue53: A few respondentsstated
thatthesection7decistonsto restrict
grazing‘arecurrentlyunderlitigation
and.astayofthesedecisionshasbeen
issued.Therefore,theeconomicanalysis
shouldbebasedon ‘current¶prelisting)
grazingpractices.

SeisooeResponse:TheServicebased
its economicbaselineonthebiological
opinionsrenderedby theServiceand
the decisionsissuedby The BLM on
livestockgrazingin deserttortoise
habitat. The interior Boardof Land
Appealsmayreviewlandusedecisions
by Interior Departmentagencies,but
lacksjurisdictionneededto review
biologicalopinionsissuedby the
Service.Therefore,thehi$.eriorBoardof
Land AppealsJudge’sstayof these
decisionsdoesnotaltertheeconomic
baseline.

Issue 54:One respondentstatedthat
noattempt to quantifythe benefitsof
criticalhabitatdesignationwasmadeby
theService.This isneededto balance
thecosts,evenii foundnotbe
significant.TheEconomicAnalysis
(page6133‘states,“To properlycompare
benefitsandcosts,thefull range.øfeach
mustbeconsidered.”Thestudyfails to
do This; therefore,the existingstudy
cannotbeused to excludeany of the
proposedcritical habitatareas.

SeiweResponse~Conductinga
quantitative ‘studyof speciesbenefitsis
a costlyandlengthyprocessthatwas
notpossiblewithin the‘court-mandated
deadlines.Evenwith ies&its of sucha
study,.allocatiegthebenefitsof
preservationandrecoveryof an
endangered‘speolesbetweenthevarious
actionsrequiredisenextremely
did~icu1ttask.If speciespreservation
wereaccomplishedentirelythrough
designationof critical habitat,thenthe
fall valueofbenefitscouldbeattributed
to that action. Typically, however,
preservationisachievedwith multiple
interactivemanagementactionsle.g.,
federally listing asthreatenedor
endangered,protectionunderState

law.), eachof whichmaybeessentialto
recoveryandno oneof which can be
singledoutasthesolemeansby which
a speciesis preservedor recovery
attained.(~venthedataavailable,and
withoutadeardeflnestianoftheresults
of eachmanagementalternative,It is not
possibleto disaggregatethesumof
bene6tstoidentify thatportiondirectly
attributableto criticalhabitat
designation.

Issee55-Oneletterstatedthatthe
economicanalysisdoesnotaddressthe
impactof potentialdelaysin both
maintenenoeandnewconstruction
causedbydesignationofcritical habitat.

ServiceRe ponseActionsthatam
authorized,funded,orcurriedoutby
Federalagenciesareeheady’subjectto
the jeopardystandardpursuantto
section7 cUbeAct, if suchactionsmay
affect deserttortoises.Theseactions
requireconsultationbetweentheaction
agencyand theServiceto determine
whetheror notTheyarelikely to
jeopardizethecontinuedexistenceof
the desert tortoise. Will, designationof
critical habitat,theServicewill also
determinewhetheror not suchactions
arelikely to destroyor adverselymodify
critical habitat.Both assessments‘will be
madeconcurrentlythroughconsultation
between‘the Federalactionagencyand
the Service; therefore,designationof
criticalhabitatwill notresultin any
additionalprojectdelays~TheAct
requirestheServiceto issueabiokigical
opinionwithin 135daysof thereceipt
of a request for formalsection7
consultationfrom anactionagency.
Therefore,therequirementfor Federal
agenciesto insurethattheir actionsdo
not jeopardizethecontinuedexistence
of listedspeciesor adverselymodify
critical habitat would not result in
projectdelays.

Issue56-Onegroupstatedthat,given
the long time framenecessaryfor
recoveryof The deserttortoise,the
economicanalysisshould have
consideredthelong-termaffectsof
knownor foreseeableprojects.

ServiceResponse:Withoutknowing
thedetailsoffutureprojects,theService
cannotknowhow orto whatextent
suchprojectsmayaffectcritical habitat
or viceversa.TheService evaluated
economicinformationprovidedon
existing projects to detetmmneif the
benefitsofexcludingareasoutweighed
the benefitsof designatingthoseareasas
critical habitat.TheServicewasunable
to assignacostto‘thoseprojectsthat
may or maynotbeproposedwithin
critical habitat‘in thefuture.

Issue57:Onegroopstatedthatthe
economicanalysisof theelfects‘of
removinggrazingfrom Federdilands
was inadequateandunderstatesthe
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importanceof grazingto the region’s
economy.Ranchersactasland
managersfor the Federalgovernment.
By eliminatingranching.the Federal
governmentwould haveto expend
additionalmoniesfor management.In
addition, rangeimprovements,
associatedwithgrazingonFederal
lands,improve overall habitat quality by
providing water sourcesand facilitating
effectiveforage use.

ServiceResponse:According to a
1991 study by the GAO, thecostsof
administeringthe livestockgrazing
programby the BLM andDepartmentof
Agriculture (predatorcontrol and
rangelandgrasshoppercontrol) far
exceedthefeesderivedfrom the
ranchersfor their AUMs.

Issue58: Oneletterstatedthatthe
criticalhabitateconomicanalysis
shouldhaveincludedthecosts
associatedwith implementationof the
recoveryplan. A 2006date for delisting
wasselectedin an arbitraryand
capricious manner anddesignedto limit
theamountof funding the Recovery
Teamhad to report in the Draft
RecoveryPlan,

ServiceResponse:Implementation of
the recoveryplan for the desert tortoise
is not a costattributable to designation
of critical habitat. The Draft Recovery
Plan waspreparedprior to proposing
critical habitat and is mandated by the
Endangered SpeciesAct whetheror not
a specieshas designatedcritical habitat.
Therefore, its implementation canbe
considereda costof listing the desert
tortoise as threatenedversus a cost
associatedwith designationof critical
habitat.

Issue59: The DOD installations stated
that theeconomicanalysisfailed to
evaluatethecoststo the public of
relocatingbaseactivities orpotential
baseclosuresthat might result from
inclusion in critical habitat.

ServiceResponse:After careful
considerationof theactivities that occur
on the military installations, the Service
concludedthat designation of critical
habitat should not result in the closure
of military basesin theregion.The
Servicemaintains that most training
conductedon thebasescanbe
compatible with proper tortoise
managementandhasconcludedthat
concernsaboutmilitary basesbeing
rendered unusabledue to designation of
critical habitat are overstated.Areasthat
include existing facilities, or that have
beenhighly degraded(e.g.,high-impact
bombing ranges),donot contain
constituent elementsof tortoise habitat.
Therefore, they do not constitute critical
habitat. Expansionor relocation of
facilities or activities that maydestroy
or adverselymodify critical habitat

within aCliii on amilitary base(e.g.,
relocationof high impactbombing
targets)would requiresection7
consultationto determineif the
relocationis likely to jeopardize the
continued existenceof the desert
tortoiseor destroyor adverselymodify
its critical habitat.

Issue60:The Serviceshould, on
economicgrounds,excludethe
proposedsite of the LLRWR facility in
WardValley.

ServiceResponse:The Serviceis
awarethat including the Ward Valley.
site in critical habitat may threatena
portion of theinvestmentmadein siting
the LLRWR facility andmayresult in
potentially significantcostsfor theState
of California.However,after considering
thesepotential economicimpacts, the
Servicehasdeterminedthatthearea
should not be excludedfrom critical
habitat designation.

Issue 61:Severalletters suggestedthat
designationof critical habitat would
result in taking of private property.

ServiceResponse:The courtshave
held that the mere enactmentof laws
that may result in restrictionson
property doesnot necessarilyequateto
a taking of property for which
compensationis required(Hodelv.
Virginia SurfaceMining and
ReclamationAssociation,452U.S. 264,
295(1981),Agins v. Tiburon, 447U.S.
255, 260—263 (1980)). Therefore, the
Serviceconcludesthat publication of a
final rule designatingcritical habitat for
the deserttortoisedoesnot equateto a
takingof property requiring just
compensation.

Recognizingthat governmental
regulation involvesadjustment of rights
for the public good, the U.S. Supreme
Courthasfoundthata regulationthat
curtails themostprofitableuseofone’s
property,resultingin a reductionin
value or limitations on uselikewise
doesnot necessarilyequateto a taking
(Andrusv. Allard, 444 U.S. 51, 66
(1979),Agins,447U.S. at 262,Hodel,
452U.S. at 296). Where a regulation
deniesa property ownerthe
economicallyviable useof his or her
property,thena takingwill likely occur
(Agins, 447U.S.at 260). However,
where regulations do not categorically
prohibit usebut merely regulatethe
conditions under which such usemay
occur, anddo not regulatealternative
uses,then notaking occurs(Hodel,452
U.S.at 296).With the designationof
critical habitat, a propertyowneris not
denied the economicalviable useof his
or her land. Useof land is not
categoricallyprohibited but rather
certain restrictionsmaybe imposed
upon Federal agencyactions that may
result in the destructionor adverse

modificationof critical habitat. As such,
the Serviceconcludesthat designation
of critical habitat will not result in a
takingof privateproperty.

Furthermore,a property ownermust
establishthat a “concretecontroversy”
existsbefore the court may even reach
the merits of a takingsclaim (Hodel.452
U.S. at 294,Agins,447 U.S.at 2603.The
property owner must showa specific
and real impact to specificproperties
before judicial resolution of a takings
claim is made (MacDonald, Sommer,
andFrates v. Yolo County,477U.S. 340,
348—349,Agins,447U.S. at 260). As
applied to critical habitat designation,a
claim of takingsof property would not
be ripe for judicial resolutionuntil the
consultation processis completedand
exemption from the EndangeredSpecies
Committee is denied.Even then, it is
highly unlikely that a takingsclaim
would be successfulbecause
designationof critical habitat doesnot
categorically prohibit useof the
property owner’s land. Therefore, the
Servicehasconcludedthat designation
of critical habitat for the deserttortoise
doesnot posesignificant takings
implications.

issue62:One letter statedthat
designationof State landsascritical
habitat violates the “trust”
responsibility,of theFederalgovernment
to the States.The main purposeof these
State lands is to provide funding for the
State’sschools.

ServiceResponse:Critical habitat
designationwill notaffect State lands
unlessproposedactions on theselands
areauthorized, funded, or carried out by
Federalagencies.Suchactionswould
then be subject to consultation if they
may affect the desert tortoise or its
habitat pursuant to section7 of the Act.
As with private lands, State landsare
already subject to prohibitions of
section9 of the Act, which prohibit
unauthorized take of listed species.

Issue63:Several groups statedthat
conferencingon projects in proposed
critical habitat is illegal becausethe
deserttortoiseis already listed and
becausecritical habitat hasbeen
proposedyears beyond the statutory
deadline for such designation.

ServiceResponse:Section7(a)(4) of
the Act and 50 CFR 402.10of the
regulationsrequireFederalagenciesto
confer with the Serviceon anyaction
that is likely to result in destruction or
adversemodification of proposed
critical habitat. With designationof
critical habitat, Federalagencieswill be
required to enter into formal
consultation with the Servicefor any
actions that may affect desert tortoises
or their critical habitat,
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Issue64:Oneletterstatedthat the
public did not receivean adequate
opportunity to review the mapsupon
which the proposedrulewasbased
becausethe mapsprovidedin the
FederalRegisternotice were toosmall
to be useful.

ServiceResponse:The Service
providedopportunitiesfor the public to
reviewmapsat a scaleof 1:100,000at
eachof three public hearingsandmade
themapsavailable at the field offices
locatedin Arizona. California,Nevada,
and Utah.Dueto the court-mandated
timeframe for developmentof the
proposedrule, the Servicewasunableto
providecopiesof theselarger-scaled
mapsto other agencies.

issue65:There was an insufficient
amountof time for commentand review
betweenthecritical habitat proposal
and final designation.

ServiceResponse:The Service
provided 60 daysfor public comment
on the critical habitat proposal,which
includedthreepublic hearings.The
schedulefor designationof critical
habitat follows a stipulation andorder
of dismissalfiled on August 3, 1993,in
two lawsuits filed against the Service
(Natural ResourcesDefenseCouncil, et
al., v. BruceBabbitt etci. andDesert
Tortoise(Gopherusagassizii)a
threatenedspecies;etal., v. Manual
LuJan, Jr.). This court-mandated
schedulerequirespublication of the
final critical habitat ruleby December
15, 1993.This short time frame for
finalizing the rule doesnot allow for an
extensionof thepublic commentperiod.

Issue66:One letter statedthat Tribal
economiccostsresulting from critical
habitat designationwere not considered
In the proposal.

ServiceResponse:For a 60-dayperiod
after the drafteconomicanalysiswas
madeavailable to the public, the Service
collectedandconsideredother
responsesfrom StateandFederal
agencies,private land holders, the
Tribe, andother entities regarding
economiceffectsthey might experience
from the proposeddesignation.All
responsesthat identified specific
economicimpactswere consideredin
completing the final economicanalysis.
During the public commentperiod, the
Tribe commentedthat the proposed
designation“could eliminate or reduce
economicdevelopmentandother
opportunities,” but did not identify or
describespecificeffectsthat allowed
estimation of economicimpacts.

Issue67:The Aerojet-General
CorporationandWyle Laboratories have
requestedthat the 42,800acres that they
have purchased (28,800acres)and
leased(14,000acres)from the BLM be
excludedfrom critical habitat

designation.Thebasisfor the request
was the EnvironmentalStipulations
containedin the LandExchangeand
LeaseAgreementssignedpursuantto
the Nevada-FloridaLandExchange
Authorization Act of 1988,which
establisheda detailedplanfor the
conservationof the desert tortoise on
theselands,In additionAerojet-General
Corporationfelt that statementsthat
critical habitatdoesnot affectprivate
landsaremisleading,because
designationof critical habitat will affect
theselandsand their futureuseeither
throughthe section7 processor through
the section10 permitprocess.

ServiceResponse:The Service
recognizesthedeserttortoise
managementplan for this areabut does
notbelievethat it adequatelyaddresses
the potentialimpactsofthe
transmissionlines that are proposed
throughCoyote Spring Valley.
Therefore, the Servicehasincluded this
area in the designationof critical
habitat. Whetheror not critical habitat

- is designated,landscontaining desert
tortoises andtheir habitat arestill
subject to section9 of the Act, which
prohibits unauthorized take of listed
species.The only avenuesfor
authorizing take that isincidental to
otherwise lawful activities arethe
section7 processfor activitiesthat are
authorized, funded, or carriedoutby
Federalagencies,andthe section
10(a)(1)(B)permitting processfor non-
Federalactions on private or State
lands.

National Environmental Policy Act
The Servicehasdeterminedthat an

Environmental AssessmentandJoran
Environmental Impact Statement,as
definedunder the authority of the
National Environmental Policy Act of
1969,neednot be prepared in
connection with regulationsadopted
pursuant to section4(a) of theAct. A
noticeoutlining the Service’sreasons
for this determination waspublished in
the FederalRegisteron October25,
1983 (48FR 49244).

Regulatory Flexibility Act and
ExecutiveOrder 12866

This final rule hasbeenreviewed
under ExecutiveOrder 12866.The
Department of the Interior has
determinedthat the final rule will not
have a significant economiceffect on a
substantial number of small entities
under the Regulatory Flexibility Act (5
U.S.C.601 etseq.).Basedon the
information discussedin this rule
concerningpublic projectsandprivate
activitieswithin CHUs,.signiflcant
economicimpacts will not result from
thecritical habitat designation.Also, no

directcosts,enforcementcosts,
informationcollection,or recordkeeping
requirementsareImposedon small
entitiesby this designation.Further,the
rulecontainsnorecordkeeping
requirementsasdefinedby the
PaperworkReductionAct of 1980.

TakingsImplicationsAssessment
TheServicehasanalyzedthe

potential takingsimplications of
designatingcritical habitat for the desert
tortoise in a Takings Implications
Assessmentpreparedpursuant to
requirements of ExecutiveOrder 12630,
“Governmental Actions and Interference
with Constitutionally ProtectedProperty
Rights.” The Takings Implications
Assessmentconcludesthat the
designationdoesnot posesignificant
takings implications.
ReferencesCited

A completelist of all referencescited
herein is available upon requestfrom
the Field Supervisor, Nevada Field
Office (seeADDRESSES section),
Authors

Theprimary authors of this rule and
its associatedCHU mapsare Sheryl L
Barrett,Christine Mullen, Mark Maley,
Michael Burroughs, andDavidL
Harlow, U.S. FishandWildlife Service,
NevadaField Office (seeADDRESSES
section);Ray Bransfield, Kirk Wain, and
Tim MacGillvray, U.S.Fish andWildlife
Service,Ventura Field Office; Marilet A.
Zablan, U.S. Fish andWildlife Service,
Utah StateOffice; JamesRorabaugh.
U.S. Fish andWildlife Service,Arizona
Field Office; Arthur Davenport, U.S.
Fish and Wildlife Service,Carlsbad
Field Office; Mel SchambergerandDirk
Draper, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service,
National EcologyResearchCenter. Ft.
Collins, Colorado.
List of Subjectsin 50 CFRPart17

Endangeredandthreatenedspecies,
Exports, Imports, Reporting and
recordkeepingrequirements, and
Transportation.
RegulationPromulgation

Accordingly,part 17, subchapterB of
chapterI, title 50 of the Codeof Federal
Regulationsis hereby amendedasset
forth below:

PART 17—(AMENDED]

1. The authoritycitation for part17
continuesto read as follows:

Authority: 16 U.S.C. 1361—1407;16 U.S.C.
1531—1544;16 U.S.C.4201—4245;Pub.L 99—
625,100 Stat. 3500,unlessotherwisenoted.

2. Section17.95(c) is amendedby
removingthecritical habitatof the
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BeaverDarnSlopepopulationof the § 17.55 Cdtlcal habIU~—flshandwildillS. DesertTortoise—MalayaPopulation
deserttortoiseandaddingthefollowing a a a * a (Gophesagnwzii)
newcriticalhabitatof the desert tortoise a a a Indexmapof approximate locations
(Gopherusagassizii~in fts placeto reed a (c) a a a • of critical habitatunitsfollows:
asfollows

BiLLiNGcoca43*414
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California.Areasof land asfollows:
1. Fremont-KromerUnit Kern,Los

Angeles,and San BernardinoCounties.From

BLM Maps: Victorville 1978andCuddeback
Lake1978.(IndexmaplocationA).

Mt. Diablo Meridian: T. 29S., R. 39 E..
secs.13,14,22—26,35,and36;T. 29 S.,R.
40 E.. sees.12—33; T. 29 S., R.41 E., sees.
7, 8, 17—20, 27—30, and 32—36; T. 30S.,R

38E., sees.24—26, 35. and36;T. 30S., R.
39 E.. sees.1—36 exceptsees.3—5;T. 30 S..
R.40 E., sees.4—9 and 13—36 exceptthose
portionsof sees.13, 14,and 23 lyIng
northwesterlyof the Randsburg-MojaveRoad;
T. 30 S., R. 41 E., sees.1—36 exceptsees.5—

MAP1

Nevada

California
Arizona

Yuma
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8 and20 andthoseportionsof sees.17 and
18 lying easterlyof U.S. Hwy. 395; T. 30S.,
R.42 E., sees.7—10, 15—22,and27—34; T. 31
S., R. 40 E., sees.I and 6 exceptthat portion
of sec. 6 lying southeasterlyof the
Randsburg-MojaveRoad;T. 31 S., R. 41 E.,
sees.1—17,20—29.and32—36exceptthose
portionsof sees.20, 29 and32 lying westerly
of U.S. Hwy. 395; T. 31 S., R. 42 E., sees.3—
10, 15—22, and 27—34; T. 32S., R. 41 E., sees.
1—4, 9—16, 21—28, and34—36 exceptthose
portions of sees.4, 9, 16, 21, 27, 28, and34
lying westerlyof U.S. Hwy. 395; T. 32 S., it
42 E..T. 32 S., R.43 E., sees.4—9,16-21,and
28—33.

SanBernardino Meridian: T. 7 N., R.5 W.,
sees.2—11 and 14—18except that portion of
see.18 lying west of U.S.Hwy.395;T. 7 N.,
R.6W., sees.1—6, 12,and13 exceptthose
portions of sees.1, 12, and 13 lying westerly
of U.S. Hwy. 395; T. 7 N., R. 7 W., sees.1—
6;T.7N.,R.8W.,secs.1-4;T.8N.,R4
W.,secs.6,7,andl8;T.8N.,R.SW.,secs.
1—35 exceptsees.24and25; T. 8 N., it 6 W.;
T. 8 N., R. 7 W.; T. 8 N., It 8W., sees.1-
28,and 33—36; T. 8 N., it 9W., sees.I and
7—24; T. 9 N., R. 4 W., sees.2—11, 14-23.30,
and3l;T.9N..R5W.T.9N..R.6W.;
1. 9 N., R. 7 W., sees.1-4, 9—16,and 19—36;
T. 9 N., R. 8 W., sees.24, 25, and31—36; T.

9 N., R. 9 W., sec. 36; T. 10 N., R. 4 W.. sees.
6,7, 18—20, and 29—34; T. ION.. R. SW.; T.
10 N., R. 6 W., sees.1—36 exceptsec.6; T.
ION., R. 7 W., sees.9—16, 21—28, and 33—
36; T. 11 N.,R. 5W., sees.2—11, 14-23.and
26-35;T. 11 N.,R.SW., secs 1—36except
those portions of sees.6. 7, 18, 19,30, and
31 lying westerly of U.S. Hwy. 395; T. 11 N..
it 7 W., that portionof sec. I lying easterly
U.S. Hwy. 395;T. 12 N., R. 5 W., sees.31—
35; T. 12 N., It SW., sees.31—36; T. 12 N.,
it 7 W., that portion of sec. 36 lying easterly
of U.S. Hwy. 395.

BILLING CODE 4310—65—P
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MAP2

8a.uNG CODE 4310-65-C

2 Superior.CroneseUnit. SanBernardino
CoUnty. FromBLM Maps: CuddebackLake
1978.SodaMts. 1978, Victorvilie 1978, and
N’Jewberr~Springs 1978. (Index map location
8).

M~Diablo Meridian: T. 29 S., R.42 E.,
secs.35 and 36; T. 29 S., R. 43 E., gecs.25,
26, and 31—36; T. 29 S., R. 44 E., sees.20—
36: T. 29 S., R. 45 E., sees.14—16, 19—23, and
25—36;•T. 29S.,R. 46 E., sees.30—32; T. 30
S., R. 42 5., secs.1, 2, 11—14, 23—26. 35, and
36; T. 30 S.. R. 43 E.; T. 30S., R. 44 5.; T.
30 S., 5. 45 5.: T. 30 S., R. 48 5., sees.3—
36, T. 30 S., R. 47 E., sees.7—10. 15—22,and
27—34; T. 31 S., R. 42 E., sees.1, 2, 11—14,
23—26, 35, and36;T. 31 S., 5. 43 5.; T. 31

S., R. 44 E.; T. 31 S., 5. 45 5.; T. 31 S.. R.
46 E.; T. 31 S., R. 475., sacs.3—10, 15—22,
and 27—34; T. 32 S.. R. 43E., sees.1—3, 10.—
15, 22—27, and 34—36; T. 32S., R. 44 5.; T.
32 S., R. 45 5.; T. 32 S., R. 46 5.; T. 32 S.,
5. 47 E., secs.3—10. 15—22, arid 27—34.

SanBernardino Meridian: T. 9 N., R. I W.,
thoseportions of sacs.I and 2 lying northerly
of Interstate Hwy. 15; T. 9 N., R. 1 5., that
portion of sec.6 lying northerly of interstate
Hwy. 15; T. ION., 5. 2 W., secs.1—29; T. 10
N., 5. 1 W., sees.1—28. 30,and 33—36 except
thoseportionsof sees.33—35 lying
southwesterlyof Interstate Hwy. 15; T. 10 N.,
5.1 E.,secs.18,19,30,and31; T. ION.,R.
2 E., sacs.1—5, 8—17,and 22—34 except those
portions of sees.25, 26, and 34 lying

southeasterlyof InterstateHwy. 15; T. 10 N.,
5. 3 5., sees.1—12, 14—21, and 30 except
thoseportionsof sacs.II, 12, 14—16, 19—21,
and30 lying southeasterlyof InterstateHwy.
15;T. 10N., 5. 4 E.. thoseportions of sacs.
5—7 lying northwesterly of Interstate Hwy.
15; T. 11 N., R. 5W., sees.1 and 12;T. 11
N., R. 4W., secs.1—7.9, 11,and 12;T. Ii
N., R. 3 W., sacs.1—18; T. II N., 5. 2 W.; T.
II N., R. I W.; T. II N.. 5. 1 E., sees.1—31;
T. 11 N.. R. 2 E., sees.1—36 except sec. 31;
T. 11 N..R. 3 E.; T. 11 N.. R. 4 E., sees.1—
34 exceptthoseportions of sees.25, 26, 33,
and 34 lying southeasterlyof Interstate Hwy.
15; T. 11 N., R. 5 E.. sees.1—11 and 15—20
exceptthoseportions of sees.1, 2, 10, 11, 15—
17, 19, and 20 lying southeaster]yof
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InterstateHwy. 15; T. 12 N., R. 5 W., sec. 36;
T. 12 N.,R. 4W., sees.31-36;T. 12 N., R.
3W., sees.31—36; T. 12 N., 5. 2W., sees.31—
36; T. 12 N., R. 1 W., sees.31—36;T. 12N..
5. 1 5.; T. 12 N., R. 2 E., sees.3—36; T. 12

N., 5. 3 E., sees.7—36;T. 12N., R. 4 E., sees. I E.; T. 13 N., 5. 2 E., sacs.19 and 29—34;
7—36; T. 12 N., K. SE.,sees.1—5 and 7—36; T. 13 N., R. 5 E.. sees.26—28 and 32—36;T.
T. 12 N., 5. 65., sees.5—9, 15—22, and27 14 N..it 1 5., sees.5—10. 15—23. and 24—36.
34exceptthoseportions of sees.3 1—34lying
southerly of Interstate Hwy. 15;T. 13 N.,R. BILUNG CODE 4310-65-P
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MAP3

5851

SILLIISO CODE 4310-65-C

3 Qrd.RodmonUnit. SanBernardino
County.From BLM Maps:NewberrySprings
1978and Victorvllle 1978. (Index map
location C)

San BernardinoMeridian: T. 6 N., 5. 1 E.,
sacs.1—6, 10—15. 22—27. and 34—36:T. 6 N..
R. 2 E.. sacs.1—11. 14—22, and28—33;T. 7
N., 5.. 1 W.. sees.1—4,9—15,22—26,35,and
36 exceptthoseportionsof sees.4.9, 10, 15,
22. 23. 26. and 35 lying southwesterlyof
StateHwy.247T.7N.,RIE.;T.7N..R.
ZE.;T.7N.,R.3E.;T.7N.,R.4E.:T.7

N., It 5 E., sees.4—9 and 17—19exceptthose
portionsof sees.4, 8. 9, and17—19 lying
southerly of the northern boundaryof
Twentynine PalmsMarineCorpsBase;T. 8
N.. R. 1 W., sees.1—18, 20—29, and 32—36
exceptthoseportionsofsees.6, 7, 17, 18, 20,
29, 32, and 33 lying southwesterlyofState
Hwy. 247;T. 8 N..5. 1 E.; T. 8 N., It 25.,
sees.2—36;T. 8 N.,It 3 5.. sees.7 and 18—
36; T. 8 N., 5.4 5., sees.13—16and 18—36;
T. 8 N., 5. 5 5.,sacs.16—18. 19—21, 28—30,
and 31—33 exceptthoseportionsof sees.16
and 17 lying northerly of Interstate Hwy. 40;

T. 8 N..5. 6 E.. sees.16—21 and27—36 except
thoseportions of sees.18—21,27,28,34,and
35 lying northerlyof InterstateHwy. 40; T.
9 N.. 5. I W., sees.19, 20,and 25—38except
thoseportions of sees.19. 20. and29—31
lying westerlyof State Hwy. 247;T. 9 N., 5.
1 E., sees.25—36exceptthose portions of
sees.25—27 lying northerly ofInterstateHwy.
40 T.9 N.,R. 2 E., sees.27—35 exceptthose
portions of sees.27—30 lyingnortherlyof
InterstateHwy. 40.

BILUNG CODE 4310-65-P
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4. ChuckwaliaUnit. Imperial and Riverside
Counties. From BLM Maps: Chuckwalla #18
1978,Parker-Blythe #16 1978, Salton Sea#20
1978,and Midway Well #21 1979. (Index
maplocaUonD).

San Bernardino Meridian: T. 3 S., R. 13 E.,
sees.19—21 and 27—35; T. 4 S., 5. BE., sees.
1—6, 8—16, 22—26,and 36;T. 4 5., R. 9 E.,
sees.6—tO, and15—36; T. 4 S., R. 10 E., sees.
19—21, and 27—34; T. 4 S., 5. 13 E., sacs.2—
36 exceptsees.12 and13;T. 4 S., R. 14 E.,
sees.27—36; T. 4 S., 5. 15 E., sees.31 and
32; T. 5 S., 5. 9 E., sees.1—4, 1?, 13,and 24;
T. 5 S., 5. 10 E., sees.2—36 exceptsec.31;
T. 5 S., 5. 11 E., sees.19—21 and 28—33; T.
5 S., It 12 5., sec.36;T. 5 S., R. 13 E., sees.
1—36 except sees.6 and 7; T. 5 S.. R. 14 E.;
T. 5 S., 5. 15 E., sees.4—9, 16—21, 25, S ~/2

sec. 26, S 1/2 sec.27, and sees,28—36; T. 5
S., R, 16 E.. sees.28—35;T. 6 S., R.10 E., sees.
1—4, 9—16, 21—26, 35 and36; T. 6 S., R. Ii
E., sees.4—36;T. 6 S., R. 12 E.; T. 6 S., R.
13E.;T.6S.,R.14E.;T.6S.,R,15E.;T.
6 S., 5. 16 E.; T. 6 S., 5. 17 5., sees.5—9, and
14—36; T. 6 S., R. 185., sees.29—36;T. 6 S..
R. 19 E., sees.31—36;T. 6 S., R. 20 E., sees.
31—34; T. 7 S., R. lIE., sec.1; T. 7 S., R.
12 E., sacs.1—6, 9—15,and 23—25; T. 7 S., R.
13 E., sees.1—30 and 31—36; T. 7 S., R. 14
E.; T. 7 S., R. 15 E.; T. 7 S., 5. 16 E.; T. 7
S.,R,17E.;T.7S.,R.18E.;T.7S.,R.19
E.; T. 7 S., R. 20 E., secs.3—10, 14—23, and
26—35; T. 8 S., 5. 13 E., sacs.1, 2, and ii—
14;T. 8 S.,5. 14 E., sees.1—18, andsees.21—
26;T. 8 S., 5. 15 E., sees.1—30 and 34—36;
T.8S.,R16E.;T.8S.,R.17E.;T.8S.,
R.18E.;T.8S.,R.19E.;T.8S.,R.20E.,

sacs.3—10, 15—22, and 28—33; T. 9 S., R. 15
E., sec. 1; T. 9 S., 5. 16 E., sees.1—17, 20—
29, and 32—36;T. 9 S., R. 17 E.; T. 9 S., R.
18E.;T.9S.,R.19E.;T.9S.,R.20E.,secs.
5—8. 17—20. and 29—33;T. 10 S., R. 16 E.,
sees.1—5,9-16,and 22—26;T. 10 S., 5. 17
E.; T. 10S., R. 18 E.; T. lOS., 5. 19 E.; T.
lOS.,5. 20 E., sees.3—36; T. 10 S., R. 21 E.,
sacs.18—21 and 28—34;T. 10 1/2 S., 5. 21 E.,
sees.31—33; T. 11 S., R. 17 E., sees.1—5 and
8—15;T. 11 S., R. 18 E., sees.1—24; T. Ii S.,
R. 19 E., sees.1—26, 35.and 36;T. 11 S., R.
20E., sees.1—23 and 26—34;T. 11 S., R. 21
E., sees.4—8; T. 12 S.,R. 19 E., sees.1,2,11—
14. 23—26, 35,and 36; T. 12 S., R. 20 E., sees.
3—10, 15—22, and 27—34;T. 13S., 5. 19 E.,
sees.1, 2,11,12, 22—27, and 34—36;T. 13 S.,
R. 20 E., sees.3—10, 14—23, and 26—34.

BILLING CODE 4310-65-P
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5. PintoMountain Unit. RiversideandSan
Bernardino Counties.FromBLM Maps:
Yucca Valley 1982,SheepHole Mountains
1978,Chuckwalla1978,andPalmSprings
#17 1978. (Index map locationE).

SanBernardino Meridian: T, 1 S., R. 9 E.,
sees.10—15, 24, 25,and 36;T. 1 S., R. 10£.,
sees.7—38; T. I S., 5, 11 E., sees.7—36; T.
I S., 5. 12 5., sacs.7—36exceptsec. 12; T.
I S., It 13 5., sees.13—36; T. I S., 5. 14 E.,
sees.13—32;T. 1 S., R. 15 E., sees.13—30 and
36; T. 1 S., R. 18 E., sees.18, 19, and30—
32; T. 2 S., R. 95., sees.1, 12, and 13; T.

2 S., R. 10 E., sees.1—24; T. 2 S., R. II E..
sacs.1—24;T. 2 S., It 12 E., sees.1—22 except
sec. 13;T. 2 S., 5. 13 E., sees.3—6; T. 2 S.,
5,155., see.1;T. 2S.,R. 16 E., sees.4—9,
16,17,20,21, 28,29, 32, and 33; T. IS., R.
tOE., sees.4,5, 8,and 9.

BILLING CODE 4310-65-P
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MAP6

BILLING CODE 4310-66-C

6. ChemehuevlUnit. SanBernardino
County. FromBLM Maps:SheepHole MIs.
1978,Parker 1979.Needles197$,andAznboy
1991. (Index maplocationF).

SanBernardinoMeridian T. 1 S..5.225..
thoseportionsof sect. 3—6 Lying
northwesterlyoftheAlchisonTopekaand
SantaFe Railroad;T. 1 S..5. 235.,those
portions of sees.1—3 lyIngnortherlyof the
Atchison TopekaandSantaPaRailroad
exceptthatportion of sec. I lying easterlyof
U.S. Hwy. 95;T. 1 N.,P.225.,sees.1-4,9-
16, 20—29, and 32—38 exceptthoseportions
of sees.34-36lying southerlyof theAtchison
Topekaand SantaPa Railroad;T. I N..5,23
E., sees.1-38exceptthoseportionsof sees.
31—34 lying southerly of Atchison Topeka
andSantaFe Railroad;T. I N.,5.245,, sees.
4—9. 16-21,and29—31;?.2 N.,P. 185., sees.
1—5, and9—14;?. ZN., 5.. 195.,sees.2—10,
and19-18;T. 2 N., 5.225..sacs.1-5, 8-16,
21—28,and33—38~T. 2 N., R. 235., sees.5-’
8, 17—21,and26—36;T. ZN., 5. 245., sect.
31 andl2;T. 3N..R. I7E.,secs.12,13,24,
and25;T.3N.,R.185,T.3N.,R.igE.,

sees.1—35;T. 3 N., 5. 205.,sect.5—8, 18,
and19;T. 3 N., 5.. 215.,sect.1—5,9—16,23,
and24;?. 3 N., 5. 225.. sacs.1—36except
see.31;?.3 N.. 5.. 23 5.,sect. 2—11.. 14—22,
and28—32,1’.4 N.,R. 1.85..sect.1.2, 10—
15, 21—28,and32—39.1’. 4 N..R. 195.,?.
4 N.,P.205.,sect.1-12,16-20,and 29-32;
T. 4 N., 5. 215., sect.1—1.7. 20—29,and 32—
36;?. 4 N., P.225.;?.4 N., 5.235., sect.
1—35; 1’. 4 N.. It 245., Sect8, 7, 13, and19;
T.5N.,R.155..secs,1—6;T.5N..R.1GE.,
sees.4—6; T. 5 N.,5. 185., sees.1—8, 8—Il,
22—26, 35, and 36;?.5 N.,R. 19 E.; 1’. SN..
R.20E.;T.5N.,R.215.;T.5N.,R.225.,
sees.2—36;(Unsurveyed)T. 5 N., It 235.,
protractedsees.19. and 29—33; T. 8 N.. R. 14
5.. sees.1—3. 10—15.and23-25; T. ON., P.
155.;T. 6 N., R. 16E., sees.1—23,and27—
34;T. 6 N.,It 17 5., sees.1—18, 22—26.and
38; T. 6 N.. 5. 185.; 1’. 6 N.,P. 19 E.T. 6
N.,It2OE.;T.6N.,1t21E4T.ON.,R.22
5., sees.3—10. 15—23, and26—35;T. 7 N., 5..
145., sees.1—5. 8—Il, 21—28,and33—36;T.
7 N.,R. 15 5.;T. 7 N.. R. 18 5.;T. 7 N.,P.
175.;T. 7 N., P. 185.; 1’. 7 N.. P. 19 5.; 1’.
7 N., 5. 20 5.;T. 7 N.,5. 21 5.;T. 7 N., P.
22E., sect. 18—20,and 28—34;?.8 N.. 5.. 14

5., sect.13, 23—28. and 31—36exceptthose
portions of sees.13, 23, 24, 28. 27, 28, 31,
32, and33 lying northwesterly of Interstate
Hwy. 40;T. 8 N., 5.155.. sect.9-36except
thoseportionsof sees.9—12. 17, and 18 lying
northwesterlyof Interstate Hwy. 49. T. I N.,
5. 185.. sect.1. 2. and7—36exceptthose
portIonsof sect.1,2, and7—10 end11 lying
northerlyofInterstate Hwy. 40-, 1’. 6 N., P..
175,, sees.1—36ixcept thosepostlons of
sees.1-6 lying northerlyofInterstate Hwy.
40;1’. 8 N..5. 18 5., sees.1—36exceptthat
portion of sec.6 lying northerly of Interstate
Hwy.40;T.BN.,R.19E.;T.8N.,R.20E.;
T. ON., 5. 21 5.,sees.7,17—21,and27—35;
T. 9 N., 5.. 18 E.. thoseportions ofsees.31—
38 lying southerlyof InterstateHwy. 40; T.
9 N., P.195..sacs.23—29 and31—38 except
thoseportions of sect.23,24. 26—29,31,and
32 lying northerlyof InterstateHwy. 40;T.
9 N., 5.. 205.. saCs.19, 20, and29—33 except
thoseportionsof sect.19and20 lyIng
northerlyof InterstateHwy. 40 andS½S½
sec.27, SWV

4
SW¼sec.26, andW½W½

sec.35.
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MAP7

BILUNO CODE 4310-65—C

7. !vanpah Unit. SanBernardino County.
From BLM Maps:Amboy 1991, lvanpah
1979, and MesquiteLake 1990. (Index map
locationC).

SanBernardinoMeridian: T. 9 N., It 12E.,
sees.1, 2, 11—14, and 24; T. 9 N., R. 13 E.,
sees.4—9, 16—21,and 28—30; T. 10 N.,5. 12
5.. sees.25. 35, and 36;?. ION.. R. 135.,
sees.3—10, 16—21, and28—33;T. 11 N., 5. 12
E.. sees.1, 12, 13, 24. 25, and36; T. 11 N..
5. 13 E.. sees.1—12, 15—21,and 28—33;?. 11
N..5. 14E.. sec. 6; T. 12N.,5. 11 5., sees.
1—5 and9—15;T. 12 N., 5. 12 5., sees.1—18,
21—27, 35, and36; T. 12N., R. 13 E.; T. 12
N., 5. 14 E., sees.4—9. 16—21, and 29—32;T.
13 N., It 10 E., sees.1—5, 10—14, 24, and 25;

T. 13 N..5.. 11 E.; T. 13N.,R. 125.; T. 13
N.. 5.13E.; T. 13 N., 5.145., sees.3-9,16-
21, and28—33; T. 14 N.,R. 95., sees.1, 12,
13, and 24; T. 14N., R. 105.; (Unsurveyed)
T. 14 N.,It 11 5.. Protractedsees.1—35; T.
14 N.,R 11 5.,sec.36;T. 14 N.,5. 12 5.;
T. 14 N.,5. 13 E.; T. 14N., R. 14 E., sees.
1—5,9-17,and19-35; T. 14 N..5. 15 E., sees.
1—12,and14-22;?. 14N., It 16 E., see.6;
T. 15 N., R. 95., sees.24, 25, and 36; T. 15
N.. R. 105.. sees.1—36 exceptsec.6; T. 15
N.. P. 11 E.; T. 15 N., It 12 E.; T. 15 N.. 5.
135., sacs.3—11 and 14-36;?.15N.. 5. 14
E., sees.12,13,23-28.and 33—36; T. 15 N.,
5. 15 5.;T. 15N.. 5. 18E.. sees.1—11. 14—
22, and28—33;?.15½N.,5. 14 E.. sees.24
and 25;T. 15½N.,R. 15 E., sees.19-36;?.

15½N., R.16 E.. sees.19—35;1’. 16N., R.
10 E., sees.25, 35,and 36; T. 16 N..5. 11
E.;T.I6N.,R.12E.;T.16N.,R12½E.,
sees.12. 13,24, 25. and38; T. 16N.. It 13
E., sees.7, 17—20, and29—33; T. 16N.. 5. 14
E., sees.24, 25, 35, and 38exceptthose
portionsof sees.24 and 35 lying
northwesterlyof InterstateHwy. 15;T. 16 N.,
It 15 E., sees.1—3, 10—14, and23—36; T. 16
N., It 16E., sees.6—8, 16—22,and26-36; T.
17 N.. 5. 115., sees.1—5. 8—17, 20—29, and
31—36;T. 17N.,5. 125.,sees.3—10, 14—23,
and26-36;?. 18N.. It liE., sees.13, 14,
22—28, and 33—36; T. 18 N., 5. 12E., sees.
18—20, and 28—33.
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MAP8

BILUNG CODE 4310-65-C -

8. Piute—EldoradoUnit. San Bernardino
County. From BLM Maps: Amboy 1991,
Needles1978, andIvanpah 1979. (Index map
location H).

SanBernardino Meridian: T. 8 N., R. 14 E.,
sees.1—4. 8—17, 19—24, 26—30, 32, and 33
exceptthoseportionsof sees.13, 23, 24, 26—
28, 32,and33 lying southeasterlyof
InterstateHwy. 40; 1. 8N.. 5. 15 E., sees.1—
12, 17, and18 exceptthoseportions of sees.
1, 8—12, 17, and18 lying southeasterlyof
InterstateHwy. 40; T. 8 N., It 16 E., sees.1—
10 exceptthoseportions of sections1—3 and
6—10 lying southerly of Interstate Hwy. 40; T.
8 N., 5. 175., those portions of sees.1—6

lying northerlyofInterstateHwy. 40; T. 9 N.,
R. 14 E.. sees.1—3. 10—15, 22—28, and33—36;
T. 9 N., it 15 E.; T. 9 N.. 5. 16 E.; T. 9 N.,
5. 17 E., sees.1—36 except that portion of sec.
36 lying southerly of Interstate Hwy. 40; T.
9 N., 5. 18 E.. sees.1—36 exceptthose
portions of sees.3 1—36 lying southerly of
Interstate Hwy. 40; T. 9 N.,It 19 E., sees.1—
24 and 26—32 exceptthose portions of sees.
26—29, 31, and 32 lying southerly of
Interstate Hwy. 40; T. 9 N.,It 20 E., sees.3—
8 and 17—20exceptthoseportions of sees.19
and20 lying southerly of Interstate Hwy. 40;
T. ION., R. 14 E., sacs.11—14, 22—27, and
34—36;T. iON.,R. 155., sees.1—3. 9—16, and
18—36;T. 10N.,R. 16 E.; T. 10 N., 5. 17 E.;

T. 10N., R. 18 E.; T. 10N., R. 19 E.; T. 10
N., 5. 20 E.; T. ION., 5. 21 E., sees.3—10,
15—22, and 28—31; T. ii N.,5. 15 E., sees.
9, 15, 16, 21, 22, 25—29, and 33—36;T. 11 N.,
R. 16 E., sees.9, 15. 16, 21—23. 25—28, 31, and
33—36; T. 11 N., It 17 E., sees.8, 12—17, and
19—36;T. 11 N., R. 185., sees.1—4 and 7—
36;T. 11 N., 5. 19 E., sees.1—13, 18, 19, 23—
27, and 29—36; T. 11 N., 5. 20E., sees.1—
11, 14—23, and 26-35;?. 12 N.,It 19 E.; T.
12 N., It 20 E., sees.3—11 and 13—36; T. 12
N., R. 21 E., sees.19, 30, and 31;T. 13N.,
5. 19 E., sees.3—11 and 13—36;T. 13 N., R.
20 E., sees.19 and29—33; T. 14 N., 5. 19E.,
sees.19 and 29—33.
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MAP -9

B~LUNGCODE 4310-65-C

Nevada, Areas ofland as follows;
9. Piute-Eldorado Unit. ClarkCounty. From

BLM Maps: Mesquite Lake 11990, Boulder
City 1978. Ivanpah 1979,and Davis Darn
1979. (Index map locationH).

Mt. DiabloMeridian:T. 23 S., 5. 64 E.,
sees.31—36 except that portion of see.31
lying northwesterly of thepowerline and also
exceptthoseportions of sees.34—36 lying
northeasterly of thepowerline; T. 23 1/2 S..
R. 64 5.. sees.3 1—36exceptthat portion of
sec. 31 lying northwesterly of the powerline;
T. 23 ½S., It 65E., that portion of sec.31
lying southwesterlyof thepowerline;T. 24
S., R. -63E., sacs.1.2,11—15,22—28,-and33—
36 exceptthoseportionsof sacs.1,2,11,14,
and 15 lying northwesterlyof thepowerhne
andthoseportionsofsacs.22. 27.28, and33
lying northwesterlyof U.S.Hwy. 55. T. 24 S..
R 64 5.;T. 24 S., 5. 65 5., sees.6,7, 18, 19,
30, and31;?. 25S.,5.615., sacs.13-15,
E½sec. 16,E ½sec. 21, sees.22-27,5½

sec.28,secs.35and36,T.25S.,R62E.,
sees.4—9, andsees.18—36;?.25S., 5. 63 5.,
sees.1-4, 9-16.and19—36exceptthose
portionsof secs.4, 9, and 16 lying
northwesterlyof U.S. Hwy. 95; T. 25 S., 5.
*4 E., sees.1—35 exceptsees.13, 24,and 25,;
T. 25 S. R. 655., see.6; T. 26 S.. R. 61 5.,
sees.1,2,11—14,24,25, and36;T. 26S.,R.
625., sees.1—36 exceptsees.28 and 33; T.
26 S., 5. 63 E., sees.2—36 exceptsee.12; T.
26 S.,5.645., sees.18—20,and29-33~T.27
S., R. 62 E., sees.1—3, 5—8, 10—15, 22—26, 35.,
and 36;T. 27S.,R. 62 ½E.,sees.1, 12, 13,
24, 25.and36; T. 27 5,,5. 63 5.;T. 27S.,
5.64 E., sacs,4—9, 16—21,end26—36;?.27
S..5. 65 E.. sacs.31—35;T. 28S.,-5.162E..
sees.-1—3, 9—16, 21—28, and33—36; T. 28 S.,
5.63 5., sacs.1—20,and29—32; T. 28S.,5.
645., sees.1—18. 21—26, 35.end36~1’.28
S.,5.65 E., sacs.2—11, 14—21,and26-35;?.
29S..It 62 5., sees.1—4.0—16.21—28, 34,
35 and 36;T. 29S., 5.. 63 E.,sees.5—10, 15—
23,and26-36;?. 29S.,5. 64.E.,sacs.1—3,

9—16, 21—28, and31—36;?.29S., 5. 65 E.,
sees.2—36except sees.12 and13;?. 29S.,
R. 66 5., sees.30—32;T. 30S.,R.62 E., sees.
1,2, and 11—14;?.30 S., 5.63 E., sees.1—
36 exceptsees.30 and 31;?. 30S., R. 64 E.;
T. -30 S.,R.65E., sees.1—26, 30, 31, 35, and
36;T. 30 S., R. 66E., sees.4—9, 16—21, and
28—33;T. 31 S., 5.. 63 E., sees.1—5, 8—16, 22—
26,and36;T.31S..R.64E.;T.31S.,R
65 E., sees.1, 2, 6, 11—14, and 23—36except
that portion of sec.36 lying southwesterlyof
State Hwy. 163; T. 31 5.. It 66 E., sees.3—
10. 15—22, and27—34 exceptthat portion of
sec. 31 lying southwesterlyofStateHwy.
163; T. 32S., R. 64 E., sees.1-6,6—16,22—
26, and36;T. 32 S., 5. -655.,sees.1—12, 17—
20, and29—32 exceptthoseportionsof sees.
1 and9—12 lying southeasterlyoreasterlyof
StateHwy. 163;?.32 S.. 5. ~ 5., those
portionsof sacs.3—6 lying northerlyof State
Hwy. 163;T. 33 S...5.655.. sec.5.
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MAP 10

BILUNG CODE 4310-65-C

10. Mormon MesaUnit. Clark and Lincoln
Counties.FromBLM Maps: Pahranagat1978,
Clover Mts. 1978, Overton1978, Indian
Springs1979.Lake Mead 1979,and Las
Vegas1988. (Index maplocationI).

Mt. Diablo Meridian: T. 9 S., R. 62 E., sees.
13—15, 22—27, and 34—36 exceptthose
portionsof sees.15, 22, 27.and34 lying
westerlyof theeasterlyboundaryline of the
DesertNational Wildlife Range; T. 9 S., R. 63
E.. sees.18, 19, 30, and31;?. IOS., 5. 62
E., sees.1, 2, 11—14. 23—25, and 36 except
thoseportions of sees.14. 23, 35, and36
lying westerlyof theeasterlyboundaryline
of theDesertNational Wildlife Range;T. 10
S.. R. 63 5., sees.8. 7, 13—15, 18—20, and 22—
36; T. 10 S., R. 64 E., sees.13—24 and26—
34;?. IOS.. R. 65 E., sacs.18, and 19; T. 11

S., R. 62 E.. that portion of see. I lying
easterlyof the easterlyboundaryline of the
DesertNational Wildlife Range; T. 11 S., R.
63 E.; T. 11 S., 5. 64 E.. sees.4—9, 17—20. 30,
and 31; T. 11 S., R. 66 E.. sees.31—36;?. 12
5,, R.63 E.; T. 12S.. R. 64 E., sees.6. 7, and
25—36;T. 12 S., R.65 E., sees.1. 12, 13,and
24—36 exceptthoseportions of sees.1, 2. 13,
and24 lying westerlyof UnionPacific
Railroad;T. 12 S., 5. 665.; T. 12 S., 5. 67
E., sees.6—8, 16—22. and27—33; T. 12 S., 5.
685.,sees.23—29 and31—36; T. 12 S., R. 69
E., sees.1—5, 8—17, and19-36;T. 12½5., R.
62 E.,that portion of sec. 36 lying easterly
of the easterlyboundaryline of the Desert
National Wildlife Range;?.13 S.. R. 62 E.,
thoseportions of sees.1, 12, 13, 24, and 25
lying easterlyof theeasterly line of the Desert
National Wildlife Range;T. 13 S.. R. 63 E.;
T. 13 S.,5.64E.; T. 13 S., R.65 E., sees.1—

24, N 1/2 26, N 1/2 27, N 1/2 and SW l/.~sec.
28, 29—32, and W 1/2 33;T. 13 S., R. 66 5.,
sees.1—26, W ½sec.27, 35,and 36; T. 13
S., R.67 E.; T. 13 S.,5.685., sees.1—36 -

except thoseportions of sees.25 and 3 3—36
lying southeasterlyof InterstateHwy. 15; T.
13 S.. R. 69 E.. sees.1—30exceptthose
portions of sees.25—30 lying southerlyof
Interstate Hwy. 15; T. 13 S., 5. 705.. sees.
6, 7. 18.19, 30, and 31 exceptthoseportions
of sacs.30 and 31 lying southerly of
Interstate Hwy. 15; T. 13½5., R. 63 E., sees.
31—36; T. 13½S., R. 64 E.. sees.31—36 except
that portion of see.36 lying southwesterlyof
State Hwy. 168;T. 14S., 5. 63 E., sees.1—
23, and26—35; T. 14 S.. R. 64 5.,sees.2—6,
8—Il, 15, and 16;T. 14 5.. R. 66 E., sees.1,
E 1/2 sec.2, 12, E ½sec. 13, andE ½sec.
24; T. 14 S.,5.675., sees.1—12 and 14—22
exceptthoseportions of sees.12, 14, 15. 21.
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and 22 lying southerly of InterstateHwy. 15;
T. 14S., 5.. 686, thoseportionsof sacs.4—
7 lying northwesterlyof InterstateHwy. 15;
T. 15S., 5.. 63 5,, sees.2—11, 14—22, and27—
34; T. 16S., 5.635., sacs.3—10. 15—22,and
28—33;?.17 S.,R. 63 E., sees.7—9,16—21,

and 28—32 exceptthoseportionsofsacs.29
and32 lying eastedynTthewe~dy
boundaiyline ofthe?pexJ3~sposuli~oad;T.
18S., 5.. 63 5., sees.5—8. 17—19, and29—31
exceptthoseportionsof sees.5, 8, 17—19. and
29—31 lying easterlyof thewesterlyboundary

line of the ApexDisposalRoadandthat
portion of sec. 31 lying westerlyof the
easterly boundaryline of Desert National
Wildlife Range.
BILLiNG CODE 4310-65-P
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11. Gold Butte-PakoonUnit. ClarkCounty.
FromBLM Maps: Overton1978 andLake
Mead 1979. (Index map locationJ).

Mt. Diablo Meridian: T. 13 S., 5. 71 E.,
sees.32—34; T. 14 S.,It 69 5., sees.24—26,
and34—36; T. 14 S., 5.. 70E., sees.I, and 10.-
36;T. 14 S., 5. 71 E., sees.3—10, 15—22,and

27—34; T. 15 S., R. 69E., sees.1—3, 9—16, 21—
28, and 33—36; T. 15 S., R. 70E., sees.2—11,
15—22, and28—33; T. 16 S., 5. 69 E., sees.1—
36 exceptsacs.6, 7, and 29—32; T. 16 S., 5.
705., sees.4—36 exceptsec. 12; T. 16 S.. It
71 E., sacs.19, and 29—32;T. 17 S., R. 69 E.,
sees.1—3, 11—14,24, 25, and 36; T. 17 S., R.
70 E.; T. 17 S., 5. 71 E., sees.4—10, 15—22,

and27—34; T. 18 S., It 69 E., sec. 1; T. 18
S., 5. 705., sees.1—6, 10—15, 22—27, and 34—
36; T. 18 S., R. 71 E., sees.3—10, 15—22,and
27—34; T. 19 S., R. 71 E., sees.3,4, 9, 10, 15,
16, 21, 22, 27, 28, 33 and 34;T. 20S., 5. 71
E., sees.3 and 4.
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MAP 12

BILLING CODE 4310-65-C

12. BeaverDam Slope Unit. Lincoln
County.From BLM Maps: Clover Mountains
1978 and Overton1978. (Index map location
K).

Mt. Diablo Meridian: T. 8 1/2 S., R. 71 E.,
that portionof sec. 34 lying southof a
westerly extensionof the northline of see.
26,T. 41 5., 5. 20 W. (Salt Lake Meridian),
Washington Ccunty,Utah; T. 9 S., 5. 71 E.,
sees.3, 10, 15—17, 20—22, 27—29, and 32—34;
T. lOS.. R. 70F., sees.19—36; T. lOS., R.

71 E., sees.3—5, 7—10. 15—22,and 27—34; T.
11 S., 5. 70 E.; T. 11 S.. R. 71 E., sees.3—
10, 15—22, and 27—34;T. 12 S.. 5. 705., sees.
1—12, 14—23,and 28—33;?.12 S., R. 71 E.,
sees.3—10.
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MAP 13

BILLING CODE 4310-55-C

Utah.Areasof landas follows:

13. BeaverDam SlopeUnit. Washington
County.FromBLM Maps: St. George1980
andCloverMts. 1978. (Index map location
K).

Salt Lake Meridian:T. 40 S., 5. 19 W., S
1/2 sec. 28, S 1/2 sec.29. S 1/2 sec.31, sees.
32and33,T.41S.,R.lgW..S1/Zsec.2.
S 1/2 see.3, sees.4, 5, 6, E 1/2 sec.7, sees.
8—31. 15—17, E 1/2 see.18,and sees.19—22,
and 28-33;?. 41 S., It 20 W.. 51/2 sec. 1.
sees.24—26,35, and 36;?. 42S.,5. 19W..

sees.4—9, 15—22, and 27—34; T. 42 S.. R. 20
sees.1, 2. 11—14. 23—26. 35. and 36; T.

43 S.. It 18 XV., sees.7, 8, S 1/2 sec.16, sees.
17—21, and 27—34; T. 43 S.,It 19 %V., sees.
1—36 exceptN 1/2 sec.I; T. 43 S., 5. 20 W.,
sees.1, 2, 11—14. 23—26, 35, and 36.
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MAP 14

BILLING CODE 4310-55-C

14. Upper Virgin River Unit. Washington
County. From BLM Map: St. George1980.
(IndexmaplocationL).

SaltLakeMeridian: T. 41 S., R. 13 ‘N., sees.
17—21 exceptNW 1/4 NW 1/4 see.18, also
W 1/2 and‘N 1/2 E 1/2 see.27, sec. 28 except
that portion lying westerlyofGould Wash, N
1/2 sec.29, N 1/2 see.30, N 1/2 N 1/2 sec.
33 exceptthat portion lying westerlyof
GouldWash,andN 1/2 NW 1/4 andNW 1/
4 NE 1/4 sec. 34; T. 41 S., R. 14 W., S 1/2
S 112 andNE 1/4 SE 1/4 and SE 1/4 NE1/
4 see.13, thatportion of see.14 lying
westerlyof RedCliff Road,sees.15—17
exceptN 1/2 NW 1/4 and SW 1/4 NW 1/4
sec.17, sees.19—22, that portion of see.23
lying westerlyof Red Cliff Road and westerly
of InterstateHwy. 15, sec.24, E 1/2 and N

1/2 SE 1/4 andSW 1/4 SE 1/4 see.25. and
thoseportions of sees.26, 27, and32—34
lying northwesterly of Interstate Hwy. 15;T.
41 S., R. 15 W., sees.14, 19, 20, and22—36;
T. 41 S., R. 16W..sees.4, 9, 10, 5 1/2 see.
14, 15—16, 19, 21, \V 1/2 sec.22, sees.24—
25 exceptW 1/2 SW 1/4 sec.24 and W 1/
2 NW 1/4 and NW 1/4 SW 1/4 see.25,and
W 1/2 ‘N 1/2 sec.25, SW 1/4 NE 1/4 and NW
1/4 NW 1/4 andS 1/2 NW 3/4 andSW 1/
4 and W 1/2 SE 1/4 see.27, E 1/2 andE 1/
2W 1/2 and NW 1/4 NW 1/4 andSW 1/4
SW 1/4sec. 28, N 1/2 andSE 1/4 and E 1/
2 SW1/4 see.30, NE 1/4 see.31, N 1/2 sec.
32, N 1/2 and SE 1/4 and N 1/2 SW 1/4 sec.
33, see.34. SE 1/4 SE 1/4 and that portion
of see.35 lying westerly of State Hwy. 18,
and sec. 36; T. 41 S., R. 17W., sees.9, 14—
16, NE 1/4 see.21, N 1/2 sec. 22, NW 1/4

andE 1/2 sec. 23, see.24,andNE 1/4 sec.
25; T. 42 S., R. 14 ‘N., thoseportionsof sees.
5 and 6 lying northwesterly of Interstate
Hwy. 15;T. 42 S., 5. 15W., sec. iN 1/2 and
N 1/2 S 1/2 see.2, NE 1/4 and W 1/2 sec.
3, sees.4—9, ‘iN 1/2 ‘N 1/2 sec. 10, N 1/2 N
1/2 see.12, sees.16—18, N 1/2 and N 1/2 SE
1/4 andNE 1/4 SW 1/4 sec.19,and W 1/2
NW 1/4 and NW 1/4 SW 1/4 see.20, except
thoseportions of sees.1 and12 lying
southeasterlyof InterstateHwy. 15; T. 42 S..
R. 16 W., sees.1—2, NW 1/4 and E 1/2 see.
3, NE 1/4 NE 1/4 sec. 4, NE 1/4 sec.10, NW
1/4 and 5 1/2 see.11—12, 51/2 and NW 1/
4 andN 112 SW 1/4 see.13 exceptthat
portion lying westerlyof StateHwy. 15, and
N 1/2 NE 1/4 sec. 24.
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MAP 15

BILLING CODE 4310—65—C

Arizona. Areas of landas follows:

15. BeaverDam SlopeUnit. Mohave
County. FromBLM Maps: Overton 1978 and
Littiefleid 1987. (Index maplocationK).

GiIa and Salt River Meridian: T. 41 N.,5.
14W., sees.6. 7, 18, and 19;T. 41 N.,R. 15

sees.1—24, 26—28, 30, and 31; T. 41 N.,
It 16 W., sees.1—5, 8—17, 20—29, and32—36;
T. 42 N.,R. 14 W., see,31;T. 42N.,R. 15

W., sees.31—36; T. 42 N., R. 16 ‘N., sees.32—
36.
B1WNG CODE 4310—55-P
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MAP 16

BILLING CODE 4310-55-C

16. GoldButte-PakoonUnit. Mohave
County.From BLM Maps: Overtoo1978,
Littlefield 1987,Mount Trumbull 1986,and
Lake Mead 1979. (Index map location J).

Gila and Salt River Meridian: T. 32 N., R.
15 ‘N., sees.1—18 exceptthoseportions of
sees,13—18 lying southof theLake Mead
National Recreation area boundaryline; T. 32
N., R. 16W., sees.1, 2, 12,and 13; T. 32 1/

2 N., R. 15 ‘N., sees.31—36;T. 32 1/2 N.,R.
16 ‘N., sees.35 and 36; T. 33 N., R. 14 W.,
sees.4—8, 18, 19, and 28—31; T. 33 N., R. 15
W.; T. 33N., It 16 W.. sacs. 1—14. 17—20. 23—
26, 29—32, 35, and 36;T. 34 N., R. ‘14 W.,
sees.4—9, 17—19, 30, 31. 33.and 34; T. 34 N.,
R.15W.;T.34N.,R.16W.;T.35N.,R,14
W., sees.3—9,16—22.and28—35 ; T. 35 N..
R. 15 W.; T. 35 N.,R. 16 W.; T. 36 N., R. 14
W., sees,2—11, 14—22, and 27—34; T. 36 N.,
R. 15 ‘N.; T. 36 N., R. 16W., sees.1—36

except sees.4—9; T. 37 N., R. 14 W., sees.15,
22, 27, 31, and 33—35; T. 37N., R. 15 W.,
sees.5, 8, 17—22,and 27—36; T. 37 N.,R. 16
W., see,35; T. 38 N.,R. 15W., sec.6; T. 38
N., R. 16W., sees.1—12 and14—22; T. 39N.,
R. 15 ‘N., sees.2—10, 16—21, and 29—32; T.
39 N., R. 16 W., sees.1, 12, 13,20, 23—29,
and 32—36;T. 40 N., It 14 W., sec.6; T. 40
N.,5. 15W., sees.1. 10—15, and 21—36.
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MAP17

BUSING CODE 4310-65-C

Primaiyconstituentelements:Desertlands
that are usedorpotentially usedby the desert

tortoisefor nesting,sheltering,foraging.
dispersal,orgeneflow.

Dated:December20, 1993.
RichardN. Smith,
ActingDirector.U.S. Fish and Wildlife
Service.
[FR Doc. 94—2694Filed 2—7—94; 8:45 sin)
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