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(a) The extent to which provision is 
made for a continuation of services to 
the eligible children who have been 
participating as enrollees in the pro-
gram; 

(b) The extent to which provision is 
made for continuation of services to 
the target area or areas served by the 
program; and 

(c) The extent to which provision is 
made for continued employment by the 
applicant of the qualified personnel of 
the existing program. 

Subpart C—Change in Grantee 
Requiring Amendment of Ap-
proved Application or Re-
placement of Head Start Pro-
gram 

§ 1302.20 Grantee to show both legal 
status and financial viability. 

(a) Upon the occurrence of a change 
in the legal condition of a grantee or of 
a substantial diminution of the finan-
cial resources of a grantee, or both, for 
example, such as might result from 
cessation of grants to the grantee 
under section 514 of the Act, the grant-
ee is required within 30 days after the 
effective date of the regulations in this 
Part or the date the grantee has notice 
or knowledge of the change, whichever 
is later, to show in writing to the satis-
faction of the responsible HHS official 
that it has and will continue to have 
legal status and financial viability. 
Failure to make this showing may re-
sult in suspension, termination or de-
nial of refunding. 

(b) The responsible HHS official will 
notify the grantee in writing of the de-
cision as to the grantee’s legal status 
and financial viability within 30 days 
after receiving the grantee’s written 
submittal. 

(c) When it is consistent with proper 
and efficient administration, the re-
sponsible HHS official may extend a 
grantee’s program year to end on the 
date when a change in its legal condi-
tion or a substantial diminution of fi-
nancial resources, or both, is scheduled 
to take place. 

§ 1302.21 Grantee shows legal status 
but not financial viability. 

(a) If a grantee shows legal status but 
impaired financial viability the respon-

sible HHS official will entertain a 
timely request for amendment of the 
grantee’s approved application which 
restores the grantee’s financial viabil-
ity either by a reduction in the pro-
gram which produces minimum disrup-
tion to services and functions, or by an 
amendment which incorporates essen-
tial functions and services not pre-
viously funded as part of the total cost 
of the Head Start program, and, there-
fore, requires an increase in the 
amount of the Head Start grant but 
which will not result in a Federal share 
of the total cost of the Head Start pro-
gram in excess of the percentage au-
thorized by the Act or applicable regu-
lations. In considering such a request 
which includes an increase in the Head 
Start grant the responsible HHS offi-
cial will take into account the funds 
available to him for obligation and 
whether the proposed increase is con-
sistent with that distribution of Head 
Start funds which: 

(1) Maximizes the number of childen 
served within his area of responsibility, 
or in the case of experimental or dem-
onstration programs, the experimental 
or demonstration benefits to be 
achieved, and 

(2) Maintains approximately the 
same distribution of Head Start pro-
gram funds to States as exist during 
the fiscal year in which his decision is 
made. 

(b) A request for amendment will be 
considered to be timely if it is included 
with the written submittal required by 
§ 1302.20(a) of this part, submitted with-
in 30 days after receiving the notice re-
quired by § 1302.20(b) of this part, or 
submitted as a part of a timely applica-
tion for refunding. 

(c) The grantee will be notified in 
writing by the responsible HHS official 
within 30 days after submission of the 
requested amendment of the decision 
to approve or disapprove the requested 
amendment. If the requested amend-
ment is disapproved the notice will 
contain a statement of the reasons for 
disapproval. 

§ 1302.22 Suspension or termination of 
grantee which shows financial via-
bility but not legal status. 

If a grantee fails to show that it will 
continue to have legal status after the 
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date of change even though it may 
show financial viability, the grant 
shall be suspended or terminated or re-
funding shall be denied as of the date of 
change. If it appears reasonable to the 
responsible HHS official that the defi-
ciency in legal status will be corrected 
within 30 days he may suspend the 
grant for not to exceed 30 days after 
the date of change or the date of sub-
mission of a timely request for amend-
ment. If such correction has not been 
made within the 30 day period the 
grant shall be terminated. 

§ 1302.23 Suspension or termination of 
grantee which shows legal status 
but not financial viability. 

(a) If the date of change of financial 
viability precedes or will precede the 
end of the grantee’s program year the 
grant will be suspended or terminated 
on that date, or, if a request for amend-
ment has been submitted under § 1302.21 
of this part, upon written notice of dis-
approval of the requested amendment, 
whichever is later. If it appears reason-
able to the responsible HHS official 
that the deficiency in financial viabil-
ity will be corrected within 30 days he 
may suspend the grant for not to ex-
ceed 30 days after the date of change or 
notice of disapproval. If such correc-
tion has not been made within the 30 
day period the grant will be termi-
nated. 

§ 1302.24 Denial of refunding of grant-
ee. 

(a) If the date of change will coincide 
with or will come after the end of the 
program year and the grantee has no-
tice or knowledge of such change prior 
to the end of the program year any ac-
tion taken to approve the grantee’s ap-
plication for refunding for the fol-
lowing program year shall be subject to 
rescission or ratification depending 
upon the decision of the responsible 
HHS official on the grantee’s legal sta-
tus and financial viability and on any 
requested amendment submitted by the 
grantee. If the requested amendment is 
disapproved the responsible HHS offi-
cial may extend the program year in 
accordance with § 1302.20(c) of this part. 

(b) If the date of change coincides 
with the end of the program year and 
the grantee does not have notice or 

knowledge of the change prior thereto 
and the grantee’s application for re-
funding for the following program year 
has been approved, such approval shall 
be subject to rescission or ratification 
depending upon the decision of the re-
sponsible HHS official on the grantee’s 
legal status and viability and on any 
requested financial amendment sub-
mitted by the grantee. 

(c) If the date of change will coincide 
with or will come after the end of the 
program year and if the responsible 
HHS official has prior notice thereof 
from the grantee or other official 
source such as the Community Services 
Administration action to approve any 
application for refunding submitted by 
the grantee shall be deferred pending 
decision by the responsible HHS offi-
cial on the grantee’s legal status and 
financial viability and any requested 
amendment submitted by the grantee. 

(d) When the responsible HHS official 
determines to approve a requested 
amendment for refunding he will ap-
prove it for the full term of the pro-
posed program period, if that period as 
approved is no longer than a program 
year. 

§ 1302.25 Control of funds of grantee 
scheduled for change. 

Responsible HHS officials will place 
strict controls on the release of grant 
funds to grantees which are scheduled 
for change by cessation of their grants 
under section 519 of the Act. Specifi-
cally, the following controls will be es-
tablished: 

(a) Funds will be released on a 
monthly basis regardless of the form of 
grant payment. 

(b) Funds released each month will be 
limited to the amount required to 
cover actual disbursements during that 
period for activities authorized under 
the approved Head Start program. 

(c) The amount of funds released 
must be approved each month by the 
responsible HHS official. 

Subpart D—Replacement of 
Indian Tribal Grantees 

SOURCE: 63 FR 34329, June 24, 1998, unless 
otherwise noted. 
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