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§ 2634.311 Special rules. 

(a) Political campaign funds. Political 
campaign funds, including campaign 
receipts and expenditures, need not be 
included in any report filed under this 
part. However, if the individual has au-
thority to exercise control over the 
fund’s assets for personal use rather 
than campaign or political purposes, 
that portion of the fund over which 
such authority exists must be reported. 

(b) Certificates of Divestiture. Each 
public financial disclosure report re-
quired by the provisions of this part 
shall identify those sales which have 
occurred pursuant to a Certificate of 
Divestiture during the period covered 
by such report. See subpart J of this 
part for the rules relating to the 
issuance of such Certificates. 

(c) Reporting standards. (1) In lieu of 
entering data on a schedule of the re-
port form designated by the Office of 
Government Ethics, a filer may attach 
to the reporting form a copy of a bro-
kerage report, bank statement, or 
other material, which, in a clear and 
concise fashion, readily discloses all in-
formation which the filer would other-
wise have been required to enter on the 
schedule. 

(2) In lieu of reporting the category 
of amount or value of any item listed 
in any public financial disclosure re-
port filed pursuant to this part, a filer 
may report the actual dollar amount of 
such item.

Subpart D—Qualified Trusts

SOURCE: 57 FR 11814, Apr. 7, 1992, unless 
otherwise noted.

§ 2634.401 General considerations. 

(a) Statutory standards governing 
qualified trusts—(1) Types of qualified 
trusts and their relationshp to conflict of 
interest laws. The Ethics in Government 
Act of 1978 created, and provided spe-
cial public financial disclosure require-
ments for, two types of qualified 
trusts, It was envisioned that the use 
of those trusts by Government employ-
ees would reduce the real and apparent 
conflicts of interest which might arise 
between the financial interests held by 
those employees (or attributable to 

them) and their official responsibil-
ities. 

(i) Interested party means a Govern-
ment employee, his spouse, any minor 
or dependent child, and their represent-
atives in any case in which the em-
ployee, spouse, or child has a beneficial 
interest in the principal or income of a 
trust proposed for certification or cer-
tified. 

(ii) Qualified blind trust. The most 
universally adaptable qualified trust is 
the qualified blind trust, defined in 
§ 2634.403 of this subpart. A trust is con-
sidered to be ‘‘blind’’ only with regard 
to those trust assets about which no in-
terested party has knowledge. When an 
interested party originally places as-
sets in trust, that party still possesses 
knowledge about those assets. Those 
original assets remain financial inter-
ests of the Government official for pur-
poses of 18 U.S.C. 208 or for any other 
Federal conflict of interest statutes or 
regulations, until the trustee notifies 
the official either that a particular 
original asset has been disposed of or 
that the asset’s value is less than $1000. 
If the trustee sells or disposes of origi-
nal trust assets and then uses the pro-
ceeds to acquire new trust holdings, or 
if the trustee reinvests trust income to 
acquire new trust holdings, a ‘‘blind’’ 
trust exists for those new holdings be-
cause the interested parties possess no 
information about the newly acquired 
assets. The holdings of a ‘‘blind’’ trust 
are not classified as financial interests 
of the Government official for purposes 
of 18 U.S.C. 208 or for any other Federal 
conflict of interest statutes or regula-
tions. 

(iii) Qualified diversified trust. The 
second type of qualified trust estab-
lished by the Act is the qualified diver-
sified trust, defined in § 2634.404 of this 
subpart. Among other requirements, a 
trust is considered to be ‘‘diversified’’ 
if it can be demonstrated, to the satis-
faction of the Director of the Office of 
Government Ethics, pursuant to 
§ 2634.404(b), that the trust assets com-
prise a widely diversified portfolio of 
readily marketable securities, and do 
not initially include the securities of 
any entities having substantial activi-
ties in the same area as the Govern-
ment official’s primary area of 
responsiblity. The trust holdings are 
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never classified as financial interests 
of the Government official for purposes 
of 18 U.S.C. 208 or for any other Federal 
conflict of interest statutes or regula-
tions. 

(2) Independence of trustees and other 
fiduciaries. Under the Act and § 2634.406 
of this subpart, those entities that are 
authorized by the Act or by the trust 
instrument to manage the assets of, 
and to control and administer, either a 
qualified blind or a qualified diversified 
trust must be independent, in fact and 
in appearance, from those parties who 
hold beneficial interests in the trust. 

(i) The independence of trustees is fa-
cilitated by limiting the entities which 
may serve in this capacity to certain 
financial institutions. 

(ii) In addition to the trustee, the 
Act extends the independence require-
ment to other entities which manage 
trust assets or administer the trust, in-
cluding officers and employees of the 
trustee, any other entity designated in 
the trust instrument to perform fidu-
ciary duties on behalf of the trust, and 
the officers and employees of any other 
entity that is involved in the manage-
ment or control of the trust, such as 
investment counsel, investment advis-
ers, accountants, or tax preparers and 
their assistants. 

(iii) Those entities governed by the 
Act will be considered ‘‘independent’’ 
for purposes of this subpart if, among 
other requirements, the entities are 
not affiliated with, associated with, re-
lated to, or subject to the control or in-
fluence of, any of the parties that hold 
a beneficial interest in the trust. 

(3) Communications betweeen trust ad-
ministrators and interested parties. For 
purposes of Federal ethics laws, the 
most important feature of those quali-
fied trusts that are recognized under 
the Act is the separation which those 
trusts foster between parties with ben-
eficial interests in the trust and enti-
ties which manage trust assets and ad-
minister the trust instrument. Once a 
qualified trust has been certified, the 
beneficiaries and their representatives 
are expressly prohibited from com-
menting directly to the trustee about 
matters relating to asset management 
and trust holdings, or to trust adminis-
tration and activities. Likewise, the 
trustee must make investment deci-

sions for the trust without consulting, 
or being controlled by, interested par-
ties, and the trustee is prohibited from 
informing interested parties directly 
about trust activities, except to the 
limited extent required under the Act. 
The Act requires the trustee to provide 
trust beneficiaries with certain stand-
ard periodic reports. Beyond receipt of 
these standard reports, trust bene-
ficiaries are prohibited from actively 
attempting to obtain, and from pas-
sively but knowningly obtaining, di-
rectly or indirectly, any additional in-
formation which the Act prohibits 
beneficiaries from obtaining, including 
information about trust holdings and 
activities. Finally, instruments cre-
ating qualified trusts must require in-
terested parties and trustees to make 
all permissible communications relat-
ing to the trust and to its assets in 
writing, with the prior written ap-
proval of the Director of the Office of 
Government Ethics. Sections 2634.403–
2634.405 and 2634.407 of this subpart con-
tain standards implementing these re-
strictions. 

(4) Trust and beneficiary taxes. For tax 
purposes, because a trust is a separate 
entity distinct from its beneficiaries, a 
trustee must file an annual fiduciary 
tax return for the trust (IRS Form 
1041). In addition, the trust bene-
ficiaries must report income received 
from the trust on their individual tax 
returns. The Act establishes special fil-
ing procedures to be used by the trust-
ee and trust beneficiaries in order to 
maintain the substantive separation 
between trust beneficiaries and trust 
administration. For beneficiaries of 
qualified blind trusts, the trustee sends 
a Schedule K–1 form summarizing trust 
income in appropriate categories to en-
able the beneficiaries to file individual 
tax returns. For beneficiaries of quali-
fied diversified trusts, the statute re-
quires the trustee to file the individual 
tax returns on behalf of the trust bene-
ficiaries. The beneficiaries must trans-
mit to the trustee materials con-
cerning taxable transactions and oc-
currences outside of the trust, pursu-
ant to the requirements in each trust 
instrument which detail this proce-
dure. 

(b) Policy considerations and objectives 
underlying the qualified trust program. 
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(1) Prior to enactment of the Act’s 
qualified trust provisions, there was no 
accepted definition of a properly for-
mulated blind or diversified trust. 
However, there was general agreement 
that the use of blind or diversified 
trusts often reduced the potential for 
conflicts of interest. If Government 
employees do not know the exact iden-
tity, nature, and extent of their finan-
cial interests, then the employees can-
not be influenced in the performance of 
their official duties by those interests. 
Their official actions, under these cir-
cumstances, should be free from collat-
eral attack arising out of real or appar-
ent conflicts of interest. Therefore, the 
most significant objective to be 
achieved through the use of a blind 
trust is the lack of knowledge, or ac-
tual ‘‘blindness,’’ by a Government of-
ficial with respect to the holdings in 
his trust. The same goal may be 
achieved through the use of a diversi-
fied trust, if that trust holds securities 
from different issuers in different eco-
nomic sectors, and if the trust’s inter-
est in any one issuer is limited. Under 
these conditions, it is unlikely that of-
ficial actions taken by the Government 
employee who holds a beneficial inter-
est in the trust would affect individual 
securities to such a degree that the 
overall value of the trust’s portfolio 
would be materially enhanced. Thus, 
wide diversification is tantamount to 
actual ‘‘blindness.’’

(2) Because, for the trusts certified 
under the provisions of this subpart D, 
the Government official is or will be-
come blind to the identity and nature 
of his actual trust holdings, the report-
ing requirements of section 102(f)(1) of 
the Act and subparts C or I of this part, 
which generally require Government 
filers to disclose the contents of a 
trust’s portfolio, do not apply. See 
§ 2634.310 of this part. Further, as dis-
cussed in paragraphs (a)(1) (ii) and (iii) 
of this section, 18 U.S.C. 208 and other 
Federal conflict of interest laws do not 
generally apply to the holdings of 
qualified trusts, except in the case of 
the original assets transferred to a 
qualified blind trust until notice that a 
particular original asset has been dis-
posed of or that the asset’s value is 
below $1,000. 

(c) Qualified trust provisions of the reg-
ulation. This subpart D prescribes 
standards which implement the statu-
tory requirements and policy objec-
tives underlying the Act’s qualified 
blind and diversified trust provisions. 
The Office of Government Ethics will 
apply the standards of this subpart to 
specific cases. 

(1) Classification as a qualified trust. 
In order to be classified as a qualified 
trust for purposes of the Act, blind and 
diversified trusts must satisfy the fol-
lowing three requirements: 

(i) The trust document must conform to 
announced standards. As provided under 
§ 2634.403(b) for blind trusts and 
§ 2634.404(c) for diversified trusts, the 
trust document must conform to the 
model trust instruments which are 
drafted and distributed by the Office of 
Government Ethics for use by inter-
ested parties when drafting their trust 
arrangements. Prior to certifying a 
trust under § 2634.405 of this subpart, as 
discussed in paragraph (c)(1)(iii) of this 
section, the Office of Government Eth-
ics must approve every proposed trust 
document. In addition to other re-
quired provisions, the trust instrument 
must contain language which imple-
ments the communications restrictions 
discussed in paragraph (a)(3) of this 
section. By requiring interested par-
ties, trustees, and other signatories to 
the trust instrument to include com-
munications provisions, these regula-
tions compel the signatories diligently 
to safeguard against inadvertent dis-
closures of precluded information to 
the interested parties. 

(ii) Truly independent fiduciaries. As 
discussed in paragraph (a)(2) of this 
section, the fiduciaries in charge of ad-
ministering and managing the assets of 
a qualified trust must be actually and 
apparently independent of the parties 
who hold beneficial interests in the 
trust, and of their representatives. To 
ensure such independence, § 2634.406 of 
this subpart limits the range of permis-
sible fiduciaries. Before a trust may be 
classified as a qualified blind or diver-
sified trust, the Director of the Office 
of Government Ethics must conclude, 
in his judgment, that the trust fidu-
ciaries named in the trust instrument 
satisfy the standards for independence 
contained in § 2634.406 of this subpart. 
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(iii) Certification by the Office of Gov-
ernment Ethics. Before a trust may be 
classified as a qualified blind or diver-
sified trust, the Director of the Office 
of Government Ethics must certify, in 
accordance with the standards and pro-
cedures established in § 2634.405 of this 
subpart, that the trust meets the re-
quirements of section 102(f) of the Act 
and of this subpart, that certification 
is in the public interest, and that cer-
tification is consistent with the poli-
cies established by these provisions and 
by other applicable laws and regula-
tions. This certification is essential so 
that the Office can ensure, in advance 
that the proposed trust arrangement 
satisfies the established standards. 

(2) Certification of pre-existing trusts. 
Normally, those trusts certified as 
qualified trusts by the Director of the 
Office of Government Ethics under 
§ 2634.405 of this subpart are newly cre-
ated trust arrangements, formulated in 
accordance with established standards 
by representatives of the interested 
parties in consultation with the Office 
of Government Ethics. However, the 
Director may certify a pre-existing 
trust as a qualified blind or qualified 
diversified trust under § 2634.403 (blind) 
or § 2634.404 (diversified) if he deter-
mines that such action is appropriate 
and is sufficient to ensure compliance 
with applicable laws and regulations. 
The pre-existing trust proposed for cer-
tification must meet both the gen-
erally applicable trust requirements, 
and several special requirements con-
tained in § 2634.405(c) of this subpart, 
including that all of the parties to the 
original trust agree to administer the 
trust in accordance with the require-
ments of this subpart. The pre-existing 
trust may be certified only if all of the 
conditions of this subpart are fulfilled, 
and if the requisite confidentially can 
be assured with respect to the trust. 

(3) Reporting requirements. Once a 
trust is classified as a qualified blind or 
qualified diversified trust in the man-
ner discussed under paragraph (c)(1) of 
this section, § 2634.310(b) applies less in-
clusive financial disclosure require-
ments to the trust assets. 

(4) Sanctions and enforcement. Section 
2634.702 provides civil sanctions which 
apply to any Government official or 
trust fiduciary who violates his obliga-

tions under the Act, its implementing 
regulations, or the trust instrument. In 
addition, the Office of Government 
Ethics has authority under the Act to 
impose appropriate administrative or 
other sanctions. Subpart E of this part 
delineates the procedure which must be 
followed with respect to the revocation 
of trust certificates and trustee ap-
provals. 

(d) Drafting and implementation of the 
qualified trust instrument. (1) The over-
view of the qualified trust program 
contained in this section cannot antici-
pate every concern or question, or dis-
cuss every scenario which might arise 
in the course of formulating and imple-
menting a qualified trust instrument. 
The Office of Government Ethics 
should be contacted by an interested 
party or by his professional representa-
tives if the Act, the implementing reg-
ulations, and the trust instrument 
itself do not provide guidance in a par-
ticular instance. 

(2) No trust will be considered 
‘‘qualified’’ for purposes of the Act 
until the Office of Government Ethics 
certifies the trust prior to execution. 
The Office of Government Ethics 
makes available to attorneys model 
trust agreements for use in drafting 
proposed trust agreements which are to 
be submitted to the Office for certifi-
cation. Attorneys are cautioned to con-
sider each model provision in light of 
the circumstances presented by the 
particular case, and to modify provi-
sions to the extent that such modifica-
tions are necessary or appropriate. At-
torneys should not rely uncritically 
upon the language of the model agree-
ments. However, many of the model 
provisions implement the minimum re-
quirements which must be contained in 
any trust instrument certified by the 
Office. Certificates of Independence for 
fiduciaries must be executed in the 
form indicated in appendix A of this 
part. 

(3) The Office of Government Ethics 
does not draft trust instruments for 
use in individual cases. However, its 
staff is always willing to cooperate 
with attorneys and to make its experi-
ence available to them in developing 
appropriate trust instruments which 
satisfy applicable Federal laws, Execu-
tive orders and regulations. If the use 
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of a qualified trust is contemplated in 
a particular case, it is strongly rec-
ommended that the interested parties 
or their representatives contact the Of-
fice of Government Ethics as early as 
possible. 

(4) Prior to trust certification, pro-
spective trustees or their representa-
tives should schedule with the staff of 
the Office of Government Ethics an ap-
pointment for an orientation to the 
specialized requirements and proce-
dures which have been established by 
the Act and the regulations with re-
spect to qualified trust administration.

§ 2634.402 Special notice for advice-
and-consent nominees. 

(a) In general. In any case in which 
the establishment of a qualified diver-
sified trust is contemplated with re-
spect to a reporting individual whose 
nomination is being considered by a 
Senate committee, that individual 
shall inform the committee of the in-
tention to establish a qualified diversi-
fied trust at the time of filing a finan-
cial disclosure report with the com-
mittee. 

(b) Applicability. The rule of this sec-
tion is not applicable to members of 
the uniformed services or Foreign 
Service officers. The special notice re-
quirement of this section shall not pre-
clude an individual from seeking the 
certification of a qualified blind trust 
or qualified diversified trust after the 
Senate has given its advice and consent 
to a nomination.

§ 2634.403 Qualified blind trusts. 

(a) Definition. A qualified blind trust is 
a trust in which the filer, his spouse, or 
his minor or dependent child has a ben-
eficial interest, which is certified pur-
suant to § 2634.405 of this subpart by the 
Director of the Office of Government 
Ethics, and which includes in the trust 
instrument in the provisions required 
by paragraph (b) of this section, and 
has an independent trustee as defined 
in § 2634.406 of this subpart. See section 
102(f)(3) of the Act. 

(b) Required provisions. The instru-
ment which establishes a blind trust 
must adhere substantively to model 
drafts circulated by the Office of Gov-
ernment Ethics, and must provide that: 

(1) The primary purpose of the blind 
trust is to confer on the independent 
trustee and any other designated fidu-
ciary the sole responsibility to admin-
ister the trust and to manage trust as-
sets without the participation by, or 
the knowledge of, any interested party. 
This includes the duty to decide when 
and to what extent the original assets 
of the trust are to be sold or disposed 
of and in what investments the pro-
ceeds of sale are to be reinvested; 

(2) The trustee and any other des-
ignated fiduciary in the exercise of 
their authority and discretion to man-
age and control the assets of the trust 
shall not consult or notify any inter-
ested party; 

(3) None of the assets initially placed 
in the trust’s portfolio shall include as-
sets the holding of which by any inter-
ested party would be prohibited by the 
Act, by the implementing regulations, 
or by any other applicable Federal law, 
Executive order, or regulation; 

(4) Any portfolio asset transferred to 
the trust by an interested party is free 
of any restriction with respect to its 
transfer or sale, except as fully de-
scribed in schedules attached to the 
trust instrument, and as approved by 
the Director of the Office of Govern-
ment Ethics; 

(5) During the term of the trust, the 
interested parties shall not pledge, 
mortgage, or otherwise encumber their 
interests in the property held by the 
trust; 

(6) The trustee shall promptly notify 
the filer and the Director of the Office 
of Government Ethics when any par-
ticular asset transferred to the trust by 
an interested party has been com-
pletely disposed of or when the value of 
that asset is reduced to less than $1,000; 

(7) The trustee or his designee shall 
prepare the trust’s income tax return. 
Under no circumstances shall the 
trustee or any other designated fidu-
ciary disclose publicly, or to any inter-
ested party, the trust’s tax return, any 
information relating to that return ex-
cept for a summary of trust income in 
categories necessary for an interested 
party to complete his individual tax re-
turn, or any information which might 
specifically identify current trust as-
sets, or those assets which have been 
sold or disposed of from trust holdings, 
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