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of their crops during the same hours 
that are worked by the farmers. (See 
107 Cong. Rec. (daily ed.) p.5883.) The 
reason for the exemption does not jus-
tify its application to employees sell-
ing products and services to farmers 
otherwise than as an incidental and 
subordinate part of the business of a 
country elevator as commonly recog-
nized. An establishment making such 
sales must be ‘‘such an establishment’’ 
to come within this exemption. An em-
ployer may, however, be engaged in the 
business of making sales of goods and 
services to farmers in an establishment 
separate from the one in which he pro-
vides the recognized country elevator 
services. In such event, the exemption 
of employees who work in both estab-
lishments may depend on whether the 
work in the sales establishment comes 
within another exemption provided by 
the Act. (See Remington v. Shaw (W.D. 
Mich.), 2 WH Cases 262, and infra, 
§ 780.724.) 

EMPLOYMENT OF ‘‘NO MORE THAN FIVE 
EMPLOYEES’’ 

§ 780.712 Limitation of exemption to 
establishments with five or fewer 
employees. 

If the operations of an establishment 
are such that it is commonly recog-
nized as a country elevator, its employ-
ees may come within the section 
13(b)(14) exemption provided that ‘‘no 
more than five employees are employed 
in the establishment in such oper-
ations’’. The exemption is intended, as 
explained by its sponsor, to ‘‘affect 
only institutions that have five em-
ployees or less’’ (107 Cong. Rec. (daily 
ed.) p. 5883). Since the Act is applied on 
a workweek basis, a country elevator is 
not an exempt place of work in any 
workweek in which more than five em-
ployees are employed in its operations. 

§ 780.713 Determining the number of 
employees generally. 

The number of employees referred to 
in section 13(b)(14) is the number ‘‘em-
ployed in the establishment in such op-
erations’’. The determination of the 
number of employees so employed in-
volves a consideration of the meaning 
of employment ‘‘in the establishment’’ 
and ‘‘in such operations’’ in relation to 
each other. If, in any workweek, an 

employee is ‘‘employed in the estab-
lishment in such operations’’ for more 
than a negligible period of time, he 
should be counted in determining 
whether, in that workweek, more than 
five employees were so employed. An 
employee so employed must be counted 
for this purpose regardless of whether 
he would, apart from this exemption, 
be within the coverage of the Act. Also, 
as noted in the following discussion, 
the employees to be counted are not 
necessarily limited to employees di-
rectly employed by the country eleva-
tor but may include employees directly 
employed by others who are engaged in 
performing operations of the elevator 
establishment. 

§ 780.714 Employees employed ‘‘in such 
operations’’ to be counted. 

(a) The five-employee limitation on 
the exemption for country elevators re-
lates to the number of employees em-
ployed in the establishment ‘‘in such 
operations.’’ This means that the em-
ployees to be counted include those 
employed in, and do not include any 
who are not employed in, the oper-
ations of the establishment commonly 
recognized as a country elevator, in-
cluding the operations of such an es-
tablishment in selling products and 
services used in the operation of a 
farm, as previously explained. 

(b) In some circumstances, an em-
ployee employed in an establishment 
commonly recognized as a country ele-
vator may, during his workweek, be 
employed in work which is not part of 
the operations of the elevator estab-
lishment. This would be true, for exam-
ple, in the case of an employee who 
spends his entire workweek in the con-
struction of an overflow warehouse for 
the elevator. Such an employee would 
not be counted in that workweek be-
cause constructing a warehouse is not 
part of the operations of the country 
elevator but is an entirely distinct ac-
tivity. 

(c) Employees employed by the same 
employer in a separate establishment 
in which he is engaged in a different 
business, and not employed in the oper-
ations of the elevator establishment, 
would not be counted. 

(d) Employees not employed by the 
elevator establishment who come there 
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