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§ 330.702 [Reserved]

§ 330.703 Definitions. 
For the purposes of this subpart: 
(a) Agency has the meaning given in 

§ 330.604(a). 
(b) Displaced employee means: 
(1) A current career or career-condi-

tional competitive service employee, in 
tenure group 1 or 2, at grade levels GS–
15 or equivalent and below, who has re-
ceived a specific RIF separation notice, 
or a notice of proposed removal for de-
clining a directed reassignment or 
transfer of function outside of the local 
commuting area; 

(2) A former career or career-condi-
tional competitive service employee, in 
tenure group 1 or 2, at grade levels GS–
15 or equivalent and below, who was 
separated through reduction in force, 
or removed for declining a directed re-
assignment or transfer of function out-
side of the local commuting area; 

(3) A former career or career-condi-
tional employee who was separated be-
cause of a compensable injury or ill-
ness as provided under the provisions 
of subchapter I of chapter 81 of title 5, 
United States Code, whose compensa-
tion has been terminated and whose 
former agency is unable to place the 
individual as required by § 353.110(b) of 
this chapter; 

(4) A former career or career-condi-
tional competitive service employee, in 
tenure group 1 or 2, who retired with a 
disability under sections 8337 or 8451 of 
title 5, United States Code, whose dis-
ability annuity has been or is being 
terminated; 

(5) A former career or career-condi-
tional competitive service employee, in 
tenure group 1 or 2, at grades GS–15 
level or equivalent or below, who re-
ceived a RIF separation notice, and 
who retired on the effective date of the 
reduction in force or under the discon-
tinued service retirement option; 

(6) A former Military Reserve Tech-
nician or National Guard Technician 
who is receiving a special disability re-
tirement annuity from OPM under sec-
tion 8337(h) or 8456 of title 5 United 
States Code, as described in subpart H 
of this part; 

(7) A current Executive Branch agen-
cy employee in the excepted service, 
serving on an appointment without 

time limit, at grade levels GS–15 or 
equivalent and below, who has been 
given noncompetitive appointment eli-
gibility and selection priority by stat-
ute for positions in the competitive 
service, and who is in receipt of a re-
duction in force separation notice or 
notice of proposed removal for declin-
ing a transfer of function or directed 
reassignment outside of the local com-
muting area; or 

(8) A former Executive Branch agen-
cy employee in the excepted service, 
who served on an appointment without 
time limit, at grade levels GS–15 or 
equivalent and below, who has been 
given noncompetitive appointment eli-
gibility and selection priority by stat-
ute for positions in the competitive 
service, and who has been separated 
through reduction in force or removed 
for declining a transfer of function or 
directed reassignment outside of the 
local commuting area. 

(c) Eligible employee means a displaced 
employee who meets the conditions set 
forth in § 330.704(a). 

(d) Local commuting area has the 
meaning given in § 330.604(e). 

(e) Special selection priority has the 
meaning given in § 330.604(g). 

(f) Vacancy has the meaning given in 
§ 330.604(j). 

(g) Well-qualified employee has the 
meaning given in § 330.604(k). 

[62 FR 31323, June 9, 1997, as amended at 64 
FR 40509, July 27, 1999]

§ 330.704 Eligibility. 
(a) To be eligible for the special se-

lection priority, an individual must 
meet all of the following conditions: 

(1) Is a displaced employee as defined 
in § 330.703(b); 

(2) Has a current (or a last) perform-
ance rating of record of at least fully 
successful or equivalent (except for 
those eligible under § 330.703(b)(3), 
(b)(4), and (b)(6); 

(3) Applies for a vacancy at or below 
the grade level from which the em-
ployee has been or is being separated, 
that does not have a greater promotion 
potential than the position from which 
the employee has been or is being sepa-
rated; 

(4) Occupies, or was displaced from a 
position in the same local commuting 
area of the vacancy;
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