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(d)(1) The USDA Interstate and Inter-
national Certificate of Health Exam-
ination for Small Animals (APHIS 
Form 7001) and Record of Aquisition 
and Dogs and Cats on Hand (APHIS 
Form 7005) are forms which may be 
used by research facilities to keep and 
maintain the information required by 
paragraph (b) of this section. 

(2) The USDA Interstate and Inter-
national Certificate of Health Exam-
ination for Small Animals (APHIS 
Form 7001) and Record of Disposition of 
Dogs and Cats (APHIS Form 7006) are 
forms which may be used by research 
facilities to keep and maintain the in-
formation required by paragraph (c) of 
this section. 

(e) One copy of the record containing 
the information required by paragraphs 
(b) and (c) of this section shall accom-
pany each shipment of any live dog or 
cat sold or otherwise disposed of by a 
research facility; Provided, however, 
That, except as provided in § 2.133 of 
this part, information that indicates 
the source and date of acquisition of 
any dog or cat need not appear on the 
copy of the record accompanying the 
shipment. One copy of the record con-
taining the information required by 
paragraphs (b) and (c) of this section 
shall be retained by the research facil-
ity. 

(f) All records and reports shall be 
maintained for at least three years. 
Records that relate directly to pro-
posed activities and proposed signifi-
cant changes in ongoing activities re-
viewed and approved by the IACUC 
shall be maintained for the duration of 
the activity and for an additional three 
years after completion of the activity. 
All records shall be available for in-
spection and copying by authorized 
APHIS or funding Federal agency rep-
resentatives at reasonable times. 
APHIS inspectors will maintain the 
confidentiality of the information and 
will not remove the materials from the 
research facilities’ premises unless 
there has been an alleged violation, 
they are needed to investigate a pos-
sible violation, or for other enforce-
ment purposes. Release of any such 
materials, including reports, sum-
maries, and photographs that contain 
trade secrets or commercial or finan-
cial information that is privileged or 

confidential will be governed by appli-
cable sections of the Freedom of Infor-
mation Act. Whenever the Adminis-
trator notifies a research facility in 
writing that specified records shall be 
retained pending completion of an in-
vestigation or proceeding under the 
Act, the research facility shall hold 
those records until their disposition is 
authorized in writing by the Adminis-
trator. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0579–0254) 

[54 FR 36147, Aug. 31, 1989, as amended at 58 
FR 39129, July 22, 1993; 60 FR 13895, Mar. 15, 
1995; 69 FR 42101, July 14, 2004] 

§ 2.36 Annual report. 
(a) The reporting facility shall be 

that segment of the research facility, 
or that department, agency, or instru-
mentality of the United States, that 
uses or intends to use live animals in 
research, tests, experiments, or for 
teaching. Each reporting facility shall 
submit an annual report to the AC Re-
gional Director for the State where the 
facility is located on or before Decem-
ber 1 of each calendar year. The report 
shall be signed and certified by the 
CEO or Institutional Official, and shall 
cover the previous Federal fiscal year. 

(b) The annual report shall: 
(1) Assure that professionally accept-

able standards governing the care, 
treatment, and use of animals, includ-
ing appropriate use of anesthetic, an-
algesic, and tranquilizing drugs, prior 
to, during, and following actual re-
search, teaching, testing, surgery, or 
experimentation were followed by the 
research facility; 

(2) Assure that each principal investi-
gator has considered alternatives to 
painful procedures; 

(3) Assure that the facility is adher-
ing to the standards and regulations 
under the Act, and that it has required 
that exceptions to the standards and 
regulations be specified and explained 
by the principal investigator and ap-
proved by the IACUC. A summary of all 
such exceptions must be attached to 
the facility’s annual report. In addition 
to identifying the IACUC-approved ex-
ceptions, this summary must include a 
brief explanation of the exceptions, as 
well as the species and number of ani-
mals affected; 
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(4) State the location of all facilities 
where animals were housed or used in 
actual research, testing, teaching, or 
experimentation, or held for these pur-
poses; 

(5) State the common names and the 
numbers of animals upon which teach-
ing, research, experiments, or tests 
were conducted involving no pain, dis-
tress, or use of pain-relieving drugs. 
Routine procedures (e.g., injections, 
tattooing, blood sampling) should be 
reported with this group; 

(6) State the common names and the 
numbers of animals upon which experi-
ments, teaching, research, surgery, or 
tests were conducted involving accom-
panying pain or distress to the animals 
and for which appropriate anesthetic, 
analgesic, or tranquilizing drugs were 
used; 

(7) State the common names and the 
numbers of animals upon which teach-
ing, experiments, research, surgery, or 
tests were conducted involving accom-
panying pain or distress to the animals 
and for which the use of appropriate 
anesthetic, analgesic, or tranquilizing 
drugs would have adversely affected 
the procedures, results, or interpreta-
tion of the teaching, research, experi-
ments, surgery, or tests. An expla-
nation of the procedures producing 
pain or distress in these animals and 
the reasons such drugs were not used 
shall be attached to the annual report; 

(8) State the common names and the 
numbers of animals being bred, condi-
tioned, or held for use in teaching, 
testing, experiments, research, or sur-
gery but not yet used for such pur-
poses. 

[54 FR 36147, Aug. 31, 1989, as amended at 63 
FR 62926, Nov. 10, 1998] 

§ 2.37 Federal research facilities. 
Each Federal research facility shall 

establish an Institutional Animal Care 
and Use Committee which shall have 
the same composition, duties, and re-
sponsibilities required of nonfederal re-
search facilities by § 2.31 with the fol-
lowing exceptions: 

(a) The Committee shall report defi-
ciencies to the head of the Federal 
agency conducting the research rather 
than to APHIS; and 

(b) The head of the Federal agency 
conducting the research shall be re-

sponsible for all corrective action to be 
taken at the facility and for the grant-
ing of all exceptions to inspection pro-
tocol. 

§ 2.38 Miscellaneous. 
(a) Information as to business: fur-

nishing of same by research facilities. 
Each research facility shall furnish to 
any APHIS official any information 
concerning the business of the research 
facility which the APHIS official may 
request in connection with the enforce-
ment of the provisions of the Act, the 
regulations, and the standards in this 
subchapter. The information shall be 
furnished within a reasonable time and 
as may be specified in the request for 
information. 

(b) Access and inspection of records and 
property. (1) Each research facility 
shall, during business hours, allow 
APHIS officials: 

(i) To enter its place of business; 
(ii) To examine records required to be 

kept by the Act and the regulations in 
this part; 

(iii) To make copies of the records; 
(iv) To inspect the facilities, prop-

erty, and animals, as the APHIS offi-
cials consider necessary to enforce the 
provisions of the Act, the regulations, 
and the standards in this subchapter; 
and 

(v) To document, by the taking of 
photographs and other means, condi-
tions and areas of noncompliance. 

(2) The use of a room, table or other 
facilities necessary for the proper ex-
amination of the records and for in-
spection of the property or animals 
shall be extended to APHIS officials by 
the research facility. 

(c) Publication of names of research fa-
cilities subject to the provisions of this 
part. APHIS will publish lists of re-
search facilities registered in accord-
ance with the provisions of this sub-
part in the FEDERAL REGISTER. The 
lists may be obtained upon request 
from the AC Regional Director. 

(d) Inspection for missing animals. 
Each research facility shall allow, upon 
request and during business hours, po-
lice or officers of other law enforce-
ment agencies with general law en-
forcement authority (not those agen-
cies whose duties are limited to en-
forcement of local animal regulations) 
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