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DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION 

Notice of Proposed Information 
Collection Requests 

AGENCY: Department of Education 
SUMMARY: The IC Clearance Official, 
Regulatory Information Management 
Services, Office of Management, invites 
comments on the proposed information 
collection requests as required by the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995. 

DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before July 7, 
2008. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
3506 of the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. Chapter 35) requires 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) provide interested 
Federal agencies and the public an early 
opportunity to comment on information 
collection requests. OMB may amend or 
waive the requirement for public 
consultation to the extent that public 
participation in the approval process 
would defeat the purpose of the 
information collection, violate State or 
Federal law, or substantially interfere 
with any agency’s ability to perform its 
statutory obligations. The IC Clearance 
Official, Regulatory Information 
Management Services, Office of 
Management, publishes that notice 
containing proposed information 
collection requests prior to submission 
of these requests to OMB. Each 
proposed information collection, 
grouped by office, contains the 
following: (1) Type of review requested, 
e.g. new, revision, extension, existing or 
reinstatement; (2) Title; (3) Summary of 
the collection; (4) Description of the 
need for, and proposed use of, the 
information; (5) Respondents and 
frequency of collection; and (6) 
Reporting and/or Recordkeeping 
burden. OMB invites public comment. 

The Department of Education is 
especially interested in public comment 
addressing the following issues: (1) Is 
this collection necessary to the proper 
functions of the Department; (2) will 
this information be processed and used 
in a timely manner; (3) is the estimate 
of burden accurate; (4) how might the 
Department enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (5) how might the 
Department minimize the burden of this 
collection on the respondents, including 
through the use of information 
technology. 

Dated: May 1, 2008. 
Angela C. Arrington, 
IC Clearance Official, Regulatory Information 
Management Services, Office of Management. 

Institute of Education Sciences 

Type of Review: New. 
Title: High School Graduation 

Confirmation Study. 
Frequency: One Time. 
Affected Public: Individuals or 

household; State, Local, or Tribal Gov’t, 
SEAs or LEAs. 

Reporting and Recordkeeping Hour 
Burden: 

Responses: 5,130. 
Burden Hours: 1,845. 

Abstract: This study will be 
conducted as a part of the October 
Current Population Survey October 
education supplement. The purpose is 
to confirm the accuracy of reporting by 
household respondents of high school 
graduation status of household members 
by contacting reported school from 
which household members ages 18 to 24 
were reported graduating. 

Requests for copies of the proposed 
information collection request may be 
accessed from http://edicsweb.ed.gov, 
by selecting the ‘‘Browse Pending 
Collections’’ link and by clicking on 
link number 3678. When you access the 
information collection, click on 
‘‘Download Attachments’’ to view. 
Written requests for information should 
be addressed to U.S. Department of 
Education, 400 Maryland Avenue, SW., 
LBJ, Washington, DC 20202–4537. 
Requests may also be electronically 
mailed to ICDocketMgr@ed.gov or faxed 
to 202–401–0920. Please specify the 
complete title of the information 
collection when making your request. 

Comments regarding burden and/or 
the collection activity requirements 
should be electronically mailed to 
ICDocketMgr@ed.gov. Individuals who 
use a telecommunications device for the 
deaf (TDD) may call the Federal 
Information Relay Service (FIRS) at 1– 
800–877–8339. 

[FR Doc. E8–10087 Filed 5–6–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4000–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Environmental Management Site- 
Specific Advisory Board, Hanford 

AGENCY: Department of Energy. 
ACTION: Notice of Open Meeting. 

SUMMARY: This notice announces a 
meeting of the Environmental 
Management Site-Specific Advisory 
Board (EM SSAB), Hanford. The Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (Pub. L. 92– 

463, 86 Stat. 770) requires that public 
notice of this meeting be announced in 
the Federal Register. 
DATES: Thursday, June 5, 2008, 9 a.m.– 
5 p.m.; Friday, June 6, 2008, 8:30 a.m.– 
4 p.m. 
ADDRESSES: Red Lion Hotel Hanford 
House, 802 George Washington Way, 
Richland, Washington 99352, Phone: 
(509) 946–7611, Fax: (509) 943–8564. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Erik 
Olds, Federal Coordinator, Department 
of Energy Richland Operations Office, 
2440 Stevens Drive, P.O. Box 450, H6– 
60, Richland, WA 99352; Phone: (509) 
372–8656; or E-mail: 
Theodore_E_Erik_Olds@orp.doe.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 
Purpose of the Board: The purpose of 

the Board is to make recommendations 
to DOE in the areas of environmental 
restoration, waste management, and 
related activities. 

Tentative Agenda 

• State of Columbia River; 
• Uniform Safety Systems throughout 

Hanford; 
• Configuration Control of Critical 

Assumptions; 
• Rattlesnake Mountain; 
• Update on Office of River 

Protection’s Integrated System Plan; 
• Update on Tri-Party Agreement 

Negotiations; 
• Update from Hanford Advisory 

Board Leadership Retreat and Board 
work priorities; 

• Science and Technology Roadmap; 
• Update on Nuclear Regulatory 

Commission and their review of the 
regulatory processes of the Waste 
Treatment Plant; 

• Recap of EM SSAB Chairs Meeting 
held on April 23–24, 2008 in Richland, 
Washington; 

• Committee Updates including: Tank 
Waste Committee; River and Plateau 
Committee; Health, Safety and 
Environmental Protection Committee; 
Public Involvement Committee; and 
Budgets and Contracts Committee. 

Public Participation: The meeting is 
open to the public. Written statements 
may be filed with the Board either 
before or after the meeting. Individuals 
who wish to make oral statements 
pertaining to agenda items should 
contact Erik Olds’ office at the address 
or telephone number listed above. 
Requests must be received five days 
prior to the meeting and reasonable 
provision will be made to include the 
presentation in the agenda. The Deputy 
Designated Federal Officer is 
empowered to conduct the meeting in a 
fashion that will facilitate the orderly 
conduct of business. Individuals 
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