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Introduction 
 
In accordance with the National Environmental Policy Act (NEPA) the Bureau of 
Reclamation (Reclamation) has prepared a Draft Environmental Assessment (EA) that 
evaluates the environmental effects of the Reclamation’s proposed Deer Flat Dam Upper 
Embankment Safety of Dams Project. 
 
The purpose of the project is to prevent failure of the Upper Embankment which would 
cause extensive property damage, potential loss of life, and loss of project benefits.  
Corrective action is needed due to internal erosion of embankment material currently 
occurring along the Caldwell Canal conduit and which has the potential to occur along 
the Nampa Canal conduit, both located within the Upper Embankment. 
 
Deer Flat dams form Lake Lowell, an off-stream reservoir, located in a natural depression 
between the Snake and Boise Rivers.  Water diverted from the Boise River at the Boise 
River Diversion Dam flows through the 40-mile-long New York Canal and into Lake 
Lowell.  The total capacity of Lake Lowell is 173,100 acre-feet at full pool elevation 
2531.2 feet.  Irrigation water is released from Lake Lowell through four canal outlets. 
The Caldwell and Nampa Canal outlets are located in the Upper Embankment while the 
Lowline and North Canals are located in the Lower Embankment.  Lake Lowell is 
operated by the Boise Project Board of Control. 
 
Deer Flat National Wildlife Refuge (Refuge), established in 1909 and managed by the 
U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, (USFWS) surrounds and includes Lake Lowell.  Large 
numbers of wintering waterfowl use the Refuge.  The reservoir and surrounding area 
support excellent warm water fishing, upland game bird and waterfowl hunting, boating, 
picnicking, wildlife viewing, swimming, and sightseeing.   
 
Alternatives Considered and Recommended Action 
 
A range of structural and nonstructural alternatives were developed to address the safety 
concerns at Deer Flat Dam Upper Embankment.  Screening analysis resulted in two 
structural alternatives for the Caldwell Canal that were deemed reasonable and feasible 
and carried forward for more detailed analysis.  Other structural alternatives were 
rejected early due to excessive cost, significant environmental impact, or because they 



did not adequately address the safety concerns. A single alternative was developed for 
modification of the Nampa Canal outlet.  This alternative was further revised during a 
Value Engineering exercise. 
 
Two nonstructural alternatives were evaluated.  These were 1) implementation of a 
reservoir operating level restriction and 2) abandonment of the Deer Flat Dam.  Both of 
these were rejected because the project irrigation storage benefits would not be retained, 
and environmental impacts to the Refuge would be too great. 
 
Two alternatives were analyzed in the EA: the proposed action and no action.  Under the 
proposed action Reclamation will completely excavate and replace the Caldwell Canal 
conduit and partial excavation and installation of a sand filter on the downstream portion 
of the Nampa Canal conduit.  In order to accomplish the work at the Caldwell Canal, 
Lake Lowell will need to be held at a lower pool level than normal during the fall and 
winter of the construction season.  A new access road to the Refuge headquarters will 
also be constructed since access will be cut off during the safety of dams work. 
 
Reclamation has selected the proposed action as the alternative to be implemented. 
 
Consultation, Coordination, and Public Involvement 
 
Reclamation developed a list of issues and concerns based on previous safety of dams 
work conducted at Deer Flat from 1990-1991 and through consultation and coordination 
with the Refuge.  Idaho Department of Fish and Game and USFWS were also contacted 
for their input, and the project was discussed with IDFG via telephone. 
 
Consultations with the Idaho State Historic Preservation Office (SHPO) pursuant to 36 
CFR 800 regulations regarding protection of historic properties under Section 106 of the 
National Historic Preservation Act included a site visit and discussions and 
correspondence regarding impacts to historic resources and mitigation measures.  A 
memorandum of agreement was jointly developed and executed with the Idaho SHPO on 
July 12, 2006 that stipulates mitigation measures. 
 
The Draft EA was mailed to over 50 agencies, tribes, organizations and individuals for a 
30-day comment period and was posted on Reclamation’s Pacific Northwest Region 
website.  Reclamation received comment letters from USFWS Snake River Basin Office, 
the Refuge, and Canyon County Highway District No. 4.  The comment letters and 
Reclamation’s responses to comments are attached. (See Attachments 1-3.)  
 
The Draft EA served as the biological assessment for species listed under the Endangered 
Species Act (ESA) and was provided to USFWS to meet informal consultation 
requirements under Section 7 of ESA.  Reclamation determined that the proposed action 
may affect, but is not likely to adversely affect bald eagles.  USFWS concurred with this 
finding by memo on September 12, 2006 (Attachment 1).   
 
 



Summary of Environmental Effects 
 
Lake Operations and Hydrology – In order to accomplish the excavation of the Caldwell 
Canal outlet conduit the level of Lake Lowell will need to be lower than normal during 
the fall and early winter of the construction season.  These levels are within normal 
operating ranges during moderately dry years and would be expected to occur 
approximately 50 percent of all water years based on Reclamation modeling studies. 
 
Water Quality - Impacts will be limited to minor and localized increases in turbidity 
during the excavation of the emergency berm at Caldwell Canal.  The lower reservoir 
pool is not expected to exacerbate water quality concerns at the lake during the fall/winter 
construction period. 
 
Cultural Resources – The project will alter characteristics of the Upper Embankment that 
qualify it for inclusion in the National Register of Historic Places and have an adverse 
effect on the property.  Reclamation has consulted with the SHPO and executed a 
memorandum of agreement that specifies mitigation measures Reclamation will 
undertake to minimize the impacts.  
 
Aquatic Species – No measurable impact to gamefish populations or other aquatic species 
is expected. 
 
Vegetation - Vegetation impacts will consist of approximately 2.5 acres of recently 
burned and revegetated sagebrush/grassland due to construction of the new Refuge access 
road and 3 acres of sparse, weedy sagebrush/grassland lost from embankment excavation.  
These impacts are minor compared to the abundance of these vegetation communities in 
the area.  Areas disturbed during construction would be re-seeded with the exception of 
the Upper Embankment slope. 
 
Threatened and Endangered Species - Reclamation has determined that the proposed 
action may affect but is not likely to adversely affect bald eagles, and USFWS has 
concurred with this determination (Attachment 1).  The project would have no affect on 
the gray wolf or Idaho springsnail, which also occur in Canyon County. 
 
Transportation and Access - Short-term road closures will occur during excavation of the 
Nampa Canal conduit requiring detours of up to 1.5 miles for nearby residents and 
commercial traffic.  No comments were received by potentially affected residents.  Haul 
routes will be designated to avoid paved County roads to the extent practical, and 
Reclamation will coordinate with Canyon Highway District No. 4 regarding signage and 
haul routes (Attachment 3).  
 
Noise - Noise from construction equipment will be noticeable but not extremely 
bothersome for the approximately 20 residences near the construction area.  Most of the 
noise will occur in the winter months when residents are not outside and have their 
windows closed. 
 



 
 
Recreation – Only minimal short-term impacts will occur.  Impacts will be limited to loss 
of fishing opportunity from the Upper Embankment, reduced cover for waterfowl hunters 
and loss of some open water for boaters in early fall. 
 
Indian Trust Assets – No impacts to any Tribal rights to hunt and fish will occur.  Impacts 
to water quality, fish, and wildlife will be minimal. 
 
Minority or Low-income Populations – The proposed action would not affect these 
groups and therefore there was no discussion of effects in the Draft EA. 
 
Cumulative Impacts – There are no present or reasonably foreseeable future actions that 
will have additive or interactive impacts on the environment in the project area. 
Development is gradually impacting some environmental parameters, but the timing, 
scope and details of development are unknown and unquantifiable. 
 
Past safety of dams activities resulted in adverse effects to the dams’ historic integrity, 
however mitigation measures developed and implemented jointly with the SHPO will 
avoid and minimize impacts to the extent feasible. 
 
Changes to the Draft EA 
 
Reclamation received three letters commenting on the Draft EA, none of which requested 
or required revision of the document. Therefore a final EA will not be prepared.  The 
findings of this document are based on the Draft EA and the attached comments and 
responses. 
 
Finding 

Based on the analysis of the environmental impacts in the Draft EA and consultation with 
potentially affected agencies, Tribes, organizations, and the general public, Reclamation 
concludes that implementation of the proposed safety of dams project will not have a 
significant effect on the quality of the human environment or natural and cultural 
resources.  The effects of the proposed action will be minor and localized.  Therefore 
preparation of and environmental impact statement is not required. 
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Responses to USFWS Snake River Fish and Wildlife Office  
 

 
Conservation Recommendations Under ESA 
 
1.  Bald Eagle Monitoring – Reclamation does not plan to conduct a formal monitoring 
program to observe bald eagle behavior during construction, however we will maintain 
close communication with Refuge personnel regarding any behavior changes in bald 
eagles that they notice at or near the construction site.  Any observation noted by 
Reclamation construction inspectors will be also noted. This would include avoidance of 
perching areas that are normally used, flushing of eagles from perching areas during 
various construction activities, and general absence or presence in and around the Upper 
Embankment.  A report summarizing observations will be prepared by Reclamation and 
provided to USFWS. 
 
2.  Implement Mitigation Measures - See responses to recommendations below. 
 
Comments and Recommendations in Accordance With Fish and Wildlife 
Coordination Act, Migratory Bird Act, and NEPA 
 
3.  DDT Exposure – We have not programmed funds to conduct any further DDT 
contamination studies at Lake Lowell.  We would like to discuss the scope of these 
recommendations and priorities with USFWS prior to seeking funding for any further 
DDT work.  We will be contacting you in the near future to arrange these discussions.   
 
4.  Mercury Exposure – Reclamation is cooperating with the Idaho Department of 
Environmental Quality (DEQ) and Idaho Department of Fish and Game (IDFG), to 
conduct additional mercury studies associated with the development of a TMDL for Lake 
Lowell.  These studies are scheduled to occur in late 2006 and will include the collection 
and analysis of fish tissue and water column samples for mercury as well water column 
pH.  Reclamation does not anticipate collecting sediment samples, but we would like to 
discuss the scope of these recommendations further. 
 
5.  Fish Die Offs – As indicated in Figure 7 on Page 11 of the Draft EA, the lake 
elevation required for construction would be lowest in September and October – not the 
warmest months of the summer.  During July and August the lake elevation would be 
fairly typical. As stated on Page 15, even the lowest lake levels during September and 
October are within the operating range of moderately dry years, and wind should 
adequately mix the shallower water to minimize oxygen poor areas.  According to Refuge 
personnel, no significant fish die-offs have occurred during lake operation to even lower 
levels than what is proposed.  Therefore, no contingency plan to acquire fish for 
restocking, except for normal annual stocking has been made.  IDFG has annually 
stocked between 91,000 and 164,000 cutthroat fry and 6,000 and 13,000 channel catfish 
catchables the last three years, and it is expected that fish stocking would continue after 
completion of the project. 
 



6.  Botulism Outbreaks – Refuge personnel have indicated that avian botulism has not 
been a problem in the past during similar or lower lake water levels than what is 
proposed.  As stated above, significant fish kills have not occurred in the past nor are they 
expected to occur with the proposed lake operation. 
 
7.  Nutrients and Bacterial Loading – The DEQ included Lake Lowell on their 2002 
§303(d) list for excess nutrients and low dissolved oxygen.  In response to this listing 
DEQ is currently developing a TMDL for nutrients, which will also address dissolved 
oxygen.  The TMDL is scheduled to be completed in 2007.  Reclamation is providing 
laboratory assistance to DEQ for TMDL related water quality monitoring, including 
nutrients.  Following development of the TMDL, Reclamation intends to cooperate with 
DEQ to help develop an achievable TMDL implementation plan.  It is anticipated that 
part of TMDL implementation will include strategies to reduce pollutant loading 
(nutrients, bacteria, and sediment) from all applicable sources. 
 
8.  Petroleum Exposure – Reclamation’s construction specifications will require stringent 
petroleum containment and spill prevention measures including approval of a Spill 
Prevention Control and Countermeasure Plan.  Required measures will include 
containment berms, impermeable barriers, prohibition of underground storage, spill kits 
and training of personnel involved in fueling and servicing. 
 
9.  Introduced Species – Reclamation will include language in the construction 
specifications requiring inspection and other measures to ensure aquatic invasive species 
are not introduced to Lake Lowell by equipment used in the water.  It is not practical to 
inspect every vehicle used for construction on land, and there are several exotic invasive 
species already present in the construction area.  However, Reclamation will assist the 
Refuge in control of any new noxious terrestrial weeds that may be introduced to the 
construction area during the next growing season following construction.  Revegetation 
of disturbed areas will also help prevent the spread of invasive plants. 
 
10.  Mosquito Transmitted West Nile Virus – At the water surface elevations proposed 
for construction, there would be no more stagnant pools than during normal operations. 
Stagnant areas are most prevalent at full pool when riparian vegetation is flooded.  The 
low pool proposed for construction would be large open water areas subject to agitation 
by wind and not conducive to mosquito breeding.  Reclamation is not involved in regular 
mosquito control on the Refuge.  This is planned and controlled by Refuge personnel. 
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TO:  Area Manager, Snake River Area Office, Bureau of Reclamation   
 

FROM: Refuge Manager, Deer Flat National Wildlife Refuge 
 

SUBJECT: Comments on Draft Environmental Assessment, Deer Flat Dam Upper 
Embankment Safety of Dams Project 

 
Thank you for the opportunity to provide comments on this Draft EA.  We have the following 
comments. 
 

With the water level of Lake Lowell at 2518 feet elevation, the target for November 1 of 
the construction year, wintering waterfowl will have difficulty reaching all but the very 
edge of smartweed beds.  Additionally, there will be little cover for waterfowl hunters.  
While we realize the construction will limit the water level that the Lake can be raised, 
the Refuge would like to see the Lake at the highest level possible. 
 
As a clarification in section 3.5.1, the legislated purpose of Deer Flat National Wildlife 
Refuge is to provide a refuge and breeding grounds for migratory birds and other 
wildlife.  The emphasis has been on wintering waterfowl. 
 

The Snake River Fish and Wildlife Office has also provided comments and we concur with their 
comments and recommendations. 
 
We will continue to work with the Bureau on this project and look forward to the Final EA and 
the completion of this project. 
 
Please contact me, Elaine Johnson, at (208) 467-9278 if you need any further information.    
 

 
 
 
 

http://deerflat.fws.gov/
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Responses to USFWS Deer Flat National Wildlife Refuge 
 
 
1.  As stated on page 11 of the Draft EA, the lake elevation would be at least 2518 if 
sufficient water in the Boise River and upstream reservoirs is available.  Reclamation will 
work with the Boise Project Board of Control to provide an elevation higher than 2518 if 
water is available and icing conditions allow. 
 
2.  Comment noted. 
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Response to Canyon Highway District No 4. 
 
 
1.  Reclamation will work closely with Canyon Highway District No. 4 (District) to 
ensure that adequate signage is placed at the Indiana and Roosevelt intersection and in all 
other transportation-related aspects within the District.   
 
2.  Haul routes are designed to minimize heavy truck traffic over District paved roads.  
Reclamation will contact the District to discuss haul routes prior to designating these 
routes for the contractor.  
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