
EXlBIT"A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dal1as~ Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: Torrey Pines Bank *

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank:i

The undersigned Potential Acquircr submits this Bid Form ("Bidtt), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instrctions contained on this Fonn, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (it) a Loan
Sale.

* Torrey Pines bank is a wholly owned subsidiary of Western Alliance Bancorp.



This is bid number
of _ bids submitted.

L Prirr.ha~e and As.i;umption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: Torrey Pines Bank, San Diego. CA
(Name, City, State)

The following options arc to be selcctcd by the Potentio.l Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting_froJI_apositive oercentagc bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquircr to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certin
liabilties of the Institution. A discount is a negativc dollar amount resulting from a
ne"gative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits 10 be paid by thc FDIC to the acauire:r fur
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilties of the Institution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "( )".

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits N/A % of Asumed Denositi.

Insured .Dcposits Only OtOO % of Assumed Deposits.

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS Ll STED IN SECTION II)

i: Exercise the option to purchas certain or all Luan Puul:

(X Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
U Bids on the Loan Pools sre not linke.d to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing box.es are cheeked with an "x" it wil be
assumed that the loan pool bids are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Ll Wl1iv~ ili~ lJpliuli iú purclia~ certain or all Loan Pools

2
9id formoii131
Janua 28, 2009, 3: 18 PM

A11lmcc Bank
Culver City, CA



This is bid number
of bids submitted.

II. Loan Pool Purchas

The Potential Acquirer is: Torrey Eines Bank, San Diego CA
(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools

100 Construction &, Land Development; Commercial 33 90% of Book Value.

200 Constction & Land Development: Residential 3390 % of Book Value.

300 Construction & Land Development: Undetenninable (1)33.90% of 
Book

Value.

400 Conventional 1-11 Family Propert 33.90% of Book Value.

500 Equity Lines- Secured by 1-4 Family Propert 33.90% of Book Value.

600 Multiple Family Residence 33.90% of Book Value.

700 Non-Fann~ Non-Residential 33.90% of Book Value.

800 Commercial & Industrial 33.90% of Book Value.

900 Small Business Administration ~,9Q% of Book Value.

t 000 Consumer - Performing ;33.90% of Book Value.

1100 Non-Performing 33.90 % of Book V¡¡ll1~.

A. Note: Linked Bids

B ids on th~ above Loan Pools:

(Xl ~ linked to each other
Ll are not linked to each othu

Note: .If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it wil be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

3
Bid Form 02131
January 28, 2009. 318 PM

Alliance Bank
Culver City. CA



This is bid number
of bids submitted.

m. ResultinglnstitutioQ Informaton (place nxs" where and as appropriate)

A. lfthe Potential Acquircr's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial institution wil be a

~bank
thrift

(ii) the resulting financial institution

will
-- will not

involve a de novo institution

(iii) the resulting financial institution

-- wil
wil not

he operated as 0. brunoh of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of 
the

resulting financial institution involved in the transaction wil be

Torrey PInes Bank

Ilnd such institution wil be 0.:

national bank
state member bank

-- state non member bank
federal savings bank
state savings ban
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

C. 1'0 be completed only if a hoiding company is involved:

Name ofholdil1g company: Western Alliance Bancorporation
4Bid Form Ù22131 Allance BankJanuary 28. 2009. 3: 1 g PM Culver City. CA



This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Address of holding company: 2700 West Sabara Ayenue

Las Vegas. NV 89102

The holding company ~ a:

.x bank holding company
thrift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Dale Gibbons

Title: CFO, Western Allance

Address: 2700 West Sahara Ave.

L~s Veg~s, NV 89102

Telephone: L0252-6236 (offce)

Facsimile:

702-370-722.6

I02-252-3648

(other)

cc: Name:

v. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of the trasactions contemplated herein has

ben accepted, the potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agrement(s) and work
dilgently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion detennines.

The: Pule:nliul At,4uirtr r~pn:~~riL~ I1mJ Wl1irdlllS LliaL it has ell~cult:u i1l1d deli vefed to the

Corpration a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
5

Rid Fi;rm 02213 I
Januar 28, 2009. 3:18 PM

AlIanccBank
Çulv~rCity. CA



This i5 bid number
of . bids submitted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certification ("Certification") and that all information provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the transactions contemplatf:d hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Con.Gi.c:rililllily Agic:c:im::iit i1ud its eligibility to purchci:;i; ~=:i:i=: and ability to c~ccutc u
Certification, are and remain true and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact. required to make the information contained therein not misleading. The Potential AcquireI'
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notification it wil execute and immcdiately deliver
to the FDiC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf ofthc Potcntial Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
AcquireI' 1m!: full power and authority to siihmit this Hid and has taken all corporate action
necc!lsaiy with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned ha!l been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf ofthè Potential Aequirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the ~ubmission of the bid and authorizing this representative to
sign on bchEllf of the in9titution or group has been !:ubinitted with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potential Acquirer~/'Torrey: Pines_Qank

By:

(signatur

Name: Phil Fowler

Title: Chief Finaoc.Qffiker

Date: February ;;, tPQS

6
Bid Foim lJ2Z 131

January 28, 2009. 3: i 8 PM

AIIÎuJll"i. Deii,\
Culver City. C/\



To Page 7 of 40 2009-02-03 17: 1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St. - Suite 3212&
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing

Division of Reso\utions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ('IBid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or Oi) a Loan
Sale.

Bid Form 022131
January 28, 2009, 3:18 PM

Allance Bank

Culver City, CA



To Page 8 of 40 2009-02-03 1i.1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number I
of4 bids submitted.

L Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

The fol1owing options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids inay be stated as a premium or as a diSeQunt. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive ~entage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
liabilities of the Instirution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain liabilities ofthe Instirution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "( )".

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits 1.47 % of Assumed Deposits. (*)

Insured Deposits Only % of Assumed Deposits.

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with th~ll9sit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION II)

LJ Exercise the option to purchase ceitain or all Loan Pools
U Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
U Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franc.hise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it wil be
assumed that the loan pool bids are !! linked to the deposit fi'anchise bid.

00 Waive the option to purchase certain or all Loan Pools

(*) This bid amount applies to all deposits to be assumed less assumed brokered
deposits. NQ premium is offered with respect to brokered deposits.

Bid Form 022131
January 28, 2009,3:18 PM

2 AJliam:c Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 9 of 40 2009-02-03 1i:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 1
of 4 bids submitted.

II. Loan Pool Purchase

Loan Pools

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California.
(Name, City, State)

100

200

300
Value.

400

500

600

700

800

900

Construction & Land Development: Commercial_~ of 
Book Value.

Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

Constrction & Land Development: Undeterminable (1) % of Book

Conventional 1-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

Equity Lines - Secured by 1-4 Family Propert % of Book Value.

Multiple Family Residence _.____~__~o. of Book Value.

Non-Farm, Non~Residential__~ of Book Value.

Commercial & Industrial__~ of Book Value.

Small Business Administration % of Book Value.

1000 Consumer - Performing % of Book Value.

1100 Non-Perorming % of Book Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

U !! linked to each other

LJ arc Dot linked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are cheeked with an "Xl' it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

Bid Form 022131
Januar 28, 2009,3:18 PM

3 Ailance Bank
Culver City. CA



To Page 10 of 40 2009-02-03 17: 1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number i
of 4 bids submitted.

m. Resulting Instiution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial institution wil be a

~ bank

thrift

(ii) the resulting financial instituion

will
~ will not

involve a de novo institution

(iii) the resulting financial institution

1& wil
will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

California Bank & Trust

and such institution will be a;

national bank
stte member bank

state non member bank~
federal savings bank
state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

c. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation

Bid Fonn 022131

Januar 28,2009,3:18 PM

4 Al1ance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 11of40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number i
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lal(e City. Utah 8411 i

The holding company will be a:

~ bank holding company

thrift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for thè Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President Zions Bancorporation

Address: 300 Lakeside Dnve. Eighth Floor

Oaklwid, California 94612

Telephone: 510.808.1662 (offce)

fll. . cell (other)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

VI. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of 

the transactions contemplated herein has

been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will execute the appropriate agreeinent(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion detennines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrnts that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation n Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a

Bid form 022131

Januar 28, 2009, 3:18 PM

5 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 12 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number i
of 4 bids submilted.

Purchaser Eligibilty Certfication ("Certification") and that all information provided Bod
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
trariiction and the transactions contemplated lierehy, including, but not limted to, tlie
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purhase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and remain tre and correct ín all material respts and do not fail to state any
fact reuired to miikc t1e infoimation eoU1aincd therein not misleadng. The Potential Acqiiirer

agrees tbat if it is a successful bidder that all notification it will execute and immediately deliver
to the FmC it Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned. on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that 0) the Potential
AcquiIer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken al corporate Dction

necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Polentiiil Acquirer.

A Board re,wlulion authorizing the submission of the bid and authorjzigg this representative to
sign on behalf of the imtjp,itjon or grQUp has been submitted with each bid. form.

Printed Name ofPotentlnl Acquirer

California Bank & Trust

By: V~:1 L.q~-__
(signatue) )

Name: Dennis Uyeniura

Title: Managing Director / Chief Financial Offcer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Form 022)3~
Jaiil1uy 28,200,3:18 PM

6 Alli3Jl~e !:ao!:
Culver City. CA



To Page 130f40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BlDFORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corpration
160 i Bryan St. - Suite 32 i 28
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing

Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential Acquirer subinits this Bid Fonn ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instructions contained on this Form, to
acquire certin assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (ii) a Loan
Sale.

Bid Folm022131
January 28. 2009, 3: i 8 PM

Alliance Bank
Culver Cit, CA



To Page 140f40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid ntiiiber 2
of 4 bids submitted. ~

I. Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential AcquireI'. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Dep9sits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certin
liabilities of the Institution. A discount is a negative dollar amount resulting from a
negative percentage bid of ASSll!Ted Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume certain I iabilties of the Institution. Discount bids
must be included in parenthesis "( )".

A. The bid amount is:

All Deposits % of Assumed Deposits.

Insured Deposits Only 1.33 % of Assumed Deposits. (*)

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTiON II)

LJ Exercise the option to purchase certin or all Loan Pools
r_J Bids on the Loan Pools are linked to the deposit franchise bid.
U Bids on the Loan Pools are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it will be
assumed that the loan pol bids are not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

~ Waive the option to purchase certin or all Loan Pools

("') This bid amount applies to all deposits to be assumed less assumed brokered
deposits. No premium is offered with respect to brokered deposits.

Bid Form 022 ¡ 3 i
Januar 2lS, 2009, 3:lg PM

2 Alliance Bank
Culvel City, CA



To Page 150f40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

II. Loan Pool Purchase

Loan Pools

The Potential AcquireI' is: California Banle & Trust, San Diego, California.
(Name, City, State)

100

200

300
Value.

400

500

600

700

800

900

Construction & Land Development: Commercial % of Book Value.

Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

Construction & Land Development: Undeterminable (i) % of Book

Conventional 1-4 Family Propert __t!! of Book Value.

Equity Lines - Secured by 1-4 Family Propert % of Book Value.

Multiple Family Residence % of Book Value.

Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

Commercial & Industrial _.- of Book Value.

Small Business Administration % of Book Value.

i 000 Consumer - Perfonning _~ of Book Value.

i i 00 Non-Performing % of Book Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

LI !! linked to each other

LJ ~ linked to each other

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "Xli it will be assumed
that the loan pool bids are mnlínked to each other.

Bid Form 02213 i
January 28, 2009, 3: I g PM

3 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To: Page 16 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

in. Resulting Institution Information (Place "XS" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acauirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial institution wil be a

l& bank
thrift

(ii) the resulting financial institution

~
will
wil not

involve a de noVo institution

(iii) the resulting financial institution

00 will
will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of the
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

Caliornia Bank & Trust

and such institution will be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank(g
federal savings bank
state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company: Zions BancorporatiQß

Bid Form 022 i 3 i
January 28,2009,3: 18 PM

4 Alliance Bank
Culver City. CA



To Page 170f40 2009-02-03 171753 (GMT) 12023799839 From Brian Alprin

This is bid number 2
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 841 i 1

The holding company will be a:

~ bank holding company

thrift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior vice President, Zions Bancorporalion

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive. Eighth Floor

Oakland, Califol1ia 946 I 2

Telephone: 510,808.1662 (offce)

...2 11 ccll (other)

Facsimile: 510.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alpiin, Esq.,
Duane Monis LLP, 202.7J.§.:7820__

VI. Consummation of Transaction

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential AClJuirets Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein Iias

been accepted, the Potential Acquirer will exocute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and placc
as the Corpration in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a

Bid Porr 022131

January 28, 2009, 3. i 8 PM

5 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To: Page 18 of 40 2009-02-03 1i:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

11iIs is bid Dumber 2
of 4 bids submitted.

Pm'chaser Blìgibility Certification (~Ceiiifkation") and tht all inormatiDn provided ÐDd
representaion made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirel in connection with ths
transactioii and the tran.~actiollS contemplated hereby, including, but nol: limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement lind its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certfication. are and reman true and corrct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the. informtion contained t1ierein not iu.leadiiig. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notifcation it wil execute and iinmediatdy deli ver
to the FDIC 11 Certiftcation via fax and overnight d.elivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential AcquiTer, hereby cel1ifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has fiil1 power and authority to submit this Bid and has taen al corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the uudersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution mlthOlizíng tbe submission of the bid and authoriing this represeutative to
sign on behalf of the institution or group bas been submitted with each bid form.

Printed Name ofPotentiaJ Acquirer

Caliornia Bank & Trust

By: ~~
(signature) ~~

Nmne: Dennis Uyemura

Title: Managing Diredor I Chief Financial Offcer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Fcirm 022131
Jaminry 28, 2009, 3:18 PM

6 Alliance Bllk
Cutver City, CA



To Page 190f40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIBIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan St.-Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing

Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

ßIDFOR: Allance Banl(

Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential AcquireI' submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instnictions contained on this Form, to
acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption (Whole Bank) with
Loss Share Agreement.

Bid Form 022131
Januar 7, 2009

Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 20 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

I. Transaction # 1- All Deposits and Unsecured Liabilties

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential Acquirer will assume prior to the cominencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a

negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts wil be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. Ifoo bid is made for a transaction or option,

leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form wil be treated as a
live bid of SO.

A. The bid amount is:

Bid Form 02213 i
January 7, 2009

2 AlIiiice Bank
Cùlver City, CA



To Page 21 of 40 2009-02-03 1i:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid numb~
of 4 bids submitt~J

ll. Transaction 1# 2 - An Deposits

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential AcquireI' wil assume prior to the commencement of loss sharng with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
AcquireI' for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis H( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid ofzero in any form wil be treated as It

live bid of $0,

A. The hid amount is: ($24,500,000)

Bid Form 022131 3
January 7, 2009

Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 22 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753(GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

ID. Ti'ansaction # 3 - Insured Deposits Only

The Potential AcquireI' is: California Bani, & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount. which represents the amount of 
First Loss

the Potential AcquireI' wil assume prior to the commencement orioss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
AcquireI' tor the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities otthe Bank. Wher
completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts wil be considered positive (Le.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. Tfno bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero In any form wil be treated as a
live bid of $0.

A. The bid amount is:

Rid Form 02213 i
January 7, 2009

4 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 23 of 40 2009-02-03 17: 1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

III. Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Aequirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial instituion will be a

~ bank

thrift

(ii) the resulting financial institution

will
~ will not

involve a de novo institution

(iii) the resulting financial instituion

~ wil
will not
be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name ofihe
resulting financial institution involved in the transaction will be

California Bank & Trust

and such instituion wil be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bank~
federal savings bank
state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company: Zions Bancorporation

Bid Form 02213 i
January 7. 2009

5 AIliani;c Biirik
Culver City, CA



To Paiie 24 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 3
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Maio Street

Salt Lake City. Utah 84111

The holding company wil be a:

l& bank holding company

thrift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name: Alyin Lee

Tiile: Senior Vice President. Zions Sancorporation__

Address: 100 Lakeside Dri'ßßigJlth Floor

Oakland. Galifornia 94612

Telephone: 5 10.808.1662 (offce)

'I ?J'.. cell (other)

Facsiini!l:: S 10.808.1640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morri~ LLP, 202.776.7820

VI. Consummation of Transl\ction

The Potential AcquireI' agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirets Bid with respect to one of 

the transactions contemplated herein has

been accepted, the Potential AcquireI' will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warrnts that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agrement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Eligibility Certilìcation ("Certification") and that all information provided and

Bid Form 02213 i
January 7. 2009

6 Alliance ßank
Culver City, CA



To Page 25 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

¡Ths i5-bid niiinb~r 3

i of 4 bids submittd.

representatioriö made by or all behalf of the Potential Acqu!rer in cDlmectiou with this
transaction aud the tranactions contemplated hereby, includig, but not ¡iinited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certification, are and rellru tnie and correct in all uiateiial re-pects and. do not fail to state an)'
fact required to make the Lnfonnnticin contained therein not inisleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notificatiou it wil execute and imediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fmc and overnight delivef)i,

The undersigned. on behalf of tiie Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corporate action
necessar with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly uuthoriz to execute and
siibmít this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission of the bid and authorizin2 this representative to
sign on behalf of the institUtiOll.JOUI2 hus been submittd with each bid form.

Pnnted Name ofPotentlal Acquirer

CaIlforDÍn Bank & Trust

By: ~~. L lJ
(signature) U

Name: Deiiuis Uyemura

Title: Managing Director I Chief Financial Otfcer

Date: February i, 2009

Bid form 02213 i
JllIlIil 7, 2l.09

7 Allinii~e. Bwik
C\llver Ciiy. CA



To: Page 26 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

EXHIIT "A"
BID FORM

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bi)'an St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank")

The undersigned Potential AcquireI' submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Instructions to Potential Acquirers ("Instructions") and instnictions contained on this Foiin, to
acquire certain assets and liahilities pursuant to a Purchase and Assumption (Whole Bank) with
Loss Share Agreement.

Bid Form 022131
Jannary 7, 2009

Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 27 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

I. Transaction # 1- All Deposits and Unsecured Liabilties

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of 
First Loss

the Potential AcquireI' wil assume prior to the commencement ofloss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of 

the Bank, or a

negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
AcquireI' for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of 

the Bank. Wher

completing the Bid Fonn, Potential Acquirers ~ indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar ainount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form wil be treated as a

live bid of SO.

A. The bid amount is:

Bid Form 02213 i
Januar 7, 2009

2 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 28 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

II. Transaction # 2 - All Deposit'!

The Potential Acquirer is: California Bank & Trust, San Diego, California

(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of 
First Loss

the Potential AcquireI' wil assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing with the
FDIC for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of the Bank, or a
negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of 

the Bank. Wher

completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers must indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts wil be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) ifnot in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid ". A bid of zero in any form wil be treated as a
live bid of $0.

A. Tbe bid amount is:

Biå Form 02213J
January 7, 2009

3 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To: Page 29 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

m. Transaction # 3 - Insured Deposits Only

The Potential AcquireI' is: Caliornia Bank & Trust, San Diego, California
(Name, City, State)

Bids may be stated as a positive dollar amount, which represents the amount of First Loss
the Potential AcquireI' wil assume prior to the commencement of loss sharing witli the
FDIOfor the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of 

the Bank, or a

negative dollar amount, which is the amount to be paid by the FDIC to the Potential
Acquirer for the purchase of assets and/or to assume certain liabilities of 

the Bank. Wher

completing the Bid Form, Potential Acquirers ~ indicate a negative by placing
parenthesis "( )" around the dollar amount. All amounts will be considered positive (i.e.,
a First Loss amount) if not in parenthesis. If no bid is made for a transaction or option,
leave the space blank or write "no bid". A bid of zero in any form will be treated as a

live bid of $0.

A. The bid amount is: ($9,900,000)

Bid form 022131 4
January 7,2009

Alliaiice Bank
Culver City, CA



To. Page 30 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

m. Resulting Institution Information (Place "Xs" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial institution wil be a

rg bank

thrift

(ii) the resulting financial institution

wil
gg will not

involve a de novo institution

(iii) the resulting financial institution

rg wil
wil not

be operated as a branch ofthc Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of any transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name of 
the

resulting financial institution involved in the transaction wil be

California Bank & Trust

and such institution wil be a:

national bank
state member bank
state non member bankrg
federal savings bank
state savings bank
federal savings and loan association
state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company: Zions Bancolporation

Bid Form 022131
January 7,2009

5 Alliance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 31 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

This is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

Address of holding company: One South Main Street

Salt Lake City, Utah 84111

The holding company will be a:

~ bank holding company

thrift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acauirer:

Name: Alvin Lee

Title: Senior Vice President. Zigi\SBaneolP9f1tion

Address: 300 Lakeside Drive, Eighth Floor

Oakland, California 94612

Telephone: 5 i 0.808.1662 (offce)

fl SIl eell (other)

Facsimile: 510,808.1 640

cc: Name: Brian D. Alprin, Esq.,
Duane Morris LLP, 202.776.7820

VI. Consummation of Transaction 

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notifcation (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirer's Bid with respect to one of 

the transactions contemplated herein has

been accepted, the Potential Acquircr wil execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Corporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquirer represents and warants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to execute a
Purchaser Eligibilit Certifi~ation ("Certification") and that all information provided and

Bid Forni 022131
Januar 7,2009

6 Allance Bank
Culver City, CA



To Page 32 of 40 2009-02-0317:1753 (GMT) 12023799839 From: Brian Alprin

Tlús is bid number 4
of 4 bids submitted.

representations made by or on behaf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the tninsactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confidentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and ability to execute a
Certificaon, are and remain tre and coircet in all material respects and do noi fail to state any
fact required to make the information couuLined ilerein not misleading. The Potential Acquirer
agrees tliat if it is a Siicccssful bidder that on notification. it wil oxecute and immediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby certifies tbnt (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and. authority to submit this Bid and has taken all corpnite iictioii
necess¡uy with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute lind
subiit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution iiithorizing the submission of the bid iid authorizing this representative to
sign on behalf of the inßtitutioii or pionp \ii; be~n submitt with each bid form.

Piinted Nn,c of Potentil Acquirer

Californi Bank. & Trust

By: D~o'.
(signature) iy

Name: Dennis Uyemulß

Title: Managing Director f CbiefFiuancial Offcer

Date: February 2, 2009

Bid Furm022i31
January 7, 200

7 Alliance Bank
Culver City. CA



FeD, 2, 2009 5:04PM PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No,0211 P,3

EXHBITIIA"
BID FORM

. .

TO: Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation
1601 Bryan Sf. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketing
Division of Resolutions and Receiverships

FROM: _ _Pacific Western Bank -' Vic Santoro

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City, CA (the "Bank") - B08-37

The undersigned Potential Acquirer submits this Bid Form ("Bid"), in accordance with the
Intrctions to Potential Acquirers C'Instrctions") and instructions contained on this Form, to

acquire certain assets and liabilities pursuant to (i) a Purchase and Assumption or (ii) a Loan
Sale.



FeD, 2, 2009 5:04PM PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No, 0211 P, 4

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

1. . Purchase and Assumption Bid

The Potential Acquirer is: Pacific Western Bank, San Dìego, CA.
(Name. City. State)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acquirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a premium or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed Deposits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to assume certain
liabilties of the Institution. A discount is a negative doltar amount resultig from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposits to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume cerai liabílties of 

the Institution. Discount bids

must be included in parenthesis "()",

A. The bid amount is:

Al Deposits ----- % of Assumed DeposIts.

Insui'ed Drposits Onl o . i 5 % of Assumed Deposits.

B. Loan Pool Purchase Options with the Deposit Franchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION II

U Exercise the option to purchase certin or aU Loan Pools
Ll Bids on the Loan Pools are lined to the deposit franchise bid.
U Bids on the Loan Pools ø.re not linked to the deposit franchise bid.

Note: Ifneither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it wil be

assumed that the loan pool bids are not lined to the deposit fi:anchise bid.

U Waive the option to purchase certin or all Loan Pools

2
BldFonn 02213 i
JanuiU.28, 2009. 3:18 PM

AllanceBank
Culver City, CA



Feb. 2. 2009 5:04PM PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No.0211 P.5

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

n. Loan Pool Purchase PACIFIC WESTERN BANK MAKES NO BIDS ON ANY LOAN

Tlie Potential Acqulrer is: Pacific Western Banki San Diegoi CA.
(Name, City, State)

Loan Pools

100 Construction & Land Development: Commercial % of Book Value.

. 200 Construction & Land Development: Residential % of Book Value.

300 Construction & Land Development: Undeterminble (1)
Value.

% of Book

400 ConventIona11-4 Family Property % of Book Value.

500 Equity Lines - Secured by 1-4 Family Propert % of Book Value.

600 Multiple Family Residence % of Book Value. 

700 Non-Farm, Non-Residential % of Belok Value.

800 Commercial & Industrial % of Book Va.lue.

900 Small Business Administration % of Book Value.

1000 Consumer ~ Performing % of Book Value, 

1100 Non-Pei-fonning % of Book Value,

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

Ll il hoked to each other

Ll are not lined to each other

Note: Ifneither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it wil be assumed
.that the loan pool bids are not linked to each other.

3
Bid Form 02213 i
Januar 28, 2009, 3:18 PM

AUiance Ban
Culver City, CA



FeD, 2, 2009 5:04PM PWB Century City 310-20ì-0498 No, 0211 P, 6

This is bid number
of bids submitted,

il. Resulting Institution Information (Place "XS" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is accepted:

(i) the resulting financial intitution wil be a

-Lbank
thrft

(íi) the resultig financial institution

wil
X wil not

involve a de novo institution

(ii) the resulting financial institution

-- will
wil not

be operated as a branch of the Acquirer

B. Upon consummation of aiiy transaction contemplated in this Bid, the name ofthe
resulting fiiancial institution involved in the transaction wil be

Pacific Western Bank

and such institution wil be a:

national ban
state member ban

-l state non member ban
federal savings bank
state savings ban
federal savigs and loan association

state savings and loan association
other (please explain)

C. To be completed only 1f a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company:

4
Bid FDrm 022131
Janua28. 2009, 3:18PM

Al1ailce J3ank

CulVer Ciry, CA



Feb. 2, 2009 5:05PM PWB Century City 310-201-0498 No. 0211 P. 7

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Address of holding company:

The holding company wil be a:

bank holding company
thift holding company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact person for the Potential Acquirer:

Name; Victor R. Santoro

Title: Executive Vice President

Address: 10250 Constellation Blvd, Suite 1640

LOB Angeles, CA 90067

Telephone: (310) 728-1021 (offce)

( 31 0) 7 2 8 -1 0 2 6 ( oile~

Facsimile: (310) 201-0498

co: Name: Jared Wolff

V. Consummation of Transaction 

The Potential Acquirer agrees that upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquirets Bid with respect to one of the transactions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirer wil execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
diligently to consummate the transaction. Such consummation shall occur at such time and place
as the Coiporation in its sole discretion determines.

The Potential Acquier represents and wan'ants that it has executed and delivered to the
Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement, is eligible to purchase assets and able to ex.ecute a

5
BidFoim0221:i1
January 28, 2009,3: 18 PM

AUiance Bank
Culver Cily, CA



Feb. 2, 2009 5:05PM PWB Century City 310-201-0498 ~i o. 0211 8

This is bid number
of bids submitted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certification ("Certification") and that al inormation provided and
representations made by or on behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with this
transaction and the tranactions contemplated hereby, including, but not limited to, the
Confdentiality Agreement and its eligibility to purchase assets and abllity to ex.ecutea
Certification, are and remain tre and correct in all material respects and do not fail to state any
fact required to make the infolTiation contained therein not misleading, The Potential Acquirer
agrees that if it is a successful bidder that on notìftcation it wil execute and imediately deliver
to the FDIC a Certification via fax and overnight delivery.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquirer, hereby cerfies that (i) the Potential
Acquirer has full power and authority to submit this Bíd and has taken all corporate action
necessary with respect thereto, and (ii) the undersigned has been duly authorized to execute and
submit this Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquirer.

A Board resolution authorizing the submission ofthe bid and authorizing this representative to
sign on behalf of the institution'or group has been submitted with each bid form.

Printed Name ofPotentiaI Acquirer

By:

Name: Santoro
Title: Executive Vice President

Date: february 3 i 2009

6
BId Fort 022131

Janua 28, 2009, 3:18PM

Allirue 1I1lk

Culver City, CA



FEB-02-2009 16: 03 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.02

EXHIT"A"
BlDFORM

TO: Federl Deposit Inurnce Corporation

1601 Bryan St. - Suite 32128
Dallas, Texas 75201

Attention: Manager - Franchise Marketig
Diviion of Resolutions and Reciverships

~trlr~S 73 IA C i AJ c"J S ~ ;f IIFROM:

BID FOR: Allance Bank
Culver City CA (the "Ban~

The undersigned Potetial Acquier submits ths Bid Fonn ("Bid"). in accordace with the
Intrctions to Potential Acquirers ("Instrctionsll) and instrctions contained on ths Form, to

acquíre certin assets an liabilities put to (i) a Puchase and Assumption or (ii) a Loan

Sale.



FEB-02-2009 16: 03 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.03

This is bid number i.

of -- bids submitted.

i. Purcbase and Assumption Bid

ThePotentialAcquil"eris: ~'iI~t'S i3.."RoIF 7:"'AJIC~ ~g77Ilj~ Q.J#.
(Name, City, Slate)

The following options are to be selected by the Potential Acqirer. Each Section must
have an option designated. Bids may be stated as a prum or as a discount. A premium
is a positive dollar amount resulting from a positive percentage bid of Assumed DePQsits
paid by the acquirer to the FDIC for the purchase of assets and to asswne cert
liabilities of the Institution. A diount is a negative dollar amount resultig from a
negative percentage bid of Assumed Deposi~ to be paid by the FDIC to the acquirer for
the purchase of assets and to assume cern liabilties of the httitution. Discount bids
.m be included in parenthesis "( )".

A. The bid amount is:

Al Deposits
% of Assumed Deposits.

.: 0010 of Assumed Deposits.
Insured Deposits Oniy

B. Loan Pool Puchase Options with the Deposit Fnmchise

(LOAN POOLS LISTED IN SECTION ll)

LJ Exercis the option to purhase cert Or all Loan Pools
LJ Bids on the Loan Pools 3i-e lined to the deposit frclùse bid.
LJ Bids on the Loan Pools are not lined to the deposit frchise bid.

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes ar checked with an "x" it wil be
assued tht the loan pool bids are Dot linked to the deposit frchise bid.

)Xl Waive the option to purhase certin or all Loan Pools

Bid 1'(lmi02il3l

January 28,2009.3:18 PM

2

Alliance Bank
Culver Ciiy, CA



FEB-02-2009 15: 03 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.04

This is bid number 1-
of -- bids submitted.

II. Loan Pool Purcbase

The Potential Acquirer is: .

(Name, City, Sta)
Loan Pools

100 Constrction & Land Development: Commercial
% of Book Value.

200 Construction & Lan Development: Residential % of Book Value.

300 Constrction & Land Development: Undetenninable (I)

Value.
% of Book

400 Conventional 1-4 Famly Propert
% of Book Value.

500 Equity Lines - Secured by 1-4 Famiy Propert
% of Book Value.

600 Mulnple Famly Residence % of Book Value.

700 Non-Far, Non-Residential % of Book Value.

800 Commercial & Industral % of Book Value.

900 Small Business Admitrtion .. of Book Value.

1000 Consumer - Performg % of Book Value.

1100 Non-Pedormg % of Book Value.

A. Note: Linked Bids

Bids on the above Loan Pools:

U are líned to each other
U are not lined to each oiher

Note: If neither of the forgoing boxes are checked with an "x" it wil be assumed
tht the loan pool bids are not lied to each other.

3
Bid Form 022131
Janunty 28, 2009,3:18 PM

Alliance Ban1c

Culvcr Cily. C:/\



FEB-02-2009 16: 04 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.05

This is bid number -.

of -- bids submitted.

ILL. Resulting Institntiou luformation (Place "XS" where and as appropriate)

A. If the Potential Acquirer's Bid is acepted:

(i) the resultig ficial institution wil be a

-$ban_thn
(ií) the resultig fiania institution

wil
+- wil not

involve a de novo intitution

(ii) the resultig financial institution

-¥ wil
_ wil not

be operated as a brach of the Acquirer

B. Upon consumation of any trtion contemplated in ths Bid, the name of the
resulting fiania institution involved in the traction wil be

e ,.. i è £" A, , '" fA C , .. #f S 7j~ I(

and such institution wil be a:

~
national ban
state member bank
state non member ban
federl savings ban
state savigs ban
federal savings and loan associaton
stte savings and loan association

other (please explain)

C. To be completed only if a holding company is involved:

Name of holding company:

4
Bid Fonn on 13 J
Januar 28, 2009, 3, 18 PM

Allian Bank

Culv.. City, CA



FEB-02-2009 16: 04 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.06

Ths is bid number 1-

of -L bids submittd.

Address of holding company:

The holding company wil be a:

ban holdig company

thft holdi company

IV. Contact

The following person is the designated contact pern for the Potential Acquir:

Name: ~Aib ;: 3/e~~'CI.J, .'

Tite: EVP - ~ ":0
':ai NoA.iI J.JI4VE'1l HVtr"uu.E'Address:

t! AJnl~, D.. ~ JI 7 i ~, t.
Telephone: 9D~- tL" .1-:¡ilI, (offce)

(other)

Facsime: 9D'-I/'l/- :¿''20

cc: Name: etb :e t êl l' , C ".

v. Consummation of Transacton

The Potential Acquier agrees th upon notification (which may be verbal) from the Corporation
that the Potential Acquiers Bid with respect to One of the trctions contemplated herein has
been accepted, the Potential Acquirr will execute the appropriate agreement(s) and work
dilgently to consumate the trction. Such consummtion shall occur at such time and place

as the Corporation in its sole discretion determes.

The Potetial Acquirer repesets and warts tht it ha executed and delivered to the

Corporation a Confidentiality Agreement. is eligible to purchae assets and able to execute a

5
Bid Form02213J
Januar 2&, 2009,3:18 PM

Allane Bank
C\llv'!t Cìiy, CA



FEB-02-2009 16: 04 CIT I ZENS BUS I NESS BANK 9094812120 P.0?

Thi is bid number Ì-
of -- bids submitted.

Purchaser Eligibility Certfication ("Certfication") and tht all infonnation provided and
representations made by or On behalf of the Potential Acquirer in connection with ths
trction and the trsactions contemplated herby, includig, but not limited to, the

Confidentiality Agrment and its eligibility to purha assets and ability to execute a
Certfication, ar and rem tre and correct in all matenal repects and do not fail to state any
fact required to mae the inomiation contained therein not nnsleading. The Potential Acquir
agees tht if it is a successfu bidder that on notication it will execute and immediately deliver

to the FDIC a Cerfication via fax and overght deliver.

The undersigned, on behalf of the Potential Acquier, herby certfies that (i) the Potential
Acquier has full power and authority to submit th Bid and has taen all corporate action
necessa with respet theret, and (ii) the undersigned has been duty authoried to execute and

submit ths Bid on behalf of the Potential Acquire.

A Board resolution authoriing the submission of the bid and authoriing ths representative tQ

sign on behalf of the insttution or grug has be submittd with each bid form.

Printed Name of Potental Acquirer

C:t"T'''~ V3 IA , ii,) c~ S --A-1c

By: ~-:~"' yr -- -,
(signature)

Title: ê",/ P-
¡:JI

~. 311!'?llIt ~l/ I ~
~"
) 2. I' 200'

Name: Q. +c ll

Date:

6
Bid Form 022131
Januar 28. 2009, 3: 18 PM

Al1iaoeBank
Culver City, CA


