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Consumer Product Safety Commission § 1401.2

(e) Alternatives. (1) The Commission 
considered various labeling require-
ments and limitations on the mar-
keting of lawn darts that would be in-
tended to discourage the marketing of 
the product to children and the use of 
the product by children. The Commis-
sion concluded, however, that these 
types of requirements would not pre-
clude substantial use of the product by 
children and would not reduce ade-
quately the risk of injury addressed by 
this rule. 

(2) The Commission also considered 
the possibility of performance require-
ments for lawn darts to determine 
which lawn darts present an unreason-
able risk of injury of skull penetration 
to children, but such requirements 
were determined not to be feasible. 

(f) Conclusion. The Commission finds: 
(1) That this rule, including its effec-

tive date, is reasonably necessary to 
eliminate or adequately reduce the un-
reasonable risk of skull puncture 
wounds to children associated with 
lawn darts and will also eliminate or 
reduce the other injuries, including 
puncture wounds, that have been asso-
ciated with this product. 

(2) That issuance of the rule is in the 
public interest. 

(3) That no feasible consumer product 
safety standard would adequately pro-
tect the public from the unreasonable 
risk associated with lawn darts. 

(4) That the benefits expected from 
this rule bear a reasonable relationship 
to its costs. 

(5) That the rule imposes the least 
burdensome requirement which pre-
vents or adequately reduces the risk of 
injury for which the rule is being pro-
mulgated.

§ 1306.5 Effective date. 

This rule is effective December 19, 
1988 and applies to all lawn darts in the 
chain of distribution on or after that 
date.

PART 1401—SELF PRESSURIZED 
CONSUMER PRODUCTS CON-
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BONS: REQUIREMENTS TO PRO-
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DATA; REQUIREMENTS TO NOTIFY 
CONSUMERS AT POINT OF PUR-
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§ 1401.1 Scope. 
This part 1401 establishes require-

ments under section 27(e) of the Con-
sumer Product Safety Act (15 U.S.C. 
2076(e)) for marketers and importers of 
self-pressurized consumer products 
that contain chlorofluorocarbons as 
propellants to provide notification of 
certain performance and technical data 
to prospective purchasers of such prod-
ucts at the time of original purchase 
and to the first purchaser of such prod-
ucts for purposes other than resale. 
The notification shall consist of a label 
on the product stating that it contains 
a chlorofluorocarbon that may harm 
the public health and environment by 
reducing the ozone in the upper atmos-
phere. Also, manufacturers and import-
ers must provide the commission with 
reports identifying which of the self-
pressurized consumer products sold by 
them contain chlorofluorocarbon pro-
pellants.

§ 1401.2 Purpose. 
Chlorofluorocarbons are used as pro-

pellants in self-pressurized containers 
of a variety of products subject to the
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Commission’s jurisdiction. Scientific 
research has indicated that chloro-
fluorocarbons may pose a risk of deple-
tion of ozone in the stratosphere. The 
stratospheric ozone shield is of great 
importance in protecting life on earth 
from shortwave ultra-violet rays of the 
sun. Ozone depletion allows more of 
these rays to reach the earth, and the 
consequences include a possibility of a 
significant increase in human skin can-
cer and other effects of unknown mag-
nitude on man, animals, and plants. 
Chlorofluorocarbon release may also 
cause climatic change, both by reduc-
ing stratospheric ozone and by increas-
ing infrared absorption in the atmos-
phere. The Commission believes that 
the requirements of this part 1401 will 
enable consumers to make a conscious 
choice of whether to use products that 
contain chlorofluorocarbon propel-
lants. The Commission also believes 
that these requirements are necessary 
in order to carry out the purposes of 
the Consumer Product Safety Act of (a) 
helping to protect the public against 
unreasonable risks of injury associated 
with consumer products and (b) assist-
ing consumers in evaluating the com-
parative safety of consumer products.

§ 1401.3 Definitions. 
For the purposes of this part 1401: 
(a) Chlorofluorocarbon means any 

fully halogenated chlorofluoroalkane. 
(b) Finished product means a product 

which has been completely manufac-
tured, packaged, and labeled. 

(c) Initially introduced into interstate 
commerce means the first shipment of 
the product into interstate commerce 
by the firm marketing the product. 
There must be both physical movement 
in interstate commerce and passage of 
title to the product. Thus, mere ship-
ment of a product across state lines 
from a contract filler to the marketer 
of the product would not constitute 
initial introduction into interstate 
commerce. All products initially intro-
duced into interstate commerce before 
the effective date may continue to be 
distributed and sold even though they 
do not bear the warning statement. 

(d) Manufacturer means any person 
who manufactures or imports a con-
sumer product. The term includes both 
a person who manufactures the product 

at the direction of another (such as a 
contract filler of aerosol products) and 
the person at whose direction the prod-
uct is manufactured (such as the mar-
keter of the brand). 

(e) Propellent means a liquefied or 
compressed gas in a container, where a 
purpose of the liquefied or compressed 
gas is to expel material from the con-
tainer. The material to be expelled 
may be the propellant itself and/or a 
material different from the propellent. 

(f) The definitions given in section 3 
of the Consumer Product Safety Act (15 
U.S.C. 2052) shall, where applicable, 
apply to this part 1401.

§ 1401.4 [Reserved]

§ 1401.5 Providing performance and 
technical data to purchasers by la-
beling. 

(a) Manufacturers of self-pressurized 
consumer products containing a 
chlorofluorocarbon propellant shall 
provide performance and technical 
data concerning such products that 
they import or initially introduce into 
interstate commerce after February 19, 
1978, to prospective purchasers at the 
time of original purchase and to the 
first purchaser for purposes other than 
resale. The data shall consist of the fol-
lowing identification and warning 
statement: ‘‘WARNING—Contains a 
chlorofluorocarbon that may harm the 
public health and environment by re-
ducing ozone in the upper atmos-
phere.’’

(b) The identification and warning 
statement required by paragraph (a) of 
this section shall be in addition to any 
other required labeling and shall be 
sufficiently prominent and conspicuous 
as to be likely to be read and under-
stood by ordinary individuals under 
normal conditions of purchase. This 
identification and warning statement 
shall appear on the immediate con-
tainer of the product and also on any 
outside container or wrapper in which 
the product is normally offered for sale 
at retail. The identification and warn-
ing statement may appear on a firmly 
affixed tag, tape, card, or sticker or 
similar overlabeling attached to the 
package. 

[42 FR 42783, Aug. 24, 1977; 42 FR 46285, Sept. 
15, 1977]
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