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through oral or written inquiries, re-
ceiving and reviewing minutes of meet-
ings and copies of draft standards, or 
attending meetings for the purpose of 
observing and commenting during the 
standards development process in ac-
cordance with subpart B of this part. 
For example, monitoring may involve 
responding to requests from voluntary 
standards organizations, standards de-
velopment committees, trade associa-
tions and consumer organizations; by 
providing information concerning the 
risks of injury associated with par-
ticular products, NEISS data, sum-
maries and analyses of in-depth inves-
tigation reports; discussing Commis-
sion goals and objectives with regard 
to voluntary standards and improved 
consumer product safety; responding to 
requests for information concerning 
Commission programs; and initiating 
contacts with voluntary standards or-
ganizations to discuss cooperative vol-
untary standards activities. 

(2) Participating. Participating in-
volves regularly attending meetings of 
a standard development committee or 
group and taking an active part in the 
discussions of the committee and in de-
veloping the standard, in accordance 
with subpart B of this part. Under cer-
tain conditions, the Commission will 
contribute to the deliberations of the 
committee by expending resources to 
provide technical assistance (e.g., re-
search, engineering support, and infor-
mation and education programs) and 
administrative assistance (e.g., travel 
costs, hosting meetings, and secre-
tarial functions) which would support 
the development and implementation 
of voluntary standards. Participating 
may also include Commission support 
of voluntary standards activities as de-
scribed in § 1031.7. 

(d) Normally, the total amount of 
Commission support given to a vol-
untary standards activity shall be no 
greater than that of all non-Federal 
participants in that activity, except 
where it is in the public interest to do 
so. 

(e) In the event of duplication of ef-
fort by two or more groups (either in-
side or outside the Commission) in de-
veloping a voluntary standard for the 
same product or class of products, the 
Commission shall encourage the sev-

eral groups to cooperate in the develop-
ment of a single voluntary standard.

§ 1031.7 Commission support of vol-
untary standards activities. 

(a) The Commission’s support of vol-
untary safety standards development 
activities may include any one or a 
combination of the following actions: 

(1) Providing epidemiological and 
health science information and expla-
nations of hazards for consumer prod-
ucts. 

(2) Encouraging the initiation of the 
development of voluntary standards for 
specific consumer products. 

(3) Identifying specific risks of injury 
to be addressed in a voluntary stand-
ard. 

(4) Performing or subsidizing tech-
nical assistance, including research, 
health science data, and engineering 
support, in the development of a vol-
untary standard activity in which the 
Commission is participating. 

(5) Providing assistance on methods 
of disseminating information and edu-
cation about the voluntary standard or 
its use. 

(6) Performing a staff evaluation of a 
voluntary standard to determine its 
adequacy and efficacy in reducing the 
risks of injury that have been identi-
fied by the Commission as being associ-
ated with the use of the product. 

(7) Encouraging state and local gov-
ernments to reference or incorporate 
the provisions of a voluntary standard 
in their regulations or ordinances and 
to participate in government or indus-
trial model code development activi-
ties, so as to develop uniformity and 
minimize conflicting State and local 
regulations. 

(8) Monitoring the number and mar-
ket share of products conforming to a 
voluntary safety standard. 

(9) Providing for the involvement of 
agency personnel in voluntary stand-
ards activities as described in subpart 
B of this part. 

(10) Providing administrative assist-
ance, such as hosting meetings and sec-
retarial assistance. 

(11) Providing funding support for 
voluntary standards development, as 
permitted by the agency budget.
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(12) Taking other actions that the 
Commission believes appropriate in a 
particular situation. 

(b) [Reserved]

§ 1031.8 Voluntary Standards Coordi-
nator. 

(a) The Executive Director shall ap-
point a Voluntary Standards Coordi-
nator to coordinate agency participa-
tion in voluntary standards bodies so 
that: 

(1) The most effective use is made of 
agency personnel and resources, and 

(2) The views expressed by such per-
sonnel are in the public interest and, at 
a minimum, do not conflict with the 
interests and established views of the 
agency. 

(b) The Voluntary Standards Coordi-
nator is responsible for managing the 
Commission’s voluntary standards pro-
gram, as well as preparing and submit-
ting to the Commission a semiannual 
summary of its voluntary standards ac-
tivities. The summary shall set forth, 
among other things, the goals of each 
voluntary standard under development, 
the extent of CPSC activity (moni-
toring or participation; the current 
status of standards development and 
implementation) and, if any, rec-
ommendations for additional Commis-
sion action. The Voluntary Standards 
Coordinator shall also compile infor-
mation on the Commission’s voluntary 
standards activities for the Commis-
sion’s annual report.

Subpart B—Employee 
Involvement

§ 1031.9 Purpose and scope. 
(a) This subpart sets forth the Con-

sumer Product Safety Commission’s 
criteria and requirements governing 
membership and involvement by Com-
mission officials and employees in the 
activities of voluntary standards devel-
opment bodies. 

(b) The Commission realizes there 
are advantages and benefits afforded by 
greater involvement of Commission 
personnel in the standards activities of 
domestic and international voluntary 
standards organizations. However, such 
involvement might present an appear-
ance or possibility of the Commission 
giving preferential treatment to an or-

ganization or group or of the Commis-
sion losing its independence or impar-
tiality. Also, such participation may 
present real or apparent conflict of in-
terest situations. 

(c) The purpose of this subpart is to 
further the objectives and programs of 
the Commission and to do so in a man-
ner that ensures that such membership 
and participation: 

(1) Is consistent with the intent of 
the Consumer Product Safety Act and 
the other acts administered by the 
Commission, as well as with federal 
policy as set forth in the current 
version of OMB Circular No. A–119, 
Federal Participation in the Develop-
ment and Use of Voluntary Standards; 

(2) Is not contrary to the public in-
terest; 

(3) Presents no real or apparent con-
flict of interest, and does not result in 
or create the appearance of the Com-
mission giving preferential treatment 
to an organization or group or the 
Commission compromising its inde-
pendence or impartiality; and 

(4) Takes into account Commission 
resources and priorities. 

(d) In general, Commission employ-
ees must obtain approval from their su-
pervisor and appropriate agency man-
agement to be involved in voluntary 
standards activities. They should also 
strive to apprise the Voluntary Stand-
ards Coordinator, where practicable, as 
to their involvement in voluntary 
standards activities. 

(e) All Commission employees in-
volved in voluntary standards activi-
ties are subject to any restrictions for 
avoiding conflicts of interest and for 
avoiding situations that would present 
an appearance of bias.

§ 1031.10 Definitions. 

For purposes of describing the level 
of involvement in voluntary standards 
activities for which Commission em-
ployees may be authorized, the fol-
lowing definitions apply: 

(a) Membership. Membership is the 
status of an employee who joins a vol-
untary standards development or advi-
sory organization or subgroup and is 
listed as a member. It includes all oral 
and written communications which are 
incidental to such membership.
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