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(b) Section 5(a)(3) provides that the 
Commission shall, following publica-
tion of an advance notice of proposed 
rulemaking or a notice of proposed 
rulemaking for a product safety rule 
under any rulemaking authority ad-
ministered by the Commission, assist 
public and private organizations or 
groups of manufacturers, administra-
tively and technically, in the develop-
ment of safety standards addressing 
the risk of injury identified in such no-
tice. (15 U.S.C. 2054(a)(3)). 

(c) Section 5(a)(4) provides that the 
Commission shall, to the extent prac-
ticable and appropriate (taking into 
account the resources and priorities of 
the Commission), assist public and pri-
vate organizations or groups of manu-
facturers, administratively and tech-
nically, in the development of product 
safety standards and test methods. (15 
U.S.C. 2054(a)(4)).

§ 1031.4 Effect of voluntary standards 
activities on Commission activities. 

(a)(1) The Commission, in deter-
mining whether to begin proceedings to 
develop mandatory standards under the 
acts it administers, considers whether 
mandatory regulation is necessary or 
whether there is an existing voluntary 
standard that adequately addresses the 
problem and the extent to which that 
voluntary standard is complied with by 
the affected industry. 

(2) The Commission acknowledges 
that there are situations in which ade-
quate voluntary standards, in combina-
tion with appropriate certification pro-
grams, may be appropriate to support a 
conclusion that a mandatory standard 
is not necessary. The Commission may 
find that a mandatory standard is not 
necessary where compliance with an 
existing voluntary standard would 
eliminate or adequately reduce the 
risk of injury associated with the prod-
uct, contains requirements and test 
methods that have been evaluated and 
found acceptable by the Commission, 
and it is likely that there will be sub-
stantial and timely compliance with 
the voluntary standard. Under such 
circumstances, the Commission may 
agree to encourage industry compli-
ance with the voluntary standard and 
subsequently evaluate the effectiveness 
of the standard in terms of accident 

and injury reduction for products pro-
duced in compliance with the standard. 

(3) In evaluating voluntary stand-
ards, the Commission will relate the 
requirements of the standard to the 
identified risks of injury and evaluate 
the requirements in terms of their ef-
fectiveness in eliminating or reducing 
the risks of injury. The evaluation of 
voluntary standards will be conducted 
by Commission staff members, includ-
ing representatives of legal, economics, 
engineering, epidemiological, health 
sciences, human factors, other appro-
priate interests, and the Voluntary 
Standards Coordinator. The staff eval-
uation will be conducted in a manner 
similar to evaluations of standards 
being considered for promulgation as 
mandatory standards. 

(4) In the event that the Commission 
has evaluated an existing voluntary 
standard and found it to be adequate in 
all but a few areas, the Commission 
may defer the initiation of a manda-
tory rulemaking proceeding and re-
quest the voluntary standards organi-
zation to revise the standard to address 
the identified inadequacies expedi-
tiously. In such cases, the Commission 
may monitor or participate in the de-
velopment of these revisions. 

(b) In the event the Commission de-
termines that there is no existing vol-
untary standard that will eliminate or 
adequately reduce a risk of injury the 
Commission may commence a pro-
ceeding for the development of a con-
sumer product safety rule or a regula-
tion in accordance with section 9 of the 
Consumer Product Safety Act, 15 
U.S.C. 2058, section 3(f) of the Federal 
Hazardous Substances Act, 15 U.S.C. 
1262(f), or section 4(a) of the Flam-
mable Fabrics Act, 15 U.S.C. 1193(g), as 
may be applicable. In commencing 
such a proceeding, the Commission will 
publish an advance notice of proposed 
rulemaking which shall, among other 
things, invite any person to submit to 
the Commission an existing standard 
or portion of an existing standard, or 
to submit a statement of intention to 
modify or develop, within a reasonable 
period of time, a voluntary standard to 
address the risk of injury. 

(c) The Commission will consider 
those provisions of a voluntary stand-
ard that have been reviewed, evaluated,
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and deemed to be adequate in address-
ing the specified risks of injury when 
initiating a mandatory consumer prod-
uct safety rule or regulation under the 
Consumer Product Safety Act, the Fed-
eral Hazardous Substances Act, or the 
Flammable Fabrics Act, as may be ap-
plicable. Comments will be requested 
in the advance notice of proposed rule-
making on the adequacy of such vol-
untary standard provisions.

§ 1031.5 Criteria for Commission par-
ticipation in voluntary standards 
activities. 

The Commission will consider the ex-
tent to which the following criteria are 
met in considering Commission partici-
pation in the development of voluntary 
safety standards for consumer prod-
ucts: 

(a) The likelihood the voluntary 
standard will eliminate or adequately 
reduce the risk of injury addressed and 
that there will be substantial and time-
ly compliance with the voluntary 
standard. 

(b) The likelihood that the voluntary 
standard will be developed within a 
reasonable period of time. 

(c) Exclusion, to the maximum ex-
tent possible, from the voluntary 
standard being developed, of require-
ments which will create anticompeti-
tive effects or promote restraint of 
trade. 

(d) Provisions for periodic and timely 
review of the standard, including re-
view for anticompetitive effects, and 
revision or amendment as the need 
arises. 

(e) Performance-oriented and not de-
sign-restrictive requirements, to the 
maximum practical extent, in any 
standard developed. 

(f) Industry arrangements for achiev-
ing substantial and timely industry 
compliance with the voluntary stand-
ard once it is issued, and the means of 
ascertaining such compliance based on 
overall market share of product pro-
duction. 

(g) Provisions in the standard for 
marking products conforming to the 
standard so that future Commission in-
vestigation can indicate the involve-
ment of such products in accidents and 
patterns of injury. 

(h) Provisions for insuring that prod-
ucts identified as conforming to such 
standards will be subjected to a testing 
and certification (including self-certifi-
cation) procedure, which will provide 
assurance that the products comply 
with the standard. 

(i) The openness to all interested par-
ties, and the establishment of proce-
dures which will provide for meaning-
ful participation in the development of 
such standards by representatives of 
producers, suppliers, distributors, re-
tailers, consumers, small business, pub-
lic interests and other individuals hav-
ing knowledge or expertise in the areas 
under consideration, and procedures for 
affording other due process consider-
ations.

§ 1031.6 Extent and form of Commis-
sion involvement in the develop-
ment of voluntary standards. 

(a) The Commission shall approve 
agency ‘‘participation’’, as defined 
below, in the development and support 
of voluntary safety standards for con-
sumer products. The Executive Direc-
tor shall approve Commission activi-
ties that are defined below as ‘‘moni-
toring.’’ The extent of Commission in-
volvement will be dependent upon the 
Commission’s interest in the particular 
standards development activity and 
the commission’s priorities and re-
sources. 

(b) The Commission’s interest in a 
specific voluntary standards activity 
will be based in part on the frequency 
and severity of injuries associated with 
the product, the involvement of the 
product in accidents, the susceptibility 
of the hazard to correction through 
standards, and the overall resources 
and priorities of the Commission. Com-
mission involvement in voluntary 
standards activities generally will also 
be guided by the Commission’s oper-
ating plan and budget. 

(c) There are two levels of Commis-
sion involvement in voluntary stand-
ards activities, each of which reflects a 
different level of Commission involve-
ment as set forth below: 

(1) Monitoring. Monitoring involves 
maintaining an awareness of the vol-
untary standards development process
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