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(10) Employees shall not engage in 
outside employment or activities, in-
cluding seeking or negotiating for em-
ployment, that conflict with official 
Government duties and responsibil-
ities. 

(11) Employees shall disclose waste, 
fraud, abuse, and corruption to appro-
priate authorities. 

(12) Employees shall satisfy in good 
faith their obligations as citizens, in-
cluding all just financial obligations, 
especially those—such as Federal, 
State, or local taxes—that are imposed 
by law. 

(13) Employees shall adhere to all 
laws and regulations that provide equal 
opportunity for all Americans regard-
less of race, color, religion, sex, na-
tional origin, age, or handicap. 

(14) Employees shall endeavor to 
avoid any actions creating the appear-
ance that they are violating the law or 
the ethical standards set forth in this 
part. Whether particular circumstances 
create an appearance that the law or 
these standards have been violated 
shall be determined from the perspec-
tive of a reasonable person with knowl-
edge of the relevant facts. 

(c) Related statutes. In addition to the 
standards of ethical conduct set forth 
in this part, there are conflict of inter-
est statutes that prohibit certain con-
duct. Criminal conflict of interest stat-
utes of general applicability to all em-
ployees, 18 U.S.C. 201, 203, 205, 208, and 
209, are summarized in the appropriate 
subparts of this part and must be taken 
into consideration in determining 
whether conduct is proper. Citations to 
other generally applicable statutes re-
lating to employee conduct are set 
forth in subpart I and employees are 
further cautioned that there may be 
additional statutory and regulatory re-
strictions applicable to them generally 
or as employees of their specific agen-
cies. Because an employee is consid-
ered to be on notice of the require-
ments of any statute, an employee 
should not rely upon any description or 
synopsis of a statutory restriction, but 
should refer to the statute itself and 
obtain the advice of an agency ethics 
official as needed. 

§ 2635.102 Definitions. 

The definitions listed below are used 
throughout this part. Additional defi-
nitions appear in the subparts or sec-
tions of subparts to which they apply. 
For purposes of this part: 

(a) Agency means an executive agen-
cy as defined in 5 U.S.C. 105 and the 
Postal Service and the Postal Rate 
Commission. It does not include the 
General Accounting Office or the Gov-
ernment of the District of Columbia. 

(b) Agency designee refers to any em-
ployee who, by agency regulation, in-
struction, or other issuance, has been 
delegated authority to make any deter-
mination, give any approval, or take 
any other action required or permitted 
by this part with respect to another 
employee. An agency may delegate 
these authorities to any number of 
agency designees necessary to ensure 
that determinations are made, approv-
als are given, and other actions are 
taken in a timely and responsible man-
ner. Any provision that requires a de-
termination, approval, or other action 
by the agency designee shall, where the 
conduct in issue is that of the agency 
head, be deemed to require that such 
determination, approval or action be 
made or taken by the agency head in 
consultation with the designated agen-
cy ethics official. 

(c) Agency ethics official refers to the 
designated agency ethics official or to 
the alternate designated agency ethics 
official, referred to in § 2638.202(b) of 
this chapter, and to any deputy ethics 
official, described in § 2638.204 of this 
chapter, who has been delegated au-
thority to assist in carrying out the re-
sponsibilities of the designated agency 
ethics official. 

(d) Agency programs or operations re-
fers to any program or function carried 
out or performed by an agency, wheth-
er pursuant to statute, Executive 
order, or regulation. 

(e) Corrective action includes any ac-
tion necessary to remedy a past viola-
tion or prevent a continuing violation 
of this part, including but not limited 
to restitution, change of assignment, 
disqualification, divestiture, termi-
nation of an activity, waiver, the cre-
ation of a qualified diversified or blind 
trust, or counseling. 
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(f) Designated agency ethics official re-
fers to the official designated under 
§ 2638.201 of this chapter. 

(g) Disciplinary action includes those 
disciplinary actions referred to in Of-
fice of Personnel Management regula-
tions and instructions implementing 
provisions of title 5 of the United 
States Code or provided for in com-
parable provisions applicable to em-
ployees not subject to title 5, including 
but not limited to reprimand, suspen-
sion, demotion, and removal. In the 
case of a military officer, comparable 
provisions may include those in the 
Uniform Code of Military Justice. 

(h) Employee means any officer or em-
ployee of an agency, including a special 
Government employee. It includes offi-
cers but not enlisted members of the 
uniformed services. For purposes other 
than subparts B and C of this part, it 
does not include the President or Vice 
President. Status as an employee is un-
affected by pay or leave status or, in 
the case of a special Government em-
ployee, by the fact that the individual 
does not perform official duties on a 
given day. 

(i) Head of an agency means, in the 
case of an agency headed by more than 
one person, the chair or comparable 
member of such agency. 

(j) He, his, and him include she, hers 
and her. 

(k) Person means an individual, cor-
poration and subsidiaries it controls, 
company, association, firm, partner-
ship, society, joint stock company, or 
any other organization or institution, 
including any officer, employee, or 
agent of such person or entity. For pur-
poses of this part, a corporation will be 
deemed to control a subsidiary if it 
owns 50 percent or more of the subsidi-
ary’s voting securities. The term is all- 
inclusive and applies to commercial 
ventures and nonprofit organizations 
as well as to foreign, State, and local 
governments, including the Govern-
ment of the District of Columbia. It 
does not include any agency or other 
entity of the Federal Government or 
any officer or employee thereof when 
acting in his official capacity on behalf 
of that agency or entity. 

(l) Special Government employee means 
those executive branch officers or em-
ployees specified in 18 U.S.C. 202(a). A 

special Government employee is re-
tained, designated, appointed, or em-
ployed to perform temporary duties ei-
ther on a full-time or intermittent 
basis, with or without compensation, 
for a period not to exceed 130 days dur-
ing any consecutive 365-day period. 

(m) Supplemental agency regulation 
means a regulation issued pursuant to 
§ 2635.105. 

§ 2635.103 Applicability to members of 
the uniformed services. 

The provisions of this part, except 
this section, are not applicable to en-
listed members of the uniformed serv-
ices. Each agency with jurisdiction 
over enlisted members of the uni-
formed services shall issue regulations 
defining the ethical conduct obliga-
tions of enlisted members under its ju-
risdiction. Those regulations shall be 
consistent with Executive Order 12674, 
April 12, 1989, as modified, and may 
prescribe the full range of statutory 
and regulatory sanctions, including 
those available under the Uniform Code 
of Military Justice, for failure to com-
ply with such regulations. 

§ 2635.104 Applicability to employees 
on detail. 

(a) Details to other agencies. Except as 
provided in paragraph (d) of this sec-
tion, an employee on detail, including 
a uniformed officer on assignment, 
from his employing agency to another 
agency for a period in excess of 30 cal-
endar days shall be subject to any sup-
plemental agency regulations of the 
agency to which he is detailed rather 
than to any supplemental agency regu-
lations of his employing agency. 

(b) Details to the legislative or judicial 
branch. An employee on detail, includ-
ing a uniformed officer on assignment, 
from his employing agency to the leg-
islative or judicial branch for a period 
in excess of 30 calendar days shall be 
subject to the ethical standards of the 
branch or entity to which detailed. For 
the duration of any such detail or as-
signment, the employee shall not be 
subject to the provisions of this part, 
except this section, or, except as pro-
vided in paragraph (d) of this section, 
to any supplemental agency regula-
tions of his employing agency, but 
shall remain subject to the conflict of 
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