
248 

39 CFR Ch. I (7–1–06 Edition) § 913.4 

final order entered under this section 
by any court may be punished as con-
tempt. 

§ 913.4 Disclosure. 
Any documentary material provided 

pursuant to any subpoena issued under 
this section shall be exempt from dis-
closure under section 552 of title 5, 
United States Code. 

PART 916 [RESERVED] 

Rules of Procedure Before the Mail 
Processing Department 

PART 927—RULES OF PROCEDURE 
RELATING TO FINES, DEDUC-
TIONS, AND DAMAGES 

Sec 
927.1 Noncontractual carriage of inter-

national mail by vessel. 
927.2 Noncontractual air service for inter-

national and military mail. 
927.3 Other remedies. 

AUTHORITY: 39 U.S.C. 401, 2601 Chap. 56 Sec-
tion 5604; 49 U.S.C. 1357, 1471. 

SOURCE: 67 FR 50353, Aug. 2, 2002, unless 
otherwise noted. 

§ 927.1 Noncontractual carriage of 
international mail by vessel. 

(a) Report of infraction. Where evi-
dence is found or reported that a car-
rier of mail by vessel which has trans-
ported mail pursuant to the provisions 
of Chapter 4, USPS Purchasing Man-
ual, has unreasonably or unnecessarily 
delayed the mails, or committed other 
delinquencies in the transportation of 
mail, has failed to carry the mail in a 
safe and secure manner, or has caused 
loss or damage to the mail, the facts 
will be reported to International Net-
work Operations, Headquarters. 

(b) Review, investigation, recommenda-
tion. International Network Operations 
will investigate the matter, record 
findings of fact, make a recommenda-
tion concerning the need for imposition 
of fine or penalty with reasons for the 
recommendation, and will advise the 
carrier of the recommendation. 

(c) Penalty action. International Net-
work Operations, upon review of the 
record, may impose a fine or penalty 
against a carrier for any irregularity 

properly documented, whether or not 
penalty action has been recommended. 
A tentative decision of International 
Network Operations to take penalty 
action will be set forth in detail the 
facts and reasons upon which the deter-
mination is based. International Net-
work Operations will send the ten-
tative decision, including notice of the 
irregularities found and the amount of 
fine or penalty proposed, to the carrier. 
The carrier may present a written de-
fense to the proposed action within 21 
days after receipt of the tentative deci-
sion. International Network Operations 
will advise the carrier of the final deci-
sion. 

(d) Appeal. If the final decision in-
cludes a penalty International Network 
Operations will advise the carrier that 
it may, within 30 days, appeal the ac-
tion in writing to the Vice President, 
Network Operations Management, U.S. 
Postal Service Headquarters and that 
its written appeal should include all 
facts and arguments upon which the 
carrier relies in support of the appeal. 
If an appeal is not received, Inter-
national Network Operations will close 
the record. When an appeal is taken, 
the Vice President, Network Oper-
ations Management will review the 
complete record the decide the appeal. 
He will advise the carrier of the deci-
sion in writing and will take actions 
consistent with that decision. The Vice 
President, Network Operations Man-
agement, may sustain, rescind, or com-
promise a fine or penalty. The decision 
of the Vice President, Network Oper-
ations Management on appeal shall be 
the final decision of the Postal Service. 
The Postal Service may, in its discre-
tion, deduct from payment otherwise 
due the carrier an amount necessary to 
satisfy the penalty action taken under 
this section. 

(e) Details of administration. For fur-
ther administrative details, see USPS 
Purchasing Manual, chapter 4. 

§ 927.2 Noncontractual air service for 
international and military mail. 

(a) Report of infraction. Each mail 
handling irregularity will be reported 
in the prescribed format by the cog-
nizant postal official or designated rep-
resentative. As soon as possible the re-
porting authority will ask the local 
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