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the respondent or respondent’s agent 
and forwarded to the Recorder, to be-
come a part of the official record. 

(b) If, after 5 days, the postmaster or 
the postmaster’s designee, can find no 
person to accept service of the notice 
of hearing and petition pursuant to 
paragraph (a) of this section, the notice 
and copy of the petition may be deliv-
ered in the usual manner as other mail 
addressed to the respondent. A state-
ment, showing the time and place of 
delivery, signed by the postal employee 
who delivered the notice of hearing and 
petition shall be forwarded to the Re-
corder and such statement shall con-
stitute evidence of service. 

[39 FR 33213, Sept. 16, 1974, as amended at 63 
FR 66052, Dec. 1, 1998] 

§ 959.9 Filing documents for the 
record. 

(a) Each party shall file with the Re-
corder pleadings, motions, orders and 
other documents for the record. The 
Recorder shall cause copies to be deliv-
ered promptly to other party(ies) to 
the proceeding and to the presiding of-
ficer. 

(b) The parties shall submit three 
copies of all documents unless other-
wise ordered by the presiding officer. 
One copy shall be signed as the origi-
nal. 

(c) Documents shall be dated and 
state the title of the proceeding and, 
except initial petitions, the docket 
number. Any pleading or other docu-
ment required by order of the presiding 
officer to be filed by a specified date, 
shall be delivered to the Recorder on or 
before such date. The date of filing 
shall be entered thereon by the Re-
corder. 

[39 FR 33213, Sept. 16, 1974, as amended at 63 
FR 66052, Dec. 1, 1998] 

§ 959.10 Default. 
(a) If the respondent fails to file an 

answer within the time specified in the 
notice of hearing, the respondent shall 
be deemed in default and to have 
waived hearing and further procedural 
steps. The Judicial Officer shall there-
after issue an order without further no-
tice to the respondent. 

(b) If the respondent files an answer 
but fails to appear at the hearing, the 

presiding officer shall receive peti-
tioner’s evidence and render an initial 
decision. 

[39 FR 33213, Sept. 16, 1974, as amended at 63 
FR 66052, Dec. 1, 1998] 

§ 959.11 Amendment of pleadings. 

(a) Amendments proposed prior to 
the hearing shall be filed with the Re-
corder. Amendments proposed there-
after shall be filed with the presiding 
officer. 

(b) By consent of the parties, a plead-
ing may be amended at any time. Also, 
a party may move to amend a pleading 
at any time prior to the close of the 
hearing and, provided that the amend-
ment is reasonably within the scope of 
the proceeding initiated by the peti-
tion, the presiding officer shall make 
such ruling on the motion as he or she 
deems fair and equitable to the parties. 

(c) When issues not raised by the 
pleadings, but reasonably within the 
scope of the proceedings initiated by 
the petition, are tried by express or im-
plied consent of the parties, they shall 
be treated in all respects as if they had 
been raised in the pleadings. Such 
amendments as may be necessary to 
make the pleadings conform to the evi-
dence, and to raise such issues, shall be 
allowed at any time upon the motion of 
any party. 

(d) If a party objects to the introduc-
tion of evidence at the hearing on the 
ground that it is not within the issues 
made by the pleadings, but fails to sat-
isfy the presiding officer that an 
amendment of the pleadings would 
prejudice the objecting party on the 
merits, the presiding officer may allow 
the amendment and may grant a con-
tinuance to enable the objecting party 
to rebut the evidence presented. 

(e) The presiding officer may, upon 
reasonable notice and upon such terms 
as are just, permit service of supple-
mental pleadings setting forth trans-
actions, occurrences, or events which 
have happened since the date of the 
pleading sought to be supplemented 
and which are relevant to any of the 
issues involved. 

[39 FR 33213, Sept. 16, 1974, as amended at 63 
FR 66052, Dec. 1, 1998] 
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