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between a hearing before an adminis-
trative judge and an immediate final 
decision. 

(c) Dismissal. (1) An agency may dis-
miss a mixed case complaint for the 
reasons contained in, and under the 
conditions prescribed in, § 1614.107. 

(2) An agency decision to dismiss a 
mixed case complaint on the basis of 
the complainant’s prior election of the 
MSPB procedures shall be made as fol-
lows: 

(i) Where neither the agency nor the 
MSPB administrative judge questions 
the MSPB’s jurisdiction over the ap-
peal on the same matter, it shall dis-
miss the mixed case complaint pursu-
ant to § 1614.107(d) and shall advise the 
complainant that he or she must bring 
the allegations of discrimination con-
tained in the rejected complaint to the 
attention of the MSPB, pursuant to 5 
CFR 1201.155. The dismissal of such a 
complaint shall advise the complainant 
of the right to petition the EEOC to re-
view the MSPB’s final decision on the 
discrimination issue. A dismissal of a 
mixed case complaint is not appealable 
to the Commission except where it is 
alleged that § 1614.107(d) has been ap-
plied to a non-mixed case matter. 

(ii) Where the agency or the MSPB 
administrative judge questions the 
MSPB’s jurisdiction over the appeal on 
the same matter, the agency shall hold 
the mixed case complaint in abeyance 
until the MSPB’s administrative judge 
rules on the jurisdictional issue, notify 
the complainant that it is doing so, 
and instruct him or her to bring the al-
legation of discrimination to the atten-
tion of the MSPB. During this period of 
time, all time limitations for proc-
essing or filing under this part will be 
tolled. An agency decision to hold a 
mixed case complaint in abeyance is 
not appealable to EEOC. If the MSPB’s 
administrative judge finds that MSPB 
has jurisdiction over the matter, the 
agency shall dismiss the mixed case 
complaint pursuant to § 1614.107(d), and 
advise the complainant of the right to 
petition the EEOC to review the 
MSPB’s final decision on the discrimi-
nation issue. If the MSPB’s administra-
tive judge finds that MSPB does not 
have jurisdiction over the matter, the 
agency shall recommence processing of 

the mixed case complaint as a non- 
mixed case EEO complaint. 

(d) Procedures for agency processing of 
mixed case complaints. When a complain-
ant elects to proceed initially under 
this part rather than with the MSPB, 
the procedures set forth in subpart A 
shall govern the processing of the 
mixed case complaint with the fol-
lowing exceptions: 

(1) At the time the agency advises a 
complainant of the acceptance of a 
mixed case complaint, it shall also ad-
vise the complainant that: 

(i) If a final decision is not issued 
within 120 days of the date of filing of 
the mixed case complaint, the com-
plainant may appeal the matter to the 
MSPB at any time thereafter as speci-
fied at 5 CFR 1201.154(b)(2) or may file 
a civil action as specified at 
§ 1614.310(g), but not both; and 

(ii) If the complainant is dissatisfied 
with the agency’s final decision on the 
mixed case complaint, the complainant 
may appeal the matter to the MSPB 
(not EEOC) within 30 days of receipt of 
the agency’s final decision; 

(2) Upon completion of the investiga-
tion, the notice provided the complain-
ant in accordance with § 1614.108(f) will 
advise the complainant that a final de-
cision will be issued within 45 days 
without a hearing; and 

(3) At the time that the agency issues 
its final decision on a mixed case com-
plaint, the agency shall advise the 
complainant of the right to appeal the 
matter to the MSPB (not EEOC) within 
30 days of receipt and of the right to 
file a civil action as provided at 
§ 1614.310(a). 

[57 FR 12646, Apr. 10, 1992, as amended at 61 
FR 17576, Apr. 22, 1996; 64 FR 37659, July 12, 
1999] 

§ 1614.303 Petitions to the EEOC from 
MSPB decisions on mixed case ap-
peals and complaints. 

(a) Who may file. Individuals who 
have received a final decision from the 
MSPB on a mixed case appeal or on the 
appeal of a final decision on a mixed 
case complaint under 5 CFR part 1201, 
subpart E and 5 U.S.C. 7702 may peti-
tion EEOC to consider that decision. 
The EEOC will not accept appeals from 
MSPB dismissals without prejudice. 
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(b) Method of filing. Filing shall be 
made by certified mail, return receipt 
requested, to the Office of Federal Op-
erations, Equal Employment Oppor-
tunity Commission, P.O. Box 19848, 
Washington, DC 20036. 

(c) Time to file. A petition must be 
filed with the Commission either with-
in 30 days of receipt of the final deci-
sion of the MSPB or within 30 days of 
when the decision of a MSPB field of-
fice becomes final. 

(d) Service. The petition for review 
must be served upon all individuals and 
parties on the MSPB’s service list by 
certified mail on or before the filing 
with the Commission, and the Clerk of 
the MSPB, 1120 Vermont Ave., NW., 
Washington, DC 20419, and the peti-
tioner must certify as to the date and 
method of service. 

§ 1614.304 Contents of petition. 
(a) Form. Petitions must be written 

or typed, but may use any format in-
cluding a simple letter format. Peti-
tioners are encouraged to use EEOC 
Form 573, Notice Of Appeal/Petition. 

(b) Contents. Petitions must contain 
the following: 

(1) The name and address of the peti-
tioner; 

(2) The name and address of the peti-
tioner’s representative, if any; 

(3) A statement of the reasons why 
the decision of the MSPB is alleged to 
be incorrect, in whole or in part, only 
with regard to issues of discrimination 
based on race, color, religion, sex, na-
tional origin, age or handicap; 

(4) A copy of the decision issued by 
the MSPB; and 

(5) The signature of the petitioner or 
representative, if any. 

§ 1614.305 Consideration procedures. 
(a) Once a petition is filed, the Com-

mission will examine it and determine 
whether the Commission will consider 
the decision of the MSPB. An agency 
may oppose the petition, either on the 
basis that the Commission should not 
consider the MSPB’s decision or that 
the Commission should concur in the 
MSPB’s decision, by filing any such ar-
gument with the Office of Federal Op-
erations and serving a copy on the peti-
tioner within 15 days of receipt by the 
Commission. 

(b) The Commission shall determine 
whether to consider the decision of the 
MSPB within 30 days of receipt of the 
petition by the Commission’s Office of 
Federal Operations. A determination of 
the Commission not to consider the de-
cision shall not be used as evidence 
with respect to any issue of discrimina-
tion in any judicial proceeding con-
cerning that issue. 

(c) If the Commission makes a deter-
mination to consider the decision, the 
Commission shall within 60 days of the 
date of its determination, consider the 
entire record of the proceedings of the 
MSPB and on the basis of the evi-
dentiary record before the Board as 
supplemented in accordance with para-
graph (d) of this section, either: 

(1) Concur in the decision of the 
MSPB; or 

(2) Issue in writing a decision that 
differs from the decision of the MSPB 
to the extent that the Commission 
finds that, as a matter of law: 

(i) The decision of the MSPB con-
stitutes an incorrect interpretation of 
any provision of any law, rule, regula-
tion, or policy directive referred to in 5 
U.S.C. 7702(a)(1)(B); or 

(ii) The decision involving such pro-
vision is not supported by the evidence 
in the record as a whole. 

(d) In considering any decision of the 
MSPB, the Commission, pursuant to 5 
U.S.C. 7702(b)(4), may refer the case to 
the MSPB for the taking of additional 
evidence within such period as permits 
the Commission to make a decision 
within the 60-day period prescribed or 
provide on its own for the taking of ad-
ditional evidence to the extent the 
Commission considers it necessary to 
supplement the record. 

(e) Where the EEOC has differed with 
the decision of the MSPB under 
§ 1614.305(c)(2), the Commission shall 
refer the matter to the MSPB. 

§ 1614.306 Referral of case to Special 
Panel. 

If the MSPB reaffirms its decision 
under 5 CFR 1201.162(a)(2) with or with-
out modification, the matter shall be 
immediately certified to the Special 
Panel established pursuant to 5 U.S.C. 
7702(d). Upon certification, the Board 
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