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a proposal is made to exchange Na-
tional Forest System lands, which pro-
posal shall be filed in compliance with 
36 CFR part 254, the authorized officer 
may request that the appropriate BLM 
State Office segregate such lands by a 
notation on the public land records. 

[46 FR 1638, Jan. 6, 1981, as amended at 63 FR 
23681, Apr. 30, 1998; 65 FR 70112, Nov. 21, 2000]

§ 2201.1–3 Assumption of costs. 
(a) Generally, parties to an exchange 

will bear their own costs of the ex-
change. However, if the authorized offi-
cer finds it is in the public interest, 
subject to the conditions and limita-
tions specified in paragraphs (b) and (c) 
of this section, an agreement to ini-
tiate an exchange may provide that: 

(1) One or more of the parties may as-
sume, without compensation, all or 
part of the costs or other responsibil-
ities or requirements that the author-
ized officer determines would ordi-
narily be borne by the other parties; or 

(2) The parties may agree to make 
adjustments to the relative values in-
volved in an exchange transaction in 
order to compensate parties for assum-
ing costs or other responsibilities or re-
quirements that the authorized officer 
determines would ordinarily be borne 
by the other parties. These costs or 
services may include but are not lim-
ited to: Land surveys, appraisals, min-
eral examinations, timber cruises, title 
searches, title curative actions, cul-
tural resource surveys and mitigation, 
hazardous substance surveys and con-
trols, removal of encumbrances, arbi-
tration including all fees, bargaining, 
cure of deficiencies preventing highest 
and best use of the land, conduct of 
public hearings, assemblage of non-
Federal parcels from multiple owner-
ships, expenses of complying with laws, 
regulations, and policies applicable to 
exchange transactions, and expenses 
that are necessary to bring the Federal 
and non-Federal lands involved in the 
exchange to their highest and best use 
for appraisal and exchange purposes. 

(b) The authorized officer may agree 
to assume without compensation costs 
ordinarily borne under local custom or 
practice by the non-Federal party or to 
compensate the non-Federal party for 
costs ordinarily borne under local cus-
tom or practice by the United States 

but incurred by the non-Federal party, 
but only when it is clearly in the pub-
lic interest and the authorized officer 
determines and documents that each of 
the following circumstances exist: 

(1) The amount of the cost assumed 
or compensation is reasonable and ac-
curately reflects the value of the goods 
and services received; 

(2) The proposed exchange is a high 
priority of the agency; 

(3) The land exchange must be expe-
dited to protect important Federal re-
source values, such as congressionally 
designated areas or endangered species 
habitat; 

(4) Cash equalization funds are avail-
able for compensating the non-Federal 
party; and 

(5) There are no other practicable 
means available to the authorized offi-
cer of meeting Federal exchange proc-
essing costs, responsibilities, or re-
quirements. 

(c) The total amount of adjustment 
agreed to as compensation for costs in-
curred pursuant to this section shall 
not exceed the limitations set forth in 
§ 2201.6 of this part.

§ 2201.2 Notice of exchange proposal. 
(a) Upon entering into an agreement 

to initiate an exchange, the authorized 
officer shall publish a notice once a 
week for 4 consecutive weeks in news-
papers of general circulation in the 
counties in which the Federal and non-
Federal lands or interests proposed for 
exchange are located. The authorized 
officer shall notify authorized users, 
jurisdictional State and local govern-
ments, and the congressional delega-
tion, and shall make other distribution 
of the notice as appropriate. At a min-
imum, the notice shall include: 

(1) The identity of the parties in-
volved in the proposed exchange; 

(2) A description of the Federal and 
non-Federal lands being considered for 
exchange; 

(3) A statement as to the effect of 
segregation from appropriation under 
the public land laws and mineral laws, 
if applicable; 

(4) An invitation to the public to sub-
mit in writing any comments on or 
concerns about the exchange proposal, 
including advising the authorized offi-
cer as to any liens, encumbrances, or
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other claims relating to the lands 
being considered for exchange; and 

(5) The deadline by which comments 
must be received, and the name, title, 
and address of the official to whom 
comments must be sent. 

(b) To be assured of consideration in 
the environmental analysis of the pro-
posed exchange, all comments shall be 
made in writing to the authorized offi-
cer and postmarked or delivered within 
45 days after the initial date of publica-
tion. 

(c) The authorized officer is not re-
quired to republish descriptions of any 
lands excluded from the final exchange 
transaction, provided such lands were 
identified in the notice of exchange 
proposal. In addition, minor correc-
tions of land descriptions and other in-
significant changes do not require re-
publication.

§ 2201.3 Appraisals. 
The Federal and non-Federal parties 

to an exchange shall comply with the 
appraisal standards set forth in 
§§ 2201.3–1 through 2201.3–4 of this part 
and, to the extent appropriate, with 
the Department of Justice ‘‘Uniform 
Appraisal Standards for Federal Land 
Acquisitions’’ when appraising the val-
ues of the Federal and non-Federal 
lands involved in an exchange.

§ 2201.3–1 Appraiser qualifications. 
(a) A qualified appraiser(s) shall pro-

vide to the authorized officer apprais-
als estimating the market value of 
Federal and non-Federal properties in-
volved in an exchange. A qualified ap-
praiser may be an employee or a con-
tractor to the Federal or non-Federal 
exchange parties. At a minimum, a 
qualified appraiser shall be an indi-
vidual, approved by the authorized offi-
cer, who is competent, reputable, im-
partial, and has training and experi-
ence in appraising property similar to 
the property involved in the appraisal 
assignment. 

(b) Qualified appraisers shall possess 
qualifications consistent with State 
regulatory requirements that meet the 
intent of title XI of the Financial Insti-
tutions Reform, Recovery and Enforce-
ment Act of 1989 (FIRREA) (12 U.S.C. 
3331). In the event a State does not 
have approved policies, practices and 

procedures regulating the activities of 
appraisers, the Bureau of Land Man-
agement may establish appraisal quali-
fication standards commensurate with 
those adopted by other States meeting 
the requirements of FIRREA.

§ 2201.3–2 Market value. 
(a) In estimating market value, the 

appraiser shall: 
(1) Determine the highest and best 

use of the property to be appraised; 
(2) Estimate the value of the lands 

and interests as if in private ownership 
and available for sale in the open mar-
ket; 

(3) Include historic, wildlife, recre-
ation, wilderness, scenic, cultural, or 
other resource values or amenities that 
are reflected in prices paid for similar 
properties in the competitive market; 

(4) Consider the contributory value of 
any interest in land such as minerals, 
water rights, or timber to the extent 
they are consistent with the highest 
and best use of the property; and 

(5) Estimate separately, if stipulated 
in the agreement to initiate in accord-
ance with § 2201.1 of this part, the value 
of each property optioned or acquired 
from multiple ownerships by the non-
Federal party for purposes of exchange, 
pursuant to § 2201.1–1 of this part. In 
this case, the appraiser shall estimate 
the value of the Federal and non-Fed-
eral properties in a similar manner. 

(b) In estimating market value, the 
appraiser may not independently add 
the separate values of the fractional in-
terests to be conveyed, unless market 
evidence indicates the following: 

(1) The various interests contribute 
their full value (pro rata) to the value 
of the whole; and 

(2) The valuation is compatible with 
the highest and best use of the prop-
erty. 

(c) In the absence of current market 
information reliably supporting value, 
the authorized officer may use other 
acceptable and commonly recognized 
methods to determine market value.

§ 2201.3–3 Appraisal report standards. 
Appraisals prepared for exchange 

purposes shall contain, at a minimum, 
the following information: 

(a) A summary of facts and conclu-
sions;
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