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(c) These regulations are intended to 
aid the internal management of the 
Agency, and are not intended to create 
any right or benefit enforceable at law 
by a party against the agency or its of-
ficers. 

§ 1204.1502 Definitions. 
Administrator means the Adminis-

trator of the U.S. National Aeronautics 
and Space Administration or an offi-
cial or employee of the Agency acting 
for the Administrator under a delega-
tion of authority. 

Agency means the U.S. National Aer-
onautics and Space Administration. 

Order means Executive Order 12372, 
issued July 14, 1982, and amended April 
8, 1983, and titled ‘‘Intergovernmental 
Review of Federal Programs.’’ 

State means any of the 50 states, the 
District of Columbia, the Common-
wealth of Puerto Rico, the Common-
wealth of the Northern Mariana Is-
lands, Guam, American Samoa, the 
U.S. Virgin Islands, or the Trust Terri-
tory of the Pacific Islands. 

§ 1204.1503 Programs and activities 
subject to these regulations. 

The Administrator publishes in the 
FEDERAL REGISTER a description of the 
Agency’s programs and activities that 
are subject to these regulations. 

§ 1204.1504 [Reserved] 

§ 1204.1505 Federal interagency co-
ordination. 

The Administrator to the extent 
practicable, consults with and seeks 
advice from all other substantially af-
fected federal departments and agen-
cies in an effort to assure full coordina-
tion between such agencies and the 
Agency regarding programs and activi-
ties covered under these regulations. 

§ 1204.1506 Procedures for selecting 
programs and activities under these 
regulations. 

(a) A state may select any program 
or activity published in the FEDERAL 
REGISTER in accordance with § 1204.1503 
of this part for intergovernmental re-
view under these regulations. Each 
state, before selecting programs and 
activities shall consult with local 
elected officials. 

(b) Each state that adopts a process 
shall notify the Administrator of the 
Agency’s programs and activities se-
lected for that process. 

(c) A state may notify the Adminis-
trator of changes in its selections at 
any time. For each change, the state 
shall submit to the Administrator an 
assurance that the state has consulted 
with local elected officials regarding 
the change. The Agency may establish 
deadlines by which states are required 
to inform the Administrator of changes 
in their program selections. 

(d) The Administrator uses a state’s 
process as soon as feasible, depending 
on individual programs and activities, 
after the Administrator is notified of 
its selections. 

§ 1204.1507 Communicating with State 
and local officials concerning the 
Agency’s programs and activities. 

(a) For those programs and activities 
covered by a state process under 
§ 1204.1506 the Administrator, to the ex-
tent permitted by law: 

(1) Uses the official state process to 
determine views of state and local 
elected officials; and; 

(2) Communicates with state and 
local elected officials, through the offi-
cial state process, as early in a pro-
gram planning cycle as is reasonably 
feasible to explain specific plans and 
actions. 

(b) The Administrator provides no-
tice to directly affected state, 
areawide, regional, and local entities 
in a state of proposed direct Federal 
development if: 

(1) The state has not adopted a proc-
ess under the Order; or 

(2) The development involves a pro-
gram or activity not selected for the 
state process. 
This notice may be made by publica-
tion in a periodical of general circula-
tion in the area likely to be affected or 
other appropriate means, which the 
Agency in its discretion deems appro-
priate. 

§ 1204.1508 Time limitations for receiv-
ing comments on proposed direct 
Federal development. 

(a) Except in unusual circumstances, 
the Administrator gives state processes 
or state, areawide, regional and local 
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officials and entities at least 60 days 
from the date established by the Ad-
ministrator to comment on proposed 
direct Federal development. 

(b) This section also applies to com-
ments in cases in which the review, co-
ordination, and communication with 
the Agency has been delegated. 

§ 1204.1509 Receiving and responding 
to comments. 

(a) The Administrator follows the 
procedures in § 1204.1510 if: 

(1) A state office or official is des-
ignated to act as a single point of con-
tact between a state process and all 
federal agencies; and 

(2) That office or official transmits a 
state process recommendation for a 
program selected under § 1204.1506. 

(b)(1) The single point of contact is 
not obligated to transmit comments 
from state, areawide, regional or local 
officials and entities where there is no 
state process recommendation. 

(2) If a state process recommendation 
is transmitted by a single point of con-
tact, all comments from state, 
areawide, regional, and local officials 
and entities that differ from it must 
also be transmitted. 

(c) If a state has not established a 
process, or is unable to submit a state 
process recommendation, state, 
areawide, regional and local officals 
and entities may submit comments to 
the Agency. 

(d) If a program or activity is not se-
lected for a state process, state, 
areawide, regional and local officials 
and entities may submit comments to 
the Agency. In addition, if a state proc-
ess recommendation for a nonselected 
program or activity is transmitted to 
the Agency by the single point of con-
tact, the Administrator follows the 
procedures of § 1204.1510 of this part. 

(e) The Administrator considers com-
ments which do not constitute a state 
process recommendation submitted 
under these regulations and for which 
the Administrator is not required to 
apply the procedures of § 1204.1510 of 
this part, when such comments are pro-
vided by a single point of contact, or 
directly to the Agency by a com-
menting party. 

§ 1204.1510 Efforts to accommodate 
intergovernmental concerns. 

(a) If a state provides a state process 
recommendation to the Agency 
through its single point of contact, the 
Administrator either: 

(1) Accepts the recommendation; 
(2) Reaches a mutally agreeable solu-

tion with the state process; or 
(3) Provides the single point of con-

tact with a written explanation of its 
decision, in such form as the Adminis-
trator in his or her discretion deems 
appropriate. The Administrator may 
also supplement the written expla-
nation by providing the explanation to 
the single point of contact by tele-
phone, other telecommunication, or 
other means. 

(b) In any explanation under para-
graph (a)(3) of this section, the Admin-
istrator informs the single point of 
contact that: 

(1) The Agency will not implement 
its decision for a least ten days after 
the single point of contact receives the 
explanation; or 

(2) The Administrator has reviewed 
the decision and determined that, be-
cause of unusual circumstances, the 
waiting period of at least ten days is 
not feasible. 

(c) For purposes of computing the 
waiting period under paragraph (b)(1) 
of this section, a single point of con-
tact is presumed to have received writ-
ten notification five days after the date 
of mailing of such notification. 

§ 1204.1511 Coordination in interstate 
situations. 

(a) The Administrator is responsible 
for— 

(1) Identifying proposed direct Fed-
eral development that has an impact 
on interstate areas; 

(2) Notifying appropriate officials 
and entities in states which have 
adopted a process and which select the 
Agency’s program or activity. 

(3) Making efforts to identify and no-
tify the affected state, areawide, re-
gional, and local officials and entities 
in those states that have not adopted a 
process under the Order or do not se-
lect the Agency’s program or activity; 
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