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the NASA has made a determination 
that the Federal Government’s interest 
is adequately protected. If such a de-
termination has not been made, the 
minimum requirements shall be as fol-
lows. 

(1) A bid guarantee from each bidder 
equivalent to five percent of the bid 
price. The ‘‘bid guarantee’’ shall con-
sist of a firm commitment such as a 
bid bond, certified check, or other ne-
gotiable instrument accompanying a 
bid as assurance that the bidder shall, 
upon acceptance of his bid, execute 
such contractual documents as may be 
required within the time specified. 

(2) A performance bond on the part of 
the contractor for 100 percent of the 
contract price. A ‘‘performance bond’’ 
is one executed in connection with a 
contract to secure fulfillment of all the 
contractor’s obligations under such 
contract. 

(3) A payment bond on the part of the 
contractor for 100 percent of the con-
tract price. A ‘‘payment bond’’ is one 
executed in connection with a contract 
to assure payment as required by stat-
ute of all persons supplying labor and 
material in the execution of the work 
provided for in the contract. 

(4) Where bonds are required in the 
situations described in this section, the 
bonds shall be obtained from compa-
nies holding certificates of authority 
as acceptable sureties pursuant to 31 
CFR part 223, ‘‘Surety Companies 
Doing Business with the United 
States.’’ 

(d) All negotiated contracts (except 
those for less than the small purchase 
threshold) awarded by recipients shall 
include a provision to the effect that 
the recipient, NASA, the Comptroller 
General of the United States, or any of 
their duly authorized representatives, 
shall have access to any books, docu-
ments, papers and records of the con-
tractor which are directly pertinent to 
a specific program for the purpose of 
making audits, examinations, excerpts 
and transcriptions. 

(e) All contracts, including small 
purchases, awarded by recipients and 
their contractors shall contain the pro-
curement provisions of appendix A to 
this subpart, as applicable. 

REPORTS AND RECORDS 

§ 1260.150 Purpose of reports and 
records. 

Sections 1260.151 through 1260.153 set 
forth the procedures for monitoring 
and reporting on the recipient’s finan-
cial and program performance and the 
necessary standard reporting forms. 
They also set forth record retention re-
quirements. 

§ 1260.151 Monitoring and reporting 
program performance. 

(a) Recipients are responsible for 
managing and monitoring each project, 
program, subcontract, function or ac-
tivity supported by the award. Recipi-
ents shall monitor subcontracts to en-
sure subcontractors have met the audit 
requirements as delineated in § 1260.126. 

(b) The terms and conditions of the 
award shall prescribe the frequency 
with which the performance reports 
shall be submitted. Except as provided 
in 1260.151(f), performance reports shall 
not be required more frequently than 
quarterly or, less frequently than an-
nually. Annual reports shall be due 90 
calendar days after the grant year; 
quarterly or semi-annual reports shall 
be due 30 days after the reporting pe-
riod. NASA may require annual reports 
before the anniversary dates of mul-
tiple year awards in lieu of these re-
quirements. The final performance re-
ports are due 90 calendar days after the 
expiration or termination of the award. 

(c) If inappropriate, a final technical 
or performance report shall not be re-
quired after completion of the project. 

(d) When required, performance re-
ports shall generally contain, for each 
award, brief information on each of the 
following. 

(1) A comparison of actual accom-
plishments with the goals and objec-
tives established for the period, the 
findings of the investigator, or both. 
Whenever appropriate and the output 
of programs or projects can be readily 
quantified, such quantitative data 
should be related to cost data for com-
putation of unit costs. 

(2) Reasons why established goals 
were not met, if appropriate. 

(3) Other pertinent information in-
cluding, when appropriate, analysis 
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