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or other entity of which the applicant 
directly or indirectly owns or controls 
a majority of the voting shares or 
other interest, will be considered an af-
filiate for purposes of this part, unless 
the adjudicative officer determines 
that such treatment would be unjust 
and contrary to the purposes of the Act 
in light of the actual relationship be-
tween the affiliated entities. In addi-
tion, the adjudicative officer may de-
termine that financial relationships of 
the applicant other than those de-
scribed in this paragraph constitute 
special circumstances that would make 
an award unjust. 

(g) An applicant that participates in 
a proceeding primarily on behalf of one 
or more other persons or entities that 
would be ineligible is not itself eligible 
for an award. 

[51 FR 15311, Apr. 23, 1986, as amended at 60 
FR 12668, Mar. 8, 1995] 

§ 1262.105 Standards for awards. 
(a) A prevailing applicant may re-

ceive an award subject to paragraph (b) 
of this section, for fees and expenses in-
curred in connection with a proceeding, 
or in a significant and discrete sub-
stantive portion of the proceeding, un-
less the position of the agency over 
which the applicant has prevailed was 
substantially justified. No presumption 
arises that the agency’s position was 
not substantially justified simply be-
cause the agency did not prevail. The 
burden of proof that an award should 
not be made to an eligible prevailing 
applicant is on the agency. 

(b) An award, for any portion of the 
adversary adjudication, will be denied 
if the applicant has unreasonably pro-
tracted the proceedings, or denied or 
reduced if special circumstances make 
the award sought unjust. 

§ 1262.106 Allowable fees and ex-
penses. 

(a) Awards will be based on rates cus-
tomarily charged by persons engaged 
in the business of acting as attorneys, 
agents, and expert witnesses, even if 
the services were made available with-
out charge or at a reduced rate to the 
applicant. 

(b) No award for the fee of an attor-
ney or agent under these rules may ex-
ceed $75 per hour. No award to com-

pensate an expert witness may exceed 
the highest rate at which this Agency 
pays expert witnesses, which is $20 an 
hour (5 hours maximum) or maximum 
daily rate of $100 (3 days maximum). 
However, an award may also include 
the reasonable expenses of the attor-
ney, agent, or witness as a separate 
item, if the attorney, agent, or witness 
ordinarily charges clients separately 
for such expenses. 

(c) In determining the reasonableness 
of the fee sought for an attorney, 
agent, or expert witness, the adjudica-
tive officer shall consider the fol-
lowing: 

(1) If the attorney, agent, or witness 
is in private practice, his or her cus-
tomary fee for similar service, or, if an 
employee of the applicant, the fully al-
located cost of the services; 

(2) The prevailing rate for similar 
services in the community in which the 
attorney, agent, or witness ordinarily 
performs services; 

(3) The time actually spent in the 
representation of the application; 

(4) The time reasonably spent in light 
of the difficulty or complexity of the 
issues in the proceeding; and 

(5) Such other factors as may bear on 
the value of the services provided. 

(d) The reasonable cost of any study, 
analysis, engineering report, test, 
project, or similar matter prepared on 
behalf of a party may be awarded, to 
the extent that the charge for the serv-
ice does not exceed the prevailing rate 
for similar services, and the study or 
other matter was necessary for prepa-
ration of the applicant’s case. 

§ 1262.107 Rulemaking on maximum 
rates for attorney fees. 

(a) If warranted by an increase in the 
cost of living or by special cir-
cumstances (such as limited avail-
ability of attorneys qualified to handle 
certain types of proceedings), the 
Agency may adopt regulations pro-
viding that attorney fees may be 
awarded at a rate higher then $75 per 
hour in some or all of the types of pro-
ceedings covered by this part. This 
Agency will conduct any rulemaking 
proceedings for this purpose under the 
informal rulemaking procedures of the 
Administrative Procedure Act (5 U.S.C. 
553). 
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(b) Any person may file with the 
Agency a petition for rulemaking to in-
crease the maximum rate for attorney 
fees. The petition should be addressed 
to the General Counsel, NASA Head-
quarters, Washington, DC 20546; should 
identify the rate the petitioner be-
lieves the Agency should establish and 
the types of proceedings in which the 
rate should be used; and should also ex-
plain fully the reasons why the higher 
rate is warranted. The Agency will re-
spond to the petition within 60 days 
after it is filed, by initiating a rule-
making proceeding or denying the peti-
tion, or taking other appropriate ac-
tion. 

§ 1262.108 Awards against other agen-
cies. 

If an applicant is entitled to an 
award because it prevails over another 
agency of the United States that par-
ticipates in a proceeding before NASA, 
the award or an appropriate portion of 
the award shall be made against that 
agency, subject to § 1262.105(b), if it had 
taken a position that is not substan-
tially justified. 

§ 1262.109 Delegations of authority. 
(a) The NASA Administrator hereby 

delegates authority to the General 
Counsel or designee to take final ac-
tion on matters pertaining to the Act, 
other than the authority for final fee 
determination after Agency review 
pursuant to § 1262.308. 

(b) The NASA Administrator may, in 
particularly specified matters under 
the Act, delegate authority to officials 
other than those designated in para-
graph (a) of this section. 

Subpart 1262.2—Information 
Required From Applicants 

§ 1262.201 Contents of application. 
(a) An application for an award of 

fees and expenses under the Act shall 
identify the applicant and the pro-
ceeding for which an award is sought. 
The application shall show that the ap-
plicant has prevailed and identify the 
position of an agency or agencies in the 
proceeding that the applicant alleges 
was not substantially justified. Unless 
the applicant is an individual, the ap-
plication shall also state the number of 

employees of the applicant and de-
scribe briefly the type and purpose of 
its organization or business. 

(b) The application shall also include 
a statement that the applicant’s net 
worth does not exceed $2 million (if an 
individual) or $7 million (for all other 
applicants, including their affiliates). 
However, an applicant may omit this 
statement if the applicant: 

(1) Attaches a copy of a ruling by the 
Internal Revenue Service that it quali-
fies as an organization described in sec-
tion 501(c)(3) of the Internal Revenue 
Code (26 U.S.C. 501(c)(3)), or, in the case 
of a tax-exempt organization not re-
quired to obtain a ruling from the In-
ternal Revenue Service on its exempt 
status, a statement that describes the 
basis for the applicant’s belief that it 
qualifies under such section; or 

(2) States that it is a cooperative as-
sociation as defined in section 15(a) of 
the Agricultural Marketing Act (12 
U.S.C. 1141j(a)). 

(c) The application shall state the 
amount of fees and expense for which 
an award is sought. 

(d) The application may also include 
any other matters that the applicant 
wishes this Agency to consider in 
determing whether and in what 
amount an award should be made. 

(e) The application shall be signed by 
the applicant or an authorized officer 
or attorney of the applicant. It shall 
also contain or be accompanied by a 
written verification under oath or 
under penalty of perjury that the infor-
mation provided in the application is 
true and correct. 

§ 1262.202 Net worth exhibit. 

(a) Each applicant except a qualified 
tax-exempt organization or cooperative 
association must provide with its ap-
plication a detailed exhibit showing 
the net worth of the applicant and any 
affiliates (as defiined in § 1262.104(f) 
when the proceeding was initiated. The 
exhibit may be in any form convenient 
to the applicant that provides full dis-
closure of the applicant’s and its affili-
ates’ assets and liabilities and is suffi-
cient to determine whether the appli-
cant qualifies under the standards in 
this part. The adjudicative officer may 
require an applicant to file additional 
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