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only a temporary license has been 
granted. 

(d) Any registration form, any sched-
ule or supplement thereto, any finger-
print card or other document required 
by this part or any rule of the National 
Futures Assocation to be filed with the 
National Futures Association shall be 
deemed for all purposes to have been 
filed with, and to be the official record 
of, the Commission. 

[49 FR 39530, Oct. 9, 1984, as amended at 53 FR 
8431, Mar. 15, 1988; 54 FR 19558, May 8, 1989; 67 
FR 38874, June 6, 2002]

§ 3.3 [Reserved]

§ 3.4 Registration in one capacity not 
included in registration in any 
other capacity. 

(a) Except as may be otherwise pro-
vided in the Act or in any rule, regula-
tion, or order of the Commission, each 
futures commission merchant, floor 
broker, floor trader, associated person, 
commodity trading advisor, com-
modity pool operator, introducing 
broker, and leverage transaction mer-
chant must register as such under the 
Act. Registration in one capacity 
under the Act shall not include reg-
istration in any other capacity: Pro-
vided, however, That a registered floor 
broker need not also register as a floor 
trader in order to engage in activity as 
a floor trader. 

(b) Except as may be provided in any 
rule, regulation or order of the Com-
mission, registration as an associated 
person in one capacity shall not in-
clude registration as an associated per-
son in any other capacity: Provided, 
however, That an associated person who 
is sponsored by a registrant, which 
itself is registered in more than one ca-
pacity, need register only once to act 
as an associated person of the reg-
istrant, and shall be deemed to be an 
associated person of such registrant, in 
each such capacity. 

[49 FR 39530, Oct. 9, 1984, as amended at 58 FR 
19590, Apr. 15, 1993]

§§ 3.5–3.9 [Reserved]

§ 3.10 Registration of futures commis-
sion merchants, introducing bro-
kers, commodity trading advisors, 
commodity pool operators and le-
verage transaction merchants. 

(a) Application for registration. (1)(i) 
Except as provided in paragraph (a)(3) 
of this section, application for registra-
tion as a futures commission mer-
chant, introducing broker, commodity 
trading advisor, commodity pool oper-
ator or leverage transaction merchant 
must be on Form 7–R, completed and 
filed with the National Futures Asso-
ciation in accordance with the instruc-
tions thereto. 

(ii) Applicants for registration as a 
futures commission merchant or intro-
ducing broker must accompany their 
Form 7–R with a Form 1–FR–FCM or 
Form 1–FR–IB, respectively, in accord-
ance with the provisions of § 1.10 of this 
chapter: Provided, however, That an ap-
plicant for registration as a futures 
commission merchant or introducing 
broker which is registered with the Se-
curities and Exchange Commission as a 
securities broker or dealer may accom-
pany its Form 7–R with a copy of its 
Financial and Operational Combined 
Uniform Single Report under the Secu-
rities Exchange Act of 1934, Part II or 
Part II A, in accordance with the provi-
sions of § 1.10(h) of this chapter. 

(iii) Applicants for registration as a 
commodity pool operator must accom-
pany their Form 7–R with the financial 
statements described in § 4.13(c) of this 
chapter. 

(iv) Applicants for registration as a 
leverage transaction merchant must 
accompany their Form 7–R with a 
Form 2–FR in accordance with the pro-
visions of § 31.13 of this chapter. 

(2) Each Form 7-R filed in accordance 
with the requirements of paragraph 
(a)(1)(i) of this section must be accom-
panied by a Form 8-R, completed in ac-
cordance with the instructions thereto 
and executed by each natural person 
who is a principal of the applicant, and 
must be accompanied by the finger-
prints of that principal on a fingerprint 
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