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Environmental Protection Agency § 63.4890 

Forces of the United States (including 
the Coast Guard and the National 
Guard of any State). 

§ 63.4882 What parts of my plant does 
this subpart cover? 

(a) This subpart applies to each new, 
reconstructed, and existing affected 
source. 

(b) The affected source is the collec-
tion of all of the items listed in para-
graphs (b)(1) through (4) of this section 
that are used for surface coating of 
metal furniture: 

(1) All coating operations as defined 
in § 63.4981; 

(2) All storage containers and mixing 
vessels in which coatings, thinners, and 
cleaning materials are stored or mixed; 

(3) All manual and automated equip-
ment and containers and all pumps and 
piping within the affected source used 
for conveying coatings, thinners, and 
cleaning materials; and 

(4) All storage containers, all pumps 
and piping, and all manual and auto-
mated equipment and containers with-
in the affected source used for con-
veying waste materials generated by a 
coating operation. 

(c) An affected source is a new af-
fected source if you commenced its 
construction after April 24, 2002, and 
the construction is of a completely new 
metal furniture surface coating facility 
where previously no metal furniture 
surface coating facility had existed. 

(d) An affected source is recon-
structed if you meet the criteria as de-
fined in § 63.2. 

(e) An affected source is existing if it 
is not new or reconstructed. 

§ 63.4883 When do I have to comply 
with this subpart? 

The date by which you must comply 
with this subpart is called the compli-
ance date. The compliance date for 
each type of affected source is specified 
in paragraphs (a) through (c) of this 
section. The compliance date begins 
the initial compliance period during 
which you conduct the initial compli-
ance demonstration described in 
§§ 63.4940, 63.4950, and 63.4960. 

(a) For a new or reconstructed af-
fected source, the compliance date is 
the applicable date in paragraph (a)(1) 
or (2) of this section: 

(1) If the initial startup of your new 
or reconstructed affected source is be-
fore May 23, 2003, the compliance date 
is May 23, 2003. 

(2) If the initial startup of your new 
or reconstructed affected source occurs 
after May 23, 2003, the compliance date 
is the date of initial startup of your af-
fected source. 

(b) For an existing affected source, 
the compliance date is the date 3 years 
after May 23, 2003. 

(c) For an area source that increases 
its emissions or its potential to emit 
such that it becomes a major source of 
HAP emissions, the compliance date is 
specified in paragraphs (c)(1) and (2) of 
this section. 

(1) For any portion of the source that 
becomes a new or reconstructed af-
fected source subject to this subpart, 
the compliance date is the date of ini-
tial startup of the affected source or 
May 23, 2003, whichever is later. 

(2) For any portion of the source that 
becomes an existing affected source 
subject to this subpart, the compliance 
date is the date 1 year after the area 
source becomes a major source or 3 
years after May 23, 2003, whichever is 
later. 

(d) You must meet the notification 
requirements in § 63.4910 according to 
the dates specified in that section and 
in subpart A of this part. Some of the 
notifications must be submitted before 
the compliance dates described in para-
graphs (a) through (c) of this section. 

EMISSION LIMITATIONS 

§ 63.4890 What emission limits must I 
meet? 

(a) For a new or reconstructed af-
fected source, you must emit no or-
ganic HAP during each compliance pe-
riod, determined according to the pro-
cedures in § 63.4941. 

(b) Alternative emission limit. You may 
request approval from the Adminis-
trator to use an alternative new source 
emission limit for specific metal fur-
niture components or type of compo-
nents for which you believe the emis-
sion limit in paragraph (a) of this sec-
tion cannot be achieved. 

(1) Any request to use an alternative 
emission limit under paragraph (b) of 
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