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activities, describe the maintenance 
activities and the frequency of the 
maintenance activities, explain why 
the maintenance cannot be accom-
plished during process shutdowns, de-
scribe how you plan to make reason-
able efforts to minimize emissions dur-
ing the maintenance, and provide any 
other documentation required by the 
EPA Administrator. 

(b) The routine control device main-
tenance exemption must not exceed the 
percentages of process unit operating 
uptime in paragraphs (b)(1) and (2) of 
this section. 

(1) If the control device is used to 
control a green rotary dryer, tube 
dryer, rotary strand dryer, or pressur-
ized refiner, then the routine control 
device maintenance exemption must 
not exceed 3 percent of annual oper-
ating uptime for each process unit con-
trolled. 

(2) If the control device is used to 
control a softwood veneer dryer, recon-
stituted wood product press, reconsti-
tuted wood product board cooler, hard-
board oven, press predryer, conveyor 
strand dryer, or fiberboard mat dryer, 
then the routine control device mainte-
nance exemption must not exceed 0.5 
percent of annual operating uptime for 
each process unit controlled. 

(3) If the control device is used to 
control a combination of equipment 
listed in both paragraphs (b)(1) and (2) 
of this section, such as a tube dryer 
and a reconstituted wood product 
press, then the routine control device 
maintenance exemption must not ex-
ceed 3 percent of annual operating 
uptime for each process unit con-
trolled. 

(c) The request for the routine con-
trol device maintenance exemption, if 
approved by the EPA Administrator, 
must be IBR in and attached to the af-
fected source’s title V permit. 

(d) The compliance options and oper-
ating requirements do not apply during 
times when control device mainte-
nance covered under your approved 
routine control device maintenance ex-
emption is performed. You must mini-
mize emissions to the greatest extent 
possible during these routine control 
device maintenance periods. 

(e) To the extent practical, startup 
and shutdown of emission control sys-

tems must be scheduled during times 
when process equipment is also shut 
down. 

§ 63.2252 What are the requirements 
for process units that have no con-
trol or work practice requirements? 

For process units not subject to the 
compliance options or work practice 
requirements specified in § 63.2240 (in-
cluding, but not limited to, lumber 
kilns), you are not required to comply 
with the compliance options, work 
practice requirements, performance 
testing, monitoring, SSM plans, and 
recordkeeping or reporting require-
ments of this subpart, or any other re-
quirements in subpart A of this part, 
except for the initial notification re-
quirements in § 63.9(b). 

[71 FR 8372, Feb. 16, 2006] 

INITIAL COMPLIANCE REQUIREMENTS 

§ 63.2260 How do I demonstrate initial 
compliance with the compliance op-
tions, operating requirements, and 
work practice requirements? 

(a) To demonstrate initial compli-
ance with the compliance options and 
operating requirements, you must con-
duct performance tests and establish 
each site-specific operating require-
ment in Table 2 to this subpart accord-
ing to the requirements in § 63.2262 and 
Table 4 to this subpart. Combustion 
units that accept process exhausts into 
the flame zone are exempt from the 
initial performance testing and oper-
ating requirements for thermal 
oxidizers. 

(b) You must demonstrate initial 
compliance with each compliance op-
tion, operating requirement, and work 
practice requirement that applies to 
you according to Tables 5 and 6 to this 
subpart and according to §§ 63.2260 
through 63.2269 of this subpart. 

(c) You must submit the Notification 
of Compliance Status containing the 
results of the initial compliance dem-
onstration according to the require-
ments in § 63.2280(d). 

§ 63.2261 By what date must I conduct 
performance tests or other initial 
compliance demonstrations? 

(a) You must conduct performance 
tests upon initial startup or no later 
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