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Ecat
NiEmR

Ecat Eq
st

st-Limit =
1.0 mg/kg coke burn-off

 2
2

× ( ).

Where: 

NiEmR2st = Average Ni emission rate cal-
culated as the arithmetic average Ni emis-
sion rate using Equation 8 of § 63.1564 for 
each performance test run, mg/kg coke 
burn-off. 

(3) If you choose to adjust the equi-
librium catalyst Ni concentration to 
the maximum level, you can’t adjust 
any other monitored operating param-
eter (i.e., gas flow rate, voltage, pres-
sure drop, liquid-to-gas ratio). 

(4) Except as specified in paragraph 
(d)(3) of this section, if you use contin-
uous parameter monitoring systems, 
you may adjust one of your monitored 
operating parameters (flow rate, volt-
age and secondary current, pressure 
drop, liquid-to-gas ratio) from the av-
erage of measured values during the 
performance test to the maximum 
value (or minimum value, if applicable) 
representative of worst-case operating 
conditions, if necessary. This adjust-
ment of measured values may be done 
using control device design specifica-
tions, manufacturer recommendations, 
or other applicable information. You 
must provide supporting documenta-
tion and rationale in your Notification 
of Compliance Status, demonstrating 
to the satisfaction of your permitting 
authority, that your affected source 
complies with the applicable emission 
limit at the operating limit based on 
adjusted values. 

(e) Can I change my operating limit? 
You may change the established oper-
ating limit by meeting the require-
ments in paragraphs (e)(1) through (3) 
of this section. 

(1) You may change your established 
operating limit for a continuous pa-
rameter monitoring system by doing 
an additional performance test, a per-
formance test in conjunction with an 
engineering assessment, or an engi-
neering assessment to verify that, at 
the new operating limit, you are in 
compliance with the applicable emis-
sion limitation. 

(2) You must establish a revised oper-
ating limit for your continuous param-

eter monitoring system if you make 
any change in process or operating con-
ditions that could affect control sys-
tem performance or you change des-
ignated conditions after the last per-
formance or compliance tests were 
done. You can establish the revised op-
erating limit as described in paragraph 
(e)(1) of this section. 

(3) You may change your site-specific 
opacity operating limit or Ni operating 
limit only by doing a new performance 
test. 

§ 63.1572 What are my monitoring in-
stallation, operation, and mainte-
nance requirements? 

(a) You must install, operate, and 
maintain each continuous emission 
monitoring system according to the re-
quirements in paragraphs (a)(1) 
through (4) of this section. 

(1) You must install, operate, and 
maintain each continuous emission 
monitoring system according to the re-
quirements in Table 40 of this subpart. 

(2) If you use a continuous emission 
monitoring system to meet the NSPS 
CO or SO2 limit, you must conduct a 
performance evaluation of each contin-
uous emission monitoring system ac-
cording to the requirements in § 63.8 
and Table 40 of this subpart. This re-
quirement does not apply to an af-
fected source subject to the NSPS that 
has already demonstrated initial com-
pliance with the applicable perform-
ance specification. 

(3) As specified in § 63.8(c)(4)(ii), each 
continuous emission monitoring sys-
tem must complete a minimum of one 
cycle of operation (sampling, ana-
lyzing, and data recording) for each 
successive 15-minute period. 

(4) Data must be reduced as specified 
in § 63.8(g)(2). 

(b) You must install, operate, and 
maintain each continuous opacity 
monitoring system according to the re-
quirements in paragraphs (b)(1) 
through (3) of this section. 

(1) Each continuous opacity moni-
toring system must be installed, oper-
ated, and maintained according to the 
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requirements in Table 40 of this sub-
part. 

(2) If you use a continuous opacity 
monitoring system to meet the NSPS 
opacity limit, you must conduct a per-
formance evaluation of each contin-
uous opacity monitoring system ac-
cording to the requirements in § 63.8 
and Table 40 of this subpart. This re-
quirement does not apply to an af-
fected source subject to the NSPS that 
has already demonstrated initial com-
pliance with the applicable perform-
ance specification. 

(3) As specified in § 63.8(c)(4)(i), each 
continuous opacity monitoring system 
must complete a minimum of one cycle 
of sampling and analyzing for each suc-
cessive 10-second period and one cycle 
of data recording for each successive 6- 
minute period. 

(c) You must install, operate, and 
maintain each continuous parameter 
monitoring system according to the re-
quirements in paragraphs (c)(1) 
through (5) of this section. 

(1) The owner or operator shall in-
stall, operate, and maintain each con-
tinuous parameter monitoring system 
in a manner consistent with the manu-
facturer’s specifications or other writ-
ten procedures that provide adequate 
assurance that the equipment will 
monitor accurately. The owner or oper-
ator shall also meet the equipment 
specifications in Table 41 of this sub-
part if pH strips or colormetric tube 
sampling systems are used. 

(2) The continuous parameter moni-
toring system must complete a min-
imum of one cycle of operation for 
each successive 15-minute period. You 
must have a minimum of four succes-
sive cycles of operation to have a valid 
hour of data (or at least two if a cali-
bration check is performed during that 
hour or if the continuous parameter 
monitoring system is out-of-control). 

(3) Each continuous parameter moni-
toring system must have valid hourly 
average data from at least 75 percent of 
the hours during which the process op-
erated. 

(4) Each continuous parameter moni-
toring system must determine and 
record the hourly average of all re-
corded readings and if applicable, the 
daily average of all recorded readings 
for each operating day. The daily aver-

age must cover a 24-hour period if oper-
ation is continuous or the number of 
hours of operation per day if operation 
is not continuous. 

(5) Each continuous parameter moni-
toring system must record the results 
of each inspection, calibration, and 
validation check. 

(d) You must monitor and collect 
data according to the requirements in 
paragraphs (d)(1) and (2) of this section. 

(1) Except for monitoring malfunc-
tions, associated repairs, and required 
quality assurance or control activities 
(including as applicable, calibration 
checks and required zero and span ad-
justments), you must conduct all moni-
toring in continuous operation (or col-
lect data at all required intervals) at 
all times the affected source is oper-
ating. 

(2) You may not use data recorded 
during monitoring malfunctions, asso-
ciated repairs, and required quality as-
surance or control activities for pur-
poses of this regulation, including data 
averages and calculations, for fulfilling 
a minimum data availability require-
ment, if applicable. You must use all 
the data collected during all other pe-
riods in assessing the operation of the 
control device and associated control 
system. 

[67 FR 17773, Apr. 11, 2002, as amended at 70 
FR 6940, Feb. 9, 2005] 

§ 63.1573 What are my monitoring al-
ternatives? 

(a) What are the approved alternatives 
for measuring gas flow rate? (1) You may 
use this alternative to a continuous pa-
rameter monitoring system for the 
catalytic regenerator exhaust gas flow 
rate for your catalytic cracking unit if 
the unit does not introduce any other 
gas streams into the catalyst regenera-
tion vent (i.e., complete combustion 
units with no additional combustion 
devices). You may also use this alter-
native to a continuous parameter mon-
itoring system for the catalytic regen-
erator atmospheric exhaust gas flow 
rate for your catalytic reforming unit 
during the coke burn and rejuvenation 
cycles if the unit operates as a con-
stant pressure system during these cy-
cles. If you use this alternative, you 
shall use the same procedure for the 
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