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owned minerals; and certain federally 
managed water resources. The Sec-
retary of the Interior shall also be 
trustee for those natural resources for 
which an Indian tribe would otherwise 
act as trustee in those cases where the 
United States acts on behalf of the In-
dian tribe. 

(3) Secretary for the land managing 
agency. For natural resources located 
on, over, or under land administered by 
the United States, the trustee shall be 
the head of the department in which 
the land managing agency is found. 
The trustees for the principal federal 
land managing agencies are the Secre-
taries of DOI, USDA, DOD, and DOE. 

(4) Head of authorized agencies. For 
natural resources located in the United 
States but not otherwise described in 
this section, the trustee shall be the 
head of the federal agency or agencies 
authorized to manage or control those 
resources. 

§ 300.605 State trustees. 

State trustees shall act on behalf of 
the public as trustees for natural re-
sources, including their supporting eco-
systems, within the boundary of a 
state or belonging to, managed by, con-
trolled by, or appertaining to such 
state. For the purposes of subpart G of 
this part, the definition of the term 
state does not include Indian tribes. 
The governor of a state is encouraged 
to designate a state lead trustee to co-
ordinate all state trustee responsibil-
ities with other trustee agencies and 
with response activities of the RRT 
and OSC. The state’s lead trustee 
would designate a representative to 
serve as contact with the OSC. This in-
dividual should have ready access to 
appropriate state officials with envi-
ronmental protection, emergency re-
sponse, and natural resource respon-
sibilities. The EPA Administrator or 
USCG Commandant or their designees 
may appoint the state lead trustee as a 
member of the Area Committee. Re-
sponse strategies should be coordinated 
between the state and other trustees 
and the OSC for specific natural re-
source locations in an inland or coastal 
zone and should be included in the Fish 
and Wildlife and Sensitive Environ-
ments Plan annex of the ACP. 

§ 300.610 Indian tribes. 

The tribal chairmen (or heads of the 
governing bodies) of Indian tribes, as 
defined in § 300.5, or a person designated 
by the tribal officials, shall act on be-
half of the Indian tribes as trustees for 
the natural resources, including their 
supporting ecosystems, belonging to, 
managed by, controlled by, or apper-
taining to such Indian tribe, or held in 
trust for the benefit of such Indian 
tribe, or belonging to a member of such 
Indian tribe, if such resources are sub-
ject to a trust restriction on alien-
ation. When the tribal chairman or 
head of the tribal governing body des-
ignates another person as trustee, the 
tribal chairman or head of the tribal 
governing body shall notify the Presi-
dent of such designation. Such officials 
are authorized to act when there is in-
jury to, destruction of, loss of, or 
threat to natural resources, including 
their supporting ecosystems as a result 
of a release of a hazardous substance. 

§ 300.612 Foreign trustees. 

Pursuant to section 1006 of the OPA, 
foreign trustees shall act on behalf of 
the head of a foreign government as 
trustees for natural resources belong-
ing to, managed by, controlled by, or 
appertaining to such foreign govern-
ment. 

§ 300.615 Responsibilities of trustees. 

(a) Where there are multiple trustees, 
because of coexisting or contiguous 
natural resources or concurrent juris-
dictions, they should coordinate and 
cooperate in carrying out these respon-
sibilities. 

(b) Trustees are responsible for desig-
nating to the RRTs and the Area Com-
mittees, for inclusion in the RCP and 
the ACP, appropriate contacts to re-
ceive notifications from the OSCs/ 
RPMs of discharges or releases. 

(c)(1) Upon notification or discovery 
of injury to, destruction of, loss of, or 
threat to natural resources, trustees 
may, pursuant to section 107(f) of 
CERCLA, or section 311(f)(5) of the 
CWA, take the following or other ac-
tions as appropriate: 

(i) Conduct a preliminary survey of 
the area affected by the discharge or 
release to determine if trust resources 
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