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required data have been or are being 
submitted in accordance with a test 
rule; and 

(3) Submission of the required test 
data concerning that chemical sub-
stance or mixture would be duplicative 
of data which have been or are being 
submitted to EPA in accordance with a 
test rule. 

(b)(1) If a single representative sub-
stance is to be tested under a test rule, 
EPA will consider all forms of the 
chemical subject to that rule to be 
equivalent and will contact the exemp-
tion applicant only if information is 
missing or unclear. 

(2) If two or more representative sub-
stances are to be tested under a test 
rule, EPA will evaluate equivalence 
claims made in each exemption appli-
cation according to the criteria dis-
cussed in the test rule. 

(i) If EPA finds an equivalence claim 
to be in error or inadequately sup-
ported, the applicant will be notified 
by certified mail. The applicant will be 
given 15 days to provide clarifying in-
formation. 

(ii) Exemption applicants will be no-
tified that equivalence has been ac-
cepted or rejected. 

(c) The final Phase II test rule which 
adopts the study plans in two-phase 
rulemaking, a separate FEDERAL REG-
ISTER notice in single-phase rule-
making, or a letter by certified mail 
will give exemption applicants final 
notice that they have received a condi-
tional exemption. All conditional ex-
emptions thus granted are contingent 
upon the test sponsors’ successful com-
pletion of testing according to the 
specifications in the test rule. 

§ 790.88 Denial of exemption applica-
tion. 

(a) EPA may deny any exemption ap-
plication if: 

(1) EPA determines that the appli-
cant has failed to demonstrate that the 
applicant’s chemical is equivalent to 
the test substance; or 

(2) The exemption applicant fails to 
submit any of the information speci-
fied in § 790.82; or 

(3) The exemption applicant fails to 
submit any of the information speci-
fied in § 790.85 if required in the test 
rule; or 

(4)(i) For single-phase test rules, EPA 
has not received a letter of intent to 
conduct the test for which exemption 
is sought; or 

(ii) For two-phase test rules, EPA has 
not received an adequate study plan for 
the test for which exemption is sought; 
or 

(5) The study sponsor(s) fails to ini-
tiate the required testing by the dead-
lines adopted in the test rule; or 

(6) The study sponsor(s) fails to sub-
mit data as required in the test stand-
ard and deadlines for submission of test 
data as adopted in the test rule or as 
modified in accordance with § 790.55. 

(b) EPA will notify the exemption ap-
plicant by certified mail or FEDERAL 
REGISTER notice of EPA’s determina-
tion that the exemption application is 
denied. 

§ 790.90 Appeal of denial of exemption 
application. 

(a) Within 30 days after receipt of no-
tification that EPA has denied an ap-
plication for exemption, the applicant 
may file an appeal with EPA. 

(b) The appeal shall indicate the 
basis for the applicant’s request for re-
consideration. 

(c)(1) The applicant may also include 
a request for a hearing. Hearings will 
be held according to the procedures de-
scribed in § 790.97. 

(2) Hearing requests must be in writ-
ing and must be received by EPA with-
in 30 days of receipt of the letter or 
publication of the FEDERAL REGISTER 
notice described in § 790.88(b). Hearing 
requests must provide reasons why a 
hearing is necessary. 

(d) If EPA determines that there are 
material issues of fact, then the re-
quest for a hearing will be granted. If 
EPA denies a hearing request, EPA will 
base its decision on the written sub-
mission. 

(e) EPA will notify the applicant of 
its decision within 60 days after EPA 
receives the appeal described in para-
graph (a) of this section or within 60 
days after completion of a hearing de-
scribed in paragraph (c) of this section. 

(f) The filing of an appeal from the 
denial of an exemption shall not act to 
stay the applicant’s legal obligations 
under a test rule promulgated under 
section 4 of the Act. 
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