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(3) Detailed descriptions of control 
algorithms and other design param-
eters for controlling transient emis-
sions. 

(r) Report all test results, including 
those from invalid tests or from any 
other tests, whether or not they were 
conducted according to the test proce-
dures of subpart F of this part. If you 
measure CO2, report those emission 
levels. We may ask you to send other 
information to confirm that your tests 
were valid under the requirements of 
this part and 40 CFR part 1065. 

(s) Describe all adjustable operating 
parameters (see § 1039.115(e)), including 
production tolerances. Include the fol-
lowing in your description of each pa-
rameter: 

(1) The nominal or recommended set-
ting. 

(2) The intended physically adjust-
able range. 

(3) The limits or stops used to estab-
lish adjustable ranges. 

(4) Information showing why the lim-
its, stops, or other means of inhibiting 
adjustment are effective in preventing 
adjustment of parameters on in-use en-
gines to settings outside your intended 
physically adjustable ranges. 

(t) Provide the information to read, 
record, and interpret all the informa-
tion broadcast by an engine’s onboard 
computers and electronic control units. 
State that, upon request, you will give 
us any hardware, software, or tools we 
would need to do this. If you broadcast 
a surrogate parameter for torque val-
ues, you must provide us what we need 
to convert these into torque units. You 
may reference any appropriate publicly 
released standards that define conven-
tions for these messages and param-
eters. Format your information con-
sistent with publicly released stand-
ards. 

(u) Confirm that your emission-re-
lated installation instructions specify 
how to ensure that sampling of exhaust 
emissions will be possible after engines 
are installed in equipment and placed 
in service. If this cannot be done by 
simply adding a 20-centimeter exten-
sion to the exhaust pipe, show how to 
sample exhaust emissions in a way 
that prevents diluting the exhaust 
sample with ambient air. 

(v) State whether your certification 
is intended to include engines used in 
stationary applications. State whether 
your certification is limited for certain 
engines. If this is the case, describe 
how you will prevent use of these en-
gines in applications for which they are 
not certified. This applies for engines 
such as the following: 

(1) Constant-speed engines. 
(2) Engines used for transportation 

refrigeration units that you certify 
under the provisions of § 1039.645. 

(3) Hand-startable engines certified 
under the provisions of § 1039.101(c). 

(4) Engines above 560 KW that are not 
certified to emission standards for gen-
erator-set engines. 

(w) Unconditionally certify that all 
the engines in the engine family com-
ply with the requirements of this part, 
other referenced parts of the CFR, and 
the Clean Air Act. 

(x) Include estimates of U.S.-directed 
production volumes. 

(y) Include the information required 
by other subparts of this part. For ex-
ample, include the information re-
quired by § 1039.725 if you participate in 
the ABT program. 

(z) Include other applicable informa-
tion, such as information specified in 
this part or 40 CFR part 1068 related to 
requests for exemptions. 

[69 FR 39213, June 29, 2004, as amended at 71 
FR 39185, July 11, 2006] 

§ 1039.210 May I get preliminary ap-
proval before I complete my appli-
cation? 

If you send us information before you 
finish the application, we will review it 
and make any appropriate determina-
tions, especially for questions related 
to engine family definitions, auxiliary 
emission-control devices, deterioration 
factors, testing for service accumula-
tion, maintenance, and NTE defi-
ciencies and carve-outs. Decisions 
made under this section are considered 
to be preliminary approval, subject to 
final review and approval. If you re-
quest preliminary approval related to 
the upcoming model year or the model 
year after that, we will make best-ef-
forts to make the appropriate deter-
minations as soon as practicable. We 
will generally not provide preliminary 
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approval related to a future model year 
more than two years ahead of time. 

§ 1039.220 How do I amend the mainte-
nance instructions in my applica-
tion? 

You may amend your emission-re-
lated maintenance instructions after 
you submit your application for certifi-
cation, as long as the amended instruc-
tions remain consistent with the provi-
sions of § 1039.125. You must send the 
Designated Compliance Officer a re-
quest to amend your application for 
certification for an engine family if 
you want to change the emission-re-
lated maintenance instructions in a 
way that could affect emissions. In 
your request, describe the proposed 
changes to the maintenance instruc-
tions. We will disapprove your request 
if we determine that the amended in-
structions are inconsistent with main-
tenance you performed on emission- 
data engines. 

(a) If you are decreasing the specified 
maintenance, you may distribute the 
new maintenance instructions to your 
customers 30 days after we receive your 
request, unless we disapprove your re-
quest. We may approve a shorter time 
or waive this requirement. 

(b) If your requested change would 
not decrease the specified mainte-
nance, you may distribute the new 
maintenance instructions anytime 
after you send your request. For exam-
ple, this paragraph (b) would cover add-
ing instructions to increase the fre-
quency of a maintenance step for en-
gines in severe-duty applications. 

(c) You need not request approval if 
you are making only minor corrections 
(such as correcting typographical mis-
takes), clarifying your maintenance in-
structions, or changing instructions for 
maintenance unrelated to emission 
control. 

§ 1039.225 How do I amend my applica-
tion for certification to include new 
or modified engines or to change an 
FEL? 

Before we issue you a certificate of 
conformity, you may amend your ap-
plication to include new or modified 
engine configurations, subject to the 
provisions of this section. After we 
have issued your certificate of con-
formity, you may send us an amended 

application requesting that we include 
new or modified engine configurations 
within the scope of the certificate, sub-
ject to the provisions of this section. 
You must amend your application if 
any changes occur with respect to any 
information included in your applica-
tion. 

(a) You must amend your application 
before you take either of the following 
actions: 

(1) Add an engine (that is, an addi-
tional engine configuration) to an en-
gine family. In this case, the engine 
added must be consistent with other 
engines in the engine family with re-
spect to the criteria listed in § 1039.230. 

(2) Change an engine already included 
in an engine family in a way that may 
affect emissions, or change any of the 
components you described in your ap-
plication for certification. This in-
cludes production and design changes 
that may affect emissions any time 
during the engine’s lifetime. 

(3) Modify an FEL for an engine fam-
ily, as described in paragraph (f) of this 
section. 

(b) To amend your application for 
certification, send the Designated 
Compliance Officer the following infor-
mation: 

(1) Describe in detail the addition or 
change in the engine model or configu-
ration you intend to make. 

(2) Include engineering evaluations or 
data showing that the amended engine 
family complies with all applicable re-
quirements. You may do this by show-
ing that the original emission-data en-
gine is still appropriate with respect to 
showing compliance of the amended 
family with all applicable require-
ments. 

(3) If the original emission-data en-
gine for the engine family is not appro-
priate to show compliance for the new 
or modified nonroad engine, include 
new test data showing that the new or 
modified nonroad engine meets the re-
quirements of this part. 

(c) We may ask for more test data or 
engineering evaluations. You must give 
us these within 30 days after we request 
them. 

(d) For engine families already cov-
ered by a certificate of conformity, we 
will determine whether the existing 
certificate of conformity covers your 
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