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Environmental Protection Agency § 26.1116 

§ 26.1115 IRB records. 
(a) An IRB shall prepare and main-

tain adequate documentation of IRB 
activities, including the following: 

(1) Copies of all research proposals re-
viewed, scientific evaluations, if any, 
that accompany the proposals, ap-
proved sample consent documents, 
progress reports submitted by inves-
tigators, and reports of injuries to sub-
jects. 

(2) Minutes of IRB meetings which 
shall be in sufficient detail to show at-
tendance at the meetings; actions 
taken by the IRB; the vote on these ac-
tions including the number of members 
voting for, against, and abstaining; the 
basis for requiring changes in or dis-
approving research; and a written sum-
mary of the discussion of controverted 
issues and their resolution. 

(3) Records of continuing review ac-
tivities. 

(4) Copies of all correspondence be-
tween the IRB and the investigators. 

(5) A list of IRB members identified 
by name; earned degrees; representa-
tive capacity; indications of experience 
such as board certifications, licenses, 
etc., sufficient to describe each mem-
ber’s chief anticipated contributions to 
IRB deliberations; and any employ-
ment or other relationship between 
each member and the institution, for 
example, full-time employee, a member 
of governing panel or board, stock-
holder, paid or unpaid consultant. 

(6) Written procedures for the IRB in 
the same detail as described in 
§ 26.1108(a) and § 26.1108(b). 

(7) Statements of significant new 
findings provided to subjects, as re-
quired by § 26.1116(b)(5). 

(b) The records required by this sub-
part shall be retained for at least 3 
years, and records relating to research 
which is conducted shall be retained 
for at least 3 years after completion of 
the research. All records shall be acces-
sible for inspection and copying by au-
thorized representatives of EPA at rea-
sonable times and in a reasonable man-
ner. 

§ 26.1116 General requirements for in-
formed consent. 

No investigator may involve a human 
being as a subject in research covered 
by this subpart unless the investigator 

has obtained the legally effective in-
formed consent of the subject or the 
subject’s legally authorized representa-
tive. An investigator shall seek such 
consent only under circumstances that 
provide the prospective subject or the 
representative sufficient opportunity 
to consider whether or not to partici-
pate and that minimize the possibility 
of coercion or undue influence. The in-
formation that is given to the subject 
or the representative shall be in lan-
guage understandable to the subject or 
the representative. No informed con-
sent, whether oral or written, may in-
clude any exculpatory language 
through which the subject or the rep-
resentative is made to waive or appear 
to waive any of the subject’s legal 
rights, or releases or appears to release 
the investigator, the sponsor, the insti-
tution or its agents from liability for 
negligence. 

(a) Basic elements of informed con-
sent. In seeking informed consent the 
following information shall be provided 
to each subject: 

(1) A statement that the study in-
volves research, an explanation of the 
purposes of the research and the ex-
pected duration of the subject’s partici-
pation, a description of the procedures 
to be followed, and identification of 
any procedures which are experi-
mental; 

(2) A description of any reasonably 
foreseeable risks or discomforts to the 
subject; 

(3) A description of any benefits to 
the subject or to others which may rea-
sonably be expected from the research; 

(4) A disclosure of appropriate alter-
native procedures or courses of treat-
ment, if any, that might be advan-
tageous to the subject; 

(5) A statement describing the ex-
tent, if any, to which confidentiality of 
records identifying the subject will be 
maintained; 

(6) For research involving more than 
minimal risk, an explanation as to 
whether any compensation and an ex-
planation as to whether any medical 
treatments are available if injury oc-
curs and, if so, what they consist of, or 
where further information may be ob-
tained; 

(7) An explanation of whom to con-
tact for answers to pertinent questions 
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