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 “Lion Taming” Author Steve Katz Will Speak to Federal 
Communicators 

Washington, DC--Steven Katz, author of “Lion Taming: Working Successfully with 
Leaders, Bosses, and other Tough Customers,” will conduct a free workshop for federal 
communicators and clients of Treasury’s Federal Consulting Group on April 20, 2005. 

The workshop, co-sponsored by FCG and the Federal Communicators Network, will run 
from 8:30 a.m. - noon in the Amphitheater, 1700 G St., NW, Washington, DC. A 
continental breakfast will be available at 8:30 a.m.  

“This is a return visit for Steve Katz,” said Anne Kelly, CEO of the Federal Consulting 
Group. “He was featured at the quarterly meeting of federal executive coaches in January 
and he was a real hit. We wanted to bring him back.” 

 “Comparing yourself to a lion tamer will help you deal with the strong and powerful 
around you,” Katz says on his Website. “Lion Taming is everyone's real job of working 
with people who wield power and influence around us — leaders, bosses, customers, 
clients, employees, and others.” 

Steven L. Katz worked for more than twenty years as a right-hand executive and senior 
advisor to leaders and executives across the worlds of business, non-profit organizations, 
politics, and government, including serving as legal counsel to Senator John Glenn. He 
has degrees in anthropology, history, and law. He lives with his family outside 
Washington, D.C.  Steve Katz http://www.liontaming.com/about/index.cfm  

The Federal Consulting Group, a fee-for-service franchise in the Department of the 
Treasury, works with federal agencies to transform public service. FCG collaborates with 
senior leaders to create a citizen-centered, results-oriented government and facilitates the 
sharing of best practices from the public and private sectors. FCG http://www.fcg.gov  

The Federal Communicators Network, organized in 1996, has almost 800 members in 
agencies all over the country. Membership is open to communicators in all branches of 
government. An affiliate membership is open to reporters, corporate communicators, and 
others in the private sector whose professional activities support the work of the Network. 
To join, go to http://www.fcn.gov/members/join.htm . 
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