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accordance with regulations promul-
gated by the Small Business Adminis-
tration (see secs. 304 and 305 of the 
Small Business Investment Act of 1958, 
as amended (15 U.S.C. 684, 685)). 
On the other hand, if such a company 
violates or fails to comply with any of 
the provisions of the Small Business 
Investment Act of 1958, as amended, or 
the regulations thereunder, or ceases 
to be actively engaged in the business 
of providing funds to small business 
concerns in the manner provided in 
subparagraph (2) of this paragraph, it 
will not be considered to have over-
come the presumption by reason of any 
rules provided in this paragraph. 

[T.D. 6500, 25 FR 11737, Nov. 26, 1960, as 
amended by T.D. 6652, 28 FR 4786, May 14, 
1963] 

§ 1.533–2 Statement required. 
The corporation may be required to 

furnish a statement of its accumulated 
earnings and profits, the payment of 
dividends, the name and address of, and 
number of shares held by, each of its 
shareholders, the amounts that would 
be payable to each of the shareholders 
if the income of the corporation were 
distributed and other information re-
quired under section 6042. 

§ 1.534–1 Burden of proof as to unrea-
sonable accumulations generally. 

For purposes of applying the pre-
sumption provided for in section 533(a) 
and in determining the extent of the 
accumulated earnings credit under sec-
tion 535(c)(1), the burden of proof with 
respect to an allegation by the Com-
missioner that all or any part of the 
earnings and profits of the corporation 
have been permitted to accumulate be-
yond the reasonable needs of the busi-
ness may vary under section 534 as be-
tween litigation in the Tax Court and 
that in any other court. In case of a 
proceeding in a court other than the 
Tax Court, see paragraph (b) of § 1.533– 
1. 

§ 1.534–2 Burden of proof as to unrea-
sonable accumulations in cases be-
fore the Tax Court. 

(a) Burden of proof on Commissioner. 
Under the general rule provided in sec-
tion 534(a), in any proceeding before 
the Tax Court involving a notice of de-

ficiency based in whole or in part on 
the allegation that all or any part of 
the earnings and profits have been per-
mitted to accumulate beyond the rea-
sonable needs of the business, the bur-
den of proof with respect to such alle-
gation is upon the Commissioner if: 

(1) A notification, as provided for in 
section 534(b) and paragraph (c) of this 
section, has not been sent to the tax-
payer; or 

(2) A notification, as provided for in 
section 534(b) and paragraph (c) of this 
section, has been sent to the taxpayer 
and, in response to such notification, 
the taxpayer has submitted a state-
ment, as provided in section 534(c) and 
paragraph (d) of this section, setting 
forth the ground or grounds (together 
with facts sufficient to show the basis 
thereof) on which it relies to establish 
that all or any part of its earnings and 
profits have not been permitted to ac-
cumulate beyond the reasonable needs 
of the business. However, the burden of 
proof in the latter case is upon the 
Commissioner only with respect to the 
relevant ground or grounds set forth in 
the statement submitted by the tax-
payer, and only if such ground or 
grounds are supported by facts (con-
tained in the statement) sufficient to 
show the basis thereof. 

(b) Burden of proof on the taxpayer. 
The burden of proof in a Tax Court pro-
ceeding with respect to an allegation 
that all or any part of the earnings and 
profits have been permitted to accumu-
late beyond the reasonable needs of the 
business is upon the taxpayer if: 

(1) A notification, as provided for in 
section 534(b) and paragraph (c) of this 
section, has been sent to the taxpayer 
and the taxpayer has not submitted a 
statement, in response to such notifi-
cation, as provided in section 534(c) and 
paragraph (d) of this section; or 

(2) A statement has been submitted 
by the taxpayer in response to such no-
tification, but the ground or grounds 
on which the taxpayer relies are not 
relevant to the allegation or, if rel-
evant, the statement does not contain 
facts sufficient to show the basis there-
of. 

(c) Notification to the taxpayer. Under 
section 534(b) a notification informing 
the taxpayer that the proposed notice 
of deficiency includes an amount with 
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