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(b) For purposes of determining the 
period or periods over which the liabil-
ity of the taxpayer exists, and for pur-
poses of allocating prepaid dues income 
to such periods, the taxpayer may ag-
gregate similar transactions during the 
taxable year in any reasonable manner, 
provided the method of aggregation 
and allocation is consistently followed. 

[T.D. 6937, 32 FR 16395, Nov. 30, 1967] 

§ 1.456–4 Cessation of liability or exist-
ence. 

(a) If a taxpayer has elected to apply 
the provisions of section 456 to a trade 
or business in connection with which 
prepaid dues income is received, and if 
the taxpayer’s liability to render serv-
ices or make available membership 
privileges ends for any reason, as for 
example, because of the cancellation of 
a membership then so much of the pre-
paid dues income attributable to such 
liability as was not includible in the 
taxpayer’s gross income under section 
456 for preceding taxable years shall be 
included in gross income for the tax-
able year in which such liability ends. 
This paragraph shall not apply to 
amounts includible in gross income 
under § 1.456–7. 

(b) If a taxpayer which has elected to 
apply the provisions of section 456 
ceases to exist, then the prepaid dues 
income which was not includible in 
gross income under section 456 for pre-
ceding taxable years shall be included 
in the taxpayer’s gross income for the 
taxable year in which such cessation of 
existence occurs. This paragraph shall 
not apply to amounts includible in 
gross income under § 1.456–7. 

(c) If a taxpayer is a party to a trans-
action to which section 381(a) applies 
and the taxpayer’s method of account-
ing with respect to prepaid dues in-
come is used by the acquiring corpora-
tion under the provisions of section 
381(c)(4), then neither the liability nor 
the existence of the taxpayer shall be 
deemed to have ended or ceased. In 
such cases see section 381(c)(4) and the 
regulations thereunder for the treat-
ment of the portion of prepaid dues in-
come which was not included in gross 
income under section 456 for preceding 
taxable years. 

[T.D. 6937, 32 FR 16395, Nov. 30, 1967] 

§ 1.456–5 Definitions and other rules. 
(a) Prepaid dues income. (1) The term 

‘‘prepaid dues income’’ means any 
amount for membership dues includible 
in gross income which is received by a 
membership organization in connec-
tion with, and is directly attributable 
to, a liability of the taxpayer to render 
services or make available membership 
privileges over a period of time which 
extends beyond the close of the taxable 
year in which such amount is received. 

(2) For purposes of section 456, pre-
paid dues income does not include 
amounts received by a taxpayer in con-
nection with sales of memberships on a 
prepaid basis where the taxpayer does 
not have the liability to furnish the 
services or make available the mem-
bership privileges. For example, where 
a taxpayer has a contract with several 
membership organizations to sell mem-
berships in such organizations and re-
tains a portion of the amounts received 
from the sale of such memberships and 
remits the balance to the membership 
organizations, the amounts retained by 
such taxpayer represent commissions 
and do not constitute prepaid dues in-
come for purposes of section 456. 

(b) Liability. The term ‘‘liability’’ 
means a liability of the taxpayer to 
render services or make available 
membership privileges over a period of 
time which does not exceed 36 months. 
Thus, if during the taxable year a tax-
payer sells memberships for more than 
36 months and also memberships for 36 
months or less, section 456 does not 
apply to the income from the sale of 
memberships for more than 36 months. 
For the purpose of determining the du-
ration of a liability, a bona fide re-
newal of a membership shall not be 
considered to be a part of the existing 
membership. 

(c) Membership organization. (1) The 
term ‘‘membership organization’’ means 
a corporation, association, federation, 
or other similar organization meeting 
the following requirements: 

(i) It is organized without capital 
stock of any kind. 

(ii) Its charter, bylaws, or other writ-
ten agreement or contract expressly 
prohibits the distribution of any part 
of the net earnings directly or indi-
rectly, in money, property, or services, 
to any member, and 
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