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mobility services for individuals who 
are blind. 

(l) Job-related services, including job 
search and placement assistance, job 
retention services, follow-up services, 
and follow-along services. 

(m) Supported employment services 
in accordance with the definition of 
that term in § 361.5(b)(54). 

(n) Personal assistance services in ac-
cordance with the definition of that 
term in § 361.5(b)(39). 

(o) Post-employment services in ac-
cordance with the definition of that 
term in § 361.5(b)(42). 

(p) Occupational licenses, tools, 
equipment, initial stocks, and supplies. 

(q) Rehabilitation technology in ac-
cordance with the definition of that 
term in § 361.5(b)(45), including vehic-
ular modification, telecommuni-
cations, sensory, and other techno-
logical aids and devices. 

(r) Transition services in accordance 
with the definition of that term in 
§ 361.5(b)(55). 

(s) Technical assistance and other 
consultation services to conduct mar-
ket analyses, develop business plans, 
and otherwise provide resources, to the 
extent those resources are authorized 
to be provided through the statewide 
workforce investment system, to eligi-
ble individuals who are pursuing self-
employment or telecommuting or es-
tablishing a small business operation 
as an employment outcome. 

(t) Other goods and services deter-
mined necessary for the individual 
with a disability to achieve an employ-
ment outcome. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 1820–0500) 

(Authority: Section 103(a) of the Act; 29 
U.S.C. 723(a)) 

[66 FR 4382, Jan. 17, 2001, as amended at 66 
FR 7253, Jan. 22, 2001]

§ 361.49 Scope of vocational rehabilita-
tion services for groups of individ-
uals with disabilities. 

(a) The designated State unit may 
also provide for the following voca-
tional rehabilitation services for the 
benefit of groups of individuals with 
disabilities: 

(1) The establishment, development, 
or improvement of a public or other 
nonprofit community rehabilitation 

program that is used to provide voca-
tional rehabilitation services that pro-
mote integration and competitive em-
ployment, including, under special cir-
cumstances, the construction of a facil-
ity for a public or nonprofit commu-
nity rehabilitation program. Examples 
of ‘‘special circumstances’’ include the 
destruction by natural disaster of the 
only available center serving an area 
or a State determination that con-
struction is necessary in a rural area 
because no other public agencies or pri-
vate nonprofit organizations are cur-
rently able to provide vocational reha-
bilitation services to individuals. 

(2) Telecommunications systems that 
have the potential for substantially 
improving vocational rehabilitation 
service delivery methods and devel-
oping appropriate programming to 
meet the particular needs of individ-
uals with disabilities, including tele-
phone, television, video description 
services, satellite, tactile-vibratory de-
vices, and similar systems, as appro-
priate. 

(3) Special services to provide non-
visual access to information for indi-
viduals who are blind, including the 
use of telecommunications, Braille, 
sound recordings, or other appropriate 
media; captioned television, films, or 
video cassettes for individuals who are 
deaf or hard of hearing; tactile mate-
rials for individuals who are deaf-blind; 
and other special services that provide 
information through tactile, vibratory, 
auditory, and visual media. 

(4) Technical assistance and support 
services to businesses that are not sub-
ject to Title I of the Americans with 
Disabilities Act of 1990 and that are 
seeking to employ individuals with dis-
abilities. 

(5) In the case of any small business 
enterprise operated by individuals with 
significant disabilities under the super-
vision of the designated State unit, in-
cluding enterprises established under 
the Randolph-Sheppard program, man-
agement services and supervision pro-
vided by the State unit along with the 
acquisition by the State unit of vend-
ing facilities or other equipment, ini-
tial stocks and supplies, and initial op-
erating expenses, in accordance with 
the following requirements:
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(i) ‘‘Management services and super-
vision’’ includes inspection, quality 
control, consultation, accounting, reg-
ulating, in-service training, and related 
services provided on a systematic basis 
to support and improve small business 
enterprises operated by individuals 
with significant disabilities. ‘‘Manage-
ment services and supervision’’ may be 
provided throughout the operation of 
the small business enterprise. 

(ii) ‘‘Initial stocks and supplies’’ in-
cludes those items necessary to the es-
tablishment of a new business enter-
prise during the initial establishment 
period, which may not exceed 6 
months. 

(iii) Costs of establishing a small 
business enterprise may include oper-
ational costs during the initial estab-
lishment period, which may not exceed 
6 months. 

(iv) If the designated State unit pro-
vides for these services, it must ensure 
that only individuals with significant 
disabilities will be selected to partici-
pate in this supervised program. 

(v) If the designated State unit pro-
vides for these services and chooses to 
set aside funds from the proceeds of the 
operation of the small business enter-
prises, the State unit must maintain a 
description of the methods used in set-
ting aside funds and the purposes for 
which funds are set aside. Funds may 
be used only for small business enter-
prises purposes, and benefits that are 
provided to operators from set-aside 
funds must be provided on an equitable 
basis. 

(6) Other services that promise to 
contribute substantially to the reha-
bilitation of a group of individuals but 
that are not related directly to the in-
dividualized plan for employment of 
any one individual. Examples of those 
other services might include the pur-
chase or lease of a bus to provide trans-
portation to a group of applicants or 
eligible individuals or the purchase of 
equipment or instructional materials 
that would benefit a group of appli-
cants or eligible individuals. 

(7) Consultative and technical assist-
ance services to assist educational 
agencies in planning for the transition 
of students with disabilities from 
school to post-school activities, includ-
ing employment. 

(b) If the designated State unit pro-
vides for vocational rehabilitation 
services for groups of individuals, it 
must— 

(1) Develop and maintain written 
policies covering the nature and scope 
of each of the vocational rehabilitation 
services it provides and the criteria 
under which each service is provided; 
and 

(2) Maintain information to ensure 
the proper and efficient administration 
of those services in the form and detail 
and at the time required by the Sec-
retary, including the types of services 
provided, the costs of those services, 
and, to the extent feasible, estimates of 
the numbers of individuals benefiting 
from those services. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 1820–0500) 

(Authority: Sections 12(c), 101(a)(6)(A), and 
103(b) of the Act; 29 U.S.C. 709(c), 721(a)(6), 
and 723(b)) 

[66 FR 4382, Jan. 17, 2001, as amended at 66 
FR 7253, Jan. 22, 2001]

§ 361.50 Written policies governing the 
provision of services for individuals 
with disabilities. 

(a) Policies. The State unit must de-
velop and maintain written policies 
covering the nature and scope of each 
of the vocational rehabilitation serv-
ices specified in § 361.48 and the criteria 
under which each service is provided. 
The policies must ensure that the pro-
vision of services is based on the reha-
bilitation needs of each individual as 
identified in that individual’s IPE and 
is consistent with the individual’s in-
formed choice. The written policies 
may not establish any arbitrary limits 
on the nature and scope of vocational 
rehabilitation services to be provided 
to the individual to achieve an employ-
ment outcome. The policies must be 
developed in accordance with the fol-
lowing provisions: 

(b) Out-of-State services. 
(1) The State unit may establish a 

preference for in-State services, pro-
vided that the preference does not ef-
fectively deny an individual a nec-
essary service. If the individual chooses 
an out-of-State service at a higher cost
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