
851

Federal Motor Carrier Safety Administration, DOT Pt. 382

(c) Pilot programs must, at a min-
imum, include all of the program ele-
ments listed in § 381.505. 

(d) The FMCSA will publish in the 
FEDERAL REGISTER a detailed descrip-
tion of each pilot program, including 
the exemptions to be considered, and 
provide notice and an opportunity for 
public comment before the effective 
date of the pilot program.

§ 381.505 What are the minimum ele-
ments required for a pilot program? 

(a) Safety measures. Before granting 
exemptions for a pilot program, the 
FMCSA will ensure that the safety 
measures in a pilot program are de-
signed to achieve a level of safety that 
is equivalent to, or greater than, the 
level of safety that would be achieved 
by complying with the regulations. 

(b) Pilot program plan. Before initi-
ating a pilot program, the FMCSA will 
ensure that there is a pilot program 
plan which includes the following ele-
ments: 

(1) A scheduled duration of three 
years or less; 

(2) A specific data collection and 
safety analysis plan that identifies a 
method of comparing the safety per-
formance for motor carriers, CMVs, 
and drivers operating under the terms 
and conditions of the pilot program, 
with the safety performance of motor 
carriers, CMVs, and drivers that com-
ply with the regulation; 

(3) A reasonable number of partici-
pants necessary to yield statistically 
valid findings; 

(4) A monitoring plan to ensure that 
participants comply with the terms 
and conditions of participation in the 
pilot program; 

(5) Adequate safeguards to protect 
the health and safety of study partici-
pants and the general public; and 

(6) A plan to inform the States and 
the public about the pilot program and 
to identify approved participants to en-
forcement personnel and the general 
public.

§ 381.510 May the FMCSA end a pilot 
program before its scheduled com-
pletion date? 

The FMCSA will immediately termi-
nate a pilot program if there is reason 
to believe the program is not achieving 

a level of safety that is at least equiva-
lent to the level of safety that would be 
achieved by complying with the regula-
tions.

§ 381.515 May the FMCSA remove ap-
proved participants from a pilot 
program? 

The Administrator will immediately 
revoke participation in a pilot program 
of a motor carrier, CMV, or driver for 
failure to comply with the terms and 
conditions of the pilot program, or if 
continued participation is inconsistent 
with the goals and objectives of the 
safety regulations.

§ 381.520 What will the FMCSA do with 
the results from a pilot program? 

At the conclusion of each pilot pro-
gram, the FMCSA will report to Con-
gress the findings and conclusions of 
the program and any recommendations 
it considers appropriate, including sug-
gested amendments to laws and regula-
tions that would enhance motor car-
rier, CMV, and driver safety and im-
prove compliance with the FMCSRs.

Subpart F—Preemption of State 
Rules

§ 381.600 Do waivers, exemptions, and 
pilot programs preempt State laws 
and regulations? 

Yes. During the time period that a 
waiver, exemption, or pilot program 
authorized by this part is in effect, no 
State shall enforce any law or regula-
tion that conflicts with or is incon-
sistent with the waiver, exemption, or 
pilot program with respect to a person 
operating under the waiver or exemp-
tion or participating in the pilot pro-
gram.
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