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or repaired. (See appendix B of this 
part.)

STEAM PIPES

§ 230.62 Dry pipe. 

Dry pipes subject to pressure shall be 
examined at each annual inspection to 
measure wall thickness. Dry pipes with 
wall thickness reduced below that re-
quired to render the pipe suitable for 
the service intended at the MAWP 
must be replaced or repaired.

§ 230.63 Smoke box, steam pipes and 
pressure parts. 

The smoke box, steam pipes and pres-
sure parts shall be inspected at each 
annual inspection, or any other time 
that conditions warrant. The indi-
vidual conducting the inspection must 
enter the smoke box to conduct the in-
spection, looking for signs of leaks 
from any of the pressure parts therein 
and examining all draft appliances.

STEAM LEAKS

§ 230.64 Leaks under lagging. 

The steam locomotive owner and/or 
operator shall take out of service at 
once any boiler that has developed a 
leak under the lagging due to a crack 
in the shell, or to any other condition 
which may reduce safety. Pursuant to 
§ 230.29, the boiler must be repaired be-
fore being returned to service.

§ 230.65 Steam blocking view of engine 
crew. 

The steam locomotive owner and/or 
operator shall keep the boiler, and its 
piping and appurtenances, in such re-
pair that they do not emit steam in a 
manner that obscures the engine crew’s 
vision.

Subpart C—Steam Locomotives 
and Tenders

§ 230.66 Design, construction, and 
maintenance. 

The steam locomotive owner and op-
erator are responsible for the general 
design, construction and maintenance 
of the steam locomotives and tenders 
under their control.

§ 230.67 Responsibility for inspection 
and repairs. 

The steam locomotive owner and/or 
operator shall inspect and repair all 
steam locomotives and tenders under 
their control. All defects disclosed by 
any inspection shall be repaired in ac-
cordance with accepted industry stand-
ards, which may include established 
railroad practices, before the steam lo-
comotive or tender is returned to serv-
ice. The steam locomotive owner and/
or operator shall not return the steam 
locomotive or tender to service unless 
they are in good condition and safe and 
suitable for service.

SPEED INDICATORS

§ 230.68 Speed indicators. 
Steam locomotives that operate at 

speeds in excess of 20 miles per hour 
over the general system of railroad 
transportation shall be equipped with 
speed indicators. Where equipped, 
speed indicators shall be maintained to 
ensure accurate functioning.

ASH PANS

§ 230.69 Ash pans. 
Ash pans shall be securely supported 

from mud-rings or frames with no part 
less than 21⁄2 inches above the rail. 
Their operating mechanism shall be so 
arranged that they may be safely oper-
ated and securely closed.

BRAKE AND SIGNAL EQUIPMENT

§ 230.70 Safe condition. 
(a) Pre-departure inspection. At the be-

ginning of each day the locomotive is 
used, the steam locomotive operator 
shall ensure that: 

(1) The brakes on the steam loco-
motive and tender are in safe and suit-
able condition for service; 

(2) The air compressor or compres-
sors are in condition to provide an 
ample supply of air for the locomotive 
service intended; 

(3) The devices for regulating all 
pressures are properly performing their 
functions; 

(4) The brake valves work properly in 
all positions; and 

(5) The water has been drained from 
the air-brake system. 
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