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§ 213.241 Inspection records. 
(a) Each owner of track to which this 

part applies shall keep a record of each 
inspection required to be performed on 
that track under this subpart. 

(b) Each record of an inspection 
under §§ 213.4, 213.233, and 213.235 shall 
be prepared on the day the inspection 
is made and signed by the person mak-
ing the inspection. Records shall speci-
fy the track inspected, date of inspec-
tion, location and nature of any devi-
ation from the requirements of this 
part, and the remedial action taken by 
the person making the inspection. The 
owner shall designate the location(s) 
where each original record shall be 
maintained for at least one year after 
the inspection covered by the record. 
The owner shall also designate one lo-
cation, within 100 miles of each state in 
which they conduct operations, where 
copies of records which apply to those 
operations are either maintained or 
can be viewed following 10 days notice 
by the Federal Railroad Administra-
tion. 

(c) Rail inspection records shall 
specify the date of inspection, the loca-
tion and nature of any internal defects 
found, the remedial action taken and 
the date thereof, and the location of 
any intervals of track not tested per 
§ 213.237(d). The owner shall retain a 
rail inspection record for at least two 
years after the inspection and for one 
year after remedial action is taken. 

(d) Each owner required to keep in-
spection records under this section 
shall make those records available for 
inspection and copying by the Federal 
Railroad Administration. 

(e) For purposes of compliance with 
the requirements of this section, an 
owner of track may maintain and 
transfer records through electronic 
transmission, storage, and retrieval 
provided that— 

(1) The electronic system be designed 
so that the integrity of each record is 
maintained through appropriate levels 
of security such as recognition of an 
electronic signature, or other means, 
which uniquely identify the initiating 
person as the author of that record. No 
two persons shall have the same elec-
tronic identity; 

(2) The electronic storage of each 
record shall be initiated by the person 

making the inspection within 24 hours 
following the completion of that in-
spection; 

(3) The electronic system shall en-
sure that each record cannot be modi-
fied in any way, or replaced, once the 
record is transmitted and stored; 

(4) Any amendment to a record shall 
be electronically stored apart from the 
record which it amends. Each amend-
ment to a record shall be uniquely 
identified as to the person making the 
amendment; 

(5) The electronic system shall pro-
vide for the maintenance of inspection 
records as originally submitted with-
out corruption or loss of data; 

(6) Paper copies of electronic records 
and amendments to those records, that 
may be necessary to document compli-
ance with this part shall be made avail-
able for inspection and copying by the 
Federal Railroad Administration at the 
locations specified in paragraph (b) of 
this section; and 

(7) Track inspection records shall be 
kept available to persons who per-
formed the inspections and to persons 
performing subsequent inspections.

Subpart G—Train Operations at 
Track Classes 6 and Higher

§ 213.301 Scope of subpart. 

This subpart applies to all track used 
for the operation of trains at a speed 
greater than 90 m.p.h. for passenger 
equipment and greater than 80 m.p.h. 
for freight equipment.

§ 213.303 Responsibility for compli-
ance. 

(a) Any owner of track to which this 
subpart applies who knows or has no-
tice that the track does not comply 
with the requirements of this subpart, 
shall— 

(1) Bring the track into compliance; 
or 

(2) Halt operations over that track. 
(b) If an owner of track to which this 

subpart applies assigns responsibility 
for the track to another person (by 
lease or otherwise), notification of the 
assignment shall be provided to the ap-
propriate FRA Regional Office at least 
30 days in advance of the assignment. 
The notification may be made by any 
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