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(d) Withdrawal of notification. A DoD 
employee may withdraw written notice 
under paragraphs (a), (b) or (c) of this 
section upon deciding that disqualifica-
tion from participation in the matter 
is no longer required.

§ 3601.106 Limitation on solicited 
sales. 

A DoD employee shall not knowingly 
solicit or make solicited sales to DoD 
personnel who are junior in rank, grade 
or position, or to the family members 
of such personnel, on or off duty. In the 
absence of coercion or intimidation, 
this does not prohibit the sale or lease 
of a DoD employee’s noncommercial 
personal or real property or commer-
cial sales solicited and made in a retail 
establishment during off-duty employ-
ment. The posting of an advertisement 
in accordance with Federal building 
management policies does not con-
stitute solicitation for purposes of this 
section.

§ 3601.107 Prior approval for outside 
employment and business activities. 

(a) A DoD employee, other than a 
special Government employee, who is 
required to file a financial disclosure 
report (SF 450 or SF 278) shall obtain 
written approval from the agency des-
ignee before engaging in a business ac-
tivity or compensated outside employ-
ment with a prohibited source, unless 
general approval has been given in ac-
cordance with paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion. Approval shall be granted unless 
a determination is made that the busi-
ness activity or compensated outside 
employment is expected to involve con-
duct prohibited by statute or regula-
tion. For purposes of this section, the 
following definitions apply: 

(1) Business activity. Any business, 
contractual or other financial relation-
ship not involving the provision of per-
sonal services by the DoD employee. It 
does not include a routine commercial 
transaction or the purchase of an asset 
or interest, such as common stock, 
that is available to the general public; 

(2) Employment. Any form of non-Fed-
eral employment or business relation-
ship involving the provision of personal 
services by the DoD employee. It in-
cludes, but is not limited to, personal 
services as an officer, director, em-

ployee, agent, attorney, consultant, 
contractor, general partner or trustee; 
and 

(3) Prohibited source. See 5 CFR 
2635.203(d) (modified by the separate 
DoD component agency designations in 
§ 3601.102 of this part). 

(b) The DoD component designated 
agency ethics official or designee may, 
by a written notice, exempt categories 
of business activities or employment 
from the requirement of paragraph (a) 
of this section, for prior approval based 
on a determination that business ac-
tivities or employment within those 
categories would generally be approved 
and are not likely to involve conduct 
prohibited by statute or regulation.

§ 3601.108 Disclaimer for speeches and 
writings devoted to agency matters. 

A DoD employee who uses or permits 
the use of his military rank or who in-
cludes or permits the inclusion of his 
title or position as one of several bio-
graphical details given to identify him-
self in connection with teaching, 
speaking or writing, in accordance 
with 5 CFR 2635.807(b), shall make a 
disclaimer if the subject of the teach-
ing, speaking or writing deals in sig-
nificant part with any ongoing or an-
nounced policy, program or operation 
of the DoD employee’s agency, as de-
fined in § 3601.102, and the DoD em-
ployee has not been authorized by ap-
propriate agency authority to present 
that material as the agency’s position. 
The disclaimer shall be made as fol-
lows: 

(a) The required disclaimer shall ex-
pressly state that the views presented 
are those of the speaker or author and 
do not necessarily represent the views 
of DoD or its components. 

(b) Where a disclaimer is required for 
an article, book or other writing, the 
disclaimer will be printed in a reason-
ably prominent position in the writing 
itself. 

(c) Where a disclaimer is required for 
a speech or other oral presentation, the 
disclaimer may be given orally pro-
vided it is given at the beginning of the 
oral presentation.

VerDate Dec<13>2002 13:02 Feb 12, 2003 Jkt 200009 PO 00000 Frm 00689 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\200009T.XXX 200009T


