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similar serial or series equipment, 
from the contractor’s accounting 
records. When such costs cannot be so 
determined, the contracting agency 
may specify the use of a particular 
schedule of predetermined rates or any 
part thereof to determine ownership 
and operating costs of construction 
equipment (see subdivisions (d)(2)(i)(B) 
and (C) of this section). However, costs 
otherwise unallowable under this part 
shall not become allowable through the 
use of any schedule (see 31.109(c)). For 
example, schedules need to be adjusted 
for Government contract costing pur-
poses if they are based on replacement 
cost, include unallowable interest 
costs, or use improper cost of money 
rates or computations. Contracting of-
ficers should review the computations 
and factors included within the speci-
fied schedule and ensure that unallow-
able or unacceptably computed factors 
are not allowed in cost submissions. 

(B) Predetermined schedules of con-
struction equipment use rates (e.g., the 
Construction Equipment Ownership 
and Operating Expense Schedule pub-
lished by the U.S. Army Corps of Engi-
neers, industry sponsored construction 
equipment cost guides, or commer-
cially published schedules of construc-
tion equipment use cost) provide aver-
age ownership and operating rates for 
construction equipment. The allowance 
for ownership costs should include the 
cost of depreciation and may include 
facilities capital cost of money. The al-
lowance for operating costs may in-
clude costs for such items as fuel, fil-
ters, oil, and grease; servicing, repairs, 
and maintenance; and tire wear and re-
pair. Costs of labor, mobilization, de-
mobilization, overhead, and profit are 
generally not reflected in schedules, 
and separate consideration may be nec-
essary. 

(C) When a schedule of predetermined 
use rates for construction equipment is 
used to determine direct costs, all 
costs of equipment that are included in 
the cost allowances provided by the 
schedule shall be identified and elimi-
nated from the contractor’s other di-
rect and indirect costs charged to the 
contract. If the contractor’s account-
ing system provides for site or home of-
fice overhead allocations, all costs 
which are included in the equipment 

allowances may need to be included in 
any cost input base before computing 
the contractor’s overhead rate. In peri-
ods of suspension of work pursuant to a 
contract clause, the allowance for 
equipment ownership shall not exceed 
an amount for standby cost as deter-
mined by the schedule or contract pro-
vision. 

(ii) Reasonable costs of renting con-
struction equipment are allowable (but 
see paragraph (C) below). 

(A) Costs, such as maintenance and 
minor or running repairs incident to 
operating such rented equipment, that 
are not included in the rental rate are 
allowable. 

(B) Costs incident to major repair 
and overhaul of rental equipment are 
unallowable. 

(C) The allowability of charges for 
construction equipment rented from 
any division, subsidiary, or organiza-
tion under common control, will be de-
termined in accordance with 31.205–
36(b)(3). 

(3) Costs incurred at the job site inci-
dent to performing the work, such as 
the cost of superintendence, 
timekeeping and clerical work, engi-
neering, utility costs, supplies, mate-
rial handling, restoration and cleanup, 
etc., are allowable as direct or indirect 
costs, provided the accounting practice 
used is in accordance with the contrac-
tor’s established and consistently fol-
lowed cost accounting practices for all 
work. 

(4) Rental and any other costs, less 
any applicable credits incurred in ac-
quiring the temporary use of land, 
structures, and facilities are allowable. 
Costs, less any applicable credits, in-
curred in constructing or fabricating 
structures and facilities of a temporary 
nature are allowable. 

[48 FR 42301, Sept. 19, 1983, as amended at 50 
FR 23607, June 4, 1985; 52 FR 19804, May 27, 
1987; 62 FR 51271, Sept. 30, 1997]

31.106 Facilities contracts.

31.106–1 Applicable cost principles. 

The cost principles and procedures 
applicable to the evaluation and deter-
mination of costs under facilities con-
tracts (as defined in 45.301), and sub-
contracts thereunder, will be governed 
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