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48 CFR Ch. 1 (10–1–02 Edition)27.101

Subpart 27.1—General

27.101 Applicability. 

The policies, procedures, and clauses 
prescribed by this part 27 are applica-
ble to all agencies. Agencies are au-
thorized to adopt alternate policies, 
procedures, and clauses, but only to 
the extent determined necessary to 
meet the specific requirements of laws, 
executive orders, treaties, or inter-
national agreements. Any agency ac-
tion adopting such alternate policies, 
procedures, and clauses shall be cov-
ered in published agency regulations.

27.102 [Reserved]

27.103 Policy. 

The policies pertaining to patents, 
data, and copyrights are set forth in 
this part 27 and the related clauses in 
part 52.

27.104 General guidance. 

(a) The Government encourages the 
maximum practical commercial use of 
inventions made while performing Gov-
ernment contracts. 

(b) Generally, the Government will 
not refuse to award a contract on the 
grounds that the prospective con-
tractor may infringe a patent. 

(c) Generally, the Government en-
courages the use of inventions in per-
forming contracts and, by appropriate 
contract clauses, authorizes and con-
sents to such use, even though the in-
ventions may be covered by U.S. pat-
ents and indemnification against in-
fringement may be appropriate. 

(d) Generally, the Government should 
be indemnified against infringement of 
U.S. patents resulting from performing 
contracts when the supplies or services 
acquired under the contracts normally 
are or have been sold or offered for sale 
by any supplier to the public in the 
commercial open market or are the 
same as such supplies or services with 
relatively minor modifications. 

(e) The Government acquires supplies 
or services on a competitive basis in 
accordance with part 6, but it is impor-
tant that the efforts directed toward 
full and open competition not improp-
erly demand or use data relating to pri-
vate developments. 

(f) The Government honors the rights 
in data resulting from private develop-
ments and limits its demands for such 
rights to those essential for Govern-
ment purposes. 

(g) The Government honors rights in 
patents, data, and copyrights, and com-
plies with the stipulations of law in 
using or acquiring such rights. 

(h) Generally, the Government re-
quires that contractors obtain permis-
sion from copyright owners before in-
cluding privately-owned copyrighted 
works in data required to be delivered 
under Government contracts. 

[49 FR 12974, Mar. 30, 1984, as amended at 50 
FR 1743, Jan. 11, 1985; 50 FR 52429, Dec. 23, 
1985]

Subpart 27.2—Patents
27.200 Scope of subpart. 

This subpart prescribes policy with 
respect to— 

(a) Patent infringement liability re-
sulting from work performed by or for 
the Government; 

(b) Royalties payable in connection 
with performing Government con-
tracts; and 

(c) Security requirements covering 
patent applications containing classi-
fied subject matter filed by contrac-
tors.

27.201 Authorization and consent.

27.201–1 General. 
(a) In those cases where the Govern-

ment has authorized or consented to 
the manufacture or use of an invention 
described in and covered by a patent of 
the United States, any suit for in-
fringement of the patent based on the 
manufacture or use of the invention by 
or for the United States by a con-
tractor (including a subcontractor at 
any tier) can be maintained only 
against the Government in the U.S. 
Claims Court and not against the con-
tractor or subcontractor (28 U.S.C. 
1498). To ensure that work by a con-
tractor or subcontractor under a Gov-
ernment contract may not be enjoined 
by reason of patent infringement, the 
Government shall give authorization 
and consent in accordance with this 
regulation. The liability of the Govern-
ment for damages in any such suit 
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against it may, however, ultimately be 
borne by the contractor or subcon-
tractor in accordance with the terms of 
any patent indemnity clause also in-
cluded in the contract, and an author-
ization and consent clause does not de-
tract from any patent indemnification 
commitment by the contractor or sub-
contractor. Therefore, both a patent 
indemnity clause and an authorization 
and consent clause may be included in 
the same contract. 

(b) The contracting officer shall not 
include in any solicitation or con-
tract— 

(1) Any clause whereby the Govern-
ment expressly agrees to indemnify the 
contractor against liability for patent 
infringement; or 

(2) Any authorization and consent 
clause when both complete perform-
ance and delivery are outside the 
United States, its possessions, and 
Puerto Rico.

27.201–2 Clauses on authorization and 
consent. 

(a) The contracting officer shall in-
sert the clause at 52.227–1, Authoriza-
tion and Consent, in solicitations and 
contracts (including those for con-
struction; architect-engineer services; 
dismantling, demolition, or removal of 
improvements; and noncommon carrier 
communication services), except when 
using simplified acquisition procedures 
or both complete performance and de-
livery are outside the United States, 
its possessions, and Puerto Rico. Al-
though the clause is not required when 
simplified acquisition procedures are 
used, it may be used with them. 

(b) The contracting officer shall in-
sert the clause with its Alternate I in 
all R&D solicitations and contracts (in-
cluding those for construction and ar-
chitect-engineer services calling exclu-
sively for R&D work or exclusively for 
experimental work), unless both com-
plete performance and delivery are out-
side the United States, its possessions, 
and Puerto Rico. When a proposed con-
tract involves both R&D work and sup-
plies or services, and the R&D work is 
the primary purpose of the contract, 
the contracting officer shall use this 
alternate. In all other proposed con-
tracts involving both R&D work and 

supplies or services, the contracting of-
ficer shall use the basic clause. Also, 
when a proposed contract involves ei-
ther R&D or supplies and materials, in 
addition to construction or architect-
engineer work, the contracting officer 
shall use the basic clause. 

(c) If the solicitation or contract is 
for communication services with a 
common carrier and the services are 
unregulated and not priced by a tariff 
schedule set by a regulatory body, the 
contracting officer shall use the clause 
with its Alternate II. 

[49 FR 12974, Mar. 30, 1984, as amended at 60 
FR 34758, July 3, 1995]

27.202 Notice and assistance.

27.202–1 General. 

The contractor is required to notify 
the contracting officer of all claims of 
infringement that come to the contrac-
tor’s attention in connection with per-
forming a Government contract. The 
contractor is also required, when re-
quested, to assist the Government with 
any evidence and information in its 
possession in connection with any suit 
against the Government, or any claims 
against the Government made before 
suit has been instituted, on account of 
any alleged patent or copyright in-
fringement arising out of or resulting 
from the contract performance.

27.202–2 Clause on notice and assist-
ance. 

The contracting officer shall insert 
the clause at 52.227–2, Notice and As-
sistance Regarding Patent and Copy-
right Infringement, in supply, service, 
or research and development solicita-
tions and contracts (including con-
struction and architect-engineer con-
tracts) which anticipate a contract 
value above the simplified acquisition 
threshold, except when complete per-
formance and delivery are outside the 
United States, its possessions, and 
Puerto Rico, unless the contracts indi-
cate that the supplies or other 
deliverables are ultimately to be 
shipped into one of those areas. 

[60 FR 34758, July 3, 1995]
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