
35376 Federal Register / Vol. 68, No. 114 / Friday, June 13, 2003 / Notices 

points are available for proposals that 
have geographic diversity. Geographic 
diversity means multiple states or 
regions as defined by the National 
Agricultural Statistics Service and have 
the broadest number of producers 
impacted. 

C. Confidentiality 

The names of applicants, the names of 
individuals identified in the 
applications, the content of 
applications, and the panel evaluations 
of applications will all be kept 
confidential, except to those involved in 
the review process, to the extent 
permitted by law. In addition, the 
identities of review panel members will 
remain confidential throughout the 
entire review process and will not be 
released to applicants. At the end of the 
fiscal year, names of panel members 
will be made available. However, 
panelists will not be identified with the 
review of any particular application.

Part VI—Additional Information 

A. Access to Panel Review Information 

Upon written request, scores from the 
evaluation panel, not including the 
identity of reviewers, will be sent to the 
applicant after the review and awards 
process has been completed. 

B. Notification of Partnership 
Agreement Awards and Notification of 
Non-Selection 

Following approval of the 
applications selected for funding, notice 
of project approval and authority to 
draw down funds will be made to the 
selected applicants in writing. Within 
the limit of funds available for such 
purpose, the awarding official of RMA 
shall enter into partnership agreements 
with those applicants whose 
applications are judged to be most 
meritorious under the procedures set 
forth in this announcement. The 
partnership agreement provides the 
amount of Federal funds for use in the 
project period, the terms and conditions 
of the award, and the time period for the 
project. 

The effective date of the partnership 
agreement shall be the date the 
agreement is executed by both parties. 
All funds provided to the applicant by 
FCIC must be expended solely for the 
purpose for which funds are obligated 
in accordance with the approved 
application and budget, the regulations, 
the terms and conditions of the award, 
and the applicability of Federal cost 
principles. No commitment of Federal 
assistance beyond the project period is 
made or implied, as a result of any 

award made pursuant to this 
announcement. 

Notification of denial of funding will 
be sent to applicants after final funding 
decisions have been made. Reasons for 
denial of funding can include 
incomplete proposals, proposals that 
did not meet the objectives, scored low 
or were duplicative. 

C. Confidential Aspects of Proposals 
and Awards 

When an application results in a 
partnership agreement, it becomes a part 
of the official record of RMA 
transactions, available to the public 
upon specific request. Information that 
the Secretary of Agriculture determines 
to be of a confidential, privileged, or 
proprietary nature will be held in 
confidence to the extent permitted by 
law. Therefore, any information that the 
applicant wishes to be considered 
confidential, privileged, or proprietary 
should be clearly marked within the 
application, including the basis for such 
designation. The original copy of a 
proposal that does not result in an 
award will be retained by RMA for a 
period of one year. Other copies will be 
destroyed. Such a proposal will be 
released only with the express written 
consent of the applicant or to the extent 
required by law. A proposal may be 
withdrawn at any time prior to award. 

D. Reporting Document 
Applicants awarded a partnership 

agreement will be required to submit 
monthly progress and financial reports 
(SF–269) throughout the project period, 
as well as a final program and financial 
report not later than 90 days after the 
end of the project period. 

E. Audit Requirements 
Applicants awarded the partnership 

agreements are subject to audit. 

F. Prohibitions and Requirements With 
Regard to Lobbying 

Section 1352 of Public Law 101–121, 
enacted on October 23, 1989, imposes 
prohibitions and requirements for 
disclosure and certification related to 
lobbying on recipients of Federal 
contracts, grants, cooperative 
agreements, and loans. It provides 
exemptions for Indian Tribes and tribal 
organizations. Current and prospective 
recipients, and any subcontractors, are 
prohibited from using Federal funds, 
other than profits from a Federal 
contract, for lobbying Congress or any 
Federal agency in connection with the 
award of a contract, grant, cooperative 
agreement, or loan. In addition, for each 
award action in excess of $100,000 
($150,000 for loans) the law requires 

recipients and any subcontractors (1) to 
certify that they have neither used nor 
will use any appropriated funds for 
payments of lobbyists; (2) to disclose the 
name, address, payment details, and 
purpose of any agreements with 
lobbyists whom recipients or 
subcontractors will pay with profit or 
other nonappropriated funds on or after 
December 22, 1989; (3) to file quarterly 
updates about the use of lobbyists if 
material changes occur in their use. The 
law establishes civil penalties for non-
compliance. A copy of the certification 
and disclosure forms must be submitted 
with the application and are available 
from David Fulk at the above stated 
address and telephone number. 

G. Applicable OMB Circulars 
All partnership and cooperative 

agreements funded as a result of this 
notice will be subject to the 
requirements contained in all applicable 
OMB circulars.

Signed in Washington, DC, on May 10, 
2003. 
Ross J. Davidson, Jr., 
Manager, Federal Crop Insurance 
Corporation.
[FR Doc. 03–14954 Filed 6–12–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3410–08–M

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

Food and Nutrition Service 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request—FNS–380, 
Worksheet for Food Stamp Program 
Quality Control Reviews

AGENCY: Food and Nutrition Service, 
USDA.
ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: As required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995, this notice 
invites the general public and other 
public agencies to comment on the 
proposed information collection of 
FNS–380, Worksheet for Food Stamp 
Program Quality Control Reviews.
DATES: Written comments must be 
submitted on or before August 12, 2003.
ADDRESSES: Comments are invited on: 
(a) Whether the proposed collection of 
information is necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information has practical utility; (b) the 
accuracy of the agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information, including the validity of 
the methodology and assumptions used; 
(c) ways to enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information to be 
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collected; (d) ways to minimize the 
burden of the collection of information 
on those who are to respond, including 
the use of appropriate automated, 
electronic, mechanical, or other 
technological collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 
Comments may be sent to: Daniel 
Wilusz, Chief, Quality Control Branch, 
Program Accountability Division, Food 
and Nutrition Service, U.S. Department 
of Agriculture, 3101 Park Center Drive, 
Alexandria, VA 22302. 

All responses to this notice will be 
included in the request for OMB’s 
approval. All comments will also 
become a matter of public record.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Requests for additional information or 
copies of the information collection 
form and instruction should be directed 
to Daniel Wilusz, (703) 305–2460.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: Worksheet for Food Stamp 
Program Quality Control Reviews. 

OMB Number: 0584–0074. 
Form Number: FNS–380. 
Expiration Date: November 30, 2003. 
Type of Request: Revision of an 

existing information collection. 
Abstract: Form FNS–380 is a 

worksheet used in the Food Stamp 
Program to determine eligibility and 
benefits for households selected for 
review in the quality control sample of 
active cases. We estimate the reporting 
burden for this collection of information 
averages 8.9764 hours per each States’ 
response. This includes the time for 
analyzing the household case record; 
planning and carrying out the field 
investigation; gathering, comparing, 
analyzing and evaluating the review 
data and forwarding selected cases to 
the Food and Nutrition Service for 
Federal validation. In addition to the 
State agency’s burden, we also estimate 
the average burden on each household 
to be 0.50 hours for each of the 
estimated 54,703 households being 
interviewed. This includes a face-to-face 
interview with the Quality Control 
Reviewer to verify the identity and 
existence of the household and explore 
the household circumstances affecting 
the eligibility and benefit level. We 
estimate that the total reporting burden 
associated with this information 
collection for both State agencies and 
the households is 518,388 hours. The 
total recordkeeping burden for the State 
agency is 0.0236 hours per record. 

We previously cleared the reporting 
and recordkeeping burden for this form 
under Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) clearance number 0584–0074. 
OMB approved the burden through 
November 30, 2003. Based on the most 

recent table of active case sample sizes 
and completion rates (FY 2001), we 
estimate 54,703 FNS–380 worksheets 
and interviews will now be completed 
annually. This is an increase of 40 
responses from the estimate made to 
substantiate the current collection. This 
estimate will also cause a corresponding 
increase in the reporting and 
recordkeeping burden. The increase in 
responses is a result of an augmented 
participation rate and is based on a 
statistical formula. We are requesting a 
three-year approval from OMB for this 
information collection. 

Affected Public: Individuals or 
households; State or local governments. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 53 
State agencies and 54,703 households. 

Estimated Total Number of Responses 
Per Year: 54,703 responses. 

Estimated Time per Response: 8.9764 
hours per State agency and 0.50 hours 
per household. 

Estimated Total Annual Reporting 
Burden: 518,388 hours. 

Estimated Number of Records: 54,703. 
Estimated Time per Recordkeeping: 

.0236 hours. 
Estimated Total Annual 

Recordkeeping Burden: 1,291 hours. 
Estimated Total Annual Reporting 

and Recordkeeping Burden: 519,679 
hours.

Dated: June 2, 2003. 
Roberto Salazar, 
Administrator, Food and Nutrition Service.
[FR Doc. 03–14956 Filed 6–12–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3410–30–P

DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE

Forest Service 

Red Pines EIS Project, Nez Perce 
National Forest, Idaho County, ID

AGENCY: Forest Service, USDA.
ACTION: Notice; intent to prepare 
environmental impact statement. 

SUMMARY: The Forest Service will 
prepare an environmental impact 
statement to disclose the environmental 
impacts of implementing fuel hazard 
reduction and watershed improvement 
activities within the Red Pines project 
area in the Red River watershed. 
Individuals interested in actions of this 
nature are encouraged to submit 
comments and become involved in the 
planning process.
DATES: Comments concerning the scope 
of the analysis should be received at the 
address below on or before July 14, 
2003.

ADDRESSES: Send written comments to 
Bruce Bernhardt, Forest Supervisor, 
Route 2, Box 475, Grangeville, ID 83530.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: Kara 
Chadwick, Project Coordinator, and 
(208) 983–1950.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The Red 
Pines project area is located on the Nez 
Perce National Forest in northern Idaho 
within Idaho County. The project area 
lies about 34 air miles southeast of 
Grangeville Idaho and three air miles 
southeast of Elk City Idaho. The project 
area encompasses 31,466 acres and 
includes Dawson, Little Moose, Blanco 
and Ditch Creeks and Lower and Main 
Red River subwatersheds, and small 
portions of Trail, Soda and Moose Butte 
Creeks subwatersheds, which drain into 
Red River, which drains directly into 
the South Fork Clearwater River. 

The actions proposed for 
implementation would reduce existing 
and potential fuel loads through the 
following activities: 

A combination of thinning and/or 
salvaging and underburning on 
approximately 4,760 acres. This 
combination would result in some 
regeneration (clearcut) harvest. A 
combination of tractor and cable yarding 
systems would be used. 

Approximately 1,645 acres of 
plantations, 20–50 years in age, would 
be thinned and underburned, favoring 
fire resistant species. A combination of 
tractor and cable yarding systems would 
be used. 

Approximately 100 acres of 15–20 
year old plantations would be 
precommercially thinned. 

Approximately 25 miles of temporary 
road would be constructed to access the 
fuel hazard reduction areas described 
above. These roads would be 
decommissioned following activities. 

Approximately 18 miles of existing 
roads would be reconditioned prior to 
use for fuel hazard reduction activities. 

As part of this project, activities 
would be implemented to meet Forest 
Plan requirements for upward trend in 
fish habitat and water quality. The 
following activities would maintain or 
improve aquatic conditions in the 
subwatersheds in the project area: 

Restore soil productivity on 175 to 
350 acres through soil restoration 
techniques, such as decompaction, 
revegetation, and reestablishing natural 
drainage features. 

Reduce erosion and water quality 
impacts at four inactive mine sites, 
using techniques such as reshaping of 
disturbed areas, soil amendments, 
revegetation, and possibly treatment of 
water draining from adits. 

Reduce sediment production from 
existing and temporary roads planned 
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