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310, 2231 Crystal Drive, Washington, 
DC 20231, by telephone at 703–308–
7400, or by e-mail at 
susan.brown@uspto.gov.

Written comments and 
recommendations for the proposed 
information collection should be sent on 
or before April 14, 2003 to David 
Rostker, OMB Desk Officer, Room 
10202, New Executive Office Building, 
Washington, DC 20503.

Dated: March 6, 2003. 
Susan K. Brown, 
Records Officer, USPTO, Office of Data 
Architecture and Services, Data 
Administration Division.
[FR Doc. 03–6049 Filed 3–12–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 3510–16–P

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Notice of Proposed Information 
Collection Requests

AGENCY: Department of Education.

SUMMARY: The Leader, Regulatory 
Management Group, Office of the Chief 
Information Officer, invites comments 
on the proposed information collection 
requests as required by the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995.
DATES: Interested persons are invited to 
submit comments on or before May 12, 
2003.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: Section 
3506 of the Paperwork Reduction Act of 
1995 (44 U.S.C. Chapter 35) requires 
that the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) provide interested 
Federal agencies and the public an early 
opportunity to comment on information 
collection requests. OMB may amend or 
waive the requirement for public 
consultation to the extent that public 
participation in the approval process 
would defeat the purpose of the 
information collection, violate State or 
Federal law, or substantially interfere 
with any agency’s ability to perform its 
statutory obligations. The Leader, 
Regulatory Management Group, Office 
of the Chief Information Officer, 
publishes that notice containing 
proposed information collection 
requests prior to submission of these 
requests to OMB. Each proposed 
information collection, grouped by 
office, contains the following: (1) Type 
of review requested, e.g., new, revision, 
extension, existing or reinstatement; (2) 
Title; (3) Summary of the collection; (4) 
Description of the need for, and 
proposed use of, the information; (5) 
Respondents and frequency of 
collection; and (6) Reporting and/or 

Recordkeeping burden. OMB invites 
public comment. 

The Department of Education is 
especially interested in public comment 
addressing the following issues: (1) Is 
this collection necessary to the proper 
functions of the Department; (2) will 
this information be processed and used 
in a timely manner; (3) is the estimate 
of burden accurate; (4) how might the 
Department enhance the quality, utility, 
and clarity of the information to be 
collected; and (5) how might the 
Department minimize the burden of this 
collection on the respondents, including 
through the use of information 
technology.

Dated: March 7, 2003. 
John D. Tressler, 
Leader, Regulatory Management Group, 
Office of the Chief Information Officer.

Federal Student Aid 

Type of Review: Revision of a 
currently approved collection. 

Title: Student Aid Internet Gateway 
(SAIG) Enrollment Document (JS). 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Affected Public: Not-for-profit 

institutions (primary), Businesses or 
other for-profit, State, Local, or Tribal 
Gov’t, SEAs or LEAs. 

Reporting and Recordkeeping Hour 
Burden: 

Responses: 6902. 
Burden Hours: 6902. 

Abstract: Enrollment in SAIG allows 
eligible entities to exchange Title IV 
information electronically with the 
Department of Education. Users are able 
to receive, transmit, view and update 
student financial aid data via SAIG. 
Eligible respondents include 
postsecondary schools that participate 
in federal student financial aid 
programs, financial aid servicers, state 
and guaranty agencies, lenders, and 
need analysis servicers. 

Written requests for information 
should be addressed to Vivian Reese, 
Department of Education, 400 Maryland 
Avenue, SW., Room 4050, Regional 
Office Building 3, Washington, DC 
20202–4651 or to the e-mail address 
Vivian.reese@ed.gov. Requests may also 
be faxed to 202–708–9346. Please 
specify the complete title of the 
information collection when making 
your request. 

Comments regarding burden and/or 
the collection activity requirements 
should be directed to Joseph Schubart at 
his e-mail address Joe.Schubart@ed.gov. 
Individuals who use a 
telecommunications device for the deaf 
(TDD) may call the Federal Information 

Relay Service (FIRS) at 1–800–877–
8339.

[FR Doc. 03–5998 Filed 3–12–03; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4000–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

Brown v. Board of Education 50th 
Anniversary Commission; Meeting

AGENCY: Brown v. Board of Education 
50th Anniversary Commission, U.S. 
Department of Education (ED).

ACTION: Notice of meeting.

SUMMARY: This notice provides the 
schedule of a forthcoming meeting of 
the Brown v. Board of Education 50th 
Anniversary Commission. This notice 
also describes the functions of the 
commission. This document is intended 
to notify the general public of their 
opportunity to attend.

DATE AND TIME: March 27, 2003, at 8:45 
a.m.

ADDRESSES: Harvard University—
Harvard Law School—Pound Hall, 1536 
Massachusetts Avenue, Cambridge, MA 
02138, (617) 495–3100.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Daniel W. Sutherland, Chief of Staff, 
330 C Street SW., Washington, DC 
20202, (202) 205–8162.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Brown v. Board of Education 50th 
Anniversary Commission is established 
under Public Law 107–41 to 
commemorate the 50th anniversary of 
the Brown decision. The Commission, 
in conjunction with the U.S. 
Department of Education, is responsible 
for planning and coordinating public 
education activities and initiatives. 
Also, the Commission, in cooperation 
with the Brown Foundation for 
Educational Equity, Excellence, and 
Research in Topeka, Kansas, and such 
other public or private entities as the 
Commission deems appropriate, is 
responsible for encouraging, planning, 
developing, and coordinating 
observances of the anniversary of the 
Brown decision. The meeting of the 
Commission is open to the public. 
Individuals who will need 
accommodations for a disability in order 
to attend the meeting (i.e., interpreting 
services, assistive listening devices, 
materials in alternative format) should 
notify Gwendolen Long at (202) 205–
9556 by no later than March 21, 2003. 
We will attempt to meet requests after 
that date, but cannot guarantee 
availability.
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Dated: March 6, 2003. 
Gerald A. Reynolds, 
Assistant Secretary for Civil Rights.
[FR Doc. 03–5999 Filed 3–12–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4000–01–M

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

Notice of Intent to Prepare an 
Environmental Impact Statement for 
Decommissioning and/or Long-Term 
Stewardship at the West Valley 
Demonstration Project and Western 
New York Nuclear Service Center

AGENCY: Department of Energy.
ACTION: Notice of Intent.

SUMMARY: The U.S. Department of 
Energy (DOE) and the New York State 
Energy Research and Development 
Authority (NYSERDA) are announcing 
their intent to prepare an Environmental 
Impact Statement (EIS) for 
Decommissioning and/or Long-Term 
Stewardship at the West Valley 
Demonstration Project (WVDP) and 
Western New York Nuclear Service 
Center (also known as the ‘‘Center’’). 
The U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC), the U.S. 
Environmental Protection Agency 
(EPA), and the New York State 
Department of Environmental 
Conservation (NYSDEC) will participate 
as cooperating agencies under the 
National Environmental Policy Act 
(NEPA, 42 U.S.C. 4321 et seq.). In 
addition, NYSDEC will participate as an 
involved agency under the New York 
State Environmental Quality Review Act 
(SEQRA) with respect to NYSERDA’s 
proposed actions. DOE, under NEPA, 
and NYSERDA, under SEQRA, plan to 
evaluate the range of reasonable 
alternatives in this EIS to address their 
respective responsibilities at the Center, 
including those under the West Valley 
Demonstration Project Act (Pub. L. 96–
368), Atomic Energy Act of 1954 (as 
amended), and all other applicable 
Federal and State statutes. 

This EIS will revise the Draft 
Environmental Impact Statement for 
Completion of the West Valley 
Demonstration Project and Closure or 
Long-Term Management of Facilities at 
the Western New York Nuclear Service 
Center (DOE/EIS–0226–D, January 1996, 
also referred to as the 1996 Cleanup and 
Closure Draft EIS). Based on 
decommissioning criteria for the WVDP 
issued by NRC since the Cleanup and 
Closure EIS was published, DOE and 
NYSERDA propose to evaluate five 
alternatives: Unrestricted Site Release, 
Partial Site Release without Restrictions, 
Partial Site Release with Restrictions, 

Monitor and Maintain under Current 
Operations, and No-Action.
DATES: DOE and NYSERDA are inviting 
public comments on the scope and 
content of the Decommissioning and/or 
Long-Term Stewardship EIS during a 
public comment period commencing 
with the date of publication of this 
Notice and ending on April 28, 2003. 
DOE and NYSERDA will hold two 
public scoping meetings on the EIS at 
the Ashford Office Complex, located at 
9030 Route 219 in the Town of Ashford, 
NY, from 7 to 9:30 p.m. on April 9, 2003 
and April 10, 2003.
ADDRESSES: Address comments on the 
scope of the Decommissioning and/or 
Long-Term Stewardship EIS to the DOE 
Document Manager: Mr. Daniel W. 
Sullivan, West Valley Demonstration 
Project, U.S. Department of Energy, 
WV–49, 10282 Rock Springs Road, West 
Valley, New York 14171, Telephone: 
(800) 633–5280, Facsimile: (716) 942–
4199, E-mail: sonja.allen@wvnsco.com.

The ‘‘Public Reading Rooms’’ section 
under SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION lists 
the addresses of the reading rooms 
where documents referenced herein are 
available.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION, CONTACT: For 
information regarding the WVDP or the 
EIS, contact Mr. Daniel Sullivan as 
described above. Those seeking general 
information on DOE’s NEPA process 
should contact: Ms. Carol M. Borgstrom, 
(EH–42), Director, Office of NEPA 
Policy and Compliance, U.S. 
Department of Energy, 1000 
Independence Avenue, SW., 
Washington, DC 20585, Telephone: 
(202) 586–4600, Facsimile: (202) 586–
7031, or leave a message at 1–800–472–
2756, toll-free. 

Questions for NYSERDA should be 
directed to: Mr. Paul J. Bembia, New 
York State Energy Research and 
Development Authority, 10282 Rock 
Springs Road, West Valley, New York 
14171, Telephone: (716) 942–4900, 
Facsimile: (716) 942–2148, E-mail: 
pjb@nyserda.org.

Those seeking general information on 
the SEQRA process should contact: Mr. 
Hal Brodie, Deputy Counsel, New York 
State Energy Research and Development 
Authority, 17 Columbia Circle, Albany, 
New York 12203–6399, Telephone: 
(518) 862–1090, ext. 3280, Facsimile: 
(518) 862–1091, E-mail: 
hb1@nyserda.org.

This Notice of Intent will be available 
on the internet at http://tis.eh.doe.gov/
nepa, under ‘‘What’s New.’’ Additional 
information about the WVDP is also 
available on the internet at http://
www.wv.doe.gov/linkingpages/
insidewestvalley.htm.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: DOE and 
NYSERDA intend to prepare a revised 
draft Environmental Impact Statement 
(EIS) for Decommissioning and/or Long-
Term Stewardship at the WVDP and 
Western New York Nuclear Service 
Center to examine the potential 
environmental impacts of the proposed 
action to decommission and/or maintain 
long-term stewardship at the Center. 
The NRC, the EPA, and NYSDEC will 
participate as cooperating agencies 
under NEPA. NYSDEC will also 
participate as an involved agency under 
SEQRA with respect to NYSERDA’s 
proposed actions. DOE, under NEPA, 
and NYSERDA, under SEQRA, plan to 
evaluate the range of reasonable 
alternatives in this EIS to address their 
respective responsibilities at the Center, 
including those under the WVDP Act, 
Atomic Energy Act of 1954 (as 
amended), and all other applicable 
Federal and State statutes. 

Background 
The Western New York Nuclear 

Service Center consists of a 3,345-acre 
reservation in rural western New York 
that is the location of the only NRC-
licensed commercial spent nuclear fuel 
reprocessing facility to have ever 
operated in the United States. 
Reprocessing operations resulted in the 
generation of approximately 600,000 
gallons of liquid high-level waste 
(HLW), which was stored in large 
underground tanks adjacent to the 
reprocessing facility. NYSERDA holds 
title to the Center on behalf of the 
people of the State of New York. (See H. 
Rep. No. 96–1000 at 4 (1980) reprinted 
in 1980 U.S.S.C.A.N 3102, 3103.)

The WVDP Act of 1980 required DOE 
to solidify the HLW, transport it to a 
Federal geologic repository, dispose of 
the low-level waste (LLW) and 
transuranic (TRU) waste generated from 
Project activities, and decontaminate 
and decommission the facilities used for 
the Project. The Act also authorized 
NRC to prescribe decommissioning 
criteria for the WVDP. The NRC has 
placed NYSERDA’s NRC site license in 
abeyance during DOE’s fulfillment of its 
WVDP Act requirements. 

Pursuant to the WVDP Act, on 
October 1, 1980, DOE and NYSERDA 
entered into a Cooperative Agreement 
(amended September 19, 1981) that 
established a framework for the 
implementation of the Project. Under 
the agreement, NYSERDA has made 
available to DOE, without transfer of 
title, an approximately 200-acre portion 
of the Center, known as the ‘‘Project 
Premises,’’ which includes a formerly 
operated spent nuclear fuel reprocessing 
plant, spent nuclear fuel receiving and 

VerDate Jan<31>2003 17:10 Mar 12, 2003 Jkt 200001 PO 00000 Frm 00019 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\13MRN1.SGM 13MRN1


