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approximately 300 workers has been 
released, and further efforts are on going 
to obtain permission to release the 
remaining information. The medical 

service subcontractor is working 
diligently to obtain the necessary 
authorizations.

FDA estimates the burden of this 
collection of information as follows:

TABLE 1.—ESTIMATED ANNUAL REPORTING BURDEN1

Type of Survey 
No. of

Respondents
Annual Frequency

/Response
Total Annual
Responses

Hours per
Response

Total
Hours

Telephone 1,200 1 1,200 .25 300

Total 300

1There is no capital costs or operating and maintenance costs associated with this collection of information.

The estimated annual reporting 
burden is based on the Centers for 
Disease Control’s administration, in 
2001 and 2002, of a similar 
questionnaire to individuals who were 
exposed to anthrax spores dispersed 
during a terrorist event.

Dated: January 15, 2003.
Margaret M. Dotzel,
Assistant Commissioner for Policy.
[FR Doc. 03–1254 Filed 1–16–03; 3:44 pm]
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In compliance with section 
3506(c)(2)(A) of the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995 concerning 
opportunity for public comment on 
proposed collections of information, the 
Substance Abuse and Mental Health 
Services Administration will publish 
periodic summaries of proposed 
projects. To request more information 
on the proposed projects or to obtain a 
copy of the information collection 
plans, call the SAMHSA Reports 
Clearance Officer on (301) 443–7978. 

Comments are invited on: (a) Whether 
the proposed collections of information 
are necessary for the proper 
performance of the functions of the 
agency, including whether the 
information shall have practical utility; 

(b) the accuracy of the agency’s estimate 
of the burden of the proposed collection 
of information; (c) ways to enhance the 
quality, utility, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
ways to minimize the burden of the 
collection of information on 
respondents, including through the use 
of automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Proposed Project: Evaluation of the 
CMHS/CSAT Collaborative Program on 
Homeless Families: Women with 
Psychiatric, Substance Use, Or Co-
Occurring Disorders and Their 
Dependent Children, Phase II—(OMB 
No. 0930–0223, Revision)—SAMHSA’s 
Center for Mental Health Services and 
Center for Substance Abuse Treatment, 
through a set of cooperative agreements, 
are conducting a longitudinal, multi-site 
evaluation study assessing mental 
health, substance abuse, and trauma 
interventions received by homeless 
mothers with psychiatric, substance use, 
or co-occurring disorders and their 
dependent children. The study will 
advance knowledge on appropriate and 
effective approaches to improving 
families’ residential stability, overall 
functioning, and decreased risk for 
violence. 

SAMHSA currently has OMB 
approval for data collection from 
approximately 1,600 participants 
recruited from eight sites. At each site, 
a documented treatment intervention is 
tested in comparison to an alternative 
treatment condition. Participants are 
interviewed at baseline (within two 
weeks of entering a program) as well as 
three additional times (3 months after 
program entry, 9 months after program 

entry, and 15 months after program 
entry). Trained interviewers administer 
the interviews to participating mothers. 
Information on the children is obtained 
from the mother. 

Key outcomes for the mothers are 
increased residential stability, decreased 
substance use, decreased psychological 
distress, improved mental health 
functioning, increased trauma recovery, 
improved health, improved functioning 
as a parent, and decreased personal 
violence. Outcomes for the children are 
reduced emotional/behavioral problems 
and improved school attendance. 

A coordinated set of interviews 
assessing the key ingredients of each 
program will supplement the 
participant data collection during the 
baseline timeframe. The purpose of the 
program ingredients interviews, 
administered in a one-time case study 
protocol format, is to systematically 
describe each treatment and comparison 
intervention with the same set of 
variables at comparable points in 
treatment. This case study protocol will 
examine the intervention and 
comparison program models, staffing, 
structure, goals, and services, and will 
include vignettes describing actual 
families referred to the programs. In-
person interviews of program directors, 
program line staff, and consumers will 
be administered in either focus group 
format or through one-on-one sessions. 
The case study protocol will be geared 
towards obtaining a standard set of 
information from each site. If some of 
these data are available from other 
sources or does not apply at a particular 
site, the protocol will be shortened. The 
estimated response burden is as follows:

Instrument Number of re-
spondents 

Responses 
per respond-

ent 

Burden re-
sponse (hrs) 

Total burden 
hours 

Currently—Approved Client Instrument (3-yr. annual average) ...................... 2,280 3,032 
Program Director .............................................................................................. 35 1 1.0 35 
Focus Group: Line Staff ................................................................................... 140 1 1.0 140 
Interview: Line Staff .......................................................................................... 140 1 1.0 140 
Focus Group: Consumers ................................................................................ 350 1 1.5 525 
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Instrument Number of re-
spondents 

Responses 
per respond-

ent 

Burden re-
sponse (hrs) 

Total burden 
hours 

Program Ingredients Sub-total ......................................................................... 2,945 3,872 
Total ..........................................................................................................

Send comments to Nancy Pearce, 
SAMHSA Reports Clearance Officer, 
Room 16–105, Parklawn Building, 5600 
Fishers Lane, Rockville, MD 20857. 
Written comments should be received 
within 60 days of this notice.

Dated: January 13, 2003. 
Richard Kopanda, 
Executive Officer, Substance Abuse and 
Mental Health Services Administration.
[FR Doc. 03–1063 Filed 1–16–03; 8:45 am] 
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ACTION: Notice.

SUMMARY: This Notice identifies 
unutilized, underutilized, excess, and 
surplus Federal property reviewed by 
HUD for suitability for possible use to 
assist the homeless.
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Mark Johnston, room 7266, Department 
of Housing and Urban Development, 
451 Seventh Street, SW., Washington, 
DC 20410; telephone (202) 708–1234; 
TTY number for the hearing- and 
speech-impaired (202) 708–2565 (these 
telephone numbers are not toll-free), or 
call the toll-free Title V information line 
at 1–800–927–7588.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: In 
accordance with 24 CFR part 581 and 
section 501 of the Stewart B. McKinney 
Homeless Assistance Act (42 U.S.C. 
11411), as amended, HUD is publishing 
this Notice to identify Federal buildings 
and other real property that HUD has 
reviewed for suitability for use to assist 
the homeless. The properties were 
reviewed using information provided to 
HUD by Federal landholding agencies 
regarding unutilized and underutilized 
buildings and real property controlled 
by such agencies or by GSA regarding 
its inventory of excess or surplus 
Federal property. This Notice is also 
published in order to comply with the 
December 12, 1988 Court Order in 
National Coalition for the Homeless v. 

Veterans Administration, No. 88–2503–
OG (D.D.C.). 

Properties reviewed are listed in this 
Notice according to the following 
categories: Suitable/available, suitable/
unavailable, suitable/to be excess, and 
unsuitable. The properties listed in the 
three suitable categories have been 
reviewed by the landholding agencies, 
and each agency has transmitted to 
HUD: (1) Its intention to make the 
property available for use to assist the 
homeless, (2) its intention to declare the 
property excess to the agency’s needs, or 
(3) a statement of the reasons that the 
property cannot be declared excess or 
made available for use as facilities to 
assist the homeless. 

Properties listed as suitable/available 
will be available exclusively for 
homeless use for a period of 60 days 
from the date of this Notice. Where 
property is described as for ‘‘off-site use 
only’’ recipients of the property will be 
required to relocate the building to their 
own site at their own expense. 
Homeless assistance providers 
interested in any such property should 
send a written expression of interest to 
HHS, addressed to Shirley Kramer, 
Division of Property Management, 
Program Support Center, HHS, room 
5B–41, 5600 Fishers Lane, Rockville, 
MD 20857; (301) 443–2265. (This is not 
a toll-free number.) HHS will mail to the 
interested provider an application 
packet, which will include instructions 
for completing the application. In order 
to maximize the opportunity to utilize a 
suitable property, providers should 
submit their written expressions of 
interest as soon as possible. For 
complete details concerning the 
processing of applications, the reader is 
encouraged to refer to the interim rule 
governing this program, 24 CFR part 
581. 

For properties listed as suitable/to be 
excess, that property may, if 
subsequently accepted as excess by 
GSA, be made available for use by the 
homeless in accordance with applicable 
law, subject to screening for other 
Federal use. At the appropriate time, 
HUD will publish the property in a 
Notice showing it as either suitable/
available or suitable/unavailable.

For properties listed as suitable/
unavailable, the landholding agency has 
decided that the property cannot be 
declared excess or made available for 

use to assist the homeless, and the 
property will not be available. 

Properties listed as unsuitable will 
not be made available for any other 
purpose for 20 days from the date of this 
Notice. Homeless assistance providers 
interested in a review by HUD of the 
determination of unsuitability should 
call the toll free information line at 1–
800–927–7588 for detailed instructions 
or write a letter to Mark Johnston at the 
address listed at the beginning of this 
Notice. Included in the request for 
review should be the property address 
(including zip code), the date of 
publication in the Federal Register, the 
landholding agency, and the property 
number. 

For more information regarding 
particular properties identified in this 
Notice (i.e., acreage, floor plan, existing 
sanitary facilities, exact street address), 
providers should contact the 
appropriate landholding agencies at the 
following addresses: DOT: Mr. Rugene 
Spruill, Principal, Space Management, 
SVC–140, Transportation 
Administrative Service Center, 
Department of Transportation, 400 7th 
Street, SW., Room 2310, Washington, 
DC 20590; (202) 366–4246; Energy: Mr. 
Andy Duran, Department of Energy, 
Office of Engineering & Construction 
Management, CR–80, Washington, DC 
20585; (202) 586–4548; GSA: Mr. Brian 
K. Polly, Assistant Commissioner, 
General Services Administration, Office 
of Property Disposal, 18th and F Streets, 
NW., Washington, DC, 20405; (202) 
501–0052; Navy: Mr. Charles C. Cocks, 
Director, Department of the Navy, Real 
Estate Policy Division, Naval Facilities 
Engineering Command, Washington 
Navy Yard, 1322 Patterson Ave., SE., 
Suite 1000, Washington, DC 20374–
5065; (202) 685–9200; (These are not 
toll-free numbers).

Dated: January 9, 2003. 
Mark R. Johnston, 
Deputy Director, Office of Special Needs 
Assistance Programs.

Title V, Federal Surplus Property 
Program Federal Register Report for 1/
17/03

Suitable/Available Properties 

Buildings (by State) 

Ohio 

USCG Old ANT Huron, 110 Wall Street 
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