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section 4(c) of the SNPLMA of 1998, the 
subject lands are withdrawn from 
location and entry, under the mining 
laws and from operation under the 
mineral leasing and geothermal leasing 
laws until such time as the Secretary 
terminates the withdrawal or the lands 
are patented. 

Except for the reservation listed 
below, the mineral interests having no 
known mineral value will be offered for 
conveyance simultaneously with the 
sale of the lands. Acceptance of a direct 
sale offer will constitute an application 
for conveyance of those mineral 
interests. The applicant will be required 
to pay a $50.00 non-returnable filing fee 
for conveyance of the available mineral 
interests. The land will be sold and the 
patent, when issued, will contain the 
following terms, reservations, and 
covenants: 

1. A right-of-way reserved for ditches 
and canals constructed or to be 
constructed, by the authority of the 
United States, in accordance with 
section 1 of the Act of August 30, 1890 
(43 U.S.C. 945). 

2. All leaseable and saleable mineral 
deposits on the land are reserved, 
together with the right of the United 
States, its permittees, licensees, and 
lessees to prospect for, mine, and 
remove the minerals owned by the 
United States under applicable law and 
any regulations that the Secretary of the 
Interior may prescribe, including all 
necessary access and exit rights. 

3. The lands are conveyed subject to 
zoning and subdivision laws, other state 
and local land use laws and, whether or 
not of record, all valid existing rights 
and claims. 

4. The lands are conveyed subject to 
right-of-way for roads, public utilities 
and flood control purposes, existing and 
proposed in accordance with state and 
the local governing entities’ 
Transportation Plans. 

5. The purchaser/patentee, by 
accepting a patent, covenants and agrees 
to indemnify, defend, and hold the 
United States harmless from any costs, 
damages, claims, causes of action, 
penalties, fines, liabilities, and 
judgments of any kind or nature arising 
from the past, present, and future acts 
or omissions of the patentee or their 
employees, agents, contractors, or 
lessees, or any third-party, arising from 
or in connection with the patented real 
property which has already resulted or 
does hereafter result in: (1) Violations of 
federal, state, and local laws and 
regulations that are now or may in the 
future become, applicable to the real 
property; (2) Judgments, claims or 
demands of any kind assessed against 
the United States; (3) Costs, expenses, or 

damages of any kind incurred by the 
United States; (4) Releases or threatened 
releases of solid or hazardous waste(s) 
and/or hazardous substance(s), as 
defined by federal or state 
environmental laws; off, on, into or 
under land, property and other interests 
of the United States; (5) Activities by 
which solid or hazardous wastes, as 
defined by federal and state 
environmental laws are generated, 
released, stored, used or otherwise 
disposed of on the patented real 
property, and any cleanup response, 
remedial action or other actions related 
in any manner to said solid or 
hazardous wastes; or (6) Natural 
resource damages as defined by federal 
and state law. This covenant shall be 
construed as running with the patented 
real property and may be enforced by 
the United States in a court of 
competent jurisdiction. 

Maps delineating the lands are 
available for public review at the Bureau 
of Land Management (BLM) Las Vegas 
Field Office. The appraisal is available 
for public review at the same office. 
Upon publication of this notice and 
until completion of this sale, the BLM 
is no longer accepting land use 
applications affecting the lands. 

In order to determine the fair market 
value of the subject public lands 
through appraisal, certain assumptions 
have been made of the attributes and 
limitations of the lands and potential 
effects of local regulations and policies 
on potential future land uses. Through 
publication of this notice, the BLM gives 
notice that these assumptions may not 
be endorsed or approved by units of 
local government. Furthermore, no 
warranty of any kind shall be given or 
implied by the United States as to the 
title or potential uses of the lands 
proposed to be offered for sale, and 
conveyance of the subject lands will not 
be on a contingency basis. It is the 
buyer’s responsibility to be aware of all 
applicable local government laws, 
policies and regulations that would 
affect the subject lands. It is also the 
buyer’s responsibility to be aware of 
existing or proposed uses of nearby 
properties. When conveyed out of 
federal ownership, the lands will be 
subject to applicable reviews and 
approvals by the respective unit or units 
of local government having jurisdiction 
as to proposed future uses, and any such 
reviews and approvals will be the 
responsibility of the buyer. Any land 
lacking access from a public road or 
highway will be conveyed as such, and 
future access acquisition will be the 
responsibility of the buyer. 

Detailed information concerning the 
proposed sale, including the terms of 

sales, sale procedures and conditions, 
planning and environmental 
documents, is available for review at the 
Bureau of Land Management, Las Vegas 
Field Office, 4701 N. Torrey Pines 
Drive, Las Vegas, NV 89130 or by calling 
(702) 515–5000. 

For a period of 45 days from the date 
of publication of this notice in the 
Federal Register, the general public and 
interested parties may submit comments 
to the Field Manager, Las Vegas Field 
Office, 4701 North Torrey Pines Drive, 
Las Vegas, NV 89130. Any adverse 
comments will be reviewed by the State 
Director who may sustain, vacate, or 
modify this realty action. In the absence 
of any adverse comments, this realty 
action will become the final 
determination of the Department of the 
Interior. The BLM may withdraw any 
land or interest in the land from sale, if, 
in the opinion of the authorized officer, 
consummation of the sale would not be 
fully consistent with FLPMA, or other 
applicable laws or is determined to not 
be in the public interest. Any comments 
received during this process, as well as 
the commentor’s name and address, will 
be available to the public in the 
administrative record and/or pursuant 
to a Freedom of Information Act request. 
You may indicate for the record that you 
do not wish your name and/or address 
made available to the public. Any 
determination by the BLM to release or 
withhold the names and/or addresses of 
those who comment will be made on a 
case-by-case basis. A commenter’s 
request to have their name and/or 
address withheld from public release 
will be honored to the extent 
permissible by law. 

The lands will not be offered for sale 
until at least 60 days after the date of 
publication of this notice in the Federal 
Register.

Dated: May 23, 2003. 
Mark T. Morse, 
Field Manager, Las Vegas Field Office.
[FR Doc. 03–15600 Filed 6–17–03; 10:54 am] 
BILLING CODE 4310–HC–P

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Bureau of Land Management 

[ES–030–1430–BJ] ES–051869, Group 28, 
Missouri 

Notice of Filing of Plat of Survey; 
Missouri 

The Bureau of Land Management 
(BLM) will officially file the plat of the 
survey of a portion of the Wappapello 
Lake acquisition boundary, Township 
28 North, Range 6 East, Fifth Principal

VerDate Jan<31>2003 16:23 Jun 18, 2003 Jkt 200001 PO 00000 Frm 00071 Fmt 4703 Sfmt 4703 E:\FR\FM\19JNN1.SGM 19JNN1



36836 Federal Register / Vol. 68, No. 118 / Thursday, June 19, 2003 / Notices 

Meridian, Missouri, accepted on June 
12, 2003, in the Eastern States Office, 
Springfield, Virginia,30 calendar days 
from the date of publication in the 
Federal Register

The survey was requested by the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers. 

All inquiries or protests concerning 
the technical aspects of the survey must 
be submitted in writing to the Chief 
Cadastral Surveyor, Eastern States, 
Bureau of Land Management, 7450 
Boston Boulevard, Springfield, Virginia 
22153, prior to the date of the official 
filing. 

We will place a copy of the plat we 
described in the open files. Copies of 
the plat will be made available upon 
request and prepayment of the 
appropriate fee.

Dated: June 12, 2003. 
Stephen D. Douglas, 
Chief Cadastral Surveyor.
[FR Doc. 03–15451 Filed 6–18–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4310–GJ–P

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

Minerals Management Service 

Agency Information Collection 
Activities: Proposed Collection; 
Comment Request

AGENCY: Minerals Management Service 
(MMS), Interior.
ACTION: Notice of extension of an 
information collection (1010–0143). 

SUMMARY: To comply with the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(PRA), we are inviting comments on a 
collection of information that we will 
submit to the Office of Management and 
Budget (OMB) for review and approval. 
The information collection request (ICR) 
concerns the paperwork requirements in 
the regulations under 30 CFR 260, 
‘‘Outer Continental Shelf Oil and Gas 
Leasing.’’

DATES: Submit written comments by 
August 18, 2003.
ADDRESSES: Mail or hand carry 
comments to the Department of the 
Interior; Minerals Management Service; 
Attention: Rules Processing Team; Mail 
Stop 4024; 381 Elden Street; Herndon, 
Virginia 20170–4817. If you wish to e-
mail comments, the address is: 
rules.comments@mms.gov. Reference 
‘‘Information Collection 1010–0143’’ in 
your e-mail subject line and mark your 
message for return receipt. Include your 
name and return address in your 
message.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Arlene Bajusz, Rules Processing Team, 

(703) 787–1600. You may also contact 
Arlene Bajusz to obtain a copy, at no 
cost, of the regulations that require the 
subject collection of information.
SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

Title: 30 CFR Part 260, Outer 
Continental Shelf Oil and Gas Leasing. 

OMB Control Number: 1010–0143. 
Abstract: The Outer Continental Shelf 

(OCS) Lands Act, as amended (43 U.S.C. 
1331 et seq. and 43 U.S.C. 1801 et seq.), 
authorizes the Secretary of the Interior 
(Secretary) to prescribe rules and 
regulations to administer leasing of the 
OCS. Section 8(a)(1) of the OCS Lands 
Act provides authority for the Secretary 
to offer leases under a variety of bidding 
systems. The regulations at 30 CFR part 
260 describe the bidding systems, our 
joint bidding requirements, and royalty 
suspensions for certain leases. They 
encourage leasing competition through 
the use of appropriate bidding-system 
alternatives and a joint bidding ban 
among certain large companies. Also, 
these regulations implement the 
Secretary’s authority to promote leasing 
interest in certain areas of the OCS 
through automatic suspension of 
royalties. The Minerals Management 
Service (MMS) administers this program 
for the Secretary. 

Regulations under part 260 require 
lessees to notify MMS of their intention 
to begin production. Lessees must also 
request confirmation of the size of the 
royalty-suspension volume that applies 
to the pre-2001 eligible lease. The MMS 
uses the information collected to make 
decisions on the shares of the royalty-
suspension volume that applies to 
multiple pre-2001 eligible leases on the 
same field. The information is used to 
ensure royalty suspension volume is 
properly allocated among constituent 
leases in a field. Respondents may 
request reconsideration of an 
assignment of their lease that has a 
qualifying well to an existing field or to 
a newly designated field. We will use 
the information to reconsider and 
adjust, if necessary, the initial field 
assignment for a lease. These decisions 
can be contentious because a favorable 
field assignment can save a lessee tens 
of millions of dollars in royalties. 
However, currently pending legislation 
may result in the elimination of this 
information collection. 

We will protect information from 
respondents considered proprietary 
under the Freedom of Information Act 
(5 U.S.C. 552), and its implementing 
regulations (43 CFR part 2), and under 
regulations at 30 CFR parts 250, 251, 
and 252. No items of a sensitive nature 
are collected. Responses are mandatory 
or required to obtain or retain a benefit. 

Frequency: On occasion. 
Estimated Number and Description of 

Respondents: Approximately 130 
Federal OCS oil and gas lessees. 

Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Hour’’ Burden: The 
currently approved annual reporting 
burden for this collection is 1,603 hours. 
The individual components and their 
respective hour burden estimates are 
detailed below. In calculating the 
burdens, we assumed that respondents 
perform certain requirements in the 
normal course of their activities. We 
consider these to be usual and 
customary and took that into account in 
estimating the burden. 

§§ 260.114(a) and 260.124(a)—
Request MMS to reconsider the field 
assignment of a lease (average of 400 
hours per request × 4 requests = 1,600 
hours). 

§ 260.114(c)—Notify MMS of intent to 
begin production and request 
confirmation of the size of royalty-
suspension volume (1⁄2 hour per notice 
× 6 notices = 3 hours). 

Part 260 also refers to various items of 
information collected under 30 CFR 
parts 203 and 256. OMB has approved 
those information collections under 
OMB Control Numbers 1010–0071 and 
1010–0006, respectively. 

Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Non-Hour Cost’’ 
Burden: We have identified no non-hour 
cost burdens for this collection. 

Public Disclosure Statement: The PRA 
(44 U.S.C. 3501, et seq.) provides that an 
agency may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. Until OMB approves a 
collection of information, you are not 
obligated to respond. 

Comments: Before submitting an ICR 
to OMB, PRA section 3506(c)(2)(A) 
requires each agency ‘‘* * * to provide 
notice * * * and otherwise consult 
with members of the public and affected 
agencies concerning each proposed 
collection of information * * *’’. 
Agencies must specifically solicit 
comments to: (a) Evaluate whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to perform its 
duties, including whether the 
information is useful; (b) evaluate the 
accuracy of the agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information; (c) enhance the quality, 
usefulness, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
minimize the burden on the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Agencies must also estimate the ‘‘non-
hour cost’’ burdens to respondents or
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