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in Certain Bearings from China, France, 
Germany, Hungary, Italy, Japan, 
Romania, Singapore, Sweden, and the 
United Kingdom, Inv. Nos. AA1921–
143, 731–TA–341, 343–345, 391–397, 
and 399 (Review), USITC Pub. 3309 
(June 2000), in which the Commission 
determined that revocation of the 
antidumping duty orders on imports of 
ball bearings from France, Germany, 
Italy, Japan, Singapore, and the United 
Kingdom would be likely to lead to 
continuation or recurrence of material 
injury to a domestic industry within a 
reasonably foreseeable time. NMB 
Singapore Ltd. et al v. United States, 
Consol. Court No. 00–07–00373, Slip 
Op. 03–115 (September 3, 2003). On 
October 20, 2003, the Commission 
published its schedule for the remand 
proceedings in the Federal Register, 68 
FR 59950. 

Scheduling the Vote 
The Commission will vote on the 

remand determination at a public 
meeting to be held on Monday, 
November 17, 2003. The meeting is 
tentatively scheduled for 11:00 a.m.

Authority: This action is taken under the 
authority of the Tariff Act of 1930, title VII.

By order of the Commission.
Issued: November 7, 2003. 

Marilyn R. Abbott, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 03–28533 Filed 11–13–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7020–02–P

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. TA–421–4] 

Ductile Iron Waterworks Fittings From 
China; Notice of Commission 
Determination To Conduct a Portion of 
the Hearing in Camera

AGENCY: International Trade 
Commission.
ACTION: Closure of a portion of a 
Commission hearing to the public. 

SUMMARY: Upon request of counsel for 
Chinese Respondents, the Commission 
has determined to conduct a portion of 
its hearing in the above-captioned 
investigation scheduled for November 6, 
2003, in camera. See Commission rules 
201.13(m) and 201.35(b)(3) (19 CFR 
201.13(m) and 201.35(b)(3)). The 
remainder of the hearing will be open to 
the public. The Commission has 
determined that the seven-day advance 
notice of the change to a meeting was 
not possible. See Commission rule 
201.35(a), (c)(1) (19 CFR 201.35(a), 
(c)(1)).

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
William Gearhart, Office of General 
Counsel, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20436, telephone 202–
205–3091, e-mail wgearhart@usitc.gov. 
Hearing-impaired individuals are 
advised that information on this matter 
may be obtained by contacting the 
Commission’s TDD terminal on 202–
205–1810.

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: The 
Commission believes that counsel has 
justified the need for a closed session. 
Counsel seeks a closed session to 
provide a full discussion of information 
relating to pricing data, its analysis of 
domestic industry and Petitioner 
financial performance, indicators of the 
extent of competition between domestic 
product and subject imports, and 
domestic shipments and domestic 
producer market share trends. Because 
such discussions will necessitate 
disclosure of confidential business 
information (CBI), they can only occur 
if a portion of the hearing is held in 
camera. In making this decision, the 
Commission nevertheless reaffirms its 
belief that whenever possible its 
business should be conducted in public. 

The hearing will include the usual 
public presentations by parties, with 
questions from the Commission. In 
addition, the hearing will include in 
camera sessions for confidential 
presentations by Chinese Respondents 
and for questions from the Commission 
relating to the CBI. For any in camera 
session the room will be cleared of all 
persons except for those company 
officials and their counsel who are 
authorized to have access to the CBI at 
issue. See 19 CFR 201.35(b)(1), (2). The 
time for the party’s presentations in the 
in camera session will be taken from its 
overall allotment for the hearing. All 
persons planning to attend the in 
camera portions of the hearing should 
be prepared to present proper 
identification.

Authority: The General Counsel has 
certified, pursuant to Commission Rule 
201.39 (19 CFR 201.39) that, in her opinion, 
a portion of the Commission’s hearing in Inv. 
No. TA–421–4, Ductile Iron Waterworks 
Fittings from China, may be closed to the 
public to prevent the disclosure of CBI. 

By order of the Commission.

Issued: November 5, 2003. 

Marilyn R. Abbott, 
Secretary to the Commission.
[FR Doc. 03–28510 Filed 11–13–03; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7020–02–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Executive Office for United States 
Attorneys; Agency Information 
Collection Activities: Proposed 
Collection; Comments Requested

ACTION: 30-Day notice of information 
collection under review: Office of Legal 
Education Nomination/Confirmation 
Form. 

The Department of Justice (DOJ), 
Executive Office for United States 
Attorneys has submitted the following 
information collection request to the 
Office of Management and Budget 
(OMB) for review and approval in 
accordance with the Paperwork 
Reduction Act of 1995. The proposed 
information collection is published to 
obtain comments from the public and 
affected agencies. This proposed 
information collection was previously 
published in the Federal Register 
Volume 68, Number 146, page 44814 on 
July 30, 2003, allowing for a 60 day 
comment period. 

The purpose of this notice is to allow 
for an additional 30 days for public 
comment until December 15, 2003. This 
process is conducted in accordance with 
5 CFR 1320.10. 

Written comments and/or suggestions 
regarding the items contained in this 
notice, especially the estimated public 
burden and associated response time, 
should be directed to The Office of 
Management and Budget, Office of 
Information and Regulatory Affairs, 
Attention Department of Justice Desk 
Officer, Washington, DC 20503. 
Additionally, comments may be 
submitted to OMB via facsimile to 
(202)–395–7285. Written comments and 
suggestions from the public and affected 
agencies concerning the proposed 
collection of information are 
encouraged. Your comments should 
address one or more of the following 
four points:
—Evaluate whether the proposed 

collection of information is necessary 
for the proper performance of the 
functions of the agency, including 
whether the information will have 
practical utility; 

—Evaluate the accuracy of the agencies 
estimate of the burden of the 
proposed collection of information, 
including the validity of the 
methodology and assumptions used; 

—Enhance the quality, utility, and 
clarity of the information to be 
collected; and 

—Minimize the burden of the collection 
of information on those who are to 
respond, including through the use of 
appropriate automated, electronic, 
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mechanical, or other technological 
collection techniques or other forms 
of information technology, e.g., 
permitting electronic submission of 
responses. 

Overview of This Information 
Collection 

(1) Type of information collection: 
Existing collection in use without an 
OMB control number. 

(2) The title of the form/collection: 
Office of Legal Education Nomination 
Form. 

(3) The agency form number, if any, 
and the applicable component of the 
Department sponsoring the collection: 
DOJ Form Number, none. Office of Legal 
Education, Executive Office for United 
States Attorneys, Department of Justice. 

(4) Affected public who will be asked 
or required to respond, as well as a brief 
abstract: Respondents will be current 
and potential users of agency training 
services. Respondents may represent 
Federal agencies, as well as State, local, 
and tribal governments. The Executive 
Office for United States Attorneys will 
use the collected information to select 
class participants, arrange for 
transportation and reserve rooms; have 
an address to contact the participant, 
and an emergency contact. 

(5) An estimate of the total number of 
respondents and the amount of time 
estimated for an average respondent to 
respond/reply: It is estimated that there 
will be 2,140 responses annually. It is 
estimated that each form will take 5 
minutes to complete. 

(6) An estimate of the total public 
burden (in hours) associated with the 
collection: An estimate of the total hour 
burden to conduct this survey is 1,750 
hours. 

If additional information is required 
contact: Brenda E. Dyer, Deputy 
Clearance Officer, United States 
Department of Justice, Justice 
Management Division, Policy and 
Planning Staff, Patrick Henry Building, 
Suite 1600, 601 D Street NW., 
Washington, DC 20530.

Dated: November 7, 2003 

Brenda E. Dyer, 
Deputy Clearance Officer, Department of 
Justice.
[FR Doc. 03–28484 Filed 11–13–03; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 4410–07–P

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Under the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response 
Compensation and Liability Act 

Pursuant to 28 CFR 507 notice is 
hereby given that on October 16, 2003, 
eleven proposed Consent Decrees in the 
case United States v. Brothers Machine 
& Tool, Inc., et al. Civil Action No. 
LACV 03–07406 DDP (RNBx) were 
lodged with the United States District 
Court for the Central District of 
California. 

In this action, under sections 106 and 
107 of CERCLA, 42, U.S.C. 9606 and 
9607, the United States sought 
injunctive relief and recovery of 
response costs to remedy conditions in 
connection with the release or 
threatened release of hazardous 
substances into the environment at the 
Waste Disposal, Inc. Superfund Site in 
Santa Fe Springs, California (hereinafter 
referred to as the ‘‘Site’’). 

The defendants in this action are as 
follows: Brothers Machine & Tool, Inc.; 
Chasin Trust; Hanson Trust; Searing 
Revocable Trust; Lucille F. Ferris Living 
Trust; John I. Maple Family Partnership; 
Thomas J. Mersits; Irene L. Mersits 
Trust; David Joseph Neptune Family 
Trust; O.R.P. LLC; Danny R. Peoples and 
Dena Peoples, Eddie E. Timmons; 
Eugene Geraldine Welter Trust; 
Graziano Trust; Los Nietos Property 
LLC. and Jovita L. Ortega. 

Each of the defendants in this action 
own a portion of the Site 
(‘‘Landowner(s)’’), and the purpose of 
each of the settlements is to provide to 
the United States the access and 
institutional controls which are required 
to perform the remedial action at the 
Site. In return, the United States has 
given, to each Landowner in each 
decree, its covenants not to sue and 
contribution protection. 

Each Landowner settlement is related 
to a prior consent decree in the case of 
United States v. Archer Daniels, et al. 
Civil Action No. 03–CV–1593WJR, 
wherein defendants which had 
allegedly arranged for the disposal of 
hazardous substances at the Site had 
agreed to perform the Site Remedy. This 
decree was entered by the United States 
District Court for the Central District of 
California on August 12, 2003. 

The Department of Justice will receive 
for a period of thirty (30) days from the 
date of this publication comments 
relating to any of the Landowner 
Consent Decrees. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environment and Natural 
Resources Division, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 

Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to United 
States v. Brothers Machine & Tool, Inc., 
et al., D.J. Ref. 90–11–2–1000/1. As each 
Consent Decree includes a covenant not 
to sue under Section 7003 of RCRA, 42 
U.S.C. 6973(d), commenters may request 
an opportunity for a public meeting in 
the affected area, in accordance with 
section 7003(d) of RCRA, 42 U.S.C. 
6973(d). 

Each Consent Decree may be 
examined at U.S. EPA Region IX, 75 
Hawthorne Street, San Francisco, CA 
94107. During the public comment 
period, each Consent Decree, may also 
be examined on the following 
Department of Justice Web site, http://
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/open.html. A copy 
of each Consent Decree may also be 
obtained by mail from the Consent 
Decree Library, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC. 
20044–7611 or by faxing or e-mailing a 
request to Tonia Fleetwood 
(tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), fax no. 
(202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–1547. In requesting a 
copy of each Landowner Consent Decree 
from the Consent Decree Library, please 
enclose a check in the amount of $63.50 
(25 cents per page reproduction cost) 
per Consent Decree payable to the U.S. 
Treasury. In requesting a copy of each 
Consent Decree, exclusive of exhibits 
and defendants’ signatures, please 
enclose a check in the amount of $11.00 
(25 cents per page reproduction cost) 
payable to the U.S. Treasury.

Ellen M. Mahan, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section.
[FR Doc. 03–28459 Filed 11–13–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

Employee Benefits Security 
Administration 

[Application No. D–10957, et al.] 

Proposed Exemptions; John Hancock 
Life Insurance Company, et al

AGENCY: Employee Benefits Security 
Administration, Labor.
ACTION: Notice of proposed exemptions.

SUMMARY: This document contains 
notices of pendency before the 
Department of Labor (the Department) of 
proposed exemptions from certain of the 
prohibited transaction restrictions of the 
Employee Retirement Income Security 
Act of 1974 (the Act) and/or the Internal 
Revenue Code of 1986 (the Code). 
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